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Sex Pistols miniseries on the way - page 3

COVID vaccinations will soon be offered 24/7, Boris 
Johnson declared this week.
	 The Prime Minister 
said round-the-clock jabs 
will be introduced by the 
Government “as soon as 
we can”.
	 He is understood to 
have given the go ahead 
to a pilot study that will 
test the potential for 24/7 
immunisation facilities. 
It will result in healthcare 
workers being vaccinated 
at the end of their shifts 
at all hours of the day and 
night.
	 Mr Johnson delivered 
his latest pledge to step 
up the rollout of the life-
saving vaccines as official 
figures confirmed the 
highest daily death toll in 
the pandemic so far.
	 The statistics showed a 
further 1,564 people had 
died within 28 days of 
testing positive for Covid 
on Tuesday. The grim 
update took the UK total 
to 84,767.
	 But, in a more positive 
sign, figures also showed 
the spread of the second 
wave appeared to be 
slowing.
	 Another 47,525 positive 

tests were confirmed on 
Wednesday, down 23 
per cent compared to the 
previous Wednesday’s 
total of 62,322.
	 It was the fourth day in 
a row that infections have 
dropped compared with 
the previous week. 
More than 2.8 million 
vaccines had been 
delivered by the middle of 
this week, according to the 
latest official Government 
figures.
	 Dr Yvonne Doyle, 
medical director at Public 
Health England, said: 
“With each passing day, 
more and more people are 
tragically losing their lives 
to this terrible virus, and 
today we have reported 
the highest number of 
deaths on a single day 
since the pandemic began.
	 “There have now been 
more deaths in the second 
wave than the first.
	 “About one in three 
people with Covid don’t 
show symptoms, but can 
still pass it on to others. So 
it is essential that we stay 
at home, minimize contact 

with other people and act 
as if you have the virus.”
	 Sir Patrick Vallance, 
the Government’s chief 
scientific adviser, warned 
that the daily death toll 
was likely to remain high 
for several more days.
	 He said: “I don’t think 
they’re going to drop very 
quickly. I’m afraid we’re 
in a period of high death 
numbers that’s going to 
carry on for some weeks.
	  “It’s not going to come 
down quickly even if 
the measures that are in 
place now start to reduce 
the infection numbers. So 
we’re in for a pretty grim 
period, I’m afraid.”
	 Mr Johnson announced 
the move towards round-
the-clock vaccinations 
at Prime Minister’s 
Questions in the 
Commons on Wednesday.
	 He told MPs: “We will 
be going to 24/7 as soon as 
we can.” Health Secretary 
Matt Hancock will set out 
details of the move “in 
due course”, the PM said.
	 He added: “At the 
moment the limit is on 

supply. We have a huge 
network: 233 hospitals, 
1,000 GP surgeries, 200 
pharmacies and 50 mass 
vaccination centres, 
and they are going 
exceptionally fast.”
	 Ministers and senior 
officials are currently 
discussing how widely 
round-the-clock tests 
should be rolled out.
	 Some concerns have 
been raised in Whitehall 
that 24-hour vaccine 

centres could potentially 
lead to many more missed 
appointments.
	 A snap YouGov poll on 
Wednesday showed 43 
per cent of Britons would 
be willing to have their 
vaccine appointment 
between midnight and 
6am. But 32 per cent 
would turn down an 
appointment during those 
times.
	 The PM also refused 
to rule out toughening 

the current lockdown 
restrictions across 
England. 
	 In Scotland, First 
Minister Nicola Sturgeon 
tightened restrictions 
further by banning people 
from drinking outside, 
forbidding customers to 
enter takeaway outlets 
and banning non-essential 
“ c l i c k - a n d - c o l l e c t ” 
services.
	 The PM added: “We 

COMING SOON: JABS 
AROUND THE CLOCK!

24/7 immunization labs on the way as second wave starts to slow

JOHNSON: said “the lockdown measures are ... having some effect.”

cont. on page 2, col 4
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News From Britain

SUPERHUB vaccine 
injection sites openend 
across the UK this week 
today as the war on 
Covid- 19 ramped up.
	 At the rate of four jabs 
a minute, thousands 
of people are being 
inoculated at each centre 
every day.
	 As the first seven 
mass vaccination hubs 
swung into action, Health 
Secretary Matt Hancock 
vowed that every adult 
in the country would 
be offered a jab by the 
autumn.
	 Two million people have 
had their shots already 
and the Government is on 
course to meet its target 
of giving more than 13 
million injections by the 
middle of next month.
	 Mr Hancock said: 
“Since the historic day 
the first vaccine was 
approved, the NHS has 
made fantastic strides in 
offering the vaccine to 
as many at risk people 
as possible and at record 
pace.
	  “We have worked 
closely with experts 
across the NHS, local 
governments and the 
armed forces to put in 
place full and thorough 
preparations for this 
rollout – this is the biggest 
vaccination programme 
in British history.
	  “From today, the full 

scale of our plans will be 
published, so the public 
can be assured of the time, 
effort and resources that 
have gone, and will go, 
into ensuring we protect 
the British people from 
the scourge of this virus.
	  “The UK vaccine 
delivery plan will be the 
keystone of our exit out 
of the pandemic, but we 
all must continue to play 
our part by staying at 
home, following the rules 
and keeping Hands, Face, 
Space at the forefront of 
our minds when out and 
about.”
	 Letters were sent to the 
homes of 630,000 over-
80s who live within 45 
minutes of one of the 
centres. They are: the 
Excel Centre, London; 
Ashton Gate, Bristol, 
Epsom racecourse in 
Surrey; Millennium 
Point, Birmingham; 
Robertson House in 
Stevenage; Etihad Tennis 
Club in Manchester and 
the Centre for Life in 
Newcastle- upon-Tyne.

‘pressure’
	 Mr Hancock said 
200,000 people are being 
inocuated in England 
daily: “We’ve now 
vaccinated around one 
third of the over-80s in this 
country so we’re making 
significant progress. This 
week we’re opening mass 

vaccination centres...with 
more to come next week 
where we will get through 
very large numbers of 
people.”
	 Mr Hancock said “the 
pressure on the NHS 
is very, very bad. The 
single biggest thing that 
anybody can do is to 
follow the stay at home 
guidance. 
	 “There are limited 
exemptions. Only if you 
can’t work from home 
and if you need to go out 
and get shopping or take 
some exercise. But these 
are highly limited for a 
good reason. We need to 
bring the case rate right 
down. So it’s on all of us 
really, it always has been 
a big team effort,” he 
added.
	 The new vaccination 
centres will be the first 
to use trained volunteers 
from St John Ambulance 
and the NHS Volunteer 
Responder scheme 
alongside NHS staff, 
Hundreds more GP-led 
and hospital services 
are due to open this 
week along with the first 
pharmacy-led pilots, 
taking total sites to around 
1,200.
	 Prof Stephen Powis, 
NHS national medical 
director, said: “The NHS 
can open even more 
vaccination services and 
protect even more people 

The world’s richest 
person has been invited 
to consider setting up a 
new manufacturing site 
in Swindon.
	 Leader of the town’s 
borough council David 
Renard has written to 
Elon Musk,  owner of 
the Tesla car company, 
asking him to consider 
opening a factory there.
	 Mr Renard suggested 
the Honda factory site, 
set to close in July 2021.
	 Mr Musk also owns 
Space X which aims 
to deliver broadband 
internet around the 
world, using 42,000 
satellites.
	 In the letter to Mr 
Musk, Mr Renard said 
he would like to “draw 

your attention” to the 
Honda site.
He called it a “prime 
site” with good 
transport links and said 
the “biggest selling 
point” might be Honda’s 
5,000-strong workforce 
which would need to 
find new employment 
when the plant closes.
	 Dale Heenan, 
Swindon Borough 
Council’s cabinet 
member for the town 
centre, said writing to 
Mr Musk was in his list 
of new year resolutions, 
according to  the Local 
Democracy Reporting 
Service (LDRS).
	 Honda said it 
was  closing its site due 
to global changes in the 

car industry  and the 
need to launch electric 
vehicles.
	 Jim Grant, the borough 
council’s Labour 
group leader, said he 
applauded the approach 
to Mr Musk and said 
“every opportunity” 
should be taken to bring 
jobs to the town.
	 But he added: “I am 
concerned, however, 
that this has more to 
do with publicising the 
Tory council itself than 
a serious approach to 
Tesla.
	 “Honda itself is keen 
on privacy, and I suspect 
Elon Musk and Tesla 
probably prefer to do 
such negotiations out of 
the public eye.” 

this week.
	  “Please don’t contact 
the NHS to seek a vaccine, 
we will contact you. 
When we do contact 
you, please attend your 
booked appointments.” 
	 Leading high street 
chemist Boots opened 
its first vaccination site 
this week, offering the 
Oxford-AstraZeneca jab 
to the most vulnerable 
people.

	 Seb James, managing 
director of Boots, said: 
“Our vaccination 
sites are clean, clinical 
environments in 
accessible, convenient 
locations.
	  “We have extensive 
experience in vaccination 
services, having carried 
out over a million flu 
vaccinations in this winter 
flu season alone. We hope 
to help the NHS and 

enable more people to get 
the vaccination quickly.”
	 Prof Devi Sridhar, 
chairman of public health 
at Edinburgh University, 
said: “We have to continue 
[the vaccine] roll-out, keep 
saving lives.
	  “But it’s not a strategy 
in and of itself and relying 
on it alone is highly, highly 
risky.” The delivery plan 
is the keystone of our exit 
from the pandemic.”

‘Superhub’ vaccine sites 
open across the UK

Swindon to Musk: come 
open a factory here

ELON MUSK: the Tesla founder plans to make broadband available worldwide

keep things under 
constant review and we 
will continue to do so. 
If there is any need to 
toughen up restrictions, 
which I do not rule out, 

we will of course come to 
this House.”
	 Striking an optimistic 
tone, the PM pointed 
to the data suggesting 
the lockdown measures 
were bringing down the 
infection rate. 
	 He said: “The lockdown 
measures that we have in 

place are starting to show 
signs of having some 
effect.
	  “We must take account 
of that too, because 
nobody can doubt the 
serious damage that is 
done by lockdowns to 
people’s mental health, 
jobs and livelihoods.” 

JABS:
cont. from page one

https://www.bbc.co.uk/news/technology-55578403
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https://www.bbc.co.uk/news/uk-england-wiltshire-51473399
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THE Queen’s cousin is 
facing up to five years in 
jail after carrying out a 
violent sex attack inside 
his ancestral home.
	 Simon Bowes-Lyon 
forced his way into the 
sleeping woman’s room 
and assaulted her. 
It happened during a 
travel PR weekend in 
February last year which 
he was hosting at the 
16,500-acre Glamis Castle 
estate, in Angus.
	 A court was told that 
the attack lasted more 
than 20 minutes.
	 On Tuesday, the 
wealthy aristocrat, who 
is Earl of Strathmore, was 
granted bail and placed 
on the sex offenders 
register as sentence was 
deferred for reports. 
Bowes-Lyon, who is 
known as “Sam”, is the 
Queen’s cousin twice 
removed. Outside court, 
the 34- yearold said: “I 
am greatly ashamed of 
my actions which have 
caused such distress to a 
guest in my home.
	 “Clearly, I had drunk to 
excess on the night of the 
incident.
	 “As someone who is 
only too well aware of 
the damage that alcohol 
can cause, I should have 
known better. I recognise, 
in any event, that alcohol 
is no excuse for my 
behaviour.”
	 The landowner, who 
walked behind Prince 
William in the funeral 
cortege of his great- great 
aunt, The Queen Mother, 

stood with his head 
bowed as the charge was 
read to him.
	 Bowes-Lyon admitted 
sexually assaulting the 
26-year-old woman.
	 Fiscal depute Lynne 
Mannion told Perth 
Sheriff Court: “He told 
her he wanted to have an 
affair. He tried to pull her 
nightdress up.
	 “She went into the en-
suite to get away but the 
accused followed her, 
stopped her closing the 
door and lit a cigarette. 
She squeezed past 
and went back to the 
bedroom.
	 “She raised her voice 
in the hope that another 
guest would hear her.  
She panicked because she 
did not know the layout 
of the castle. He refused 
to leave.”
	 She added: “He got into 
bed and began pulling 
at her. She had to keep 
pushing him off.”
	 Bowes-Lyon called her 
“a rude, mean, bad and 
horrible person” and told 
her she could not tell him 
what to do in his own 
home. After more than 20 
minutes she managed to 
get him out of her room.
	 The woman fled the 
castle the next morning 
and flew home where she 
immediately reported the 
matter to police.
	 Bowes-Lyon later 
emailed an apology to 
the woman.  He offered 
another apology for his 
behaviour this week in 
court.

Danny Boyle  is set 
to direct a six-part 
television drama about 
the  Sex Pistols  – to be 
titled Pistol – based on 
guitarist Steve Jones’s 
2016 memoir,  Lonely 
Boy.
	 In a statement this 
week, Boyle described 
the Sex Pistols’ 
emergence in the mid-
70s as the moment 
that British society and 
culture changed forever.	
 “Imagine breaking into 
the world of The Crown 
and Downton Abbey 
with your mates and 
screaming your songs 
and your fury at all they 
represent,” said Boyle. 
	 “It is the detonation 
point for British street 
culture where ordinary 
young people had the 
stage and vented their 
fury and their fashion, 
and everyone had to 
watch and listen and 
everyone feared them or 
followed them.”
	 Frank Cottrell Boyce is 
writing the series 
alongside Craig Pearce 
(Strictly Ballroom). 
Among its young 
cast will be Game 
of Thrones’  Maisie 
Williams  as  punk 
icon Jordan  and Toby 
Wallace, recently 
seen in Australian 
film  Babyteeth, as Steve 
Jones. John Lydon is to be 
portrayed by emerging 
star Anson Boon.
Pistol will appear on 
American network FX, 
which has a partnership 
for scripted comedy with 
the BBC. Production is 
due to start on 7 March.
	 In  an Observer review 
of Jones’ memoir, Jude 
Rogers described the 
guitarist’s story as “often 
eye-wateringly funny”, 
albeit with “many 
moments of poignancy” 
as he touches on sexual 
abuse, maternal neglect 
and a stint in a remand 
centre.
	 Lydon has yet to 
comment on the news. 

In 2019, he disavowed 
a prospective Sex 
Pistols biopic made by 

Starlight Films. “For 
the avoidance of doubt 
this film would be 

unauthorised, unofficial, 
and not endorsed by Sex 
Pistols,” he tweeted.	

CONVICTED: Simon Bowes Lyon
Royal shame as Queen’s 

cousin convicted of sex attack

Danny Boyle set to helm Sex 
Pistols biopic miniseries

Sex Pistols in 1977: Sid Vicious, Paul Cook, Johnny Rotten and Steve Jones

“The moment that changed British society forever”...
John Rotten (left) and Steve Jones in 1978

https://www.theguardian.com/film/danny-boyle
https://www.theguardian.com/music/sexpistols
https://www.theguardian.com/books/2016/nov/20/lonely-boy-steve-jones-set-the-boy-free-johnny-marr-review-sex-pistols-smiths
https://www.theguardian.com/books/2016/nov/20/lonely-boy-steve-jones-set-the-boy-free-johnny-marr-review-sex-pistols-smiths
https://www.theguardian.com/profile/frankcottrellboyce
https://www.theguardian.com/tv-and-radio/maisie-williams
https://www.theguardian.com/tv-and-radio/maisie-williams
https://www.theguardian.com/music/2019/apr/23/punk-jordan-mooney
https://www.theguardian.com/music/2019/apr/23/punk-jordan-mooney
https://www.theguardian.com/film/2020/aug/12/babyteeth-review-eliza-scanlen-ben-mendelsohn
https://www.theguardian.com/music/john-lydon
https://www.theguardian.com/books/2016/nov/20/lonely-boy-steve-jones-set-the-boy-free-johnny-marr-review-sex-pistols-smiths
https://www.theguardian.com/books/2016/nov/20/lonely-boy-steve-jones-set-the-boy-free-johnny-marr-review-sex-pistols-smiths
https://twitter.com/lydonofficial/status/1111282142766600193
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Ministers should 
consider writing a 
maximum distance for 
daily exercise into law, 
Britain’s most senior 
police officer has said.
	 Dame Cressida Dick, 
commissioner of the 
Metropolitan Police, said 
“clarity” was needed 
over the definition 
of local exercise in 
England at a time of 
rising concerns about 
public compliance with 
lockdown guidance and 
loopholes in the law.
	 She said that ministers 
should consider 
introducing restrictions 
on travel for exercise 
similar to those imposed 
in Scotland and Wales, 
where there are strict 
limits. “Anything that 
brings greater clarity 
would be a good thing,” 
she told  Today  on BBC 
Radio 4.

‘stay local’
	 Dame Cressida says 
that people are still 
holding house parties, 
meeting in basements 
to gamble and 
attending unlicensed 
raves in the teeth of 
the pandemic’s most 
deadly  phase.  Writing 

BRITISH stars are 
outshining Hollywood 
actors in the top 10 most 
streamed shows in the 
world on Netflix.
	 Ex-EastEnders and 
Miranda actor Tom Ellis, 
42, is the UK’s most 
successful leading man 
with his DC comic book 
serial Lucifer the second-
highest viewed original 
drama series.
	 And The Crown, 
starring Olivia Colman, 
46, was the third most 
streamed series in US- 
centred ratings.
	 Viewers watched nearly 
19 billion minutes of the 
show, which came second 
to US drug drama Ozark 
in 2020.
	 Marketing expert 
Brodie Cooper, from 
Hollywood’s PRrppd 
said: “Lucifer was actually 
dropped by Fox TV, but 
Tom Ellis’s performances 
have made it a mega 
smash.
	  “Now he genuinely can 
be classed an A-lister. “The 
UK success is remarkable.
	 In Hollywood they 
always talk about the 
British invasion and how 
so many stars from the 
other side of the pond 

in The Times  she warned 
that anyone breaking the 
rules would find officers 
“moving much more 
quickly to enforcement 
action”.
	 Her intervention 
follows fierce public 
debate over police 
enforcement of 
guidance on exercise, 
which stipulates - unlike 
English law - that the 
public must “stay local”. 
No 10 has increased 
its efforts to improve 
compliance.
	 This week even 
Boris Johnson  was 
criticised  for travelling 

seven miles from 
Downing Street for a 
cycle ride in Queen 
Elizabeth Olympic 
Park on Sunday. Dame 
Cressida said that the 
prime minister had not 
broken the law.
	 Kit Malthouse, the 
policing minister, 
agreed. “Local means 
you can get there under 
your own steam,” he 
told Times Radio. He 
added that a bike ride of 
70 miles would be “fine 
in some circumstances” 
but said the public were 
expected to recognise 
what “local” meant.

	 The health secretary 
Matt Hancock’s defence 
of Derbyshire police for 
fining two women for 
walking five miles from 
their home last week 
backfired when the force 
rescinded the penalty.
	 Mr Malthouse said 
that officers would be 
“very high profile” 
and quicker to move 
to enforcement but 
that they would still 
be relying on consent. 
He added that all 
supermarket chains 
should follow Morrisons 
and enforce the wearing 
of masks in stores. 

FRANCE has called on 
the EU to use Brexit to 
end the dominance of the 
English language on the 
Continent.
	 Paris has taken 
a hardline over the 
divorce and has used 
it to strengthen its own 
position in the EU.

	 French Europe minister 
Clement Beaune said: 
“It would be even less 
comprehensible after 
Brexit that we all operate 
in an approximate English.
	 “Let’s reaccustom 
ourselves to speaking our 
languages.”
	 To the consternation 

of the French, English 
remains the dominant 
language for EU civil 
servants and MEPs.
	 There are 23 official 
languages but the 
European Commission 
only uses English, French 
and German for its daily 
business.

	 Mr Beaune branded 
the reluctance to scrap 
English as an “obstacle 
to understanding and 
adherence”.
	 But EU officials say 
“English remains one of 
the official languages of 
[members] in Ireland and 
Malta”. 

SARAH, Duchess of 
York has landed a book 
deal with Mills & Boon 
– revealing she drew on 
family history for her 
debut romance.
	 Her Heart For A 
Compass is a fictional 
account of the life and love 
story of Lady Margaret 

Montagu Douglas Scott, 
Sarah’s great-great-aunt.
	 Mills & Boon describes 
it as an “immersive 
historical saga” that 
“sweeps the reader from 
the drawing rooms of 
Victoria’s court...to the 
slums of London”.
	 Sarah came across 

Lady Margaret as she 
researched her ancestry.
	 Unable to uncover 
much about her life, she 
“invented a history for 
her that incorporated 
real people and events, 
including some of my 
other ancestors”.
	 The Duchess, whose 

past books have included 
memoirs and children’s 
books, wrote the novel 
with “collaborator and 
mentor” Marguerite 
Kaye, a Mills & Boon 
veteran. 
● Her Heart For A 
Compass will be 
published on August 3. 

shine so bright. This list 
shows the depth of talent 
and appeal of shows the 
UK has globally.”
	 Other top homegrown 
stars include Paul 
Hollywood, 54, and Prue 
Leith, 80, whose Great 
British Baking Show – as 
Bake Off is known on 
Netflix – is the platform’s 
biggest reality show. 
	 Mr Cooper added: 
“Fans really enjoy the 
escapism of gentle, kind 
and non- confrontational 
TV in the pandemic.”
	 English ex-Game of 
Thrones star Tom Hopper, 
35, is one of the lead 
characters in The Umbrella 
Academy, which is their 
sixth biggest drama.

Britflix: Why British 
stars are the streaming 
service’s crowning glory

LUCIFER: the drama starring Tom Ellis is 
Netflix’s second most-watched show

UK’s top cop calls for law limiting exercise travel
n Police fear lockdown loopholes are hurting compliance

CRESSIDA DICK: her intervention follows fierce public debate 
over police enforcement of guidance on exercise

English no longer No.1 in Europe

Fergie love plot leads to Mills & Boon deal

https://www.thetimes.co.uk/article/police-need-the-jab-x5jtkxxjm
https://www.thetimes.co.uk/article/police-need-the-jab-x5jtkxxjm
https://www.thetimes.co.uk/article/coronavirus-boris-johnson-under-fire-for-bike-ride-miles-away-from-no-10-xxkfjhsnp
https://www.thetimes.co.uk/article/coronavirus-boris-johnson-under-fire-for-bike-ride-miles-away-from-no-10-xxkfjhsnp
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ARIES: Now you can say with truth that you have been patient for a longer time than ever before. The good news is if you can wait a while longer you will finally 
see a light at the end of a long tunnel.
TAURUS: For some of you, relationships might not have been all you desire. If this is a problem take your bull by the horns by the end of the month and make the 
first move. That is all it will take to be resolved or dissolved whichever is relevant.
GEMINI: You are ready to tackle any unfinished business next week. Best to make sure you have time and energy to complete by month’s end as you will be busier 
next month.
CANCER: Like many have have had an unpredictable time of late. This usually does not sit well with you and can have caused you to take life far too seriously. 
Fear not, life will be easier in many ways by month’s end.
LEO: You could be planning a home-based renovation or something similar in the next few weeks. Be sure that your plan is practical so you complete all your 
scheduled work. Most importantly, plan your budget ahead of time.
VIRGO: Stress is no stranger in your life occasionally. It’s probably more of a problem these past couple of weeks. So the time now is to be positive in thought and 
action. This unusual time is nearing its end and it’s best to look forward, not backward.
LIBRA: The Sun is heading next week into your cousin sign of Aquarius. This is good news overall that you can pick up speed for whatever is your goal. While it 
may have been a time of mixed signals (especially in career) now you can feel more positive from what you hear.
SCORPIO: You are possibly feeling disappointed lately. This is especially so with some relationships, since it is likely not your fault. But let the feeling (and them) 
go. Next week you will feel more settled overall.
SAGITTARIUS: You could be feeling that there are some folks who do not always see your point of view. If this is the case it’s time to let go and look at the folks 
who do. This does not mean you have to cut them off! It’s just time to change some rules.
CAPRICORN: The past few months have had many challenges for you and for the world in general. This is due to rare lineups of  planets in your sign. This has 
signaled an ending and a new beginning of change. Happy Birthday!
AQUARIUS: Your new year is coming up. Time to release any thing that does not work for your life. With Jupiter and Saturn in your life for some time ahead big 
changes are coming, so it’s best to have some space for good changes.
PISCES: You could feel like hibernating and laying low. This is a good idea for a few days so go for it. However do not make it a big deal. Life  will go on and in a 
better way! 

The British Weekly Sudoku by Myles Mellor  #474The British Weekly Crossword by Myles Mellor. #474

Stargazing with Annie Shaw
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ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 

CHANGE OF NAME
Superior Court of California

County of Los Angeles
111 N Hill St

Los Angele CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Dawei Guan, an adult over the age 

of 18 years.

Date: 03/15/21. Time: 10.00am, in 
Dept. 74, Room 735

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Dawei Guan. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Dawei 
Guan to David Guan Mendonca.
IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above 
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above 
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: December 12, 2020.
Hon. Michelle Williams Court
Judge of the Superior Court
20SMCP04068
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd
Norwalk CA 90650

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Dolores Irene Kunze, an adult 

over the age of 18 years.

Date: 02/10/21. Time: 10.30am, in 
Dept. C

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Dolores Irene Kunze. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have their name changed from 
Dolores Irene Kunze aka Dolores 
Kunze Guyan aka Mrs. Robert 
Johnson Guyan to Samanda 
Kunze Guyan.
IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above 
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above 
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 

copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: October 23, 2020.
Judge Margaret M. Bernal
Judge of the Superior Court
20NWCP00313
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition of Noga 
Cohen, an adult over the age of 18 
years.

Date: 02/19/21. Time: 8.30am, in 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Noga Cohen. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Noga 
Cohen to Noga Alona Cohen.
IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above 
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above 
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: December 14, 2020.
Lawrence Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
20SMCP00438
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020199481. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: My Goodiez, 
21021 Erwin Street #115, Woodland 
Hills CA 91367. Patrice Christopher, 
21021 Erwin Street #115, Woodland 
Hills CA 91367. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
07/2019. Signed: Patrice Christopher, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 11/30/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020201698. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: UCAR LA, 

115 Commerce Way, Walnut CA 
91789. UCAR LA Inc., 115 Commerce 
Way, Walnut CA 91789. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Leonel Lopez, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/01/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020201962. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: My Prime 
Loans, 21200 Oxnard Street #571, 
Woodland Hills CA 91367. Anthony 
Hairapetian, 21200 Oxnard Street 
#571, Woodland Hills CA 91367. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 11/2020. Signed: Anthony 
Hairapetian, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 12/01/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020202680. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Agentstory, 
11923 Laurelwood Dr #6, Studio City 
CA 91604. Highrise Consulting, Inc., 
11923 Laurelwood Dr #6, Studio City 
CA 91604. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 09/2020. Signed: Gary 
Magnone, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 12/02/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020205389. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: 1st American 
Financial; American Financial Reverse 
Mortgages, American Financial 
Corporation, American Financial 
Group, American Financial Home 
Loans, American Financial Mortgages, 
2002 Montana Ave, Santa Monica CA 
90403/300 Bay St #4, Santa Monica 
CA 90405. 1st American Financial, 
2002 Montana Ave, Santa Monica CA 
90403. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 10/2020. Signed: 
Kevin Wolter, President. Registrant(s) 

declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 12/03/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020205454. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Tax Men 
PS, 6475 Van Nuys Blvd, Van Nuys 
CA 91401. Alejandra Maldonado, 
10681 Sunnybrea Ave, Chatsworth 
CA 91311. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2010. 
Signed: Alejandra Maldonado, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/03/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020205890. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Wigging 
It Etc., 10316 Sepulveda Blvd Suite 
215, Mission Hills CA 91345. Aisha 
Della, 10316 Sepulveda Blvd Suite 
215, Mission Hills CA 91345. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 11/2020. Signed: Aisha Della, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/03/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020206195. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Beauty By 
Briana; LA I Lash Addict, 22545 Ventura 
Blvd. Woodland Hills CA 91364/18601 
Ingomar St., Reseda CA 91335. Beauty 
By Briana L.L.C., 22545 Ventura 
Blvd. Woodland Hills CA 91364. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 03/2020. Signed: 
Briana Ngo, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 12/03/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 

federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020208170. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Indigo 
Casting Group, 101 S Topanga Canyon 
Blvd #907, Topanga CA 90290. 
Tiffany Company Casting, Inc., 101 S 
Topanga Canyon Blvd #907, Topanga 
CA 90290. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2020. 
Signed: Tiffany Persons, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/07/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020208202. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: The Foya 
Project, 538 And a Half Coronado 
Street, Los Angeles CA 90057. Wonoh 
Massaquoi, 538 And a Half Coronado 
Street, Los Angeles CA 90057; Mamie 
Ndawah-Massaquoi, 7261 Chasewood 
Dr., Missouri City TX 77489. This 
business is conducted by: a general 
partnership. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2020. 
Signed: Mamie Ndawah-Massaquoi, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/07/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020208524. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Toucanec, 
1108 S. Baldwin Ave. #223, Arcadia CA 
91007. Shine Yu, 1108 S. Baldwin Ave. 
#223, Arcadia CA 91007. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Shine Yu, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 12/07/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020208526. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Tres Melo 
Musique, 3950 Laurel Canyon Blvd. 
#1351, Studio City CA 91604. Jonathan 
Lea, 3950 Laurel Canyon Blvd. #1351, 
Studio City CA 91604. This business 

is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Jonathan Lea, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/07/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020209149. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Wildland 
Hauling  And Junk Removal; Junkwild.
com, Junk Dudes, 20652 Lassen 
St. Suite 70, Chatsworth CA 91311. 
Bryan Insaurralde, 20652 Lassen St. 
Suite 70, Chatsworth CA 91311. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Bryan Insaurralde, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/08/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020209549. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Two Guys 
From Italy, 950 E. Colorado Blvd. Unit 
203, Pasadena CA 91106. Cemi Pizza 
Inc., 950 E. Colorado Blvd. Unit 203, 
Pasadena CA 91106. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
11/2020. Signed: Adem Omer Djojaj, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/08/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020211349. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Casa Amazona, 
2771 West Avenue L, Lancaster CA 
93536. Jose Lorenzo Llubien, 3574 
Crystal Ct., Palmdale CA 93550. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 10/2019. Signed: Jose Lorenzo 
Llubien, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/09/2020. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
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date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020211649. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Perfect 
Donut and Coffee, 15101 S Atlantic 
Ave, Compton CA 90221. Thai Chea, 
1245 E. Luray Street, Long Beach CA 
90807; Malinda Khieng, 1245 E. Luray 
Street, Long Beach CA 90807. This 
business is conducted by: a married 
couple. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Thai Chea, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/09/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020212736. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Maintenance 
Champ, 1976 La Cienega Blvd C325, 
Los Angeles CA 90034. Michael 
Broman, 1976 La Cienega Blvd 
C325, Los Angeles CA 90034. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Michael Broman, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/10/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020214323. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Plant Love, 
2541 Carman Crest Dr, Los Angeles 
CA 90068. Gianna Baxter, 2541 
Carman Crest Dr, Los Angeles CA 
90068; Andrea Logan, 505 Ravensbury 
St, Lake Sherwood CA 91361. This 
business is conducted by: copartners. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 04/2020. Signed: Gianna Baxter, 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/11/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020214406. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Emphatically 
Empowered, 13461 Elgers Street, 

Cerritos CA 90703. Magdalena 
Kosinka-Klaehn, 13461 Elgers Street, 
Cerritos CA 90703. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
11/2020. Signed: Magdalena Kosinka-
Klaehn, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/14/2020. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020214687. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Parakletos 
By Your Side; The Parakletos, 130 
Cook Ave. suite 102, Pasadena CA 
91107. Ferrer & Ho Psychology Corp, 
130 Cook Ave. suite 102, Pasadena 
CA 91107. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 10/2015. 
Signed: Bing-King Joseph Ho, Vice 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/14/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020215509. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Haas 
Construction; P.O.E.C., 24617 Wayman 
St, Newhall CA 91321. Herbert Haas, 
24617 Wayman St, Newhall CA 
91321. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 12/2015. Signed: 
Herbert Haas, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 12/14/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020215562. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Valley Village 
Dental Center, 12131 Magnolia Blvd, 
Valley Village CA 91607. Grosleib 
Dental Corporation, 12131 Magnolia 
Blvd, Valley Village CA 91607. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 04/2016. Signed: James Grosleib, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/14/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 

name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020215811. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Fast Geek 
Publishing, 4417 Santa Anita Ave, 
El Monte CA 91731. Xiao Song, 
4417 Santa Anita Ave, El Monte CA 
91731. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 01/2019. Signed: Xiao 
Song, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/15/2020. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020215830. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Kaz Fix, 440 
S Berendo Str #323, Los Angeles CA 
90020/440 S Berendo Str #323, Los 
Angeles CA 90020. Dias Satov, 440 
S Berendo Str #323, Los Angeles CA 
90020. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Dias 
Satov, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/15/2020. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020217178. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: EFP Associates, 
12100 Wilshire Blvd. Suite 800, Los 
Angeles CA 90025. MRH Consultants, 
Inc., 30473 Mulholland Hwy, Spc 195, 
Agoura Hills CA 91301. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
05/1991. Signed: Alexander Rapoport, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/15/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 

2020217411. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: The Studio By 
Melody Melikian, 671-675 W Broadway 
Unit 108, Glendale CA 91204/6912 San 
Fernando Road, Glendale CA 91201. 
Melody Melikian Photography Inc., 
6912 San Fernando Road, Glendale 
CA 91201. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2020. 
Signed: Melody Melikian, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/15/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020217774. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Triple J 
Design & Consulting, 30106 Hunstock 
St., Castaic CA 91384. Triple J 
Design & Consulting LLC, 30106 
Hunstock St., Castaic CA 91384. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2020. 
Signed: Ignacio Romero Jr., Managing 
Member. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/16/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020217776. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Viewline 
Realty, 20605 Soledad Cyn. Rd., Santa 
Clarita CA 91351. Nuri March, 28451 
Hawks Ridge Dr., Canyon Country CA 
91351. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 04/2020. Signed: Nuri 
March, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/16/2020. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020217794. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Anna Kafka, 
5200 Clarke Avenue #1188, Lakewood 
CA 90714. AK Psychological Services, 
Inc., 5200 Clarke Avenue #1188, 
Lakewood CA 90714. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
11/2020. Signed: Anna Belisa Kafka, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 

information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/16/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020217796. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Sky Limit 
Energy, 606 Hermosa Vista St, 
Monterey Park CA 91754. Sky Limit 
Venture Corp, 606 Hermosa Vista St, 
Monterey Park CA 91754. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
11/2020. Signed: Marksiane Senelath, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/16/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020217814. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: La Fame 
Boutique, 1101 Ocean Front Walk, 
Venice CA 90291/16030 Ventura 
Blvd., Suite 430, Encino CA 91436. 
Trio Venice LLC, 8 Brooks Ave., 
Suite D, Venice CA 90291. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2020. 
Signed: Idan Azoulay, Managing 
Member. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/16/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020217816. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Park Noack 
Agency, 10866 Wilshire Boulevard, 
Suite 400, Los Angeles CA 90024. 
Adam Sinjin Park, 1725 Ocean Avenue, 
#211, Santa Monica CA 90401. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2008. Signed: Adam Sinjin Park, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/16/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 

Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020217830. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Dot Dot Goods; 
Seventh Hill, 417 S Hill St Apt 901, 
Los Angeles CA 90013. Laura Fisher, 
417 S Hill St Apt 901, Los Angeles 
CA 90013. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 12/2015. Signed: 
Laura Fisher, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 12/16/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020218497. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Goober 
Industries, 5539 Harold Way, Los 
Angeles CA 90028. Clare C. Downs, 
5539 Harold Way, Los Angeles CA 
90028. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Clare C. 
Downs, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/17/2020. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2020219102. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Hummingbird 
Academics, 45409 Thornwood Avenue, 
Lancaster CA 93534/PO Box 4423, 
Lancaster CA 93534. Enjoli Tatiana 
Cowan, 45409 Thornwood Avenue, 
Lancaster CA 93534. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
11/2020. Signed: Enjoli Tatiana Cowan, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 12/17/2020. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 12/26/2020, 01/02/2021, 
01/09/2021and 01/16/2021.

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF: 

JEAN K. BRUNICARDI 
AKA JEAN BRUNICARDI 
AKA JEAN KATHLEEN 

BRUNICARDI 
CASE NO. 20STPB10600 

To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interested 
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Brits in LA

FOR MANY of us, the 
initial response to the 
start of the Covid-19 
lockdown last spring 
was that we should 
use our extra free time 
productively. 	
	 After all, didn’t being 
stuck at home mean we 
could FINALLY learn to 
play the piano? 
	 Or learn to speak 
Italian? 
	 Or finally read the 
collected works of Charles 
Dickens? 
	 Or learn how to bake/
brew/cook Thai food and 
so on?
	 Living in America 
we seem to absorb 
the importance of 
productivity with the air 
we breathe. But, almost 
a year on, many of us 
are going the opposite 
way. Indeed one of the 
few benefits of this very 
trying time seems to be 
the dawning realization 
that less truly can be 
more. That we can use 
this (hopefully) once-in-
a-lifetime pandemic to 
slow down, to simplify, to 
pare down our needs and 

expectations and focus on 
what is truly important.

Stroll on
	 Living in the beautiful 
Golden State, many of us 
are lucky enough to have 
gorgeous hiking trails and 
stunning vistas within a 
short drive. So when we 
need to empty our minds, 
enjoy a contemplative 
stroll AND get some good 
cardio work in, we can 
simply drive (or bike) 
to the nearest trailhead. 
I’m lucky enough to live 
very close to the beach 
and so am able to just 
stroll down and enjoy 
doing nothing....apart 
from perhaps watching a 
sunset.
 Workouts can also be 
a little more relaxed. I 
used to be a regular at 
Gold’s Gym in Venice 
and several of the nearby 
yoga studios. But with 
everything now closed 
I’ve been forced (!) to 
get out on my bicycle 
and enjoy the bike trail 
that lines the beach. I 
can head north towards 
Malibu or south towards 

Redondo and the views 
and vibes are always 
superb. I can also enjoy 
socially distanced alfresco 
yoga and workouts 
from local providers 
including DMN8 (dmn8.
com) and Shefa Yoga 
(shefayogavenice.com). 
There are a myriad of 
other providers across 
Los Angeles that offer 
similar programs at parks 
or via zoom meetings. 
And once you’ve enjoyed 
a bit of downward facing 
dog amid the lengthening 
shadows as the sun 
sinks into the Pacific, the 
sweaty, noisy, hard-rock 
soundtracked world of 
your local gym doesn’t 
seem half so appealing. 
And unlike learning the 
piano, it NEVER feels like 
work.
	 As always the internet 
has sprouted a zillion 
solutions to our changed 
world, with meditation 
apps such as Calm, 
Headspace and Wake 
Up providing guidance 
and mindfulness. I use 
Calm every day with 
my morning coffee, 
although I’m also a fan of 
Headspace, founded by 
Venice-based Brit Andy 
Puddicombe, an author, 
public speaker and 
teacher of meditation and 
mindfulness.
	 Another enterprising 
Briton who is making hay 
out of the lockdown is Joe 
Wicks, better known as 
The Body Coach, whose 
YouTube fitness channel 
has exploded since the 
lockdown, earning him 
a worldwide following 
(and an MBE). Joe’s 
fitness method uses short 
intense High Intensity 
Interval Training (HIIT) 
workouts. Starting off by 
posting 15-second recipe 
videos on social media, 
Wicks grew his brand to 
become one of the most 
followed fitness accounts 
on the web. The great 
thing about Joe is that he 
does the workouts along 
with the viewers, and 
he’s about as far from an 
intimidating fitness god 
as you can imagine. He’s 
the first to let out moans 
of pain and exhaustion 
while he coaxes us along, 
giving us the vibe that 

we’re not working out 
with a drill instructor, but 
a mate who lives down 
the street.

Baked in
	 The point being of 
course that we can have 
as much simplicity (or as 
little) as we need. Apps 
might be a technological 
solution but they can still 
take us to a far less techy 
place. We don’t need a 
gym, we just need a smart 
phone and our own 
body weight. And if we 
want, we can just ditch 
the phone simply take 
out our bike and enjoy a 
sunset. Or even rely on 
a simple pair of trainers 
or hiking boots to do the 
same.
	 If you must improve 
yourself, why not learn 
an undemanding but 
valuable artisanal skill 
which you can enjoy for 

In praise of 
simplicity...

life. I would recommend 
YouTube for learning how 
to bake sourdough bread 
or delicious focaccia. 
As you hone your skills 
you’ll often find yourself 
with more than you need, 
and the gift of bread to 
your neighbors is not 
something they’ll quickly 
forget.
	 Some wise man once 
wrote  words to the effect 
of: every trial is a gift in 
disguise. And I certainly 
feel this is true of Covid-19. 
Personally speaking, 
being able to slow down, 
be thankful and simplify 
my life certainly feels 
like a gift. And I’m sure 
the best is yet to come 
– the gift of normal life 
returning, which for 
most of us will feel like 
something we should 
savor every day for a very 
long time indeed. Which 
means perhaps Covid-19 

will have forced us into a 
healthier mindset than we 
had before. How’s that for 
irony?
	 In closing I will share 
a simple parable I found 
online from an English 
priest extolling the virtues 
of simplicity. I hope it 
resonate with you.
	 A tourist stops at the 
home of the great Rabbi. 
Since the Rabbi has 
such a world-renowned 
reputation the visitor 
expects to see a great 
home filled with valuable 
treasures.; However, he 
is shocked when he sees 
a bare home with almost 
nothing in it. “Where are 
your possessions?” he 
asks in astonishment.
	 The Rabbi responds, 
“Where are yours?”
 “What kind of question 
is that?” the tourist 
responded. “I’m a visitor 

SIMPLE PLEASURES: a bike, the beach and a California sunset

LOCKDOWN: Instead of filling all those 
extra hours with endless productivity, Nick 
Stark recommends going back to basics 

and embracing a ‘less is more’ philosophy

YOU GO, JOE: Joe Wicks’s workouts are a lifesaver for many during lockdown

Photo: Nick Stark

Headspace: don’t just do something....sit there cont. on page 9, col 4
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2995 Thousand Oaks Blvd., Thousand Oaks. (parking in rear)
Open: Mon-Sat. 10.30-5.30 • Sun: 10-6 • Tel: (805) 495-4042

Teas • Candy • Pastries • Bangers • Meat Pies • 
Heinz Beans • China Teapots • Tea Cozies • Gifts

Now featuring delicious, traditional handmade pies and 
pasties from Deli-SA. Chicken curry pasties, Cornish 

pasties, Steak & Kidney...and much more

Quality Imports from the British Isles...

2009 Mini Cooper S Turbo For Sale

115,000 miles. Runs Great. New brakes, new tires. 
Bluetooth stereo. $7500 obo. Call now (310 699-7783

Brits in LA

CONGRATULATIONS are in order for Bernard Skibben (above), Brits in LA’s 
much-loved ‘Mayor of Breakfast’ who this week turned 93...and enjoyed a 
homemade birthday cake from another BiLA member, Marina Paganucci.

Raise your glasses and join the fun when Brits in LA Virtual Pub Quiz 
returns on Tuesday January 19,  with Sandro Monetti as your host.
	 The reigning champion is Robert Dimitri - pictured here with his dog Belle. 
Can you defeat him and win the top prize of a gift card to the Cat and Fiddle? 

SMILE, IT’S TRIVIA TIME!

here.”
 “I am too,” the Rabbi 
replied.
	 Long before Marie 

Kondo, the nineteenth 
century designer and 
supporter of the arts and 
crafts movement William 
Morris advocated, “Have 
nothing in your houses 
that you do not know to 
be useful, or believe to be 

beautiful.”[1] Or, as Henry 
Wadsworth Longfellow 
wrote, “In character, 
in manner, in style, in 
all things, the supreme 
excellence is simplicity.” 
	
- Nick Stark

Simplicity:
cont. from page 8

file:///C:/Users/George Clifford/Documents/Writing and Speaking/Ethical Musings/EM - Blog Postings 2020/In praise of simplicity.docx
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LEGAL NOTICES
in the WILL or estate, or both 
of JEAN K. BRUNICARDI AKA 
JEAN BRUNICARDI AKA JEAN 
KATHLEEN BRUNICARDI.
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has 
been filed by THOMAS TOMEONI 
in the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that THOMAS TOMEONI 
be appointed as personal 
representative to administer the 
estate of the decedent.
THE PETITION requests authority 
to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without 
obtaining court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required to 
give notice to interested persons 
unless they have waived notice or 
consented to the proposed action.) 
The independent administration 
authority will be granted unless an 
interested person files an objection 
to the petition and shows good 
cause why the court should not 
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the petition will 
be held in this court as follows: 
01/21/2021 at 8:30AM in Dept. 79 
located at 111 N. HILL ST., LOS 
ANGELES, CA 90012 
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear 
at the hearing and state your 
objections or file written objections 
with the court before the hearing. 
Your appearance may be in person 
or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with 
the court and mail a copy to the 
personal representative appointed 
by the court within the later of 
either (1) four months from the 
date of first issuance of letters to 
a general personal representative, 
as defined in section 58(b) of the 
California Probate Code, or (2) 60 
days from the date of mailing or 
personal delivery to you of a notice 
under section 9052 of the California 
Probate Code. 
Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as 
a creditor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file kept 
by the court. If you are a person 
interested in the estate, you may 
file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
JOSEPH E. MEISSNER - SBN 
313199, MONICA M. O’HEARN 
SBN 324533 
THE ALVAREZ FIRM
24005 VENTURA BLVD.
CALABASAS CA 91302
1/2, 1/9, 1/16/21

CNS-3427454#

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF: 
MARY D. CHANDLER AKA 

MARY CHANDLER 
CASE NO. 20STPB10561 

To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interested 
in the WILL or estate, or both of 
MARY D. CHANDLER AKA MARY 
CHANDLER.
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has 
been filed by CLAUDIA CHANDLER 
AND CELESTE CHANDLER in the 
Superior Court of California, County 
of LOS ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that CLAUDIA 
CHANDLER AND CELESTE 
CHANDLER be appointed as 
personal representative to 
administer the estate of the 
decedent.
THE PETITION requests the 
decedent’s WILL and codicils, if 

any, be admitted to probate. The 
WILL and any codicils are available 
for examination in the file kept by 
the court. 
THE PETITION requests authority 
to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without 
obtaining court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required to 
give notice to interested persons 
unless they have waived notice or 
consented to the proposed action.) 
The independent administration 
authority will be granted unless an 
interested person files an objection 
to the petition and shows good 
cause why the court should not 
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the petition will 
be held in this court as follows: 
01/21/21 at 8:30AM in Dept. 29 
located at 111 N. HILL ST., LOS 
ANGELES, CA 90012 
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear 
at the hearing and state your 
objections or file written objections 
with the court before the hearing. 
Your appearance may be in person 
or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with 
the court and mail a copy to the 
personal representative appointed 
by the court within the later of 
either (1) four months from the 
date of first issuance of letters to 
a general personal representative, 
as defined in section 58(b) of the 
California Probate Code, or (2) 60 
days from the date of mailing or 
personal delivery to you of a notice 
under section 9052 of the California 
Probate Code. 
Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as 
a creditor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file kept 
by the court. If you are a person 
interested in the estate, you may 
file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
TRUDI SCHINDLER - SBN 
185837, JIM WOJKOWSKI - SBN 
68055, SCHINDLER EYRICH, LLP/ 
WOJKOWSKI & MCNULTY, LLP
2215 COLBY AVENUE
LOS ANGELES CA 90064
1/2, 1/9, 1/16/21

CNS-3427774#

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
6230 Sylmar Avenue
Van Nuys CA 91401

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Stephanie C. Cardin, an adult 

over the age of 18 years.

Date: 02/01/21. Time: 8.30am, in 
Dept. A, Room 510

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of 
age: Stephanie C. Cardin. And 
a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the 
clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said 
petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from Stephanie C. 
Cardin to Stephanie C. Jourdan.
IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above 
entitled matter of change of names 
appear before the above entitled 
court to show cause why the 
petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant 
the petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: December 17, 2020.
Huey Cotton
Judge of the Superior Court
20VECP00433
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021.
 
Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020210842. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Sasha McQueen, 
Matin Soire, Boheme Moderne, 
Jaunteur, London Bleue, 4368 
Overland Ave, Culver City CA 
90230. Queendom Noir LLC, 
4368 Overland Ave, Culver City 
CA 90230. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Terra Black van Buren, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/09/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020211285. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Chronic Solution, 2149 
East 63rd Street, Long Beach CA 
90805. Olanrewaju Abiose, 2149 
East 63rd Street, Long Beach CA 
90805. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2020. 
Signed: Olanrewaju Abiose, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/09/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020214197. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Peninsula Janitorial 
Services, 2059 Artesia Blvd. 
Apartment #24, Torrance CA 90504. 
Jose Ceja Ochoa, 2059 Artesia 

Blvd. Apartment #24, Torrance CA 
90504. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2020. 
Signed: Jose Ceja Ochoa, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/11/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020216709. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Hogan Wealth 
Partners; Genx Wealth Builders, 
1590 Rosecrans Ave. D-166, 
Manhattan Beach CA 90266. 
Hogan Events Group LLC, 1590 
Rosecrans Ave. D-166, Manhattan 
Beach CA 90266. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Monique Hogan, Managing 
Member. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/15/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020216791. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Laelia, 1213 S Meyler, 
San Pedro CA 90731/11710 
209th St, Lakewood CA 90715. 
Jessica Mendoza, 11710 209th 
St, Lakewood CA 90715. This 
business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2020. 
Signed: Jessica Mendoza, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/15/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020216964. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Gemini Realty, 2014 
Chilton Dr, Glendale CA 91201. 
Keshishi Corp, 2014 Chilton Dr, 
Glendale CA 91201. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 

The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Gemin 
Keshishi, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/16/2020. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020216969. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Sunrise Landscape, 
Alfredo Rodarte, O R Sunrise 
Landscape, 12000 Foothill Bl 122, 
Sylmar CA 91342. O R Investors Inc, 
12000 Foothill Bl 122, Sylmar CA 
91342. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 01/2000. 
Signed: Alfredo Rodarte, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/16/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020217648. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Landpac Realty; 
Landpac Properties, 987 S. 
Vermont Ave. Ste H, Los Angeles 
CA 90006. Robert Sang Lee, 
982 S. New Hampshire Ave., 
Ste 100, Los Angeles CA 90006. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2010. 
Signed: Robert Sang Lee, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/16/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020217650. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Welcomm Realty; 
Landpac Properties, HBL Property 
Management, 987 S. Vermont Ave. 
Ste H, Los Angeles CA 90006/982 
S. New Hampshire Ave., Ste 100, 
Los Angeles CA 90006. Robert 
Sang Lee, 982 S. New Hampshire 
Ave., Ste 100, Los Angeles CA 

90006. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Robert Sang Lee, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/16/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020217737. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Angels Crest Capital, 
3628 Fairesta Street, Glendale 
CA 91214. Cameron Barsanti, 
3628 Fairesta Street, Glendale CA 
91214. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 12/2020. 
Signed: Cameron Barsanti, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/16/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020217794. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Anna Kafka, 5200 
Clark Avenue #1188, Lakewood 
CA 90714. AK Psychological 
Services, Inc, 5200 Clark Avenue 
#1188, Lakewood CA 90714. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2020. 
Signed: Anna Belisa Kafka, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/16/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020217796. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Sky Limit Energy, 606 
Hermosa Vista St, Monterey Park 
CA 91754. Sky Limit Venture Corp, 
606 Hermosa Vista St, Monterey 
Park CA 91754. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
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listed herein on: 11/2020. Signed: 
Marksiane Senelath, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/16/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020217814. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: La Fame Boutique, 
1101 Ocean Front Walk, Venice 
CA 90291/16030 Ventura Blvd., 
Suite 430, Encino CA 91436. 
Trio Venice LLC, 8 Brooks Ave., 
Suite D, Venice CA 90291. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2020. 
Signed: Idan Azoulay, Managing 
Member. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/16/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020218663. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Bee And Associates, 
2647 S Cloveradale Ave Apt 2, 
Los Angeles CA 90016. Bee 
and Associates, LLC, 2647 S 
Cloverdale Ave Apt 2, Los Angeles 
CA 90016. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Brenda Chicas, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/17/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020219912. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: 3T Enterprises, 278 
N Holliston Ave Apt A, Pasadena 
CA 91106. Krysta Charlene 
Gonzales, 278 N Holliston Ave 
Apt A, Pasadena CA 91106. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 

Signed: Krysta Charlene Gonzales, 
President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/18/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020220453. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Rakkan; Rakkan 
Ramen, 5242 East 2nd Street, Long 
Beach CA 90803. Rakkan USA 
Long Beach, LLC, 5242 East 2nd 
Street, Long Beach CA 90803. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Ryohei Ito, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/18/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020220638. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: RA Consulting; 
RA Consulting Services, 29890 
Cashmere Place, Castaic CA 
91384/PO Box 220844, Newhall 
CA 91321. Rodney Shreckengost, 
29890 Cashmere Place, Castaic CA 
91384. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2009. 
Signed: Rodney Shreckengost, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/18/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020220911. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Rizzo Design Inc., 
Rizzo Production Design Inc., 466 
Foothill Blvd #392, La Canada CA 
91011. Rizzo Production Design 
Inc., 466 Foothill Blvd #392, La 
Canada CA 91011. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 03/2010. 
Signed: Marc Louis Rizzo, CEO. 

Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/18/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020221386. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Taipei Inn, 127 S 
Chandler Ave, Monterey Park CA 
91755. Chaw-Wu Chou, 127 S 
Chandler Ave, Monterey Park CA 
91755; Mei Chiang Chou, 127 S 
Chandler Ave, Monterey Park CA 
91755. This business is conducted 
by: a general partnership. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Chaw-
Wu Chou, partner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/21/2020. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020222410. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Mr. Dental Café, 19216 
Hamlin Street Unit 9, Reseda CA 
91335. Mersedeh Rajinia, 19216 
Hamlin Street Unit 9, Reseda CA 
91335. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 12/2020. 
Signed: Mersedeh Rajinia, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/22/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020222880. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: JMT Properties, 
120 W Beverly Blvd, Montebello 
CA 90640. John P. Thropay, 120 
W Beverly Blvd, Montebello CA 
90640; Maricela Thropay, 120 W 
Beverly Blvd, Montebello CA 90640. 
This business is conducted by: a 
married couple. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: John P. Thropay, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 

information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/22/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020225610. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Amanda Baron 
Coaching, 601 Arena Street, El 
Segundo CA 90245. Amanda 
Louise Baron, 601 Arena Street, El 
Segundo CA 90245. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Amanda Louise Baron, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/28/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/02/2021, 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021 and 01/23/2021. 

NOTICE OF AMENDED 
PETITION TO ADMINISTER 
ESTATE OF DOROTHY L. 

GREEN
Case No. 20STPB05810

	 To all heirs, beneficiaries, credi-
tors, contingent creditors, and per-
sons who may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate, or both, 
of DOROTHY L. GREEN
	 AN AMENDED PETITION FOR 
PROBATE has been filed by Rob-
ert A. Green and Matthew E. Green 
in the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
	 THE AMENDED PETITION FOR 
PROBATE requests that Randal 
Neal Cohen be appointed as per-
sonal representative to administer 
the estate of the decedent.
	 THE AMENDED PETITION re-
quests the decedent’s lost will and 
codicils, if any, be admitted to pro-
bate. Copies of the lost will and any 
codicils are available for examina-
tion in the file kept by the court.
	 THE AMENDED PETITION re-
quests authority to administer the 
estate under the Independent Ad-
ministration of Estates Act. (This 
authority will allow the personal 
representative to take many actions 
without obtaining court approval. 
Before taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal rep-
resentative will be required to give 
notice to interested persons unless 
they have waived notice or consent-
ed to the proposed action.) The in-
dependent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the amended pe-
tition will be held on Feb. 16, 2021 
at 9:30 AM in Dept. No. 2D located 
at 111 N. Hill St., Los Angeles, CA 
90012.
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-

tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and le-
gal authority may affect your rights 
as a creditor. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney knowledgeable 
in California law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a per-
son interested in the estate, you 
may file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.

Attorney for petitioner:
MATTHEW E GREEN ESQ

SBN 140301
WARRINER GREEN RILEY &

ASSOCIATES LLP
10940 WILSHIRE BLVD

STE 1600
LOS ANGELES CA 90024

CN973283 GREEN Jan 9,16,23, 
2021

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF: 

EDWARD CARTER NELSON 
AKA EDWARD C. NELSON 

AKA EDWARD NELSON 
CASE NO. 20STPB10727 

To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interested 
in the WILL or estate, or both of 
EDWARD CARTER NELSON 
AKA EDWARD C. NELSON AKA 
EDWARD NELSON.
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has 
been filed by TERI NELSON in the 
Superior Court of California, County 
of LOS ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that TERI NELSON 
be appointed as personal 
representative to administer the 
estate of the decedent.
THE PETITION requests authority 
to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without 
obtaining court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required to 
give notice to interested persons 
unless they have waived notice or 
consented to the proposed action.) 
The independent administration 
authority will be granted unless an 
interested person files an objection 
to the petition and shows good 
cause why the court should not 
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the petition will 
be held in this court as follows: 
02/10/21 at 8:30AM in Dept. 79 
located at 111 N. HILL ST., LOS 
ANGELES, CA 90012 
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear 
at the hearing and state your 
objections or file written objections 
with the court before the hearing. 
Your appearance may be in person 
or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with 
the court and mail a copy to the 
personal representative appointed 
by the court within the later of 
either (1) four months from the 
date of first issuance of letters to 
a general personal representative, 

as defined in section 58(b) of the 
California Probate Code, or (2) 60 
days from the date of mailing or 
personal delivery to you of a notice 
under section 9052 of the California 
Probate Code. 
Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as 
a creditor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file kept 
by the court. If you are a person 
interested in the estate, you may 
file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
J JOHNSON - SBN 101774
CORI B. JONES - SBN 261018 
J JOHNSON LAW OFFICE, INC.
17011 BEACH BLVD., SUITE 900
HUNTINGTON BEACH CA 92746
BSC 219240
1/9, 1/16, 1/23/21

CNS-3430063#

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Arthur Segovia, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

Date: 02/05/21. Time: 8.30am, in 
Dept. K, room A203

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Arthur Segovia. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Arthur 
Segovia to Heavy Segovia.
IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above 
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above 
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: November 17, 2020.
Hon Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
20SMCP00403
Published: 01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021. 

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

9425 Penfield Ave.
Chatsworth CA 91311

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Kristen Joy Kim, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

Date: 03/03/21. Time: 8.30am, in 
Dept. F49

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 

LEGAL NOTICES
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Kristen Joy Kim. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Kristen 
Joy Kim to Cielle Joy Kim.
IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above 
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above 
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: December 30, 2020.
David B. Gelfound
Judge of the Superior Court
20CHCP00373
Published: 01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020214120. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Goal Model Physical 
Therapy, 2345 Kansas Ave Apt 
14, Santa Monica CA 90404. 
Megan Mitchell, 2345 Kansas Ave 
Apt 14, Santa Monica CA 90404. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Megan Mitchell, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/11/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020214225. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Matt Aprea Music, 
7950 W Sunset Blvd No 214, Los 
Angeles CA 90046. Matt Aprea 
Homes, 7950 W Sunset Blvd 
No 214, Los Angeles CA 90046. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2020. 
Signed: Matt Aprea, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/11/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 

Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020219174. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Saponi Star 
Productions, 5924 S La Cienega 
Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90056. 
Jeneen Robinson, 5924 S La 
Cienega Blvd, Los Angeles CA 
90056. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 02/2015. 
Signed: Jeneen Robinson, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/17/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2020220053. Current 
file: 2019330650. The following 
person has abandoned the use of 
the fictitious business name: LA 
Medical Transport, 801 Vandal 
Way, Palmdale CA 93551. MIL 
Artistry LLC, 801 Vandal Way, 
Palmdale CA 93551. The fictitious 
business name referred to above 
was filed on: 12/27/2019, in the 
County of Los Angeles. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. Signed: Michelle 
Iris Pyland, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
12/18/2020. Published: 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021 and 
01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020220166. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: LA Medical Transport, 
801 Vandal Way, Palmdale CA 
93551, Aureum Group, LLC, 
801 Vandal Way, Palmdale CA 
93551. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2019. Signed: 
Kris Pyland, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/18/2020. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021 and 
01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020221185. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Renai Global, 
Finance and Insurance Solutions, 
18938 Labin Ct Ste A203, 
Rowland Heights CA 91748/14176 

Coldbrook Circ, Eastvale CA 
92880. Renai International Holding 
Group Inc., 14176 Coldbrook Circ, 
Eastvale CA 92880. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Rose 
R Xing, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/21/2020. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021 and 
01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020222422. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Vision Roofing, 5776 
Lindero Canyon Rd., Suite D-308, 
Westlake Village CA 91362. Be 
Innovative Roofing & Remodeling, 
Inc., 5776 Lindero Canyon Rd., 
Suite D-308, Westlake Village 
CA 91362. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Ben Elbaz, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/22/2020. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021 and 
01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020222520. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Arculus, Pacific 
Weights and Fitness, 3033 Via 
Borica, Palos Verdes Estates 
CA 90274. Tercio LLC, 3033 Via 
Borica, Palos Verdes Estates CA 
90274. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Paul Edward Vidal Jr, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/22/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021 and 
01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020222541. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Orange County 
Nannies, 14831 Hart Street, Van 
Nuys CA 91405. The Poppyfields 
Company, LLC, 14831 Hart Street, 
Van Nuys CA 91405. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Daniel R Butcher, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/22/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021 and 
01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020222891. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Fusion Motor 
Company; Fusion Luxury Motors, 
Fusion Motor Sports, 20837 
Nordhoff St, Chatsworth CA 
91311. Lucky 8 Motors LLC, 20550 
Nordhoff Street, Chatsworth CA 
91311. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 01/2016. 
Signed: Yoel Wazana, Manager. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/22/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021 and 
01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020223114. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Soleil Nails, 8528 
W Pico Blvd, Los Angeles CA 
90035/P.O. Box 10383, Beverly 
Hills CA 90213. Claire LA, 145 
N. Hamilton Dr., #1, Beverly 
Hills CA 90211. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 10/2020. Signed: 
Claire La, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/22/2020. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business 

name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020223166. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: LBF, 23663 Park 
Capri, Unit 105, Calabasas CA 
91302. LOSTBOYZFARMS, 
LLC, 23663 Park Capri, Unit 
105, Calabasas CA 91302. This 
business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Paul 
Gilbert, Member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/22/2020. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020223685. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Two Big Dogs; Two 
Big Dogs BBQ, Outside Table, 
517 14th Street, Santa Monica 
CA 90402/2203 Midvale Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90064. TBD Industries 
LLC, 517 14th Street, Santa 
Monica CA 90402. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Kenneth Wimer, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/22/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020224257. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Grace Bookkeeping, 
519 N Lucia Ave Unit B, Redondo 
Beach CA 90277. Grace Im, 519 
N Lucia Ave Unit B, Redondo 
Beach CA 90277. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Grace Im, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/23/2020. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 

it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020225515. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Funvise, 18960 
Ventura Blvd. Suite 461, Tarzana 
CA 91356. Vi Tuong Dinh, 18960 
Ventura Blvd. Suite 461, Tarzana 
CA 91356. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Vi 
Tuong Dinh, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/28/2020. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020225761. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Urban Woodshop, 
720 Palm Drive, Glendale CA 
91202. VMW Inc., 720 Palm Drive, 
Glendale CA 91202. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Vahe Menedjian, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/28/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020226055. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: El Segundo Arts 
Academy, 850 Main St #L, El 
Segundo CA 90245. Jose Eboli, 
850 Main St #L, El Segundo 
CA 90245. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Jose Eboli, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
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County on: 12/29/2020. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021 and 
01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020226069. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Wish Home, 370 
South Lemon Avenue, Walnut 
CA 91789. Shiao Win Lai, 370 
South Lemon Avenue, Walnut 
CA 91789. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under 
the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 
12/2020. Signed: Shiao Win 
Lai, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information 
in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/29/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020226914. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Golden 
Nuggets Financial Services, 
4371 Crenshaw Blvd, Los 
Angeles CA 90008/PO Box 
3043, Victorville CA 92393. 
Herman Laws, 16395 Cabrillo 
Drive, Victorville CA 92395. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Herman 
Laws, Manager. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information 
in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 12/30/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/09/2021, 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021 and 01/30/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020227348. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 

business as: Trea Lighting, 
464 S. Ogden Dr, Los Angeles 
CA 90036. Nirvana Ahyan, 
464 S. Ogden Dr, Los Angeles 
CA 90036. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under 
the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Nirvana Ahyan, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 
12/31/2020. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, 
state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/09/2021, 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021 and 
01/30/2021.  

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Larry Keith McWilliams Jr., an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

Date: 03/05/21. Time: 8.30am, in 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Larry Keith McWilliams Jr. And 
a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Larry Keith McWilliams Jr to 
Larry Keith Legend.
IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above 
entitled matter of change of names 
appear before the above entitled 
court to show cause why the petition 
for change of name(s) should not 
be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: December 14, 2020.
Judge Mark Young
Judge of the Superior Court
20SMCP00439
Published: 01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021. 

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020219042. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Kenter Home; 
Kenter Home Goods, Kenter, 
15233 Ventura Blvd Suite 552, 
Sherman Oaks CA 91403/5808 
Lemona Ave, Sherman Oaks 

CA 91411. Atrix Retail Group, 
Inc., 15233 Ventura Blvd Suite 
552, Sherman Oaks CA 91403. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein 
on: 12/2020. Signed: David 
J Heavenridge, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 
12/17/2020. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021, 01/30/2021 and 
02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020221047. 
The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: 
Loose Akoostix Music, 5551 
Hollywood Blvd #1169, 
Hollywood CA 90028. Timothy 
Martin, 5551 Hollywood Blvd 
#1169, Hollywood CA 90028. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2004. Signed: Timothy 
Martin, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/21/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020221547. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Fisher Fabrication 
House, 24831 Winlock Dr., 
Torrance CA 90505. Fisher Fab 
Enterprises Inc:, 24831 Winlock 
Dr., Torrance CA 90505. This 
business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
09/2020. Signed: Josh Fisher, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/21/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 

from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020222087. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Brand 
Acupuncture, 9209 Colima Road 
Suite 3000, Whittier CA 90605. 
Jonathan Matthew Brand, 11017 
Clare Street, Whittier CA 90601. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein 
on: 10/2019. Signed: Jonathan 
Matthew Brand, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 
12/21/2020. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021, 01/30/2021 and 
02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020222823. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: The Space, 
8157 Santa Monica Blvd, West 
Hollywood CA 90046. Scene 
Space LLC, 5910 W Sunset Blvd, 
Los Angeles CA 90028-6505. 
This business is conducted by: 
a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under 
the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Phraewa 
Chuwattanakul, Member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 
12/22/2020. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021, 01/30/2021 and 
02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 

Statement: 2020224598. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Big Al’s 
Sandwiches, Soup & Salads, 
7502 Crenshaw Blvd, Los 
Angeles CA 90043/2714 Andreo 
Ave, Torrance CA 90501. Allan 
C Marshall, 2714 Andreo Ave, 
Torrance CA 90501; Esperance 
Marshall, 2714 Andreo Ave, 
Torrance CA 90501. This 
business is conducted by: 
a general partnership. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 01/2020. 
Signed: Allan C Marshall, 
General Partner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/23/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020224999. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Santa 
Monica Tax Associates; Santa 
Monica Tax & Financial 
Associates, 12017 Ayres Ave R, 
Los Angeles CA 90064/PO Box 
18091, Los Angeles CA 90018. 
Cesar Maldonado, 12017 Ayres 
Ave R, Los Angeles CA 90064. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Cesar Maldonado, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/24/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020225894. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: CM Advisor, 
274 S. La Fayette Park Pl. 
Apt#331, Los Angeles CA 
90057. Changseong Im, 274 S. 
La Fayette Park Pl. Apt#331, 
Los Angeles CA 90057. This 
business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 

under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Changseong Im, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/29/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020226222. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Central 
Courier & Hospitality Services, 
12026 Wilshire Blvd. #304, Los 
Angeles CA 90025. CE&J, Inc., 
12026 Wilshire Blvd. #304, 
Los Angeles CA 90025. This 
business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein 
on: 01/2015. Signed: Cynthia 
Domingos, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/29/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2020226303. The 
following person(s) is/
are doing business as: NAS 
Consultant, Pivot24, 5624 
Magnolia Ave, Whittier CA 
90601. Nazier Ahmed Sharif, 
5624 Magnolia Ave, Whittier 
CA 90601. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Nazier Ahmed Sharif, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 12/29/2020. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
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authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021000043. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Cubic 
Root, 28011 Ridgebrook Ct., 
Rancho Palos Verdes CA 90275. 
Masayoshi Kirihara, 28011 
Ridgebrook Ct., Rancho Palos 
Verdes CA 90275. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 01/2014. 
Signed: Masayoshi Kirihara, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/04/2021. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021000179. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: DMG 
Consultants & Management, 
103 Glengrove Ave, Glendora 
CA 91741. David M Gouzy, 
103 Glengrove Ave, Glendora 
CA 91741. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: David M Gouzy, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 
01/04/2021. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021, 01/30/2021 and 
02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021000469. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: One Hour 
Taxes; One Hour Tax Services, 

15850 Main Street, La Puente 
CA 91744. Darlene Sharif, 1138 
Egan Ave, La Puente CA 91744. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Darlene Sharif, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/04/2021. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021000633. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Kids Art 
Center, 100 S Mentor Ave, 
Pasadena CA 91106. Ai Plus 
Studio, 100 S Mentor Ave, 
Pasadena CA 91106. This 
business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Xiaoxia 
Li, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/04/2021. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021000718. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Hollywood 
Lash and Cosmetics; Rock Glam 
Cosmetics, 2373 Westwood 
Blvd Floor 2, Westwood CA 
90064/3450 Sawtelle Blvd 
#330, Los Angeles CA 90066. 
Glam Sweet Cosmetics LLC, 
2373 Westwood Blvd Floor 
2, Westwood CA 90064. This 
business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Natasha Thompson 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 

This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/04/2021. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021000845. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Undertow 
Consulting, 4044 Miraleste 
Drive, Rancho Palos Verdes 
CA 90275. John Boehle, 4044 
Miraleste Drive, Rancho Palos 
Verdes CA 90275. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: John Boehle, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 
01/04/2021. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021, 01/30/2021 and 
02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021001139. The 
following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Sexy 
Sparkles, 8747 Shirley Ave, 
Northridge CA 91234. Glam 
Air, Inc., 8747 Shirley Ave, 
Northridge CA 91234. This 
business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
02/2016. Signed: Yossi Kedar, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/05/2021. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 

01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021001161. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Global Entry 
Recordings; Global Entry Radio, 
Charming Elephant, Galestian, 
Galestian Music, Global Entry, 
Global Entry Music, Global 
Entry With Galestian, Nomadic 
Music Producers, Nomadic 
Producers,  314 E. Glenoaks 
Blvd., Glendale CA 91207. 
Arthur Galestian, 4017 Liberty 
Ave. La Crescenta CA 91214. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Arthur Galestian, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/05/2021. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021001694. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Witness 
Coffee Roasters, 353 S Topanga 
Blvd, Topanga CA 90290. 
Bozant Atherton Katzakian, 
353 S Topanga Blvd, Topanga 
CA 90290. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under 
the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 
12/2020. Signed: Bozant 
Atherton Katzakian, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 
01/05/2021. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 01/16/2021, 
01/23/2021, 01/30/2021 and 
02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021003510. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Arcadia 
Business Services; Arcadia 
Healthcare Broker, 428 W 

Huntington Dr. Unit 2, Arcadia 
CA 91007 . Erica Fung, 428 W 
Huntington Dr. Unit 2, Arcadia 
CA 91007. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under 
the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 
12/2020. Signed: Erica Fung, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/06/2021. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021003914. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: California 
Living, 1714 East Chevy Chase 
Drive, Unit F, Glendale CA 
91206. California Designs For 
Living, Inc., 1714 East Chevy 
Chase Drive, Unit F, Glendale 
CA 91206. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under 
the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Keith Andrew 
Hackman, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/06/2021. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021004226. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Work Repair 
Services, 18547 Saticoy St. #7, 
Reseda CA 91335. Wade Kelly 
Work, 18547 Saticoy St. #7, 
Reseda CA 91335. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 07/2020. 
Signed: Wade Kelly Work, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/07/2021. 

NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021006558. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Purified 
Cleaning, 26916 Flo Ln, Unit 
447, Canyon Country CA 91351. 
Kyle Reinoso, 26916 Flo Ln, Unit 
447, Canyon Country CA 91351. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
12/2020. Signed: Kyle Reinoso, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/11/2021. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2021006560. The 
following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Our Nature 
Babies, 111 W.7th St., Unit 302, 
Los Angeles CA 90014. Hu$tle 
& Flo LLC, 111 W.7th St., Unit 
302, Los Angeles CA 90014. 
This business is conducted by: 
a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under 
the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 
12/2020. Signed: Lakeisha 
Allen, Manager. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 01/11/2021. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
01/16/2021, 01/23/2021, 
01/30/2021 and 02/06/2021. 
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hand, they are in a great 
position to launch their 
second-half push.
	 Yet this was a contest 
that his pitchside 
demeanour suggested he 
knew should have been 
out of sight before the 
hour mark after Foden’s 
eighth goal of the season 

CITY:
cont. from back page

had given City the perfect 
platform.
	 Brighton came into this 
game three points above 
the relegation zone and 
without a win in eight 
games. But they have 
picked up five draws on 
the way, suggesting they 
are not short of heart. 
	 Yet teams need more 
to beat City than a decent 
team spirit.
	 Since Brighton’s last 
win on November 21, 
Guardiola’s side are 
unbeaten in 14 matches in 
all competitions.
	 There were flashes 
of decent play for the 
visitors, including a 
belated full debut for 
Percy Tau, two-and-a-half 
years after signing for the 
club.
	 But while they look 
good enough to resist the 
pull of relegation, Potter’s 
men found their moves 
breaking down when 
opportunity knocked.
	 City had no such 
problems, wih Kevin De 
Bruyne at the heart of 
most of City’s positive 
moments.
	 It was no surprise he 
had a big hand in the goal, 
receiving a ball from Ilkay 
Gundogan on the left 
flank and moving it into 
Foden’s path on the left 

corner of the box.
	 The 20-year-old took 
one touch before guiding 
it inside Sanchez’s near 
post for his fourth league 
goal of the campaign, one 
celebrated by at least nine 
team-mates.
	 City came out of the 
blocks hard in the second 
half, looking for a second 
to put the game to bed. 
But they found Sanchez 
in a stubborn mood and 
at times brilliant form 
between the sticks. 
Riyad Mahrez, Joao 
Cancelo and Gundogan 
were all denied, while 
Bernardo Silva struck the 
angle of post and bar.
	 City nearly rued those 
missed chances and 
with Potter bringing on 
Neal Maupay and Solly 
March after the hour, the 
tide turned markedly in 
Brighton’s favour.
	 With Guardiola 
becoming increasingly 
agitated on the sidelines, 
Maupay almost got clean 
through on goal, only for 
John Stones to produce 
a wonderfully-timed 
saving tackle on the edge 
of the penalty area.
	 City weathered the 
storm, just, and when 
Lewis Dunk sold Sanchez 
short with a back- header 
and De Bruyne pounced 
to be brought down in 
the area with a couple of 
minutes to go, Sterling 
had the chance to seal it 
from the spot.
	 But De Bruyne did 
not take it himself and 
Sterling promptly blazed 
it wildly over the bar. 

Mesut Ozil is willing to 
leave some money on the 
table to secure a move 
away from Arsenal in the 
January transfer window 
and resume his football 
career elsewhere, it 
emerged this week.
	 Ozil (right) is scheduled 
to earn around £7 million 
between now and the 
end of his contract in 
June, but negotiations 
are taking place between 
the club and the player’s 
camp about an early 

termination.
	 If a compromise is 
not found, the 32-year-
old former Germany 
international will stay at 

Arsenal for the final five 
months of his deal and 
continue training with the 
first team as he has done 
hitherto. 

Ozil heading 
for Arsenal 
exit door
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PAUL POGBA fired 
Manchester United to the 
top of the Premier League 
Tuesday night to set up a 
blockbuster showdown 
against rivals Liverpool 
on Sunday.
	 United moved three 
points clear at the summit 
after Pogba’s second-half 
strike secured victory over 
Burnley.
	 Luke Shaw and Clarets 
midfielder Robbie Brady 
both escaped red cards 
after a long VAR check 
before Harry Maguire had 
a first-half header ruled 
out.
	 But an inspired Pogba 
volleyed home United’s 
71st-minute winner from 
Marcus Rashford’s cross.
	 It was a win which 
allowed Manchester 
United to take temporary 
bragging rights along the 
East Lancs Road when 
they visit Anfield on 
Sunday.
	 But Ole Gunnar 
Solskjaer will know that 
it is the bigger picture and 
three more points towards 
their title challenge that 
matters.
	 Paul Pogba’s moment 
of quality was just reward 
for a display of dominance 
and determination.
	 But it was the fact they 
managed to finally break 
down a stubborn Clarets 
that will please the United 
boss the most. This was the 

first time since September 
2017 that United have 
topped the table.
	 Yet perhaps more 
tellingly not since 
December 2012 and the 
final season of Sir Alex 
Ferguson have they led 
this deep into the season.
	 They also extended 
an unbeaten run away 
from home in the Premier 
League which stretches 
back to last January. 
Whether that can translate 
into a more permanent 
stay in the face of renewed 
challenges from Liverpool 
and neighbours City 
remains to be seen.
	 But these were 
promising steps forward.
	 Pogba was superb, 
as was Nemanja Matic 
alongside him at the 
base of midfield. The 
pair pulled the strings, 
the France international 
adding moments of real 
quality both before and 
after his winner.
	 But there were also 
good signs in the defence 
with Luke Shaw and 
Eric Bailly again good – 
with the former excellent 
forward and backwards.
	 There was no doubting 
the desire from the visitors 
against a Burnley side 
happy to play on the 
counter.
	 But in Burnley they 
came up against a solid 
counterattacking unit 

TOP POG!
Midfielder fires United to No1 spot ahead of Anfield showdown

who made things difficult. 
Bruno Fernandes put a 
side-footer too close to 
Nick Pope after a quarter 
of an hour and Anthony 
Martial had an overhead 
kick blocked at source by 
the back of Matt Lowton.
	 Just after the half 
hour Shaw was booked 
after a prolonged VAR 
intervention ruled his 
challenge on Johann 
Gudmundsson was worth 
a yellow card.
	 It was complicated by 
the fact his challenge had 
led indirectly to a United 
attack which saw Robbie 
Brady foul Edinson 
Cavani on the edge of the 
box, the visitors seeing a 
possible free-kick and red 
card turn into a caution 
for their own man. If they 
were hacked off with 
that, they were even more 
aggrieved when Harry 

Maguire got on the end 
of Shaw’s cross, heading 
the ball back across keeper 
Pope and in only to be 
ruled to have nudged a 
hand in the back of Erik 
Pieters as he jumped.
	 United were the the 
better side with Matic 
pulling the strings in 
midfield and they had 
one more chance before 
the break, Martial denied 
by Pope who pushed a 
curling effort over the 
angle.
	 And they came out 
firing at the start of the 
second half looking to 
make it grim for Burnley 
boss Sean Dyche, above.
	 Where at times in the 
opening period they were 
slow to move the ball on, 
United upped the pace of 
their passing.
	 Pogba initiated a swift 
move, receiving his keeper 

David De Gea’s long 
throw brilliantly and 
getting the ball through 
Fernandes to Martial on 
the left side.
	 His square ball was not 
met cleanly enough by 
Cavani in the middle and 
was to no avail.
	 It was the Frenchman 
who finally found a way 
through, hammering 
Rashford’s centre 
past Pope, via a slight 
deflection off Lowton, 
with 19 minutes to go.
	 Burnley battled to the 
end, but United were 
tops. 

POGBA: the difference maker for United

PHIL FODEN fired 
Manchester City to 
within touching distance 
of the top on Wednesday 
with a strike that 
stretched their unbeaten 
run to seven games.
	 But a wasteful display 
capped by a missed 
penalty by Raheem 
Sterling late in the game 
against a stubborn 
Brighton also stretched 

their manager’s patience.
	 Yet at the end of a match 
in which City found 
Seagulls goalkeeper 
Robert Sanchez in fine 
form and Graham Potter’s 
men refusing to accept 
their fate, Guardiola was 
all smiles.
	 With his side four 
points behind Manchester 
United, with a game in 

Sluggish City fired up by Foden
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