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The next PM: who are the contenders? - page 3

Boris Johnson has resigned as 
Conservative leader and blamed 
the “herd instinct” of Tory MPs for 
pushing him out of office, after a 
series of cabinet ministers told him 
he had lost the support of the party.

BYE BYE BORIS!
n Boris Johnson resigns as Conservative leader after cabinet revolt

n  PM succumbs to pressure to quit but pledges to stay on until successor is chosen

	 In a statement outside 
Downing Street on 
Thursday, Johnson 
acknowledged that 
“no one is remotely 
i n d i s p e n s a b l e ” 
and accepted that 
it was the “will of 
the parliamentary 
Conservative party” that 
he should leave No 10.
	 But he also signalled 
his intention to stay 
on as prime minister 
while the party picks his 
successor, potentially 
until autumn, triggering 
an immediate backlash 
among Tory MPs.

standoff
	 The statement 
brings an end to an 
extraordinary standoff 
between Johnson and 
cabinet ministers, 
including his new 
chancellor, Nadhim 
Zahawi, who were 
urging him to quit amid 
anger over the  Chris 
Pincher affair  and other 
scandals.

	 Joined by his wife, 
Carrie, and a number of 
Tory supporters, Johnson 
said he was “sad to be 
giving up the best job in 
the world” and claimed 
it was “eccentric” to 
change governments at 
this stage. “I regret not 
to have been successful 
in those arguments,” he 
said.
	 “When the herd 
moves, it moves,” he 
said, in a reference to 
the cabinet and MPs 
moving against him, 
while paying tribute to 
the “brilliant Darwinian 
system” that caused his 
downfall. “Them’s the 
breaks,” he added. The 
prime minister said he 
had “appointed a cabinet 
to serve, as I will, until a 
new leader is in place”, 
pointing to a sense of 
duty and obligation to 
the public.
	 His resignation will 
kick off a leadership 
contest over the coming 
months, in which Rishi 

Sunak, Ben Wallace, Liz 
Truss, Sajid Javid, Penny 
Mordaunt, Jeremy Hunt, 
Tom Tugendhat, Suella 
Braverman among many 
others are likely to stand 
to become the prime 
minister.

no confidence
	 However, senior 
Conservative MPs are 
pushing back against the 
idea that Johnson should 
be allowed to stay in 
office for any longer and 
want to see an interim 
leader in place, such as 
Dominic Raab. Labour 
also said it would force 
a confidence vote on the 

prime minister unless he 
stepped down from No 
10 in short order.
	 Support drained 
away from Johnson as 
more than 50 ministers 
and government aides 
resigned in a rolling 
walkout, while a slew 
of once supportive 
backbenchers declared 
no confidence in his 
leadership.
	 The revolt began on 
Tuesday evening with 
the resignations of  Sajid 
Javid and Rishi Sunak as 
health secretary and 
chancellor respectively.
	 Johnson faced the 
prospect of a second 

vote of no confidence as 
soon as next week, with 
elections to the executive 
of the backbench 1922 
committee due to be held 
on Monday and likely to 
result in a change to the 
rules.
	 His exit follows 
three years of scandals, 
including fury over his 
handling of harassment 
allegations against 
Pincher, the deputy 
chief whip; a police fine 
over lockdown parties 
in Downing Street, 
attempts to  change the 
standards system, and 
accusations of  breaking 
international law.

	 Johnson became prime 
minister in 2019, taking 
over from Theresa May 
with a promise to “get 
Brexit done”. After 
winning an 80-seat 
majority in a general 
election in December 
2019, and taking the UK 
out of the EU, the prime 
minister had  his eye on 
multiple terms in No 10.
	 However, his 
leadership toppled 
under a wave of 
sleaze allegations and 
failure to tell the truth, 
contributing to the 
resignation of two of his 
ethics advisers, Sir Alex 
Allan and Lord Geidt.

THE NARCISSIST IN NO.10: Johnson’s goodbye speech contained not one iota of regret or apology 
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cont. on page 4, col. 1

ONE OF THE final 
nails in the political 
coffin of Boris Johnson 
was the withering 
verdict delivered by 
Sajid Javid who told 
the House he could not 
“risk my integrity” by 
continuing to defend 
the government, telling 
Johnson “enough is 
enough”.
	 MPs, including Mr 
Johnson, listened in 
silence as he set out the 
reasons for his resignation 
as health secretary on 
Tuesday.
	 He said he could not 
go on giving Number 10 
the “benefit of the doubt” 
after Partygate and other 
scandals.
	 Something was 
“fundamentally wrong” 
with government, 
he claimed, and “the 
problem starts at the top”.
	 Chancellor Rishi 
Sunak announced his 
own departure from 
government within 
minutes of the former 
health secretary, on 
Tuesday evening, and 
they have been followed 
out the door by a string of 
junior ministers.
	 Mr Johnson batted 
away calls to stand down 
at Prime Minister’s 
Questions, saying he 
intended to “get on with 

the job” of governing, to 
howls of protest from the 
opposition benches.
	 But MPs fell silent as 
Mr Javid got to his feet 
to deliver his resignation 
statement.
	 He said he was 
“instinctively a team 
player” but added: 
“Treading the tightrope 
between loyalty and 
integrity has become 
impossible in recent 
months.

‘not fair’
	 “I will never risk losing 
my integrity.”
	 He added: “The events 
of recent months have 
made it increasingly 
difficult to be in that team.
	 “It’s not fair on 
ministerial colleagues to 
go out every morning 
defending lines that don’t 
stand up and don’t hold 
up.
	 “It’s not fair on my 
parliamentary colleagues, 
who bear the brunt of 
constituents’ dismay 
in their inboxes and on 
the doorsteps in recent 
elections.
	 “And it’s not fair on 
Conservative members 
and voters who rightly 
expect better standards 
from the party they 
supported.”
	 Mr Javid said he was 

“personally assured at the 
most senior level” of Mr 
Johnson’s team that there 
had been “no parties in 
Downing Street and no 
rules were broken” when 
the first stories emerged 
last year.
	 “So I gave the benefit 
of doubt. And I went on 
those media rounds to 
say that I’d had those 
assurances from the most 
senior level of the prime 
minister’s team.
	 “Then we had more 
stories. We had the 
Sue Gray report, a new 
Downing Street team. 
I continued to give the 
benefit of the doubt.”

‘truth and integrity’
	 He then turned to the 
row over former deputy 
chief whip Chris Pincher, 
who has been suspended 
as a Tory MP over sexual 
misconduct allegations. 
which saw ministers 
being given inaccurate 
information by Downing 
Street.
	 Mr Javid said: “This 
week again, we have 
reason to question the 
truth and integrity of 
what we’ve all been told. 
And at some point we 
have to conclude that 
enough is enough.
	 “I believe that point is 
now.”

Enough is enough, Sajid Javid tells Johnson
n In a withering resignation speech, Health Secretary hammers 

final nail into Boris Johnson’s turbulent tenure at No. 10

Something was “fundamentally wrong” with government, claimed Javid on 
Wednesday, adding that “the problem starts at the top”.

	 He added: “I do fear 
that the reset button 
can only work so many 
times. There’s only so 
many times you can 
turn that machine on 

and off before you 
realise that something is 
fundamentally wrong ... 
I have concluded that the 
problem starts at the top 
and I believe that is not 

going to change”.
	 In an apparent message 
to members of the cabinet 
who have stayed, he said: 
“Not doing something is 
an active decision”.

Less than three years 
ago, Boris Johnson led 
the Conservatives to 
their biggest election 
victory since 1987.
	 Now, the prime 
minister has lost the 
support of his MPs 
and has announced his 
resignation. How did it 
come to this?

The Pincher affair
	 On Wednesday 29 June, 
the MP Chris Pincher - at 
the time, the Conservative 
deputy chief whip - went 
to a private members’ 
club in London. In his 
words, he “drank far too 
much” and “embarrassed 
himself”.
	 He was accused of 
groping two men, which 
led to flurry of allegations, 
some dating back years. 
It set off a chain of events 
that ended with the prime 
minister’s downfall.
	 First, Downing Street 
said Mr Johnson was 
not aware of “specific 
allegations” about Mr 

Pincher before appointing 
him as deputy chief whip 
in February. Ministers 
later reiterated this line - 
even though it turned out 
to be inaccurate.
	 On 4 July, the BBC 
reported Mr Johnson had 
been aware of a formal 
complaint. The next day, 
a former civil servant - 
Lord McDonald - said the 
prime minister had been 
told of the complaint in 
person.
	 Mr Johnson then 
admitted he had been told 
in 2019, and apologised 
for appointing Mr 
Pincher as deputy chief 
whip.

Partygate
	 In April this year, the 
prime minister was fined 
for breaking lockdown 
rules,  after attending a 
gathering on his birthday 
in June 2020.
	 He also apologised 
for going to a “bring 
your own booze” party 
in the Downing Street 

garden during the first 
lockdown.
	 More widely, the 
Metropolitan Police 
issued 126 fines to 83 
people for breaking 
lockdown rules in 
Downing Street and 
Whitehall.
	 And a report by Sue 
Gray - a senior civil 
servant - described a 
series of social events by 
political staff that  broke 
lockdown rules.
	 “The senior leadership 
at the centre, both political 
and official, must bear 
responsibility for this 
culture,” she wrote.
	 Last December, 
Mr Johnson told the 
Commons that “all 
guidance was followed 
completely in No 10”. He 
is now being investigated 
by a Commons 
committee over  whether 
he knowingly misled 
Parliament.
	 Then there is the thorny 
issue of inflation, which 

Boris: where did 
it all go wrong?
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A  Conservative 
leadership race is already 
under way, with a 
number of MPs publicly 
declaring that they want 
to be the next leader or 
that they are seriously 
considering running.

Suella Braverman 
and Steve Baker did 
not even wait for the 
news that Boris Johnson 
was resigning, while 
others who have long 
been expected to be 
frontrunners have yet 
to openly state they will 
stand.
	 A clear heir-apparent 
has yet to emerge. Here 
we set out the potential 
successors, with a rating 
out of 10 of their chances.
	 Defence secretary 
Ben Wallace jumped to 
the fore as the bookies’ 
favourite, prompted by a 
YouGov poll that showed 
he was the first choice 
of among Conservative 
party members who were 
asked over the course of 
Tuesday and Wednesday 
who they would want 
to see as the next leader. 
(Penny Mordaunt and 
Rishi Sunak were second 
and third in the poll.)
	 According to the 
official Conservative 

Party website 
ConservativeHome.com, 
Wallace has also been 
at the top of the polls 
of members’ favourite 
cabinet ministers on 
account of his handling 
of the war in Ukraine 
and the evacuation from 
Afghanistan.
	 Until now he has had 
a relatively low public 
profile, but Tory MPs 
say his popularity may 
have begun to make him 
consider a bid, with many 
regarding him as the type 
of figure who would 
mark a stark contrast in 
style to Johnson.

bold move
	 However, one 
outstanding question is 
whether Wallace really 
wants the job. In marked 
contrast, it’s known that 
Mordaunt, Sunak,  Sajid 
Javid and Liz Truss have 
campaign teams in place.
	 The former chancellor’s 
leadership hopes were 
badly dented earlier this 
year but he may have re-
energised his leadership 
hopes by his bold move 
on Tuesday to quit the 
cabinet, even if Sajid Javid 
beat him to the button.
	 Long-regarded as 

a favourite to replace 
Johnson, Sunak’s profile 
took a hit from Partygate 
– he received a fixed-
penalty notice – and 
from the potentially more 
damaging controversy 
over his family’s financial 
affairs.
	 That episode sent his 
popularity plummeting 
after he had built a strong 
public profile through 
his press conferences 
explaining the Covid 
support schemes, 
winning him credit for 
swift action to keep 
families and businesses 
afloat.
	 The former defence 
secretary rocketed to the 
fore on Tuesday evening 
with bookmakers Coral 
installing her as the 
favourite to replace 
Johnson.

firm favorite
	 However, amid a 
torrent of resignations 
over the past 48 hours, 
her decision to remain 
as international trade 
minister has raised 
eyebrows. In an apparent 
move to deflect criticism, 
Mordaunt broke her 
silence on Thursday 
morning to tweet that 

The next PM: who are 
the leading contenders?

n Rishi, Truss, Hunt and Wallace among 
the favorites in the early betting

Wallace was “absolutely 
correct” when he said that 
“the public would not 
forgive us if we left these 
offices of state empty”.

	 Mordaunt had emerged 
as a firm favourite 
among the Tory faithful. 
Results of a poll of party 
members  published 

at the weekend by 
ConservativeHome  put 
her as the second choice, 
just behind Wallace.

FRONTRUNNER: Defence Secretary Ben Wallace

SETTING THE PACE:  former Chancellor Sajid Javid (above) enjoys plenty of 
support among the party’s grass roots, as does Liz Truss (below)

cont. on page 4, col. 1
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Britain’s public finances 
are on an “unsustainable” 
long-term path with a 
debt burden that could 
more than treble without 
further tax rises to cover 
the mounting cost of an 
ageing population and 
falling fuel duties, the 
Treasury’s independent 
forecaster has warned.
	 The  Office for Budget 
Responsibility  said 
that if economic shocks 
continued to hit the public 
finances, debt was on 

has risen sharply in 
2022,  to the current rate 
of 9.1%.
	 But several of the 
reasons were outside of 
Boris Johnson’s control. 
Russia’s invasion of 
Ukraine, for example, has 
led to rises in oil prices 
and the cost of food.
	 And, while the 
government has taken 
some steps - for example, 
by cutting fuel duty by 
5p per litre - it also went 
ahead  with a tax rise in 
April. National Insurance 
went up by 1.25 pence in 
the pound.
	 The government said 
the tax rise would pay 
for health and social care, 

and changes that kicked 
in this week softened the 
blow - but anyone earning 
more than £34,000 a year 
will still pay more.
	 “In the middle of the 
worst cost of living crisis 
for decades,” said Labour 
leader Sir Keir Starmer in 
April, “the government 
chooses to increase taxes 
on working people”.

Sleaze factor
	 Then there is the sleaze 
factor: in October 2021, 
a House of Commons 
committee recommended 
a 30-day suspension for 
then-Conservative MP 
Owen Paterson.
	 The committee said he 
broke lobbying rules, to 
try to benefit companies 
who paid him.
	 But the Conservatives - 
led by the prime minister 

-  voted to pause his 
suspension, and set up a 
new committee to look at 
how investigations were 
carried out.
	 After an outcry,  Mr 
Paterson ended up 
resigning.  Mr Johnson 
later admitted he 
had  “crashed the car”  in 
his handling of the case.
	
Policy failures
Boris Johnson won his 
thumping majority on the 
back of a clear, easy-to-
follow policy - Get Brexit 
Done.
	 But since then, his 
critics said, there was a 
lack of focus and ideas in 
Downing Street.
	 His ex-adviser turned 
chief critic, Dominic 
Cummings, repeatedly 
accused him of being an 
out-of-control shopping 

trolley, veering from 
position to position.
	 Others questioned 
the prime minister’s 
philosophy - or, indeed, 
if he had one. In June, 
Conservative MP and 
former minister Jeremy 
Hunt accused Mr Johnson 
of lacking  “integrity, 
competence, and vision”.
Mr Hunt was speaking 
before a confidence vote, 
which Mr Johnson won - 
but the complaints were 
getting louder.	
	 The by-election defeats 
kept coming.  After the 
latest, Mr Johnson said 
he would not undergo 
a “psychological 
transformation”.
	 But that, now, is not the 
concern of Conservative 
MPs. They have spoken, 
and the prime minister is 
going.

BORIS:
cont. from page two

	 Despite a lacklustre 
performance in the 2019 
Tory leadership race, in 
which he failed to make 
it into the final round, 
Javid may well have 
resurrected his hopes by 
in effect firing the starting 
gun on a new contest.
	 He made a dramatic 
return to the cabinet in 
June last year as health 
secretary, after previously 
quitting as chancellor 
in a clash with Dominic 
Cummings.
	 Once talked up 
by many as a strong 
contender to leader the 
party, memories of his 
relatively short 16-month 
tenure at No 11 had 
somewhat faded as 
decisions taken by Sunak 
during the pandemic 
elevated the profile of his 
successor.
		  While Javid had the 
political nerve to jump 
first with his resignation 
on Tuesday evening, his 
letter was also markedly 
difference from that of 
Sunak, which focused 
significantly on the need 
for a different economic 
strategy. By contrast, 
Javid’s was more furious 
in tone, placing a call 
for integrity at its heart. 

His  statement in the 
House of Commons  on 
Wednesday was 
devastating, even if 
Javid fluffed some of the 
strongest lines.
	 The foreign secretary 
was quick out of the 
traps to declare her 
support for Johnson after 
the departures of Javid 
and Sunak but then cut 
short an official trip to 
Indonesia.
	 She was in fourth place 
– with a considerable gap 
between her and Wallace 
– in this week’s YouGov 
poll of who Tory party 
members want to see as 
their new leader.

support
	 The move to get behind 
Johnson was seen as 
an attempt to shore up 
potential support from 
other Johnson loyalists 
– a not insignificant 
constituency in any future 
Tory leadership battle. 
However, her star has 
fallen somewhat in recent 
times as figures such as 
Mordaunt have edged 
ahead in some bookies’ 
estimations.
	 Nevertheless, Truss 
remains a frontrunner and 
has had a campaign team 
in place for some time. She 
has been busy burnishing 
her public profile  with 
Instagram shots and 
channelling Margaret 

Thatcher by wearing a 
headscarf while driving 
a tank. As the first Tory 
female foreign secretary, 
she has taken credit for 
securing the release of 
Nazanin Zaghari-Ratcliffe 
and imposing sanctions 
on Russian oligarchs, 
despite accusations the 
Foreign Office was under-
prepared for the war in 
Ukraine.
	 Despite long enjoying 
a profile as the bookies’ 
favourite to replace 
Johnson, the man who 
beat him in the last Tory 
leadership election, the 
former health secretary’s 
odds have lengthened. He 
has frequently been talked 
about as the “safe pair of 
hands” replacement for 
Johnson, but in the wake 
of the moves by Javid and 
Sunak, a lack of boldness 
on the part of Hunt may 
now be more apparent 
than ever.
	 In terms of character, 
the PM and Hunt remain 
poles apart: Johnson is 
all bombast and cheap 
jokes. Hunt is neither. But 
his achilles heel is that he 
was on the remainer wing 
of the party, something 
that could lose him votes 
to potential rivals such as 
Mordaunt.
	 He came last in a recent 
Conservative Home vote 
on who would triumph 
in a run-off.

Favorites:
cont. from page two

GOOD...YET BAD: The loss of fuel duties as Britain switches to electric cars is 
likely to blow a hole in the public finances

UK’s ‘unsustainable’ debt could reach 
320% of GDP in 50 years, OBR warns

nTaxes ‘must be raised to offset mounting cost of 
ageing population and falling fuel income’

course to reach almost 
320% of annual national 
income (GDP) in 50 
years’ time – up from 96% 
now – unless successive 
governments raised 
revenues to offset rising 
costs.
“The pressures of 
an  ageing population  on 
spending and the loss of 
existing motoring taxes in 
a decarbonising economy 
leaves public debt on an 
unsustainable path in the 
long term,” the OBR said.
In its annual health check 
of the public finances, the 
OBR said the government 
had already spent as much 
this year – 1.25% of GDP – 
to help households cope 
with the cost of living crisis 
as it had supporting the 
economy through the 2008 
financial crisis.
	 If energy prices 
remained high over the 
next year and ministers 
continued extending this 
support, government 
borrowing would surge 
by £40bn in 2023-24.
	 Richard Hughes, the 
OBR chair, said the UK’s 
debt burden had increased 
by £1tn above forecasts 
20 years ago, following a 
series of economic shocks 
– and there was no reason 
to think these would stop.
Interest rates were 
already beginning to rise, 
increasing government 

borrowing costs, while 
an ageing population 
added a further burden 
to Whitehall spending 
departments, especially 
the health service.
	 The  switch from petrol 
and diesel cars to electric 
vehicles, denying the 
government fuel duty 
revenues, would be 
another hit to revenues 
over successive decades. 
The UK government has 
pledged to ban the sale 
of new petrol and diesel-
powered cars from 2030. 
Fuel duties are currently a 
big source of tax revenue, 
while domestic electricity 
is relatively lightly taxed.
	 The OBR’s central 
forecast shows debt as 
a share of GDP falling 
over the next 20 years as 
spending on education 
decreases because of a 
lower birthrate, and slower 
increases in life expectancy 
reduce spending on state 
pensions.
	 However, even without 
successive economic 
shocks, the UK’s debt-to-
GDP ratio is expected to 
rise to 267% of GDP in 50 
years’ time.
	 To return that to its pre-
Covid level of 75% would 
require extra tax rises or 
spending cuts of 1.5% 
of GDP, or £37bn every 
decade for the next 50 
years, the OBR said.
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Why you need dental insurance in retirement.

Medicare doesn’t pay for dental care.1

As good as Medicare is, it was never meant to cover 
everything. If you want protection, you need to purchase 
individual insurance.

Early detection can prevent small 
problems from becoming expensive ones.
The best way to avoid large dental bills is preventive 
care. Experts recommend checkups twice a year. 

Previous dental work can wear out.
Your odds of having a dental problem only go up as you age.2

Treatment is expensive — especially the 
services people over 50 often need.
Unexpected bills, like $189 for a filling, or $1,219 for a crown3

can be a real burden, especially if you’re on a fixed income.

Call for a FREE Information Kit!

1-877-912-0164
Dental50Plus.health/British

Includes the Participating (GA: Designated) Providers and Preventive Benefi ts Rider. Product not available in all states. Acceptance 
guaranteed for one insurance policy/certifi cate of this type. Contact us for complete details about this insurance solicitation. 
This specifi c offer is not available in CO, LA, NY; call 1-800-969-4781 or respond for similar offer. Certifi cate C250A (ID: C250E; 
PA: C250Q); Insurance Policy P150 (GA: P150GA; NY: P150NY; OK: P150OK; TN: P150TN). Rider kinds B438, B439 (GA: B439B).
6247-0121

DENTAL Insurance
from Physicians Mutual Insurance Company

1 “Medicare & You,” Centers for Medicare & Medicaid Services, 2021. 2 “How might my oral and dental health change as I age?”, 
www. usnews.com, 11/30/2018. 3 American Dental Association, Health Policy Institute, 2018 Survey of Dental Fees, Copyright 2018, 
American Dental Association.

When you’re 
comparing plans ...

 Look for coverage that 
helps pay for major services. 

 Look for coverage 
with no deductibles.  

 Shop for coverage 
with no annual maximum 
on cash benefits. 

Simply put — without 
dental insurance, there 
may be an important 
gap in your healthcare 
coverage.

The dispute that 
threatened to cause 
a walkout of British 
Airways  check-in staff at 
Heathrow airport  during 
the summer holidays has 
been suspended, after 
the airline made a “vastly 
improved” pay offer.
	 After a day of talks on 
Wednesday a package 
was agreed with 
the  Unite  union that 
sources said in effect met 
its demand to restore the 
10% pay cut introduced 
during the pandemic.
	 A one-off bonus 
payment for 2022 worth 
10% of pay had earlier 
been rejected.
	 The offer will now be 
put to a ballot of Unite 
members but both parties 
hope that the agreement 
will resolve the immediate 
dispute.
	 A  British 

Airways  spokesperson 
said: “We are very 
pleased that, following 
collaboration with 
the unions, they have 
decided not to issue dates 
for industrial action. 
This is great news for 
our customers and our 
people.”
	 Sharon Graham, Unite 
general secretary, said: 
“We welcome that BA 
has finally listened to the 
voice of its check-in staff. 
Unite has repeatedly 
warned that pay disputes 
at BA were inevitable 
unless the company took 
our members’ legitimate 
grievances seriously.”
	 The news came a day 
after BA announced it 
would be  cancelling 
another 10,300 flights this 
summer  as the labour 
shortages at airlines and 
airports continued to 

jeopardise holiday travel.
	 A 72-hour strike over pay 
by one of the four refuelling 
firms at Heathrow remains 
in place for the start of the 
school holiday period, 
threatening possible 
further disruption.
	 The holiday airline Jet2 
said on Thursday it would 
be giving its employees an 
8% pay rise and a £1,000 
cost of living payment this 
year, as it lashed out at 
British airports for being 
“woefully ill-prepared” for 
the rebound in travel this 
summer.
	 Discount airline Jet2’s 
executive chair, Philip 
Meeson, said the airports’ 
failure to recruit staff was 
inexcusable, and was 
to blame for the chaotic 
scenes over the holiday 
periods this year and 
for thousands of flight 
cancellations.

CLEAR SKIES? BA has agreed a deal that sources say in 
effect restores the 10% pay cut introduced during the pandemic

Threat of BA strike at Heathrow 
suspended after airline agrees pay deal

n Unite union to ballot members on ‘vastly improved’ offer 
for check-in staff – while Jet2 announces 8% salary increases
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ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

6230 Sylmar Ave
Van Nuys CA 91401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Fidelia Areli Araujo, an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 07/29/22. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept T, Room 600

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Fidelia Areli Araujo. And a petition 
for change of names having been 

duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 

petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 

from 
Fidelia Areli Araujo to Areli 

Araujo

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 9, 2022.
Virginia Keeny
Judge of the Superior Court
22VECP00309

Published: 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Eden Esther Zeboulon, an 
adult over the age of 18 years. 

​
Date: 08/26/22. Time: 8.30am; 

Dept K

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Eden Esther Zeboulon. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have their name changed from 
Eden Esther Zeboulon to Eden 
Esther Zeboulon Cohen.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 

petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 8, 2022.
Hon. Lawrence Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
22SMCP00246

Published: 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

600 East Broadway
Glendale CA 91206

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Edward Garza, an adult over 

the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 08/10/22. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept D 

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Edward Garza. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Edward Garza to Edward 
Barragán Garza.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 14, 2022.
Robin Miller Sloan, Judge
Judge of the Superior Court
22GDCP00226

Published: 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

300 E Olive Ave
Burbank CA 91502

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Nrsimha-Lila Comia, an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 07/22/22. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept A 

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Nrsimha-Lila Comia. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have their name changed from 
Nrsimha-Lila Comia to Lila Hawk 
Malone

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 10, 2022.
Robin Miller Sloan, Judge
Judge of the Superior Court
22BBCP00219

Published: 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N. Hill St
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Lorena Alvarado Prado, an 
adult over the age of 18 years. 

​
Date: 08/01/22. Time: 10.00am; 

Dept 74, Room 735 

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Lorena Alvarado Prado. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have their name changed from 
Lorena Alvarado Prado to Lorena 
Alvarado.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 09, 2022.
Michelle Wolliams Court
Judge of the Superior Court
22STCP021892

Published: 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

150 West Commonwealth
Alhambra CA 91801

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Nathalie Hernandez 

Rodriguez, an adult over the age 
of 18 years. 

​
Date: 08/26/22. Time: 8.30am; 

Dept X, Room 405 

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Nathalie Hernandez Rodriguez. 
And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Nathalie Hernandez 
Rodriguez to Nathalie Arenas.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 14, 2022.
Robin Miller Sloan, Judge
Judge of the Superior Court
22AHCP00228

Published: 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

600 E Broadway
Glendale CA 91206

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Seong Suk Kim, an adult over 

the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 08/10/22. 
Time: 8.30am; Dept D

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Seong Suk Kim. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 

filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 
Seong Suk Kim to Seong Suk 

Lee.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 14, 2022.
Robin Miller Sloan, Judge
Judge of the Superior Court
22GDCP00089

Published: 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Michelle Diandra Harris, an 
adult over the age of 18 years. 

​
Date: 08/05/22. Time: 8.30am; 

Dept K, Room 203

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Michelle Diandra Harris. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have their name changed from 
Michelle Diandra Harris to Shelly 
Diandra Murphy.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 9, 2022.
Hon. Lawrence Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
22SMCP00249

Published: 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

300 East Olive Ave
Burbank CA 91502

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Peter Suk Lee and Jung Ah 
Jung, adults over the age of 18 

years, on behalf of Ha Jin Sky Lee, 
a minor under the age of 18 years.

​
It appearing that the following 

person(s) whose name is/are to be 
changed is/are a minor(s) under 

18 years of age: Ha Jin Sky 
Lee. And a petition for change 

of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 

said petitioners desire to have the 
name(s) changed from Ha Jin Sky 

Lee to Sky Ha Jin Lee. 
 

​The Court Orders that all persons 
interested in this matter appear 
before this court at the hearing 
indicated below to show cause, if 
any, why the petition for change 
of name should not be granted. 
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described above must file 
a written objection that includes 

the reasons for the objection at 
least two days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.
 
Date: 07/22/22. Time: 8:30am, in 
Dept. A
 
A copy of this Order to Show Cause 
shall be published at least once a 
week for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing 
on the petition in the following 
newspaper of general circulation, 
printed in this county: The British 
Weekly.
 
Dated: June 3, 2022.
Robin Miller Sloan
Judge of the Superior Court
22BBCP00215

Published: 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

300 E Olive Ave
Burbank CA 91502

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Vrooyr Margoosiankhouygani,  
an adult over the age of 18 years. 

​
Date: 08/05/22. Time: 8.30am; 

Dept B 

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Vrooyr Margoosiankhouygani. 
And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from 
Vrooyr Margoosiankhouygani to 
William Margosian.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 16, 2022.
Robin Miller Sloan, Judge
Judge of the Superior Court
22BBCP00226

Published: 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022110756. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Astound 
Sound, 7345 Forbes Ave. Lake Balboa 
CA 91406. County: Los Angeles. Noel 
Molenda, 7345 Forbes Ave., Lake 
Balboa CA 91406. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
05/2017. Signed: Noel Molenda, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
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and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/13/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/11/2022, 06/18/2022, 06/25/2022 
and 07/02/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022111317. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: House of 
Scherie; Amour Beauty Collection, 
Designs By Scherie, Scherie Amour, 
8939 S Sepulveda Blvd 110-799, 
Los Angeles CA 90045. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 202250017569. 
Scherie Amour LLC, 1401 21st Street 
Ste R, Sacramento CA 95811. State 
of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 04/2022. 
Signed: Aporsche Scherie Stanciel, 
Manager. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/23/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022114532. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Two Shores, 
6414 McKinley Ave, Los Angeles CA 
90001. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
3485477. Y.SA Inc., 6414 McKinley 
Ave, Los Angeles CA 90001. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: an corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Jomo Mulholland, 
CFO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/26/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022116067. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Base By 
Sabrina, 1600 Vine St. Suite 513, 
LA CA 90028. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 844430939. Revelle West, 
Inc., 1600 Vine St. Suite 513, LA 
CA 90028. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: an corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Sabrina 
Revelle, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/27/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 

the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022116116. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Simply 
Maldita Collections; GL Tax Services, 
43824 20th St W Unit 4212, Lancaster 
CA 93539. County: Los Angeles. 
Grandline Services LLC, 43824 20th 
St W, Unit 4212, Lancaster CA 93539. 
State of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Hugo Fullante, Manager. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/27/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022118291. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Allyd’s, 1016 
Santee St Unit # 5, Los Angeles CA 
90015. County: Los Angeles. 1241 
E 57th Street, Los Angeles CA 90011. 
AI#ON: C3466814. Allyd’s Corporation, 
1016 Santee St Unit # 5, Los Angeles 
CA 90015. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: an corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2017. Signed: 
Maria Isabel Jimenez Calderon, Vice 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/01/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022118366. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Paramount 
Holdings, 15148 Faulkner Ave, 
Paramount CA 90723. County: 
Los Angeles. 12005 Poutous Ct, 
Moreno Valley CA 92557. AI#ON: 
202250018254. Paramount Holdings 
LLC, 15148 Faulkner Ave, Paramount 
CA 90723. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Xitlaly Santa Cruz Carrillo, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/01/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 

must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022118420. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Fuller Vision, 
313 S Cataract Ave, San Dimas 
CA 91773. County: Los Angeles. 
Jacqueline Fuller, 313 S Cataract Ave, 
San Dimas CA 91773. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Jacqueline Fuller, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/01/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022119919. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Southbay 
Tattoo And Piercing, 22813 Figueroa 
St, Carson CA 90745. County: Los 
Angeles. Efrain Diaz Espinoza Jr, 
23409 Orchard Ave, Carson CA 
90745. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2022. 
Signed: Efrain Diaz Espinoza Jr, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/02/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022120743. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Rekitchen 
Cabinetry, 16617 S. Normandie Ave. 
Suite C, Gardena CA 90247. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: C5000066. 
Rekitchen, 16617 S. Normandie 
Ave. Suite C, Gardena CA 90247. 
State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: an 
corporation. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Yarden Dano, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/03/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022121566. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Silverman 
Remodeling, 255 Main St # 205, Venice 
CA 90291. County: Los Angeles. 2158 
Via Arandana, Camarillo CA 93012. 
Robert Silverman, 2158 Via Arandana, 
Camarillo CA 93012. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
05/2022. Signed: Robert Silverman, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/06/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022121924. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: OGT, 4932 
Alhama Dr., Woodland Hills CA 91364. 
County: Los Angeles. Armon Nasiri, 
4932 Alhama Dr., Woodland Hills CA 
91364. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Armon 
Nasiri, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/06/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022122395. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Best Cleaning 
By Maria, 2123 Estrella Avenue Apt 6, 
Los Angeles CA 90007-2078. County: 
Los Angeles. Maria de Jesus Sanchez 
Magana, 2123 Estrella Avenue Apt 
6, Los Angeles CA 90007-2078. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Maria de Jesus Sanchez 
Magana, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/06/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022122438. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Route 66 
Insurance Agency, 349 W. Route 66, 
Glendora CA 91740. County: Los 
Angeles. Route 66 Insurance Agency, 
Inc., 349 W. Route 66, Glendora 
CA 91740. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: an corporation. Registrant(s) 

commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Daniel Granados, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/06/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022122488. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lions 
Fumigation Inc, 15600 S White Ave, 
Compton CA 90221. County: Los 
Angeles. PO Box 2091, Paramount 
CA 90723-809. Lions Fumigation 
Inc, 15600 S White Ave, Compton 
CA 90221. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: an corporation. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Yonathan Grabiel Leon, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/06/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022122561. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Home Mart, 
9611 Garvey Ave Ste 117, South 
El Monte CA 91733. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 4825907. JM Home 
Mart, 9611 Garvey Ave Ste 117, 
South El Monte CA 91733. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: an corporation. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Jennifer Jiang, Secretary. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/07/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022122672. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Peri-Perry 
Productions, 2300 Montrose Ave 
Unit 2, Montrose CA 91020. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: C4862128. 
CPR Group Inc., 2300 Montrose Ave 
Unit 2, Montrose CA 91020. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: an corporation. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Julia C. Perignon Richards 
Perry, President. Registrant(s) declared 

that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/07/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022122846. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Chillis And 
Chives Creations, 4005 Merrill St, 
Torrance CA 90503. County: Los 
Angeles. Rachel Leacock, 
4005 Merrill St, Torrance CA 90503. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2022. Signed: Rachel Leacock, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/07/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022123072. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: A+H Studio; 
A+Hair Studio, Alberto & Hair, 15416 
¾ Devonshire Street, Mission Hills CA 
91345. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
C5031129. Alberto and Hair, 15416 
¾ Devonshire Street, Mission Hills 
CA 91345. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: an corporation. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 04/2022. 
Signed: Alberto Carlos, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/07/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022123569. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Pupusa Bites, 
2839 Alsace Ave, Los Angeles CA 
90016. County: Los Angeles. Ruandy 
Steven Urvieta Rodriguez, 2837 
Alsace Ave, Los Angeles CA 90016-
3401. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Ruandy Steven Urvieta Rodriguez, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/07/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
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must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022124221. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: We Craft 
Studios, 12001 El Oro Way, Granada 
Hills CA 91344. County: Los Angeles. 
Influx Audio Inc, 12001 El Oro Way, 
Granada Hills CA 91344. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: an corporation. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
05/2022. Signed: Kevin Bazell, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/08/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022124628. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: EFF2 
Films, 4402 Los Feliz Blvd Apt 103, 
Los Angeles CA 90027. County: Los 
Angeles. Francis R Frears, 4402 Los 
Feliz Blvd Apt 103, Los Angeles CA 
90027. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Francis R Frears, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/08/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022124813. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Cultivarte, 
1529 5th Avenue, Unit F, Los Angeles 
CA 90019. County: Los Angeles. 
Pablo Lenero, 1529 5th Avenue, 
Unit F, Los Angeles CA 90019. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Pablo Lenero, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/08/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 

2022125534. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Loomiere, 
3011 Bentley Court, Santa Monica 
CA 90405. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 201117110351. The Cruz 
Coalition, LLC, 3011 Bentley Court, 
Santa Monica CA 90405. State 
of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2022. 
Signed: David Loomstein, Managing 
Member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/09/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022125539. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: A to Z Auto 
Repair, 621 W Valencia Dr, Fullerton CA 
92832. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
202250313808. Angel Gabriel Aceves, 
621 W Valencia Dr, Fullerton CA 
92832. This business is conducted by: 
an individual company. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 04/2022. 
Signed: Angel Gabriel Aceves, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/09/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022125743. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Hotel 
Heritage, 12040 Garvey Ave, El 
Monte CA 91732. County: Los 
Angeles. Mashiv Inc., 12040 Garvey 
Ave, El Monte CA 91732. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Bart Patel, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/09/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022125818. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: S Massage, 
383 W 7th St, San Pedro CA 91731. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
5097268. WJH, Inc., 2406 Gladys 
Ave, Rosemead CA 91770. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business 

is conducted by: a corporation. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Hong Wu, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/09/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126083. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: IEC 
Consulting, 3857 Cazador Street, 
Los Angeles CA 90065. County: Los 
Angeles. Irene Eunhyung Cho, 3857 
Cazador Street, Los Angeles CA 
90065. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2022. 
Signed: Irene Eunhyung Cho, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/09/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126085. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: State 
Van Rentals, 11227 S. Prairie Ave, 
Inglewood CA 90303. County: Los 
Angeles. RM Trading And Leasing 
Company, 11227 S. Prairie Ave, 
Inglewood CA 90303. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
04/2014. Signed: Nima Ali Mobasser, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/09/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126088. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: State Van 
Rental, 11227 S. Prairie Ave, Inglewood 
CA 90303. County: Los Angeles. AAA 
Rent A Van, Inc., 11227 S. Prairie 
Ave, Inglewood CA 90303. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
04/2014. Signed: Nima Ali Mobasser, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 

with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/09/2022. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126151. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Starlite Premier 
Bartending, 1450 W. 228th St. #34, Torrance 
CA 90501. County: Los Angeles. Paul Cash, 
4460 Overland Ave. #27, Culver City CA 
90230; Joanne Javier, 3010 Winfield Avel, 
LaVerne CA 91750.
This business is conducted by: co-partners. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Paul 
Cash, general partner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/09/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it 
was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 
and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022127120. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Sunset 7426; 
Sunset 7426 Podcasts, Sunset 
7426 Studios, Sunset 7426 
Comedy, Sunset 7426 Theater, 
Sunset 7426 Improv, Sunset 
7426 Spaces, 7426 W Sunset 
Blvd. West Hollywood CA 90046. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
202106710401. Def Noodles, 
LLC, 7426 W Sunset Blvd. West 
Hollywood CA 90046. State of 
Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
05/2022. Signed: Dennis Feitosa, 
Managing Member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/10/2022. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/18/2022, 
06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 and 
07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022127160. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Juju  B’s Fitness 
Wear, 3804 Wisconsin Street 
Unit G, Los Angeles CA 90037. 
County: Los Angeles. Judith 
Anne Blakey, 3804 Wisconsin 
Street Unit G, Los Angeles CA 
90037. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
09/2021. Signed: Judith Anne 
Blakey, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/10/2022. NOTICE 

- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/18/2022, 
06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 and 
07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022127222. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Golden Desert, 1346 
Maine Ave Unit F, Baldwin Park 
CA 91706. County: Los Angeles. 
Bilikian-Attie Inc., 1346 Maine 
Ave #F, Baldwin Park CA 91706. 
State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
an corporation. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Tony Attie, 
President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/10/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022128453. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Bibe’s Candles; Ate 
Bibe’s Candles, 904 Raywood 
Place, Montebello CA 90640. 
County: Los Angeles. Joseph 
F. Reza, 904 Raywood Place, 
Montebello CA 90640; Annabelle 
Sabella-Rez, 904 Raywood 
Place, Montebello CA 90640. 
This business is conducted by: 
a married couple. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Annabelle 
Sabella-Rez, wife. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/14/2022. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/18/2022, 
06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 and 
07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022128599. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Marina Advanced 
Dentistry, 3017 Washington 
Blvd, Marina Del Rey CA 90292. 
County: Los Angeles. Farid 
Farahnik DDS Inc., A Professional 
Corporation, 3017 Washington 
Blvd, Marina Del Rey CA 90292. 
State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 

under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Farid Farahnik, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/14/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022128833. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: ZTC, 24204 Sylvan 
Glen Road Unit B, Diamond Bar 
CA 91765. County: Los Angeles. 
280 Lemon Avenue Unit 717, 
Walnut CA 91788. Zach Trading 
Corporation, 24204 Sylvan Glen 
Road Unit B, Diamond Bar CA 
91765. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. 
Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 06/2022. 
Signed: Zaki Wehbe, President.  
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/14/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022129374. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Vovo Builders, 
19360 Rinaldi Street, #456, 
Porter Ranch CA 91326. County: 
Los Angeles. Remodeling Guys 
Inc., 19360 Rinaldi Street, #456, 
Porter Ranch CA 91326. State 
of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Sara Naz Nizami, 
President.  Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/14/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022129377. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Golden Estate 
International Partners, 21000 
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Cornerstone Dr, Walnut CA 
91789. County: Los Angeles. Betty 
C Huang, 21000 Cornerstone Dr, 
Walnut CA 91789. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2022. 
Signed: Betty C Huang, owner.  
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/14/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022129562. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: 4th Street Properties, 
5721 S. Crescent Park #404, 
Playa Vista CA 90094. County: 
Los Angeles. Lori Hyland Trustee 
Of The Lori Hyland Non Exempt 
Trust, 5721 S. Crescent Park 
#404, Playa Vista CA 90094; Lori 
Hyland Trustee Of The Lori Hyland 
Exempt Trust, 5721 S. Crescent 
Park #404, Playa Vista CA 90094; 
Lynzie Flynn Trustee Of The 
Lynzie Flynn Non Exempt Trust, 
5721 S. Crescent Park #404, 
Playa Vista CA 90094; Lynzie 
Flynn Trustee Of The Lynzie Flynn 
Exempt Trust, 5721 S. Crescent 
Park #404, Playa Vista CA 90094. 
This business is conducted by: a 
trust. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 06/2022. 
Signed: Lynzie Flynn Trustee Of 
The Lynzie Flynn Exempt Trust, 
trustee.  Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022129567. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: 4th Street Reserve, 
5721 S. Crescent Park #404, 
Playa Vista CA 90094. County: 
Los Angeles. Lori Hyland Trustee 
Of The Lori Hyland Non Exempt 
Trust, 5721 S. Crescent Park 
#404, Playa Vista CA 90094; Lori 
Hyland Trustee Of The Lori Hyland 
Exempt Trust, 5721 S. Crescent 
Park #404, Playa Vista CA 90094; 
Lynzie Flynn Trustee Of The 
Lynzie Flynn Non Exempt Trust, 
5721 S. Crescent Park #404, 
Playa Vista CA 90094; Lynzie 
Flynn Trustee Of The Lynzie Flynn 
Exempt Trust, 5721 S. Crescent 
Park #404, Playa Vista CA 90094. 
This business is conducted by: a 
trust. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 06/2022. 
Signed: Lynzie Flynn Trustee Of 

The Lynzie Flynn Exempt Trust, 
trustee.  Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022130083. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Children’s Forest 
School, 7141 Forest Hills Road, 
West Hills CA 91307. County: 
Los Angeles. Childrens Forest 
School, 7141 Forest Hills Road, 
West Hills CA 91307. State of 
Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: 
a corporation. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Melissa-Jane Beatty, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022130257. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: MUSHR, 24404 S. 
Vermont Ave. Suite 205, Harbor 
City CA 90710. County: Los 
Angeles. VN Human Resource, 
Inc., 24404 S. Vermont Ave. 
Suite 205, Harbor City CA 90710. 
State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Ai Saga, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022130313. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Shot Glass Films; 
Shot Glass, 22431 Miranda 
St., Woodland Hills CA 91367. 
County: Los Angeles. Showreel 
International, Inc., 22431 Miranda 
St., Woodland Hills CA 91367. 

State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
04/2016. Signed: Jessica Ristic, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022130530. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: C&G Mobile Notary 
And Live Scan Fingerprinting 
Services; C&G Live Scan And 
Notary Services; 537 W 12th St, 
San Pedro CA 90731. County: 
Los Angeles. Csaba Galik, 537 
W 12th St, San Pedro CA 90731; 
Monica Galik Cristorean, 537 W 
12th St, San Pedro CA 90731. 
This business is conducted by: 
a married couple. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Csaba Galik, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/18/2022, 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022 and 07/09/2022.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2022130984. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Real Property 
Management Generations, 2210 
10th Ave, Los Angeles CA 90018. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
5093750. McShan Ward-Roston 
Enterprises Inc., 2210 10th Ave, 
Los Angeles CA 90018. State 
of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Edward Mc 
Shan II, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/16/2022. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/18/2022, 
06/25/2022, 07/02/2022 and 

07/09/2022.

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF 
OTIS EMERSON DUNHAM

Case No. 22STPB05605
	 To all heirs, beneficiaries, credi-
tors, contingent creditors, and per-
sons who may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate, or both, 
of OTIS EMERSON DUNHAM
	 A PETITION FOR PROBATE 
has been filed by Vera J. Dunham 
in the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
	 THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that Vera J. Dunham be 
appointed as personal representa-
tive to administer the estate of the 
decedent.
	 THE PETITION requests author-
ity to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Before tak-
ing certain very important actions, 
however, the personal representa-
tive will be required to give notice 
to interested persons unless they 
have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the petition will 
be held on July 12, 2022 at 8:30 AM 
in Dept. No. 44 located at 111 N. Hill 
St., Los Angeles, CA 90012.
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-
tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and le-
gal authority may affect your rights 
as a creditor. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney knowledgeable 
in California law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a per-
son interested in the estate, you 
may file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.

Petitioner: Vera J. Dunham
 VERA J DUNHAM

446 26TH ST
SANTA MONICA CA 90402

CN987506 DUNHAM Jun 25, Jul 
2,9, 2022

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF 
OTIS EMERSON DUNHAM

Case No. 22STPB05605
	 To all heirs, beneficiaries, credi-
tors, contingent creditors, and per-
sons who may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate, or both, 
of OTIS EMERSON DUNHAM
	 A PETITION FOR PROBATE 
has been filed by Vera J. Dunham 
in the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
	 THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that Vera J. Dunham be 
appointed as personal representa-
tive to administer the estate of the 

decedent.
	 THE PETITION requests author-
ity to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Before tak-
ing certain very important actions, 
however, the personal representa-
tive will be required to give notice 
to interested persons unless they 
have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the petition will 
be held on July 12, 2022 at 8:30 AM 
in Dept. No. 44 located at 111 N. Hill 
St., Los Angeles, CA 90012.
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-
tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and le-
gal authority may affect your rights 
as a creditor. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney knowledgeable 
in California law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a per-
son interested in the estate, you 
may file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.

Petitioner: Vera J. Dunham
 VERA J DUNHAM

446 26TH ST
SANTA MONICA CA 90402

CN987506 DUNHAM Jun 25, Jul 
2,9, 2022

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF: 

DARIN TODOROV 
STOYTCHEV AKA DARIN T. 
STOYTCHEV AKA DARIN 
TODOROV STOYCHEV 

CASE NO. 22STPB05722
To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interested 
in the WILL or estate, or both of 
DARIN TODOROV STOYTCHEV 
AKA DARIN T. STOYTCHEV AKA 
DARIN TODOROV STOYCHEV.
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has 
been filed by ORLIN DOBREFF 
in the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that ORLIN DOBREFF 
be appointed as personal 
representative to administer the 
estate of the decedent.
THE PETITION requests authority 
to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without 
obtaining court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required to 
give notice to interested persons 
unless they have waived notice or 
consented to the proposed action.) 
The independent administration 
authority will be granted unless an 
interested person files an objection 

to the petition and shows good 
cause why the court should not 
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the petition will 
be held in this court as follows: 
07/22/22 at 8:30AM in Dept. 67 
located at 111 N. HILL ST., LOS 
ANGELES, CA 90012
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear 
at the hearing and state your 
objections or file written objections 
with the court before the hearing. 
Your appearance may be in person 
or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with 
the court and mail a copy to the 
personal representative appointed 
by the court within the later of 
either (1) four months from the 
date of first issuance of letters to 
a general personal representative, 
as defined in section 58(b) of the 
California Probate Code, or (2) 60 
days from the date of mailing or 
personal delivery to you of a notice 
under section 9052 of the California 
Probate Code.
Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as 
a creditor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file kept 
by the court. If you are a person 
interested in the estate, you may 
file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
JAMES A. GORTON, ESQ. - SBN 
102367,
GORTON, JANOSIK & POXON, 
LLP
909 E. GREEN STREET
PASADENA CA 91106
6/25, 7/2, 7/9/22

CNS-3598592#

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd
Norwalk CA 90650

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Alexandra Marie Valencia, an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 07/20/22. Time: 10.30am; 
Dept C, Room 312 

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Alexandra Marie Valencia. And 
a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the 

clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said 

petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from 

Alexandra Marie Valencia to 
Alexandra Marie Espana.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 

Legal Notices
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It’s Time For Tea....
Traditional Afternoon Tea is now served
Wed-Sat. 11.30am-4pm in our tea room
(also available for baby showers, bridal 

showers and special occasions). 
King’s Head Pies now available in our bakery. 

Sausage rolls, pastries and 
delicious cakes, baked daily

Ye Olde King’s Head, 116 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401 • Tel: 310-451-1402

Brits in LA

HOST AN INTERNATIONAL STUDENT
Earn Up To $1,050 per month 

GLOBAL STUDENT SERVICES, USA, INC
gssusa2020@protonmail.com

310-612-7663

If 2020 was the year of 
staying home I think 
that makes 2022 the 
antithesis.
	 We’ve gone from 
‘not going out’ to 
‘ let’s dip our toes 
back in’  then almost 
overnight it seems we 
have accelerated to 
being social butterflies 
making up for lost 
time. Whilst fun, it can 
be rather exhausting 
especially when we, 
(or me, at least) are so 

out of practice.
	 The world might 
be our oyster, but I 
thought I would save 
you some valuable 
time and highlight a 
few upcoming events 
that I think might be 
the pearls we are all 
searching for.
	 Obviously I would 
be remiss to not 
mention events on the 
Brits in LA calendar: 
first up is our 
collaboration with the 

BABC and BritWeek 
- this is the perfect 
event for those of you 
who enjoy a garden 
party vibe. A belated 
celebration for  the 
Queen’s Platinum 
Jubilee will be held 
at the Fairmont 
Miramar Hotel & 
Bungalows in Santa 
Monica on Sunday 
July 10th 3-6pm. There 
is plenty of great 
entertainment lined 
up for this, including 
the legendary DJ Paul 
Oakenfold. Tickets 
include and exclusive 
opportunity to win 
Upper Class Tickets 
to London on Virgin 
Atlantic Airways! 
There will also be 
food and drink and 
surprise musical 
guests. Children 14 
and Under Free (limit 
two per family). 
Visit babcla.org for 
full details and to 
purchase tickets.
	 If you are more of a 
pub person you can’t 
go wrong with our 
weekly quiz night at 
the Market Tavern 
located at the Farmers 
Market at the Grove. 
It is every Tuesday at 
7.30pm hosted by fun 
loving Brit, Sandro 
Monetti. It’s free to 
play and get there 
early if you need help 
finding a team to join. 
Visit Britsin.LA for 
full details.
	 The football fans 
amongst you might be 
interested to hear that 

Gareth Bale has just 
signed with LAFC - he 
was expected to make 
his debut on July 8th 
but visa issues put a 
spanner in the works - 
just goes to show that 
immigration hiccups 
can happen to anyone. 
I’m sure he is itching 
to play and will be 
on the field as soon 
as that visa stamp is 
in his passport – visit 
lafc.com for the latest 
updates.

Making waves
	 Maybe netball is 
more your thing? If so 
you should check out 
the Los Angeles Waves 
Netball Club. They 
play most Saturday 
mornings at Victoria 
Park in Carson, CA.  
No prior experience is 
necessary if you want 
to participate. People 
of all ages, abilities 
and genders are 
welcomed to play. But 
if you would rather 
just support from the 

Post pandemic 
fun? Seems like 

we’re all 
gagging for it...

cont. on page 1, col. 1
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Brits in LA

2995 Thousand Oaks Blvd., Thousand Oaks. (parking in rear)
Open: Mon-Sat. 10.30-5.30 • Sun: 10-6 • Tel: (805) 495-4042

Teas • Candy • Pastries • Bangers • Meat Pies • 
Heinz Beans • China Teapots • Tea Cozies • Gifts

Now featuring delicious, traditional handmade pies and pas-
ties from Deli-SA. Chicken curry pasties, Cornish 

pasties, Steak & Kidney...and much more

Quality Imports from the British Isles...

The Hare & 
The Hounds

Stargazing with 
Annie Shaw

ARIES: Your boss planet Mars is now in your cousin sign of Leo. He will 
be visiting for some considerable time, providing plenty of energy to get 
moving ahead in any part of life. 
TAURUS: You are not going to have the financial holdup you had this 
time last month or so. This is due to your boss planet Venus in your 
money area now for several weeks. 
GEMINI: Your boss Mercury is moving forward into your money area. 
This will move everything held up in any area of your life. It’s all good 
- if you keep positive. 
CANCER: It’s good to make amends to anyone or anything that caused 
you any upset feelings. This next week or so will bring some peace of 
mind overall. Mercury is at home with you currently. Happy Birthday! 
LEO: You must get to the bottom of any emotional feelings you may be 
holding on to. This is a time to prepare to move forward and not look 
backwards. Life should be getting better every day - enjoy it. VIRGO: 
If you feel disappointed or maybe somewhat confused be honest first 
to yourself. You probably know deep down what needs to be done 
to change things, take a chance it looks good. LIBRA: Mercury is in 
a positive direction this week and whatever has been on hold can get 
moving forward. Life is slowly and surely returning to some kind of 
normal. With this in mind be clear with your intention going forward. 
SCORPIO: You have the power to do whatever you decide. Be sure to 
keep a positive attitude now as your boss Mars is in Leo and he will be 
show you where you should put your energy. 
SAGITTARIUS: You boss planet Jupiter is going slow is in your area of 
communications. Just be sure when put on the spot not to put your foot 
in it. Mars in Leo is on fire now but do not be blunt with words or you 
could be the one to get burnt. 
CAPRICORN: So it seems like time to make big decisions, however not 
so fast; you have to be sure of what you want. You have had a very 
powerful planet checking you and so do not rush to complete all until 
later in the month. 
AQUARIUS: You have never liked being boring or restrained from 
doing anything in your life. Times of late have made life difficult for you 
energetic souls. Nothing lasts forever and soon it will be time to move 
forward with your plans. 
PISCES: You could be dealing with family situations currently. This 
means that other things that are important are put on a back burner. 
Mid-month you are back on track. Do take life by the horns - you are 
eager to get going now.

Merriment, music 
and mind-bending 
questions are on the 
menu each Tuesday at 
Brits in LA Pub Quiz.
	 The fun at the Market 
Tavern always begins 
with Joanna Duff’s 
weekly performance 
(pictured right) of the 
trivia night theme 
tune at 7.30 before host 
Sandro Monetti starts 
the game.
	 Frank’s Hernia 
(pictured below) won 
the latest contest, 
narrowly seeing 
off rival teams like 
Grope Britain (also 
pictured).  Come on 
down next time on 
Tuesday July 12 and 
see if you can be 
among the prizes.

sidelines I am sure 
that is ok too. They’re 
hosting a LALA 
Land tournament 
on September 17-
18 so I’m sure they 
would love some 
volunteers.  They are 
also planning to attend  
a U.S. Open Veteran’s 
Day weekend in Las 
Vegas. 
	 V i s i t 
losangelesnetball.org 
to learn more.
	 I think everybody 

loves a good concert 
don’t they? Los 
Angeles is like 
Piccadilly Circus, 
particularly this year. 
If you can stay here 
long enough you 
will probably see 
most of your favorite 
acts popping in to 
do a show. I would 
recommend checking 
out Fred again…
who will be at the 
Hollywood Forever 
Cemetery at the end 
of September - but if 
that’s not your cup 
of tea you are bound 
to find something on 
the Hollywood Bowl 

calendar - as they are 
celebrating their 100th 
anniversary and have 
the line up to prove it. 
Visit hollywoodbowl.
com.
	 Don’t forget to 
pace yourself; there 
is always fun stuff to 
do in LA so it doesn’t 
matter if you can’t go 
to everything. 
	 If you have 
any questions or 
comments or want to 
share any news drop 
us a line at britsinla@
gmail.com

Cheers!	
Eileen 

BiLA:

Never gonna quiz you up...!
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weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 23, 2022.
Judge Margaret M. Bernal
Judge of the Superior Court
22NWCP00207

Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 
07/16/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd
Norwalk CA 90650

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Andy Shaun Valencia, an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 07/20/22. Time: 
10.30am; Dept C, Room 312 

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of 
age: Andy Shaun Valencia. 
And a petition for change of 
names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 
Andy Shaun Valencia to 
Andy Valencia

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED 
that all persons interested 
in the above-entitled matter 
of change of names appear 
before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition 
for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described 
must file a written petition 
that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and 
must appear at the hearing to 
show cause why the petition 
should not be granted. If no 
written objection is timely filed, 
the court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED 
that a copy of this order be 
published in the British Weekly, 
a newspaper of general 
circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 23, 2022.
Judge Margaret M. Bernal
Judge of the Superior Court
22NWCP00207

Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 
07/16/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd., Room 
101

Norwalk CA 90650

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Angela Marie Choate an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 08/19/22. Time: 
10.30am; Dept C Room 312

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of 
age: Angela Marie Choate. 
And a petition for change of 
names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 
Angela Marie Choate to 
Angela Marie Alvarado

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED 
that all persons interested 
in the above-entitled matter 
of change of names appear 
before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition 
for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described 
must file a written petition 
that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and 
must appear at the hearing to 
show cause why the petition 
should not be granted. If no 
written objection is timely filed, 
the court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED 
that a copy of this order be 
published in the British Weekly, 
a newspaper of general 
circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 20, 2022.
Judge Margaret M Bernal
Judge of the Superior Court
22CNWCP00248

Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 
07/16/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

275 Magnolia 
Long Beach CA 90802

In the Matter of the Petition 
of William Buck Bowen, an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 07/20/22. Time: 
10.30am; Dept C, Room 312 

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of 
age: William Buck Bowen. 
And a petition for change of 
names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 
William Buck Bowen to Buck 
Bowen

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED 
that all persons interested 
in the above-entitled matter 
of change of names appear 
before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition 
for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described 
must file a written petition 

that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and 
must appear at the hearing to 
show cause why the petition 
should not be granted. If no 
written objection is timely filed, 
the court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED 
that a copy of this order be 
published in the British Weekly, 
a newspaper of general 
circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 13, 2022.
Judge Margaret M. Bernal
Judge of the Superior Court
22NWCP00207

Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 
07/16/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
400 Civic Center Plaza 

Room 101
Pomona CA 91766

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Wing Kit Chan, an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 08/19/22. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept O, Room 543 

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of 
age: Wing Kit Chan. And a 
petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with 
the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 
Wing Kit Chan to Ken Wing 
Kit Chan

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED 
that all persons interested 
in the above-entitled matter 
of change of names appear 
before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition 
for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described 
must file a written petition 
that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and 
must appear at the hearing to 
show cause why the petition 
should not be granted. If no 
written objection is timely filed, 
the court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED 
that a copy of this order be 
published in the British Weekly, 
a newspaper of general 
circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 13, 2022.
Peter A Hernandez
Judge of the Superior Court
22PSCP00270

Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 
07/16/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

6230 Sylmar Ave Room 107
Van Nuys CA 91401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Bobby Karami, an 

adult over the age of 18 years, 
on behalf of Ahtash Karami, 
a minor under the age of 18 

years.
​

It appearing that the following 
person(s) whose name is/
are to be changed is/are a 
minor(s) under 18 years of 

age: Ahtash Karami. And a 
petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with 

the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition 
that said petitioners desire to 
have the name(s) changed 

from Ahtash Karami to Tasha 
Karami. 

 
​The Court Orders that all 
persons interested in this 
matter appear before this court 
at the hearing indicated below 
to show cause, if any, why the 
petition for change of name 
should not be granted. Any 
person objecting to the name 
changes described above 
must file a written objection 
that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two days 
before the matter is scheduled 
to be heard and must appear 
at the hearing to show cause 
why the petition should not be 
granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may 
grant the petition without a 
hearing.
 
Date: 08/05/22. Time: 8:30am, 
in Dept. A, Rooom 510
 
A copy of this Order to Show 
Cause shall be published at 
least once a week for four 
successive weeks prior to 
the date set for hearing on 
the petition in the following 
newspaper of general 
circulation, printed in this 
county: The British Weekly.
 
Dated: June 15, 2022.
Virginia Keeny
Judge of the Superior Court
22VECP00319

Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 
07/16/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

9425 Penfield Ave
Chatsworth CA 91311

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Valeriy Cohen an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 08/17/22. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept F47

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of 
age: Valeriy Cohen. And a 

petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with 

the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Valeriy Cohen to 
Valeriy Konovalenko

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED 
that all persons interested 
in the above-entitled matter 
of change of names appear 
before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition 
for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described 
must file a written petition 
that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and 
must appear at the hearing to 
show cause why the petition 
should not be granted. If no 
written objection is timely filed, 
the court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED 
that a copy of this order be 
published in the British Weekly, 
a newspaper of general 
circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 15, 2022.
David B. Gelfound
Judge of the Superior Court
22CHCP00213

Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 
07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022115444. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: True U Life Coach, 
9331 S. 5th Avenue, Inglewood CA 90305. 
Kimberly Rochelle McBride, 9331 S. 5th 
Avenue, Inglewood CA 90305. County: 
Los Angeles. Kimberly Rochelle McBride, 
9331 S. 5th Avenue, Inglewood CA 
90305. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Kimberly Rochelle McBride, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/27/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022116678. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Honey Waxing 
Agoura Hills, Honey Waxing Santa 
Monica, Honey Waxing Beverly Hills, 
Honey Waxing Calabas, Honey Waxing 
Hermosa Beach, 22129 Dardenne St, 
Calabasas CA 91302. County: Los 
Angeles. Brazilian Honey Waxing, 22129 
Dardenne St, Calabasas CA 91302. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by a: corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 05/2022. 
Signed: Germana Torres, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/31/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 

The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022118417. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Together We Are 
One, 313 S Cataract Ave, San Dimas CA 
91773. County: Los Angeles. Emmanuel 
Church, 313 S Cataract Ave, San Dimas 
CA 91773. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by a: corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Gwendoly 
Martin, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/01/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022119232. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Catered To 
Your Health; Cookie Addiction, 14530 
S Normandie Ave, Gardena CA 90247. 
County: Los Angeles. Candia Davis, 
14530 S Normandie Ave, Gardena CA 
90247. This business is conducted by an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Candia Davis, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/02/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022120845. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Fusion 
Exterminators, 7237 Luxor St, Downey 
CA 90241-4331. County: Los Angeles. 
PO Box 2602, Downey CA 90241-4331. 
AI#ON: C8947712. FusionX Corporation, 
7237 Luxor St, Downey CA 90241-4331. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by a: corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Sharlene Ortega, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/03/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022125800. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Razi Healtcare 
Solutions, 18525 Collins Street Unit A3, 
Tarzana CA 91356. County: Los Angeles. 
Razieh Bayatpour, 18525 Collins 
Street Unit A3, Tarzana CA 91356. This 
business is conducted by an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 05/2022. 
Signed: Razieh Bayatpour, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/09/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
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or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126633. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Sunshine Liquors, 
2619 W Florence Ave, Los Angeles CA 
90045. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
C5018249. Zeus 1966 Inc., 2619 W 
Florence Ave, Los Angeles CA 90045. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by a: corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 06/2022. 
Signed: Jamil Almashreki, Secretary. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/10/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126782. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: J&A Water 
Store, 494 N Allen Ave, Pasadena CA 
91106. County: Los Angeles. Osama 
Georges, 494 N Allen Ave, Pasadena CA 
91106. This business is conducted by an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Osama Georges, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/10/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022127078. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Wild Eden, Perfect 
Cali, What Have You Done Podcast, 
20046 Valley View Drive, Topanga CA 
90290. County: Los Angeles. Stephanie 
Lim, 20046 Valley View Drive, Topanga 
CA 90290. This business is conducted 
by an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Stephanie 
Lim, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/10/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022..

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022128900. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: ZMR Promoprint, 
14506 Maryton Ave, Norwalk CA 90650. 
County: Los Angeles. Rafael Mendoza 
Palafox, 14506 Maryton Ave, Norwalk CA 
90650. This business is conducted by an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Rafael Mendoza 
Palafox, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/14/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022129676. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Fairway Repair, 

20257 Paseo Del Prado, Walnut CA 
91789. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
1786650. Fairway Electronic Inc., 20257 
Paseo Del Prado, Walnut CA 91789. 
14506 Maryton Ave, Norwalk CA 90650. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by a: corporation.
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
07/1996. Signed: Lian Jun Liu, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022129846. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Twitter Real 
Estate, 3422 Maricopa St Apt. 218, 
Torrance CA 90503. County: Los 
Angeles. Zaheer Malik, 3422 Maricopa 
St Apt 218, Torrance CA 90503; Nusrat 
Ullah Khan, 3422 Maricopa St Apt. 218, 
Torrance CA 90503. This business is 
conducted by a: general partnership. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Nusrat Ullah Khan, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/15/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022129850. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Momentum 
Leadership Group; Dr. Keena, Momentum 
Travel Group, 4001 Inglewood Ave #101-
356, Redondo Beach CA 90278. County: 
Los Angeles. Momentum Leadership 
Group LLC, 4001 Inglewood Ave #101-
356, Redondo Beach CA 90278. State 
of Organization: California. This business 
is conducted by a: limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Keena Mosley, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022131191. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Veena Realty, 325 
N Larchmont Blvd #314, Los Angeles CA 
90004. County: Los Angeles. Matavee 
Group, 325 N Larchmont Blvd #314, Los 
Angeles CA 90004. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by a: corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2022. Signed: Veena 
Phootrakul, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/16/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022131671. The following person(s) 

is/are doing business as: Malibu Surf 
Shack, 22935 Pacific Coast Hwy, Malibu 
CA 90265. County: Los Angeles. Malibu 
Aventures Inc., 22935 Pacific Coast Hwy, 
Malibu CA 90265. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by a: corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2022. Signed: Sean 
Weber, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/16/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022132556. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Edit Studio, 
24251 Town Center Drive #218, Valencia 
CA 91355. County: Los Angeles. Molly 
Haugh, 24251 Town Center Drive #218, 
Valencia CA 91355. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2022. Signed: Molly 
Haugh, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/17/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022132595. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Art Project; 
Art Project Bellflower, 16633 Bellflower 
Blvd, Bellflower CA 90706. County: Los 
Angeles. Bricio Calvillo Ventures LLC, 
16633 Bellflower Blvd, Bellflower CA 
90706. State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Miriam 
I. Bricio Calvillo, Managing Member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/17/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022132765. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Happy Rizada 
Care Solution, 6010 Woodlawn Ave 
Maywood CA 90270. County: Los 
Angeles. Happy Rizada, 6010 Woodlawn 
Dr, Maywood CA 90270. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2022. Signed: Happy 
Rizada, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/17/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022132926. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: World Trade 
Broker, 45635 Chama Dr, Lancaster CA 
93535. County: Los Angeles. Anthony 
Herron, 45635 Chama Dr, Lancaster CA 
93535. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. Registrant(s) commenced 

to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Anthony Herron, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/17/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022133054. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Hadassah’s 
Care, 239 ½ W 5th St, Long Beach CA 
90802. County: Los Angeles. Maria 
Serpas, 239 ½ W 5th St, Long Beach CA 
90802. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Maria Serpas, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/17/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022133358. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: TBI Apparel; Rag 
Dynasty, 1848 E 58th Plce, Los Angeles 
CA 90001. County: Los Angeles. PO 
Box 555013, Los Angeles CA 90055. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by:  a corporation. 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Toplyn Iyoha, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/17/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022133764. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Zomo Aviation; 
Zomo Flight Training, Zomo Air, 4400 
Westlawn Ave, Los Angeles CA 90066. 
County: Los Angeles. Paul Storaasli, 
4400 Westlawn Ave, Los Angeles CA 
90066. This business is conducted by:  
an individual. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Paul Storaasli, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/17/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022133792. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Palisie, 18451 W 
Calico Ln Northridge CA 91325. Tina Fan, 
18451 W Calico Ln, Northridge CA 91325. 
County: Los Angeles. This business is 
conducted by:  an individual. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Tina Fan, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/17/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 

the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022133804. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: H2 Coating 
& Painting Services, Inc., Jonesway 
Services, Inc., 3826 Grand View Blvd. 
66702, Los Angeles CA 90066. County: 
Los Angeles. From Place 2 Palace A 
Residential & Business Cleaning Service 
LLC, 3826 Grand View Blvd., 66702, Los 
Angeles CA 90066. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: 
a limited liability company. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Herman 
Jones II, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/17/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/25/2022, 
07/02/2022, 07/09/2022 and 07/16/2022.

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF 

DUANE HAROLD HODNETT, 
SR.

Case No. 22STPB06259
	 To all heirs, beneficiaries, credi-
tors, contingent creditors, and per-
sons who may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate, or both, of 
DUANE HAROLD HODNETT, SR.
	 A PETITION FOR PROBATE 
has been filed by Duane H. Hod-
nett, II in the Superior Court of Cali-
fornia, County of LOS ANGELES.
	 THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that Duane H. Hodnett, II 
be appointed as personal represen-
tative to administer the estate of the 
decedent.
	 THE PETITION requests author-
ity to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Before tak-
ing certain very important actions, 
however, the personal representa-
tive will be required to give notice 
to interested persons unless they 
have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the petition will 
be held on July 29, 2022 at 8:30 AM 
in Dept. No. 9 located at 111 N. Hill 
St., Los Angeles, CA 90012.
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-
tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and le-
gal authority may affect your rights 
as a creditor. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney knowledgeable 

in California law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a per-
son interested in the estate, you 
may file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.

Attorney for petitioner:
WENDY E HARTMANN ESQ

SBN 204587
LAW OFFICES OF

WENDY HARTMANN
300 W GLENOAKS BLVD

STE 300
GLENDALE CA 91202

CN988004 HODNETT Jul 2,9,16, 
2022

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

9425 Penfield Ave
Chatsworth CA 91311

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Daniyar Dilixiati , an adult over 

the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 08/22/22. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept F47

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Daniyar Dilixiati. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 

filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Daniyar Dilixiati to 
Daniyar Dilshat.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 27, 2022.
David B Gelfound
Judge of the Superior Court
22CHCP00228

Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 
07/23/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401.

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Debora Rabizadeh, an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 09/02/22. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept K, Room 203

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Debora Rabizadeh. And a petition 
for change of names having been 

duly filed with the clerk of this 
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Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) 

desire to have their name changed 
from 

Debora Rabizadeh to 
Debora Rab.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 27, 2022.
Hon Lawrence Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
22SMCP00292

Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 
07/23/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 North Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of Jin 
Yoo, an adult over the age of 18 

years. 
​

Date: 08/01/22. Time: 9.30am; 
Dept 26, Room 316

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Jin Yoo. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from 
Jin Yoo to Jaeeun Yoo.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 24, 2022.
Elaine Lu
Judge of the Superior Court
22STCP02389

Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 
07/23/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 

CHANGE OF NAME
Superior Court of California

County of Los Angeles
400 Civic Center Plaza

Pomona CA 91766

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Jingwen Yin, an adult over the 

age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 08/19/22. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept R, Room 611

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Jingwen Yin. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from 
Jingwen Yin to Jessica Yin.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 20, 2022.
Thomas C Falls
Judge of the Superior Court
22PSCP00268

Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 
07/23/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main St
Santa Monica CA 90401.

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Clifford Schulman and Sonia 

Soulteranian, adults over the age 
of 18 years. 

​
Date: 08/12/22. Time: 8.30am; 

Dept K, room 203

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is a minor under 18 years 
of age: Maia Laila Schulman. And 

a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the 

clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said 

petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from 

Maia Laila Schulman to Maia 
Simcha Schulman

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the 
petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant 

the petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 10, 2022.
Hon Lawrence Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
22SMCP00253

Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 
07/23/2022.
ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 

CHANGE OF NAME
Superior Court of California

County of Los Angeles
825 Maple Ave

Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition of Julia 
Kathleen Vandross, an adult over 

the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 08/12/2022. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept M

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Julia Kathleen Vandross. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have their name changed from 
Julia Kathleen Vandross to Julia 
Kathleen Morey.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 20, 2022.
Deirdre Hill
Judge of the Superior Court
22TRCP00210

Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 
07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022120313. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Zero Media 
Works, 24809 Paseo Del Rancho, 
Calabasas CA 91302. County: Los 
Angeles. Scott Soohoo, 24809 Paseo 
Del Rancho, Calabasas CA 91302. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2022. Signed: Scott Shoohoo, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/03/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 

07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022123525. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Empire 
FSG, 8207 Stewart and Gray Rd. Unit 
10, Downey CA 90241. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: C4820878. Empire 
FSG Inc., 8207 Stewart and Gray Rd. 
Unit 10, Downey CA 90241. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Heidi Rodriguez, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/07/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022125785. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: LC Home 
Inc, 18351 Colima Rd #1296, Rowland  
Heights CA 91748. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON5057935. Luo’s Group, 18351 
Colima Rd #125, Rowland  Heights 
CA 91748. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2022. Signed: 
Miaomiao Cai, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/09/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126404. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Pacific Coast Safe 
Plumbing, 1451 E 76th Pl, Los Angeles 
CA 90001. County: Los Angeles. Edgar 
Salome, 1451 E 76th Pl, Los Angeles 
CA 90001. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 01/2021. Signed: Edgar 
Salome, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/10/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126744. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Mini Market 
Cruz, 735 E Florence Ave, Los Angeles 
CA 90001. County: Los Angeles. Jose 
M Cruz Contreras, 5707 Harold Way 
Apt 14, Los Angeles CA 90028.  This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2022. Signed: Jose M Cruz 
Contreras, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/10/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 

statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126804. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Diaz MS, 
1221 Poppy St, Long Beach CA 92705. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 5031537. 
DIAZ MS CORP, 1221 Poppy St, 
Long Beach CA 92705. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Juan Pablo Diaz Ramirez, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/10/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126815. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Team SoCal 
Real Estate Services, 16438 Bellflower 
Blvd, Bellflower CA 90706. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 5033137. Team 
SoCal Real Estate Services Corp,  
16438 Bellflower Blvd, Bellflower CA 
90706. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 04/2022. Signed: Lilia A 
Garcia, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/10/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022126827. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Preen Studio, 
21250 Hawthorne Blvd #170 Studio 
507, Torrance CA 90503. County: 
Los Angeles. 24520 Frampton Ave, 
Harbor City CA 90710. Gabriela Sophia 
Sherman, 24520 Frampton Ave, 
Harbor City CA 90710. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 10/2021. 
Signed: Gabriela Sophia Sherman, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/10/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022127305. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: A.S.P.S., 1201 
N Catalina #4223, Redondo Beach CA 
90277. County: Los Angeles. Suzanne 
Best, 1201 N Catalina #4223, Redondo 
Beach CA 90277. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
05/2022. Signed: Suzanne Best, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 

of Los Angeles County on: 06/10/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022127308. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Sonia S Cieslak, 
1140 Shelley St, Manhattan Beach CA 
90266. County: Los Angeles. Nancy 
Best, 1140 Shelley St, Manhattan Beach 
CA 90266. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2022. Signed: Nancy 
Best, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/10/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022127991. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Rula’s Tires 2 
Auto Repair, 1921 S. Central Ave., Los 
Angeles CA 90011. County: Los Angeles. 
11848 Allard Street, Norwalk CA 90650. 
Raul Oregel Vazquez, 12951 Imprerial 
Hwy, Santa Fe Springs CA 90670; 
Jesus M. Cazares, 11848 Allard Street, 
Norwalk CA 90650. This business is 
conducted by: a general partnership. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Jesus M. Cazares, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/13/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022128419. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Bad Beans 
Coffee, 13423 Burbank Blvd Suite #5, 
Sherman Oaks CA 91401. County: Los 
Angeles. Derek Samuel McKeith, 13423 
Burbank Blvd Suite #5, Sherman Oaks 
CA 91401. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Derek 
Samuel McKeith, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/14/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022128514. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: YOGASIX 
PORTER RANCH, 20065 W Rinaldi 
St A4#140, Porter Ranch CA 91325. 
County: Los Angeles. 17110 Orozco 
St, Granada Hills CA 91344. AI#ON 
C4841701. Stella Pleiades Corporation, 
17110 Orozco St, Granada Hills 
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CA 91344. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2022. Signed: 
Usman Qazi, Secretary. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/14/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022129056. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: HRE Trading, 
12913 Indian Lane, Norwalk CA 90650. 
County: Los Angeles. Hospicio Pep C. 
Ebarle Jr, 12913 Indian Lane, Norwalk 
CA 90650. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2022. Signed: 
Hospicio Pep C. Ebarle Jr, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/14/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022129574. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Noah Kahlil, 
1401 21st Street, Sacramento CA 95811. 
County: Sacramento. Lyricist LLC, 
1043 N. Genesee, West Hollywood CA 
90046. State of organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Noah Granger, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022129574. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Noah Kahlil, 
1401 21st Street, Sacramento CA 95811. 
County: Sacramento. Lyricist LLC, 
1043 N. Genesee, West Hollywood CA 
90046. State of organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Noah Granger, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 

2022130412. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: 365 Flooring 
Depot, 2628 E South St, Long Beach CA 
90805. County;  Los Angeles. 365 Day 
Construction Inc, 15731 Gale Ave, La 
Puente CA 91745. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2022. Signed: Li 
Huang CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/15/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022130649. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Carbon 
Neutral Copy, 2403 Rockefeller Lane, 
Unit B, Redondo Beach CA 90278. 
County: Los Angeles. Journocontent 
LLC, 2403 Rockefeller Lane, Unit B, 
Redondo Beach CA 90278. State of 
organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/03/22. Signed: Jacob Safane, 
Managing Member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022130821. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Cradled 
Heart Grief Recovery, 27830 Ferguson 
Dr. Castaic CA 91384. County: Los 
Angeles. Monica Davis, 27830 Ferguson 
Dr. Castaic CA 91384. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Monica Davis, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022131791. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Industrial 
Technical Services, 15300 Valley View 
Ave #E10, La Mirada CA 90638. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: C1931901. I.T.S. 
Group, Inc., 15300 Valley View Ave 
#E10, La Mirada CA 90638. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Arther Y Yee, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/16/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 

statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022132076. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Al’s Hot Chicken, 
11078 Santa Monica Blvd, Los Angeles 
CA 90025. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
202125910308. For My Umah LLC, 
5625 Windsor Way, 117, Culver City CA 
90230. State of organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2022. Signed: 
Toufik Bouzidi, Managing Member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/16/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022132483. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Descanso 
Eterno Funeral and Cremation, 611  
Wilshire Blvd Ste 1008, Los Angeles 
CA 90017. Descanso Eterno Funeral 
and Cremation, 611  Wilshire Blvd Ste 
1008, Los Angeles CA 90017. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 06/2022. 
Signed: Sandra Guadalupe Nelson, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/16/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022132609. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Fresh Start 
Insurance Solutions, 150 N Santa Anita 
Ave #630, Arcadia CA 91006. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 201623610069. 
Accord Global Holdings LLC, 150 N 
Santa Anita Ave #630, Arcadia CA 
91006. State of organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Meijuan 
Fu, Member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/17/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022132917. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Luxury Service 
And Detail, 2237 Valencia St, Santa 
Ana CA 92706. County: Los Angeles. 
Ramiro Alejandro Velador, 2237 Valencia 
St, Santa Ana CA 92706. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 01/2022. 

Signed: Ramiro Alejandro Velador, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/17/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022133809. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Q H Beverages, 
42124 50th St West, Quartz Hill CA 
93536. County: Los Angeles. 3 Guys Inc, 
42124 50th St West, Quartz Hill CA 93536. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Fahmy Soliman, 
secretary. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/17/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022134065. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: MADEXLIZ, 
11003 Eastwood Ave., Inglewood CA 
90304. County: Los Angeles. Lizbeth 
Guzman, 11003 Eastwood Ave., 
Inglewood CA 90304. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Lizbeth Guzman, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/21/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022134151. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Dotsparky, 
601 N Isabel St #304, Glendale CA 
91206. County: Los Angeles. Carole 
Antouri, 601 N Isabel St #304, Glendale 
CA 91206. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2022. Signed: Carole 
Antouri, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/21/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022134162. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Ronnie Rooter 
Plumbing Services, 2421 Foothill Blvd. 
Apt 12B, La Verne CA 91750. County: 
Los Angeles. Ronald McNutt, 2421 

Foothill Blvd. Apt 12B, La Verne CA 
91750. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Ronald 
McNutt, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/21/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022134255. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Rumi Aesthetics, 
822 Santa Fe Ave, Unit C, San Gabriel 
CA 91776. County: Los Angeles. GKN 
Management LLC, 822 Santa Fe Ave, 
Unit C, San Gabriel CA 91776. State of 
organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Angelin Lee, Member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/21/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022134646. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Motivational 
Custom Wear, 11003 Eastwood Ave, 
Inglewood CA 90304. County: Los 
Angeles. Lizbeth Guzman, 11003 
Eastwood Ave, Inglewood CA 90304. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Lizbeth Guzman, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/21/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022134986. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Armor EMF, 
601 N Isabel #304, Glendale CA 91206. 
County: Los Angeles. Carole Antouri, 
601 N Isabel #304, Glendale CA 91206. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Carole Antouri, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/21/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022135002. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Phlebotxpress, 

6636 Nagle Ave, Van Nuys CA 91401. 
County: Los Angeles. 11946 Alondra 
Blvd, Norwalk CA 90650. Juliette Arely 
Johnson, 6636 Nagle Ave, Van Nuys CA 
91401. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Juliette Arely Johnson, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/21/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022135018. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Taquiero Man, 
6636 Nagle Ave, Van Nuys CA 91401. 
County: Los Angeles. 11946 Alondra 
Blvd, Norwalk CA 90650. Juliette Arely 
Johnson, 6636 Nagle Ave, Van Nuys 
CA 91401; Mayra Alejandra Carranza, 
6636 Nagle Ave, Van Nuys CA 91401. 
This business is conducted by: a 
general partnership. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Mayra 
Alejandra Carranza, general partner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/21/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022135514. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: WFS Global 
Logistics Inc, 1309 W Walnut Parkway, 
Compton CA 90220. County: Los 
Angeles. Weida Freight System, Inc., 
1309 W Walnut Parkway, Compton 
CA 90220. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 11/2011. Signed: 
Yongliang Wei, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/21/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022135700. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Streamline 
Transaction Services, 1615 N. Martel 
Ave., #301, Los Angeles CA 90046. 
County: Los Angeles. Russell Beaman, 
1615 N. Martel Ave., #301, Los Angeles 
CA 90046. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Russell 
Beaman, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/21/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
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07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022135728. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: We Tidy 
Garages, 312 S. Beverly Blvd., #7112, 
Beverly Hills CA 90212. County: Los 
Angeles. Rachbuch Enterprises, Inc., 
312 S. Beverly Blvd., #7112, Beverly 
Hills CA 90212. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2022. Signed: 
Kenneth Maurice Raich, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/21/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022135925. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Techplugs, 476 
E. Palm Ave Apt D, Burbank CA 91501. 
County: Los Angeles. Garnik Avetisyan, 
476 E. Palm Ave Apt D, Burbank CA 
91501. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Garnik Avetisyan, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/22/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022135937. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: City Pacific, LLC, 
4730 Woodman Ave Ste 200, Sherman 
Oaks CA 91423. County: Los Angeles. 
City Pacific, LLC, 4730 Woodman Ave 
Ste 200, Sherman Oaks CA 91423.  
State of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2022. Signed: Jason 
Richard Lopata, Managing Member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/22/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022137501. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Morgan 
St. Ives; Brixta Studio, Merchants of 
Montrose, 24307 Magic Mountain Pkwy 
#707, Valencia CA 91355. County: Los 
Angeles. Laura Eggers Underhill, 24140 
Newhall Ranch Rd, #5307, Valencia CA 
91355. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2005. Signed: Laura Eggers 
Underhill, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/23/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 

use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022138077. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Meet Here, 1738-
1/4 Nogales Street, Rowland Heights 
CA 91748. County: Los Angeles. 20739 
Lycoming St 125, Walnut CA 91789. Ru 
Yee, 20739 Lycoming St 125, Walnut 
CA 91789. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Jian Zhang, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/23/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022138485. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lisa Akawie 
Photography, 4197 McConnell Blvd, 
Los Angeles CA 90066. County: Los 
Angeles. Lisa Akawie Schneider, 4197 
McConnell Blvd, Los Angeles CA 
90066. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2022. Signed: Lisa 
Akawie Schneider, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/23/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022138617. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Amir Marandy, 
22950 Oxnard St., Woodland Hills CA 
91367. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
202250612984. Match Point Wins LLC, 
22950 Oxnard St., Woodland Hills CA 
91367. State of organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Amir Marandy, Manager. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/23/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022139031. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Premier Martial 
Arts, 17265 Ventura Blvd, Encino CA 
91316. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
C4830002. 13343 First St, Van Nuys 
CA 91401. Martial Arts Moguls, 13343 
First St, Van Nuys CA 91401. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Lisa Ivey, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/23/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 

expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022139194. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: K1 Express, 
11136 Walnut St, El Monte CA 
91731. County: Los Angeles. Chiman 
Kam, 11136 Walnut St, El Monte CA 
91731. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Chiman 
Kam, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/24/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022139463. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Team8, 11565 
Missouri, Los Angeles CA 90025. 
County: Los Angeles. Michelle Freed, 
11565 Missouri, Los Angeles CA 90025. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Michelle Freed, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/24/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022139493. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: The Silen, 
Silen Media, SIlen, SIlen Audio, 5908 
Abernathy Dr, Los Angeles CA 90045. 
County: Los Angeles. Silen Audio LLC, 
5908 Abernathy Dr, Los Angeles CA 
90045. State of organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 07/2014. Signed: Adam 
Fligstein, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/24/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022139995. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Aneu Enterprises; 
Aneu Entertainment, Aneu Productions, 
Aneu Studios, Aneu Merch, 879 W 
190th, Suite 400, Gardena CA 90248. 
County; Los Angeles. AI#ON: 4640366. 
Aneu Enterprise Inc, 879 W 190th, 
Suite 400, Gardena CA 90248. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Wesley Pater Jr., CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 

statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/24/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022140161. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: The Lunava, 
10636 Woodley Ave, Unit 12, Granada 
Hills CA 91344. County; Los Angeles. 
Jelah Lugue, 10636 Woodley Ave, 
Unit 12, Granada Hills CA 91344. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Jelah Lugue, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/24/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022140786. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: The Internet 
Law Group, 9100 Wilshire Blvd Suite 
725E, Beverly Hils CA 90212. County; 
Los Angeles. The Law Offices of Kavon 
Adli, P.C., 9100 Wilshire Blvd Suite 
725E, Beverly Hils CA 90212. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2012. Signed: Kavon Adli, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/24/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022140902. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Skid Towards 
Wellness, 9315 La Shell Dr, Tujunga 
CA 91042. County: Los Angeles. Arlin 
Davidian, 9315 La Shell Dr, Tujunga CA 
91042. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Arlin Davidian, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/27/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022141049. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: AMT Security, 
23643  Newhall Avenue Apt 207, Santa 
Clarita CA 91321. County: Los Angeles. 
Tawana Craig, 23643  Newhall Avenue 
Apt 207, Santa Clarita CA 91321. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Tawana Craig, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 

statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/27/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/02/2022, 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022142099. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: KFC Nordhoff, 
19626 Nordhoff St, Northridge CA 91324. 
County: Los Angeles. 19400 Business 
Center Dr 111, Northridge CA 91324. 
Crave Concepts, Inc., 19400 Business 
Center Dr 111, Northridge CA 91324. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Fayyaz Shariff, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/27/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/02/2022, 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022 and 07/23/2022.

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF 
STEPHEN EUGENE BEATTIE

Case No. 22STPB06484
	 To all heirs, beneficiaries, credi-
tors, contingent creditors, and per-
sons who may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate, or both, 
of STEPHEN EUGENE BEATTIE
	 A PETITION FOR PROBATE 
has been filed by Monica L. Wil-
liams in the Superior Court of Cal-
ifornia, County of LOS ANGELES.
	 THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that Monica L. Williams be 
appointed as personal representa-
tive to administer the estate of the 
decedent.
	 THE PETITION requests the 
decedent’s will and codicils, if any, 
be admitted to probate. The will and 
any codicils are available for exam-
ination in the file kept by the court.
	 THE PETITION requests author-
ity to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Before tak-
ing certain very important actions, 
however, the personal representa-
tive will be required to give notice 
to interested persons unless they 
have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the petition will 
be held on August 19, 2022 at 8:30 
AM in Dept. No. 5 located at 111 N. 
Hill St., Los Angeles, CA 90012.
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-
tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 

Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and le-
gal authority may affect your rights 
as a creditor. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney knowledgeable 
in California law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a per-
son interested in the estate, you 
may file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.

Attorney for petitioner:
JAMES G MORRIS ESQ

SBN 110955
THE BURBANK FIRM L C

2312 WEST VICTORY BLVD
STE 100

BURBANK CA 91506
CN988443 BEATTIE Jul 9,16,23, 

2022

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

9425 Penfield Avenue, Room 1200
Chatsworth CA 91311

In the Matter of the Petition 
of David Nelson Perez, an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

Date: 09/01/22. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept F47

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of 

age: David Nelson Perez. And 
a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the 

clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said 

petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from David Nelson 

Perez to David Nelson Bredby 
Real.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 30, 2022.
Judge David B Gelfound
Judge of the Superior Court
22CHCP00233

Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 
07/30/2022.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd
Norwalk CA 90650

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Ilona Maria Vosburg, an 

adult over the age of 18 years. 
​

LEGAL NOTICES
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Date: 08/31/22. Time: 10.30am; 
Dept C Room 312

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Ilona Maria Vosburg. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Ilona Maria Vosburg to Ilona 
Maria Mattsson.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: July 01, 2022.
Judge Margaret M. Bernal
Judge of the Superior Court
22NWCP00272

Published: 07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 
07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Yuen Man Phyllis Chow, an 
adult over the age of 18 years. 

​
Date: 09/02/22. Time: 8.30am; 

Dept K

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Yuen Man Phyllis Chow. And 
a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the 

clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said 

petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from Yuen Man 
Phyllis Chow to Phyllis Yuen 

Man Chow.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 30, 2022.
Judge Lawrence Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
22SMCP00300

Published: 07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 
07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022125349. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: The Villas At 
Woodland Hills; The Villas At Woodland 
Hills Apartments, Villas At Woodland 
Hills; Villas At Woodland Hills Apartments, 
5807 Topanga Canyon Blvd, Woodland 
Hills CA 91367. County: Los Angeles. 
777 S California Ave Ste 100, Palo 
Alto CA 94304. State of organization: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Christopher Kober, Managing 
Member. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/09/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 
07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022127396. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Cely Spa & 
Wellness Studio, 4001 Pacific Coast 
Highway Suite #106A, Torrance CA 
90505. County: Los Angeles. Aracely 
Rico, 24035 Ocean Avenue #29, Torrance 
CA 90505; Ricardo Rico, 24035 Ocean 
Avenue #29, Torrance CA 9050524035 
Ocean Avenue #29, Torrance CA 90505. 
This business is conducted by: a married 
couple. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Aracely Rico, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/10/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022128458. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Cal Security 
Inc, 1208 W Jefferson Blvd Apt #23, Los 
Angeles CA 90007. County: Los Angeles. 
Cal Security, 1208 W Jefferson Blvd Apt 
#23, Los Angeles CA 90007. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Chaudhry M. Younus, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/14/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022130726. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Super 
Exciting Productions, 535 N. California 
St., Burbank CA 91505. County: Los 
Angeles. Logan Hall, 535 N. California 
St., Burbank CA 91505. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
09/2017. Signed: Logan Hall, owner. 

Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022130850. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Caruso 
Enterprises, Caruso Collections, 15030 
Ventura Blvd Suite 11, Sherman Oaks 
CA 91403. County: Los Angeles. Sharon 
Caruso, 15030 Ventura Blvd Suite 11, 
Sherman Oaks CA 91403. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Sharon Caruso, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/15/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022132911. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Sewgoth, 11212 
½ Richland Ave, Los Angeles CA 90064. 
County: Los Angeles. Paula S Fonseca, 
11212 ½ Richland Ave, Los Angeles CA 
90064. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2022. Signed: Paula S Fonseca, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/17/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 
07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022136099. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: LJ’s Photo Studio, 
5117 S Vermont Ave, Los Angeles CA 
90037. County: Los Angeles. Luis Rey 
Melo Camacho, 5117 S Vermont Ave, 
Los Angeles CA 90037. County: Los 
Angeles. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Luis Rey 
Melo Camacho, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/22/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022136112. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: WM Architects, 
1142 S Diamond Bar Blvd #722, 
Diamond Bar CA 91765. County: Los 
Angeles. Waleed Gabra Mosaad, 1420 
Tierra Cima Ave., Walnut CA 91789. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 

name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Waleed Gabra Mosaad, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/22/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022136121. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Original Skin, 382 
Mariposa Ave, Sierra Madre CA 91024. 
County: Los Angeles. Sarah Palacios, 
382 Mariposa Ave, Sierra Madre CA 
91024. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Sarah Palacios, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/22/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022136301. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Jimenez Cabinets 
Plus Construction, 4005 Medford St, Los 
Angeles CA 90063. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 5101465. 4003 E 6th St, Los 
Angeles CA 90063. Hernandez Brothers 
Inc, 4005 Medford St, Los Angeles 
CA 90063. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Jorge Hernandez Jimenez, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/22/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022136312. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Chelo’s Flowers, 
2809 N Figueroa St, Los Angeles CA 
90065. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
5078334. 4003 E 6th St, Los Angeles CA 
90063. La Jarochita Inc, 2809 N Figueroa 
St, Los Angeles CA 90065. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Antonia Velazquez Perez, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/22/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 
07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022136552. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Santi’s 
A&E Specialist, 1172 N Western Ave, 
Los Angeles CA 90029. County: Los 

Angeles. AI#ON: 4256273. Santis’s 
Trucking Incorporated, 1172 N Western 
Ave, Los Angeles CA 90029. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Erick David Archila Chacon, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/22/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 
07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022136787. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: 7 Pointed Star 
Press, 4219 Don Ortega Place, Los 
Angeles CA 90008. County: Los Angeles. 
Greta Brown, 4219 Don Ortega Place, 
Los Angeles CA 90008. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
08/2012. Signed: Greta Brown, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/22/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022137231. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: 7 Pointed Star 
Ministries, 4219 Don Ortega Place, Los 
Angeles CA 90008. County: Los Angeles. 
Greta Brown, 4219 Don Ortega Place, 
Los Angeles CA 90008. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
08/2012. Signed: Greta Brown, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/22/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022139198. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Opes & Theos; 
Opes and Theos, 601 N Isabel St Suite 
304, Glendale CA 91206. County: Los 
Angeles. Carole Antouri, 601 N Isabel 
St Suite 304, Glendale CA 91206. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Carole Antouri, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/24/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022140127. The following person(s) is/

are doing business as: Eagles Plumbing 
Services, 1948 Marianna Ave Apt 203, 
Los Angeles CA 90032. County: Los 
Angeles. Abraham Guoch Moreno, 1948 
Marianna Ave Apt 203, Los Angeles CA 
90032. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Abraham Guoch 
Moreno, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/24/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 
07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022140176. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lowe’s Pro 
Supply of LA Central # 124; Lowe’s 
Pro Supply of LA Inland Empire # 125, 
Lowe’s Pro Supply of LA Santa Clarita 
# 126, 6910 Brasada Drive, Houston 
TX 77085. County: Harris. 1000 Lowes 
Blvd, Mooresville NC 28117. AI#ON: 
202208110271. MSH/LPP, LLC, 1000 
Lowes Blvd, Mooresville NC 28117.  
State of organization: Delaware. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2006. 
Signed: David R Green, Vice President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/24/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022140195. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lowe’s Pro 
Supply4521(124) LA Central, 12995 
Marquardt Avenue, Santa Fe Springs 
CA 90670. County: Los Angeles. 1000 
Lowes Blvd, Mooresville NC 28117. 
AI#ON: 202208110271. MSH/LPP, 
LLC, 6910 Brasada Drive, Houston TX 
77085.  State of organization: Delaware. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2006. 
Signed: David R Green, Vice President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/24/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022140567. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Egon Blix, 1933 
N Bronson Ave Apt 409, Los Angeles 
CA 90068. County: Los Angeles. Egon 
Fjortaj, 1933 N Bronson Ave Apt 409, 
Los Angeles CA 90068. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2017. Signed: Egon Fjortaj, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/24/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
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Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022140981. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: LPS4523 
(125) LA Inland Empire 15910 Jurupa 
Ave, Fontana CA 92337. County: Los 
Angeles. 1000 Lowes Blvd, Mooresville 
NC 28117. MSH/LPP, LLC, 1000 Lowes 
Blvd, Mooresville NC 28117. State of 
organization: Delaware. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2006. Signed: David R Green, 
Vice President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/27/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 
07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022141890. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ibex Ridge, 
1814 N Bel Aire Dr, Burbank CA 91504. 
County: Los Angeles. Shant Harout 
Najarian, 1814 N Bel Aire Dr, Burbank CA 
91504. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Shant Harout Najarian, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/27/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 
07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022142219. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Brighthouse 
Books, 152 Ximeno Ave Apt A, Long 
Beach CA 90803. County: Los Angeles. 
Liya L Swift, 152 Ximeno Ave Apt A, 
Long Beach CA 90803. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Liya L Swift, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/28/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022142335. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Safe Re-
Set, Mindfield Wellness, Mindfield 
Therapies, 1138 S. Crescent Heights 
Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90035. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 4687527. Safe 
Re-Set, 1138 S. Crescent Heights 
Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90035. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Edward Bates, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 

statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/28/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022142385. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
CelebrityAndTheLaw.com, 3846 Ver 
Halen Ct, Culver City CA 90232. County: 
Los Angeles. CelebrityAndTheLaw.com 
LLC, 3846 Ver Halen Ct, Culver City CA 
90232. State of organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Tracey 
Stevens, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/28/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 
07/30/2022.

Statement of Abandonment of Use of 
Fictitious Business Name: 2022143101. 
Current file: 2022143101. The following 
person has abandoned the use of the 
fictitious business name: Olixia, 10107 
Sophia Ave, North Hills CA 91343. 
Olixia LLC, 10107 Sophia Ave, North 
Hills CA 91343. The fictitious business 
name referred to above was filed on: 
06/28/2022, in the County of Los Angeles. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. Signed: Samuel Oh, 
Manager. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/28/2022. Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022143777. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lowe’s Pro 
Supply4522 (#126) LA Santa Clarita, 
29040 Avenue Valley View Suite 
A, Valencia CA 91355. County: Los 
Angeles. 1000 Lowes Blvd, Mooresville 
NC 28117. AI#ON: 202208110271. MSH/
LPP, LLC, 1000 Lowes Blvd, Mooresville 
NC 28117. State of organization: 
Delaware. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 07/2006. 
Signed: David R Green, Vice President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/29/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022143799. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Copa Beach 
Soccer, 12100 Wilshire Blvd Suite 280, 
Los Angeles CA 90025. County: Los 
Angeles. 2410 34th Street Apt B, Santa 
Monica CA 90405. Andrew Carman, 
2410 34th Street Apt B, Santa Monica CA 
90405. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Andrew Carman, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/29/2022. 

NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022144081. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: All Reasons Real 
Estate; ARRE, 11792 Moorpark St, Unit 
C, Studio City CA 91604. County: Los 
Angeles. Michael Christensen, 11792 
Moorpark St, Unit C, Studio City CA 
91604. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Michael Christensen, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/29/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022144219. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Monkeyback 
Music Entertainment, 5311 Topanga 
Cyn. Blvd., Ste. 201, Woodland Hills CA 
91364. County: Los Angeles. Dorothy 
Reik, 5311 Topanga Cyn. Blvd., Ste. 
201, Woodland Hills CA 91364. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Dorothy Reik, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/29/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022144247. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Topanga Living 
Café, 1704 North Topanga Canyon 
Boulevard, Topanga CA 90290. County: 
Los Angeles. AI:ON; 201513310435. 
Café Topanga, LLC, 1704 N. Topanga 
Cyn Blvd., Topanga CA 90290. State 
of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2015. Signed: 
Agustina Shri Ferguson, Manager.  
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/29/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022144565. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: The Riley Foster 
Collection; Random Graphics Company, 
947 Hilldale Ave, West Hollywood CA 
90069. County: Los Angeles. Stacy 
Weddington, 947 Hilldale Ave, West 
Hollywood CA 90069. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 

Signed: Stacy Weddington, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/29/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022144585. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Pablo Nuñez 
Enterprises; Pablo Nuñez Entertainment, 
1600 E. Holt Ave., Pomona CA 91767. 
County: Los Angeles. 11449 ½ Bryant 
Rd, El Monte CA 91732. Pablo Nuñez, 
11449 ½ Bryant Rd, El Monte CA 91732. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Pablo Nuñez, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/29/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022144632. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Big Thr33 
Kennels, 4242 W Ave L #106, Lancaster 
CA 93536. County: Los Angeles. Roy 
Rojo, 4242 W Ave L #106, Lancaster CA 
93536. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2021. Signed: Roy Rojo, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/29/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022145101. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lens of Sport, 
2018 Pico Blvd., Los Angeles CA 90405. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 6757290. 
Luminary Education, Inc., 2018 Pico 
Blvd., Los Angeles CA 90405. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Hany K. Syed, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/30/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022145631. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Signature Travel 
& Tours, 4814 Bannister Ave, El Monte 
CA 91732. County: Los Angeles. Le 
Thai, 4814 Bannister Ave, El Monte CA 
91732. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 

on: n/a. Signed: Le Thai, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/30/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022146367. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Rubber 
Tubbers, 2421 Fisk Ln Apt B, Redondo 
Beach CA 90278. County: Los Angeles. 
Uncle Baby, LLC, 2421 Fisk Ln Apt B, 
Redondo Beach CA 90278. State of 
organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 04/2017. Signed: Matthew 
Michael Hobbie, Managing Member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/30/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022146624. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Bethel Christian 
Fellowship, 1014 south Westlake 
Boulevard Suite 14-257, Westlake Village 
CA 91361. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
1166127. Rehov,Inc., 28947 Thousand 
Oaks Boulevard, Unit 236, Agoura Hills 
CA 91301-2116. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 01/1983. Signed: 
Michael James Fuller, Vice President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 07/01/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022146901. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Win On Purpose, 
10586 W. Pico Blvd #215, Los Angeles 
CA 90064. County: Los Angeles. Tasha 
Danvers, 3826 Monteith Drive, View Park 
CA 90043. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2022. Signed: Tasha 
Danvers, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 07/01/2022. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 
07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022147052. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: European 
Wax Center of West Coviina, 2648 E. 
Workman Ave, Space #330, West Covina 
CA 91791. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 

200919010215. EWC Los Angeles, 
LLC, 2648 E. Workman Ave, Space 
#330, West Covina CA 91791. State of 
Organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Yvette Beaulieu, Member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 07/01/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022147325. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Light Awakening, 
6080 Center Drive 6th Floor, Los Angeles 
CA 90045. County: Los Angeles. 815 
N La Brea Ave #505, Inglewood CA 
90302. Douglas Sutton, 815 N La Brea 
Ave #505, Inglewood CA 90302. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
06/2022. Signed: Douglas Sutton, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 07/01/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022147346. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Ce Ra Way Auto, 
609 St Paul Ave Unit B 509, Los Angeles 
CA 90017. County: Los Angeles. Randal 
Cedric Carraway, 609 St Paul Ave Unit 
B 509, Los Angeles CA 90017. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Randal Cedric Carraway, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 07/01/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 07/09/2022, 
07/16/2022, 07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2022147497. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Sugar 
Sugar, 3737 Lewis Ave, Long Beach 
CA 90807. County: Los Angeles. Julia 
Summers, 3737 Lewis Ave, Long Beach 
CA 90807. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Julia Summers, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 07/01/2022. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/09/2022, 07/16/2022, 
07/23/2022 and 07/30/2022.
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Raheem Sterling has 
agreed personal terms 
with Chelsea and 
confirmation of his 
move from Manchester 
City is now imminent.
	 The England 
international headed 
a shortlist of Thomas 
Tuchel’s attacking targets 
and had entered the final 
year of his contract with 
City, who are grateful 
for his service and will 
not obstruct his desire 
for greater minutes and 
status elsewhere.
	 Pep Guardiola has 
repeatedly stated “I 
don’t like to keep 
players that are 
unhappy” and was open 
to allowing Sterling’s 
exit this summer, even 
to a Premier League 
rival, on condition that 
an acceptable bid in the 
region of £50m is tabled.
	 Tuchel was desperate 
to add a decisive edge 

in the final third to cure 
Chelsea’s goalscoring 
issues and new Blues 
owner Todd Boehly had 
been in touch with City 
to discuss figures and 
the structure of a deal.
	 Sterling would offer 
Tuchel a guaranteed 
threat - he has directly 
contributed a combined 
165 goals in the division 
in 320 appearances for 
Liverpool and City - as 
well as tactical flexibility 
and experience.
	 The 27-year-old 
believes he is in the 
decisive phase of his 
career and wants to 
make a significant 
contribution on and off 
the pitch.
	 The fact that City can 
cede two attackers to 
members of the ‘Big Six’ 
- Gabriel Jesus to Arsenal 
for £45m and Sterling 
to Stamford Bridge - 
without trepidation 

Paul Pogba is set to 
rejoin Juventus on a 
free transfer after his 
Manchester United 
contract expired.
	 It is understood the 
29-year-old France 
midfielder will have a 
medical at the weekend 
before completing the 
move.
	 Pogba joined United 
from the Italian side in 
2016 for a  then world-
record fee of £89m.
	 United and Pogba 
failed to agree on a new 
contract and the club 
confirmed at the start 
of June that he would 
leave as a free agent this 
summer.
	 It is anticipated Pogba 
will begin training with 
Juventus next week prior 
to their trip to the United 
States, where they will 
face Barcelona and Real 
Madrid on 27 and 30 July 
respectively.
	 For the second 

straight season, Juventus 
finished fourth in Serie 
A, 16 points behind 
champions AC Milan.
	 They had been Italian 
champions for the 
preceding nine seasons, 
with Pogba playing a 
key role in their title wins 
from 2012-13 to 2015-16.
	 He scored 34 goals 
from 178 games in his 
previous spell with 
Juventus having also 
joined on a free from 
United in 2012, after 
coming through the Old 
Trafford academy.
	 During his first season 
back at Old Trafford, 
Pogba helped United 
win the EFL Cup and 
Europa League but they 
would prove to be the 
only trophies he won in 
his second spell.
	 A disagreement with 
then manager Jose 
Mourinho saw him lose 
the vice-captaincy in 
2018 and injuries and 

sporadic form reduced 
his impact.
	 Pogba, who joined the 
United academy from Le 
Havre as a 16-year-old in 
2009, was influential as 
France won the World 
Cup in Russia in 2018 
and scored 16 goals for 
United in 2018-19.
	 But over the last 
three seasons he scored 
eight goals from 91 
appearances, with one 
from 27 last term.
	 “It was a low-
key end to a United 
career that brought 
so many individual 
high moments,” read 
a United statement 
earlier this month when 
they  announced Pogba 
was to leave.
	 United offered him 
an extension and BBC 
Sport understands it 
was a more lucrative 
offer than his previous 
deal but in an  Amazon 
Prime documentary ‘The 

Stirling seals Chelsea switch

is a sign of their solid 
recruitment and the gap 
that exists between the 

clubs.
	 Intra-league transfers 
at the top end of the 

table are set to become 
more common as 
European teams struggle 

to financially compete 
with their English 
counterparts.

STIRLING: The 27-year-old believes he is in the decisive phase of his 
career and wants to make a significant contribution on and off the pitch.

Pogumentary’,  he said 
the club was “bluffing”.
	 Pogba scored 39 goals 
in 233 appearances 
across his two spells 
at the club but his 

final home appearance 
against Norwich City in 
April saw him jeered by 
his own supporters as he 
was substituted.
He expressed gratitude 

for the “unconditional 
support from the fans” 
in a message on social 
media following the 
club’s announcement 
that he was leaving.

Pogba on his way back to 
Juve as contract expires

POGBA: not so great the second time round

Manchester United 
striker Cristiano 
Ronaldo wants to  leave 
the club  this summer if 
the Premier League side 
can find the right offer.
	 The Portugal 
international re-signed 
for United before the 
2021-22 season, scoring 

18 league goals. It is 
thought Ronaldo wants 
to play in the Champions 
League but United 
missed out after finishing 
sixth in the league and 
qualifying for the Europa 
League.
	 The 37-year-old has 
missed the club’s return 

to pre-season training 
at Carrington so far this 
week for family reasons 
and instead trained at 
the Portuguese national 
team’s headquarters.
	 The squad are due to 
leave for their pre-season 
tour of Thailand and 
Australia on Friday.
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RESTAURANT:
116 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 451-1402
Happy Hour Mon-Fri. 4-7

(food specials)
SHOPPE: 

132 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 394-8765
Open 11am Mon-Thurs
Open 10am Weekends

Jolly Good Baked Goods in our Shoppe: 
Bangers, Sausage Rolls and More...  

• Afternoon Tea Wed-Sat. 11.30am-4pm 
• Open Daily for breakfast, lunch & dinner

King’s Head Coffee 
Shoppe coming soon!

A great addition to our Gift Shoppe & Bakery.

www.yeoldekingshead.com

England’s cricket 
team continued their 
remarkable resurgence 
under recently appointed 
skipper Ben Stokes by 
nonchalantly completing 
a record chase of 378 to 
beat India in rapid time 
on the final morning 
of the fifth Test at 
Edgbaston.
	 Centuries from Joe Root 
and Jonny Bairstow took 
England to their highest 
successful pursuit in Test 
cricket and the ninth-
largest in the history of the 
game.
	 Needing another 119 
from their overnight 259-
3, Root and Bairstow 

coasted with incredible 
ease, taking England to a 
memorable seven-wicket 
win, one of their all-time 
greatest victories.
	 Bairstow’s 114 not out 
was his second century 
of the match, while Root 
ended unbeaten on 142 in 
an unbroken partnership 
of 269.
	 They carried England 
to a new height in what is 
turning into a spectacular 
summer under new 
captain Stokes and coach 
Brendon McCullum.
	 The win ensures a series 
that was postponed last 
summer is drawn 2-2 but, 
more importantly, it is 

the greatest validation to 
date of England’s ultra-
positive approach to Test 
cricket.
	 Their next series is with 
South Africa in August, 
while an entirely different 
squad under new white-
ball captain Jos Buttler 
plays the first of three 
T20s against India on 
Thursday.
	 Just five weeks ago, 
England’s Test cricket 
was in the doldrums, with 
McCullum and Stokes 
given the task of reviving 
a team that had won only 
once in 17 attempts.
	 While the manner of the 
3-0 series win over New 

Barcelona have claimed 
that Frenkie de Jong 
is not for sale - even 
though Manchester 
United have a broad 
agreement in place to 
sign the midfielder.
	 Last week,  United 
agreed  a 65m euro 
(£56m) fee, plus add-
ons, with Barca for 
the Netherlands 
international (pictured, 
above) and that deal 
remains active.
	 But Barca president 
Joan Laporta said: “[De 

Jong] is a Barca player 
and unless we have a 
need or interest in selling 
him, we don’t want to 
sell him.”
	 De Jong  joined from 
Ajax  in 2019 for a fee 
of £65m plus £9.5m in 
variables, and signed 
a five-year contract. 
However, Barcelona 
may now need to sell 
high-earning players to 
balance the books.
But an outline deal is 
in place with Premier 
League side United 

but progress towards 
completion has been 
slow.
	 A move to the Red 
Devils would reunite 
De Jong with his former 
Ajax boss Erik ten Hag, 
who is taking charge in 
his first season at Old 
Trafford.
	 Laporta added: “We 
know he [De Jong] has 
offers. If at some moment 
we were interested, we 
would consider it, but 
right now, we’re not 
selling the player.”

Zealand was thrilling, 
it felt like a different 
prospect to play ‘Bazball’ 
against the powerful 
Indians.
	 The home side were 
under huge pressure at 
different times during 
this match. They were 
83-5 in response to India’s 
first-innings 416, then on 
Monday India were 322 
ahead with five second-
innings wickets in hand.
	 And yet, England’s 
insistence that they could 

chase any target was 
proved correct, thanks 
largely to the cavalier 
progress they made on 
a scintillating fourth 
afternoon.
	 Strangely, given the 
magnitude of the result, 
the fifth morning was 
almost anticlimactic.
	 Edgbaston was far 
from full despite all of the 
available free tickets being 
taken, while Root and 
Bairstow removed what 
little jeopardy remained in 

the chase.
	 That takes nothing 
away from what England 
have accomplished - to 
overhaul 378 for the loss 
of only three wickets is 
truly remarkable.
	 Superlatives for 
England’s pair of 
Yorkshire batting maestros 
have long been exhausted. 
This was Bairstow’s fourth 
hundred in five innings 
and sixth this year, Root 
has made 11 since the 
beginning of 2021.

England smash 
their way to victory

Fifth LV Insurance Test: Edgbaston: day five of five. 
INDIA 416 (Pant 146, Jadeja 104; Anderson 5-60) & 245 

(Pujara 66, Pant 57; Stokes 4-33)
ENGLAND 284 (Bairstow 106, Siraj 4-66) & 378-3 (Root 142*, 

Bairstow 114*) England won by seven wickets; series drawn 2-2

THRILLING VICTORY: Root and Bairstow salute the winning runs

Barca rebuff United over de Jong


