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BORIS JOHNSON’S colorful career in British politics has 
come to an inglorious end.

BORIS: THE PARTY’S OVER
n Former prime minister found to have deliberately misled Parliament over lockdown parties

	 Following his decision 
to stand down as an MP 
last Friday, this week saw 
a damning report from 
the Privileges Committee, 
which said the former PM 
had committed repeated 
offences with his denials 
over lockdown parties the 
height of Covid.
	 Mr Johnson - who 
helped the Conservative 
Party win a landslide 
election victory under 
his leadership only three 
years ago - is the first 
former prime minister 
to have been found to 
have deliberately misled 
Parliament.
	 Johnson would have 
faced a 90-day suspension 
if he were still an MP.

‘deranged’
	 In a damning report, 
the Privileges Committee 
said the former PM had 
committed repeated 
offences with his Partygate 
denials.
	 But in typical fashion 
Johnson remained 
defiant, describing the 
Committee’s conclusions 
as “deranged”.
	 In a blistering statement, 
he branded the committee 
a “kangaroo court” and 
claimed its year-long 
inquiry had delivered 
“what is intended to be 
the final knife-thrust in 
a protracted political 
assassination”.
	 It has been confirmed a 
by-election to replace him 
in his Uxbridge and South 

Ruislip constituency will 
take place on 20 July.
	 On the same day, 
voters will also elect a 
replacement for Johnson 
ally Nigel Adams, who 
also stood down as MP 
for Selby and Ainsty in the 
wake of the former PM’s 
resignation.
	 The seven-person 
committee, chaired by 
Labour’s Harriet Harman 
but with a Tory majority, 
has been considering 
whether Mr Johnson 
misled MPs about Covid 
breaches in Downing 
Street during the 
pandemic.
	 When giving evidence 
to the committee in March, 
Mr Johnson staunchly 
denied misleading 
Parliament on purpose, in 
a stormy session.
	 But in its lengthy report, 
which runs to 106 pages, 
the committee concluded 
that Mr Johnson’s 
“personal knowledge of 
breaches”, combined with 
“his repeated failures pro-
actively to investigate” 
them, amounted to “a 
deliberate closing of his 
mind” to the facts.

‘contempt’
	 The committee focused 
on six gatherings between 
May 2020 and January 
2021, and statements 
Mr Johnson made to 
Parliament about them.
	 The committee 
concluded that officials 
did not advise Mr Johnson 

that social-distancing 
guidelines had been 
followed at all times, 
despite him making the 
claim in the House of 
Commons.
	 In key evidence, one 
of Mr Johnson’s most 
senior officials, Martin 
Reynolds, said he advised 
the former prime minister 
against making the claim, 
questioning whether it 
was “realistic”.
	 Some of Mr Johnson’s 
denials, the committee 
added, were “so 
disingenuous that they 
were by their very nature 
deliberate attempts to 
mislead”.
	 They amounted to a 
“contempt” of Parliament, 
the MPs added, because 
they stopped Parliament 
carrying out its “essential 
task” of holding him to 
account.
	 Explaining their 
recommendation for a 
90-day suspension, they 
found that he had also 
committed a repeated 
contempts by:
	 • D e l i b e r a t e l y 
misleading MPs on the 
Privileges Committee 
while they were 
investigating him
	 •Referring to the 
committee’s findings 
before they were 
published, in his 
resignation statement last 
week
	 •“Impugning the 
committee” in his criticism 
of it, and being complicit 

in a “campaign of abuse” 
against its members
	 The committee has 
also recommended that 
Mr Johnson should be 
stripped of the pass given 
to former MPs allowing 
them access to Parliament.
	 Two of the committee’s 
MPs, the SNP’s Allan 
Dorans and Labour’s 
Yvonne Fovargue, wanted 
to go further and expel 
him from the Commons 
- but were outvoted by 
the committee’s four Tory 
MPs.

‘overreached’
	 The report will be 
debated by MPs, with a 
vote held on whether to 
approve the findings on 
Monday.
	 MPs are expected to 
approve the report, after 
Commons leader Penny 
Mordaunt said Tory MPs 
would not be ordered to 
vote against it.

	 So far, only a handful 
of Conservative MPs 
have openly criticised the 
report, including Johnson 
loyalist and former culture 
secretary, Nadine Dorries.
	 In a tweet, Ms Dorries 
claimed the report had 
“overreached” and 
said any Tory MP who 
voted to approve it was 
“fundamentally not a 
Conservative”.
	 Other Tory MPs 
supportive of Mr Johnson 
hit out at the findings, 
with Jacob Rees Mogg 
saying the committee 
looked “foolish” and 
Simon Clarke adding the 
report was “absolutely 
extraordinary to the point 
of sheer vindictiveness”.
	 But Labour’s deputy 
leader, Angela Rayner, 
said the committee had 
“gone off the evidence” 
to reach “a very damning 
conclusion”.
	 She said Mr Johnson 

was a “disgraced prime 
minister” who “shouldn’t 
be anywhere near 
Parliament”.
	 The Liberal Democrats 
have called for Mr Johnson 
to be stripped of the 
£115,000 annual allowance 
available to former prime 
ministers to run their office.
	 “This damning report 
should be the final nail 
in the coffin for Boris 
Johnson’s political career,” 
the party’s deputy leader, 
Daisy Cooper, said.
	 A campaign group 
representing families 
bereaved by Covid said he 
should “never be allowed 
to stand for any form of 
public office again”.
	 The committee’s report 
was met with disdain by 
Mr Johnson, who warned 
the committee was driven 
by “the sole political 
objective of finding me 
guilty and expelling me 
from Parliament”.

Johnson’s “repeated failures pro-actively to investigate” the lockdown 
breaches, amounted to “a deliberate closing of his mind”, said the report
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News from Britain

A war of words has 
erupted between Rishi 
Sunak and Boris Johnson 
over the former prime 
minister’s attempt to give 
peerages to several close 
allies.
	 Mr Sunak accused his 
former boss of asking him 
to “overrule” the vetting 
advice on his House of 
Lords nominations.
	 But in a fiery statement, 
Mr Johnson accused 
Mr Sunak of “talking 
rubbish”.
	 The House of 
Lords Appointments 
Commission (HOLAC) 
said it rejected eight of Mr 
Johnson’s nominations.
	 There has been no 
confirmation of who 
the nominees were, 
and why they were not 
included on Mr Johnson’s 
controversial resignation 
honours list.
	 A Cabinet Office 
spokesperson said 
HOLAC did not support 
the peerage nominations 
of the MPs put forward by 
Mr Johnson.
	 The honours list was 
published by Mr Sunak’s 
government on Friday, 
without the names of 
some of Mr Johnson’s 
key supporters, including 

Conservative MPs Nadine 
Dorries and Nigel Adams.
	 A few hours after his 
honours list was released, 
Mr Johnson announced he 
was standing down as an 
MP over an investigation 
into whether he had 
misled Parliament about 
lockdown parties.
	 Competing claims 
have now surfaced about 
how and why the names 
would not have appeared 
on the list.

public spat
	 Mr Adams and Ms 
Dorries have both 
announced they would 
immediately standing 
down as MPs, triggering 
by-elections to replace 
them.
	 Earlier, the row over the 
nominations spilled into 
a public spat between Mr 
Johnson and Mr Sunak.
	 Speaking at a tech 
conference in London 
earlier, Mr Sunak claimed 
Mr Johnson had asked 
him to do “something I 
wasn’t prepared to do” on 
peerage nominations.
	 “I didn’t think that was 
right. And if people don’t 
like that, then tough,” Mr 
Sunak said.
	 A few hours later, Mr 

Johnson claimed it “was 
not necessary to overrule 
HOLAC - but simply to 
ask them to renew their 
vetting, which was a mere 
formality”.
	 Mr Sunak’s comments 
are the first made publicly 
about the dispute over 
peerages, and marks a 
heightening of tensions 
between the two.
	 Their relationship 
has been an uneasy one 
after Mr Sunak quit as 
chancellor in Mr Johnson’s 
government, setting off 
a wave of resignations 
that brought down his 
premiership.
	 The process of vetting 
Mr Johnson’s nominees 
for peerages appears to 
be the one of the points of 
disagreement between the 
former allies.

‘weasel words’
	 There has been 
speculation in media 
reports about what would 
happen if a serving MP 
was nominated for a 
peerage, and whether 
they could remain in the 
House of Commons until 
the next general election, 
before taking up their 
seats in the Lords.
	 But HOLAC says its 

vetting checks expire after 
six months, meaning its 
advice on nominations is 
only valid for that period.
	 In an interview with 
TalkTV, Ms Dorries 
claimed Downing Street 
had not been “telling 
the truth” about her 
nomination for a peerage.
	 Ms Dorries said Mr 
Johnson had told her 
in autumn last year she 
had been put on his 
resignation honours list.

	 Ms Dorries accused 
the prime minister of 
using “weasel words” 
to give Mr Johnson the 
impression Mr Sunak 
would ask HOLAC to 
restart the vetting process.
	 She said Mr Sunak used 
those words because he 
“knew a situation had 
been engineered” in 
which her name would 
not be on the list.
	 When asked who she 
believed had stopped her 

from entering the House 
of Lords, she replied: “The 
prime minister - Rishi 
Sunak.”
	 Following her interview, 
the Cabinet Office said it 
would be “unprecedented 
for a sitting prime 
minister to invite HOLAC 
to reconsider the vetting 
of individual nominees on 
a former prime minister’s 
resignation list.
	 “It is not therefore a 
formality.”

Top Tories fall 
out over gongs

n Sunak and Johnson at odds as PM refuses to 
rubber stamp honors for BoJo’s toadies and cronies

THE WAY THEY WERE: Sunak served as Chanceller in Johnson’s government

Nicola Sturgeon has 
been released without 
charge pending further 
investigations after 
being arrested by police 
investigating the SNP’s 
finances.
	 It was the latest 
remarkable twist in 
Police Scotland’s ongoing 
Operation Branchform 
inquiry.
	 The former first 
minister was taken into 
custody and questioned 
by detectives at a police 
station after she attended 
voluntarily shortly after 
10:00 on Sunday.
	 Officers had up to 12 
hours from the time Ms 
Sturgeon was arrested 
before they had to decide 
whether to charge her 
with a crime or release 
her while their inquiries 
continue.
	 In the end, she was 
released from custody at 
about 17:25 on the same 
day - well before the 
deadline expired and just 
over seven hours since 
her arrest.
	 Shorty afterwards, she 
published a statement 
on Twitter saying that 
she knew “beyond doubt 

that I am innocent of any 
wrongdoing”.
	 She also said she would 
“never do anything to 
harm either the SNP or 
the country” and that the 
situation she had found 
herself in earlier in the 
day was “both a shock 
and deeply distressing”.
	 Despite her release, 
police have said the case 
remains active for the 
purposes of the Contempt 
of Court Act 1981.

complaints
	 It means everyone 
has to be careful about 
what they say to avoid 
potentially prejudicing 
any future trial.
	 The police investigation 
into this case began 
almost two years ago 
when complaints were 
made relating to more 
than £660,000 that was 
donated to the SNP by 
activists.
	 The money was 
raised after the party 
sought funds for a future 
referendum campaign, 
and Police Scotland 
launched Operation 
Branchform to examine 
what happened to it.

	 Earlier this year, officers 
sent an initial report 
seeking advice and 
guidance from the body 
which prosecutes crimes 
in Scotland, the Crown 
Office and Procurator 
Fiscal Service (COPFS).
	 That advice was 
provided and the 
investigation continued.
	 Ultimately, the 
detectives will send 
what is called a standard 
prosecution report to 
COPFS.
	 Prosecutors will then 
consider whether there 
is sufficient evidence 
to suggest a crime was 
committed and the 
suspect was responsible.
	 They will take the public 
interest into account. That 
can be influenced by the 
particular circumstances 
of the case - for example, 
whether the person 
involved was in a position 
of trust or authority.
	 If they feel the evidence 
meets the necessary tests, 
the case will go to court.
	 Alternatively, COPFS 
can instruct the police to 
carry out further inquiries 
if they decide there is 
insufficient evidence.

Scot cops catch and release Sturgeon
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Glenda Jackson,  widely 
regarded as one of the 
greatest thespians Britain 
has produced, has died 
aged 87.
	 Ms Jackson, who won 
two best actress Oscars 
for Women in Love and 
A Touch of Class, also 
collected three Emmys, 
two Baftas and a Tony in 
an acting career which 
spanned six decades.
	 Sir Jonathan Pryce 
said he believed she was 
“the greatest actor that 
this country has ever 
produced”.
	 Jackson gave up acting 
to join the House of 
Commons as a Labour 
MP in north London from 
1992 to 2015.
	 That included two 
years as a junior transport 
minister in Tony Blair’s 
New Labour government 
from 1997.
	 She later returned to 
acting, playing King Lear 
on stage in 2016, then 
winning a Bafta for her 
screen comeback in the 
TV drama Elizabeth Is 
Missing in 2020.

‘amazing actress’
	 In a statement on 
Thursday, her agent Lionel 
Larner said: “Glenda 
Jackson, two-time 
Academy Award-winning 
actress and politician, died 
peacefully at her home 
in Blackheath, London 
this morning after a brief 
illness with her family at 
her side.”
	 Other tributes were paid 
from across the worlds of 
the arts and politics.
	 Labour MP Tulip Siddiq, 
who now sits in Jackson’s 
former seat,  tweeted: 
“Devastated to hear that 
my predecessor Glenda 
Jackson has died.
	 “A formidable politician, 
an amazing actress and a 
very supportive mentor 
to me. Hampstead and 
Kilburn will miss you 
Glenda.”
	 But although her craft 

was universally admired, 
her flinty edge was never 
far below the surface, and 
she  had scant patience 
for the usual foibles 
and pretensions of her 
profession.
	 “I regard acting,” she 
once said, “as a serious 
job for serious-minded 
people.”
	 Famously prickly, her 
view of Tinseltown often 
bordered on contempt. “If 
I’m too strong for some 
people,” she said, “that’s 
their problem”.
	 Glenda May Jackson 
was born on 9 May 1936 in 
Birkenhead, in Wirral, the 
daughter of a bricklayer.
	 She attended the local 
grammar school, leaving 
at 16 to work at Boots.
	 Bored, she joined a 
YMCA drama group. 
“I had no real ambition 
about acting,” she later 
recalled. “But I knew there 
had to be something better 
than the bloody chemist’s 
shop.”
	 Two years later, she won 
a scholarship to the Royal 
Academy of Dramatic Art 
(RADA).
	 It was, according to one 
reviewer, her “intense, 
sexually-charged talent” 
that won her a place at the 
prestigious academy.
	 She made an impression 
while still at RADA, 
when she appeared in 
a production of Terence 

Rattigan’s Separate Tables.
	 By 1963 she had married 
actor and art dealer Roy 
Hodges. The couple had 
a son, Dan, who is a noted 
political commentator.
	 She joined the Royal 
Shakespeare Company 
(RSC) in 1964. A year later, 
her big breakthrough 
came in Peter Brook’s 
stage production of 
Marat/Sade.
	 Jackson played the 
lunatic asylum inmate 
who finds herself acting 
the role of Charlotte 
Corday, the assassin of the 
French revolutionary, Jean 
Marat.
	 In 1969, she won her first 
Oscar, for best actress, in 
Ken Russell’s adaptation 
of the DH Lawrence novel, 
Women in Love.
	 The beautifully shot 
film became notorious 
for its nude scenes which, 
Jackson later recalled, she 
played with “a prevailing 
sense of coldness”.

intensity
	 Her co-star Oliver Reed 
- hardly a shrinking violet 
himself - memorably 
described acting alongside 
her as like “being run over 
by a Bedford truck”.
	 In 1971, having 
appeared as Elizabeth I in 
the historically dubious 
film, Mary, Queen of 
Scots, she reprised the role 
in BBC TV’s Elizabeth R.

	 The six-part series saw 
her play the Virgin Queen 
from princess to ailing old 
woman.
	 Jackson played the 
part with her customary 
intensity, even shaving her 
hair to accommodate the 
make-up required as her 
character aged.
	 She was now firmly 
established as one of the 
world’s foremost dramatic 
actresses. She responded 
by sending herself up.
	 In 1971, she made her 
first appearance on the 
Morecambe and Wise 
Show - playing a comedy 
Cleopatra.
	 “All men are fools,” she 
declared with a flourish, 
“and what makes them 
so is not having beauty 
like what I have got.” The 
audience loved it, and 
Hollywood took note.
	 Soon she found herself 
cast opposite George Segal 
in a romantic comedy, A 
Touch of Class.
	 Jackson plays a British 
divorcee who has an affair 
with a married American, 
and falls in love. Her classy, 

understated performance 
won her a second Oscar.
	 “Stick with us,” cabled 
Morecambe, “and we 
will get you another 
one”. But - as with her 
previous Academy Award 
- she refused to go to 
Hollywood to pick up the 
statuette.
	 “You don’t do a play 
to compete for an award, 
“she explained. “I didn’t 
win them. They were 
given to me.”
	 At the age of 56, Jackson 
announced she was 
quitting acting - to stand 
as a Labour parliamentary 
candidate in the 1992 
general election.
	 “The best theatre is 
trying to tell the truth,” 
she said. “And the best 
politics is trying to tell the 
truth.”
In an otherwise miserable 
election for her party, she 
won a notable victory 
in Hampstead and 
Highgate, which had been 
a Conservative seat for 
two decades.
	 When Labour came to 
power in 1997, Jackson 

became a junior minister 
with responsibility for 
London Transport.
	 She resigned two 
years later, to make a 
bid to become Labour’s 
candidate for the London 
mayor, but was defeated 
by Frank Dobson.

controversial
	 A left-winger by 
inclination, she became a 
fierce critic of Tony Blair’s 
New Labour project and 
spoke out against the 
invasion of Iraq.
	 In 2005, she threatened 
to stand against Blair 
for the party leadership 
unless he announced his 
intention to stand down.
	 But the most 
controversial moment 
in her political career 
came in April 2013, when 
Parliament was recalled to 
pay tribute to the former 
prime minister, Margaret 
Thatcher.
	 Lady Thatcher had just 
died. But Jackson saw 
no reason to rein in her 
criticism of a woman she 

Glenda Jackson 
exits stage at 87

n Liverpool-born actress won two Oscars, three Emmys, 
two Baftas and a Tony before switching to politics

STEAMY STUFF: Jackson with Oliver Reed in 
Women in Love, for which she won an Oscar in 1969

FLINTY EDGE: “I regard acting,” Glenda Jackson once said, 
“as a serious job for serious-minded people.”

cont. on page 5, col. 1
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Former  Manchester 
United  and Scotland 
footballer Gordon 
McQueen has died at the 
age of 70 after a battle 
against dementia.
	 McQueen - who 
played 184 times for the 
Red Devils and won 
the FA Cup in 1983 - was 
diagnosed with vascular 
dementia in 2021, with 
his family regularly 
documenting his journey 
to raise awareness about 
the disease.
	 His daughter Hayley - a 
Sky Sports presenter who 
has regularly spoken out 
about his ordeal - posted 
a tribute to her father on 
social media announcing 
his tragic passing.
	 She said she felt 
‘numb’ after his loss and 
described the harrowing 
few months of watching 

him deteriorate - but 
vowed to remember him 
for the man he was.
	 ‘Beyond heartbroken 
to announce we have 
lost our wonderful dad,’ 
she said on Instagram 
alongside a family photo. 
	 ‘I thought when the 
day came I’d be prepared 
& feel a sense of relief that 
he is no longer trying to 
battle this awful disease 
but I just feel numb. 
	 ‘I’m hoping we can now 
remember him for the 
man he was and not the 
man he became this last 
few years. We thought 
we were losing him 
when home palliative 
care came to look after 
him back in December, 
we were distraught but 
being the big strong man 
that he is, battled on for 
many months.”

	 In a full statement from 
the McQueen family, 
they said they hailed 
Gordon as ‘the ultimate 
entertainer’ who was 
‘the heart and soul of 
the dressing room’ and 
showed bravery until the 
very end.
	 ‘It is with the heaviest 
of hearts we announce 
the passing of our 
beloved husband, father 
and grandfather,’ the 
statement read.
	 ‘We hope that as well 
as creating many great 
football memories for 
club and his country, 
he will be remembered 
for the love, laughter 
and bravery that 
characterized his career 
and his family life – not 
least during his recent 
battles with ill health.
	 McQueen will be 

The city of Nottingham 
has been shaken by a 
series of attacks which 
left two teenage students 
and another man dead.
	 Barnaby Webber, 19, 
Grace O’Malley-Kumar, 
19, and Ian Coates, 65, 
were fatally stabbed. 
Three people were later 
hit by a van police believe 
was stolen from the older 
stabbing victim.
	 A suspect was Tasered 
by police before being 
arrested on suspicion of 
murder.
	 Counter- t e r ror i sm 
police are involved in the 
investigation, but no link 
to extremism has been 
confirmed.
	 Police said they were 
still in the early stages 
of the inquiry into the 
attacks, which occurred 
during the early hours 
of Tuesday, and had yet 
to determine an exact 
motive.
	 The BBC has been told 
by official sources the 
31-year-old suspect was 
originally from West 

Africa but had been in the 
UK for “many years” and 
had settled status.
	 It is also understood 
the man has a history of 
mental health issues.
	 He did not have a 
criminal record, they 
added.
	 Several roads in 
Nottingham were closed 
throughout the day 
as police combed for 
evidence, and armed 
officers were seen on the 
city’s streets.

‘devastated’
	 Nottingham City 
Council leader David 
Mellen said the city was 
in “shock and mourning”, 
while the city’s three 
MPs said the area had 
been “devastated” by the 
bloodshed.
	 In a statement, Mr 
Webber’s - from Taunton 
in Somerset - said: 
“Complete devastation 
is not enough to describe 
our pain and loss at the 
senseless murder of our 
son.

	 “At 19 he was just at 
the start of his journey 
into adulthood and 
was developing into a 
wonderful young man.
	 “As parents we are 
enormously proud of 
everything he achieved 
and all the plans he had 
made.
	 “His brother is bereft 
beyond belief, and at this 
time we ask for privacy 
as a family to be allowed 
time to process and 
grieve.”
	 Grace O’Malley-Kumar 
has been named locally as 
the second victim and a 
talented sportswoman.
	 England Hockey said it 
was “deeply saddened” 
by Ms O’Malley-Kumar’s 
death.
	 “Grace was a popular 
member of the England 
U16 and U18 squads and 
our thoughts are with 
Grace’s family, friends, 
teammates and the whole 
hockey community at this 
time,” it said.
	 L o n d o n - b a s e d 
Woodford Wells Cricket 

Club, close to the Essex 
border, also paid tribute 
to their former player, 
describing her as a 
“fiercely competitive, 
talented and dedicated 
cricketer and hockey 
player” who was “fun, 
friendly and brilliant”.
	 And Southgate Hockey 
Club in London said 
it was “shocked and 
devastated” by the death 
of the “much loved” team 
member.
	 Mr Coates, who 
was 65, was the site 
manager at Nottingham’s 
Huntingdon Academy. 
The school said he did all 
he could “for the benefit of 
our children” and would 
be greatly missed.
	 Tributes have been 

pouring in for all three 
victims, and  a vigil was 
held in Nottingham city 
centre on Thursday.
	 The deadly episode 
unfolded in less than 
two hours, seemingly at 
random.
	 Police were called out 
to Ilkeston Road around 
04:00 BST where they 
found the two students 
fatally injured.
	 Some time after 05:00 
the body of Coates, whose 
van was apparently 
stolen, was found with 
knife wounds in Magdala 
Road, just under two miles 
(3.2 km) from the scene of 
the first two killings.
	 Around 05:30 the van 
was driven into three 
people waiting at a bus 

stop on Milton Street 
in the city centre. One 
of those hit remains in 
hospital fighting for their 
life. The other two were 
lucky to escape with 
minor injuries.
	 Shortly after the van 
attack the vehicle was 
stopped in nearby Maples 
Street and the suspect 
was detained after being 
Tasered.
	 In the afternoon armed 
officers carried out a raid 
on a property on Ilkeston 
Road.
	 Nottinghamshire Police, 
which described the 
incident as “horrific and 
tragic”, said detectives 
were not looking for 
anyone else in connection 
with the inquiry. 	

Nottingham left shaken by 
senseless triple murder

n Two students and a site manager killed by 
mentally ill man in horror knife attack

Ian Coates, Barnaby Webber and Grace O’Malley-Kumar were stabbed to death

mostly remembered for 
his time at Old Trafford, 
where he also won the 
Community Shield.
	 He started his career at 
St Mirren in 1970, playing 
57 times for the Saints in 
his native Scotland before 

joining Leeds United in 
1972. 
	 McQueen would go on 
to make 140 appearances 
for the Whites and was 
part of their famous 1973-
74 First Division-winning 
side.

	 In 1985 he signed for 
Chinese outfit Seiko, 
where he played for one 
year before hanging up 
his boots.	 F o r 
Scotland, he was capped 
30 times, scoring five 
goals. 	

Gordon McQueen dead at 70
n Towering defender starred for Leeds, Manchester United and Scotland

MCQUEEN: diagnosed with vascular dementia in 2021
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THE world of 
cruciverbalists suffered 
a sad loss this week 
with the death of Roger 
Squires, who has died 
aged 91.
	 Mr Squires enjoys a 
place in the record books 
for being the world’s 
most prolific compiler. 
He compiled under the 
pseudonym Rufus in 
The Guardian, Dante in 
the Financial Times and 
was the Monday setter 
for the Daily Telegraph.
	 Over a cruciverbal 
career spanning 
almost six decades, 
Roger entertained and 
delighted solvers, and 

gained recognition as the 
most prolific compiler 
who has ever picked up 
a pencil to fill in a little 
grid containing black 
and white squares.
	 Roger’s first 
Telegraph   was 
published in November 
1986, which was the start 
of an unbroken run of 
Monday puzzles until his 
retirement in December 
2017. His puzzles were 
immensely popular with 
solvers. They were very 
much at the easier end 
of the cryptic spectrum, 
so were a great starting 
point for anyone 
wanting to step up from 

the Quick Crossword to 
the Cryptic. They were 
also full of humour, 
with clues that were 
designed to amuse as 
well as challenge, as was 
evident from one the 
one billed as his two 
millionth in print, 
published in The 
Telegraph in 1992, and 
was even used as the 
title of a book about 
crosswords: Two girls, 
one on each knee (7) In 
case you’re wondering, 
PAT + ELLA (two girls) 
combine to give patella, 
the kneecap.
	 Roger’s favourite clue 
of his own devising, and 

one certain to make the 
solver chuckle, appeared 
in the Telefrraph 
Crossword in September 
2009:
	 Roman marbles 
missing? (3,6,6) The 
word “Roman” is a clue 
that you are looking for 
a Latin phrase meaning 
“marbles missing”; or, 
in other words, non 
compos mentis.
	 Another favorite: 
disturb presbyterians 
for pop singer (13). The 
answer is an anagram of 
the second word: Britney 
Spears. 

	 Roger’s cruciverbal 
achievements weren’t 
just limited to  The 
Telegraph. He was 
recognised by the 
Guinness Book of 
Records as the world’s 
most prolific crossword 
compiler, with more 
than 75,000 published 
in all, using almost 2.5 
million individual clues. 
His puzzles appeared 
in almost 600 outlets in 
more than 30 countries.
	 Roger’s life included 
much more than just 
crosswords. He was a 
magician and member of 

The Magic Circle, an FA 
coach and referee, flew 
for the RAF (surviving a 
ditching off Sri Lanka in 
which he surfaced from 
a depth of 60 feet), and 
made over 250 television 
appearances, including 
in Crossroads and 
Doctor Who.
	 And finally…a 
favorite clue for 
everyone devoted to 
this very-British art:  
angry expressions 
which call for solutions 
(10) The answer seems 
rather appropriate: 
Crosswords.

believed “had inflicted 
heinous social, economic 
and spiritual damage 
upon the country”.
	 Conservative MPs were 
furious when the Speaker 
refused to rule her 
remarks out of order. One 
political commentator 
accused the Labour left of 
being “petty”, “childish” 
and “self-indulgent” with 
its ungracious attacks on 
the Iron Lady’s memory. 
The writer was Jackson’s 
son, Dan Hodges.
	 Jackson decided not to 
defend her seat at the 2015 
general election. And - at 
the age of 79 - she returned 
to acting.
	 She played the 104-year-
old Adelaide Fouque in a 
BBC Radio 4 production 
entitled Emile Zola: Blood 

Sex and Money.
	 And, in 2016 - a full 
quarter of a century after 
last treading the boards 
- took on the role of King 
Lear at the Old Vic.
	 The writer Marilyn 
Stasio best summed up 
the experience of watching 
her act: “It is like looking 
straight into the sun,” she 
wrote in Variety magazine.

	 “Her expressive face 
registers her thoughts 
while guarding her 
feelings. But it’s the voice 
that really thrills.
	 “Deeply pitched and 
clarion clear, it’s the 
commanding voice of 
stern authority. Don’t 
mess with this household 
god or she’ll turn you to 
stone.”

Farewell to the crossword king

ALWAYS A CROSS WORD? Mr Squires enjoys a place in the 
record books for being the world’s most prolific compiler. 

Jackson:
cont. from page 3

AT HER ZENITH: Jackson with her second Oscar, 
which she won for A Touch of Class (1973)
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Legal Notices

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Esmeralda Elena Zambrano 
Serrato, an adult over the age of 

18 years.

​Date: 07/10/2023. Time: 10.00am 
Dept.72 Room 731

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Esmeralda Elena Zambrano 
Serrato. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 
Esmeralda Elena Zambrano 
Serrato to Esmeralda Elena 
Malmuirie Zambrano Bernardi

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the 
petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant 
the petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 12, 2023.
Curtis A Kin, Judge
Judge of the Superior Court
23STCP01619

Published: 05/27/2023, 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 and 
06/17/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
400 Civic Center Plaza

Pomona CA 91766

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Aimin Bing and Wenqi Zhao, 
adults over the age of 18 years, 

on behalf of Lucas  Bing, a minor 
under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person(s) whose name is/are to 
be changed are under 18 years of 
age: Lucas  Bing. And a petition 
for change of names having been 
duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have the name changed 
from Lucas  Bing to Lucas Zhao

Date: 07/20/2023. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept O

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of names 

Successful British 
Import Store for sale 
in S. California.  Call if 

interested: 
818-687 6417.

appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the petition 
for change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 16, 2023
Christian R Gullon,
Judge of the Superior Court
23PSCP00226

Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

6230 Sylmar Avenue
Van Nuys CA 91401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Malina K. Koani, an adult over 

the age of 18 years, on behalf 
of Noelani Kawahineho’onani 

Lopez and Mililani 
Kapualehuanani Lopez, minors 

under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person(s) whose name is/are to be 
changed are under 18 years of age: 
Noelani Kawahineho’onani Lopez 
and Mililani Kapualehuanani 
Lopez. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
the name changed from Noelani 
Kawahineho’onani Lopez to 
Noelani Kawahineho’onani Koani 
and from Mililani Kapualehuanani 
Lopez to Mililani Kapualehuanani 
Koani.

Date: 07/03/2023. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept U Room 620

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the petition 
for change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 19, 2023
Virginia Keeny,
Judge of the Superior Court
23VECP00289

Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 

CHANGE OF NAME
Superior Court of California

County of Los Angeles
1725 Main Street

Santa Monica CA 90401

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Rachel Nicole Hoffler-Pinkston. 

And a petition for change of 
names having been duly filed 

with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 

their name changed from Rachel 
Nicole Hoffler-Pinkston to Rachel 

Nicole Worthy

And in the Matter of the Petition 
of  Rachel Nicole Hoffler-
Pinkston, an adult over the age 
of 18 years, on behalf of Brandon 
Avery Hoffler Pinkston, a minor 
under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person(s) whose name is/are to be 
changed are under 18 years of age: 
Brandon Avery Hoffler Pinkston. 
And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have the name changed 
from Brandon Avery Hoffler 
Pinkston to Brandon Avery 
Worthy

Date: 07/21/2023. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept K

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the petition 
for change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 22, 2023
Hon. Lawrence Cho,
Judge of the Superior Court
23SMCP00281

Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

6230 Sylmar Ave
Van Nuys CA 91401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Boma Iyam and Victor 

Ocampo, Jr., adults over the age 
of 18 years, on behalf of Serena 
Raven Obazicham Ocampo, a 
minor under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person(s) whose name is/are to 
be changed are under 18 years of 
age: Serena Raven Obazicham 
Ocampo. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have the 
name changed from Serena Raven 
Obazicham Ocampo to Serena 
Raven Solana Ocampo

Date: 07/03/2023. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept U, Room 620

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the petition 
for change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 17, 2023
Virginia Keeny,
Judge of the Superior Court
23VECP00285

Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023081449. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Go DJ Entertainment, 600 S 
Spring St, 601, Los Angeles CA 90014. County: 
Los Angeles. Brandon Cruz, 600 S Spring St, 
601, Los Angeles CA 90014. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 03/2022. Signed: Brandon Cruz, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 04/12/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023086880. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Port Yard Services, 11138 Del 
Amo Blvd #124, Lakewood CA 90715. County: 
Los Angeles. Stephanie D Perez Gomez, 11138 
Del Amo Blvd #124, Lakewood CA 90715. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 04/2023. Signed: Stephanie D 
Perez Gomez, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 04/19/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023087873. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Hustle & Bustle, 17701 
Yukon Ave #3, Torrance CA 90504. County: 
Los Angeles. Larry James Bowers, 237 W 98th 
St, Los Angeles CA 90003. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Larry James Bowers, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 04/20/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023093037. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Moda Quinceanera XV, 
1111 Santee St Suite A, Los Angeles CA 90015. 
County: Los Angeles. Kariano Fashion Designer 
LLC, 1016 Santee St #2, Los Angeles CA 90015. 
State of Organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Mariano 

Geler, Member. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 04/27/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023093355. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Beverly Hills Optometry, 
212 S Robertson Blvd, Beverly Hills CA 90211. 
County: Los Angeles. Beverly Hills Institute of 
Optometry, Inc, 212 S Robertson Blvd, Beverly 
Hills CA 90211. State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 04/2014. Signed: Kambiz 
Silani, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 04/27/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023093365. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Beverly Hills Dry Eye Center; 
Beverly Hills Institute of Optometry, 212 S 
Robertson Blvd, Beverly Hills CA 90211. County: 
Los Angeles. Beverly Hills Institute of Optometry, 
Inc, 212 S Robertson Blvd, Beverly Hills CA 
90211. State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 03/2014. Signed: Kambiz 
Silani, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 04/27/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023095339. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Magaly Ortiz TV, 4563 W 
138th St Apt A, Hawthorne CA 90250. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 5604435. Magaly Ortiz 
TV Inc, 4563 W 138th St Apt A, Hawthorne CA 
90250. State of Incorporation: California, This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Magaly Ortiz, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/01/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023097485. The following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: The Main Booth, 26124 Kenrose 
Cir, Calabasas CA 91302. County: Los Angeles. 
OFEK, Inc., 26124 Kenrose Cir, Calabasas 
CA 91302. State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Yaarit 
Tayeb, President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/03/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Statement of Abandonment of Use of Fictitious 
Business Name: 2023098372. Current file: 
2023055084. The following person has 
abandoned the use of the fictitious business 
name: California Auto Center, 3501 Gage Ave, 
Bell CA 90201. County: Los Angeles. HPM 
Collision Center, Inc., 3510 Gage Ave, Bell CA 
90201. The fictitious business name referred to 
above was filed on: 03/13/2022, in the County 
of Los Angeles. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. Signed: Jorge Gomez, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/03/2023. Published: 05/20/2023, 
05/27/2023, 06/03/2023 and 06/10/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023098807. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Fix Auto Bell, 3510 Gage 
Ave, Bell CA 90201. County: Los Angeles. HPM 
Collision Center, Inc., 3510 Gage Ave, Bell CA 
90201. State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Jorge Gomez, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/04/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023099823. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Captivate The Moment, 
18000 Studebaker Rd Suite 700, Cerritos CA 
90703. County: Los Angeles. Ai#ON3903621. 
Blaque Enterprises Inc., 18000 Studebaker 
Rd Suite 700, Cerritos CA 90703. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Bridget Ingram, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/05/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023102093. The following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Lauren Taylor Visuals, 4804 Lauren 
Canyon Blvd #1179, Valley Village CA 91607. 
County: Los Angeles. Lauren Richardson, 28271 
Cascade Road, Castaic CA 91384. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2023. Signed: Lauren Richardson, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/09/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023102702. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Liquid Paradise, 5739 Kanan 
Rd., #198, Agoura Hills CA 91301. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 3344413. Elite Pool And Spa 
Service, Inc, 5739 Kanan Rd., #198, Agoura 
Hills CA 91301. State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 06/2018. Signed: Lisa 
Winkler, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/09/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023103576. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: ABC Finco, 1404 N. Azusa 
Ave., Suite C#151, Covina CA 91722. County: 
Los Angeles. ABC Financial Consulting, LLC, 
1404 N. Azusa Ave., Suite C#151, Covina CA 
91722. State of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 05/2023. 
Signed: Richard Vazquez, Managing Member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/10/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023104619. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Visionary Earthworks, 11799 
Sebastian Way Suite 103, Rancho Cucamonga 
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CA 91730. County: San Bernadino. 912 
Yosemite Ct, San Dimas CA 91773. Visionary 
Earthworks, 11799 Sebastian Way Suite 
103, Rancho Cucamonga CA 91730. State 
of Organization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 04/2021. Signed: Kristen 
Edmond, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/10/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023105320. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Best Bookkeeper Near Me, 
1147 W Masline St, Covina CA 91722. County: 
Los Angeles. 116 E Live Oak Ave #221, Arcadia 
CA 91006. Wealthy Timing Bookkeeping And 
Management LLC, 1147 W Masline St, Covina 
CA 91722. State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 04/2023. 
Signed: Liying Liu, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 05/11/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023105558. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Molina Manufacturing; Molina 
Gaskets, 23126 Mariposa Avenue, Torrance 
CA 90502. County: Los Angeles. Molina 
Manufacturing, Inc., 23126 Mariposa Avenue, 
Torrance CA 90502. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 05/2018. 
Signed: Joe Molina, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/11/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023105677. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Golden State Pest Control, 
9688 Lev Ave., Arleta CA 91331. County: Los 
Angeles. Sergio Ceja, 9688 Lev Ave., Arleta 
CA 91331. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 01/2015. 
Signed: Sergio Ceja, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/11/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023105679. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Coldwell Banker Collective, 
777 S Figueroa Street Suite 4600, Los Angeles 
CA 90017. County: Los Angeles. 713 W Duarte 
Rd G236, Arcadia CA 91007. Agent Collective, 
777 S Figueroa Street Suite 4600, Los Angeles 
CA 90017. State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2022. Signed: Erwin 
Pineda, President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/11/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023106097. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: News 2 Impress, 1725 
Ocean Front Walk 219, Santa Monica CA 90401. 

County: Los Angeles. Mehvish Shahzadi, 1725 
Ocean Front Walk 219, Santa Monica CA 90401; 
Bulat Bagautdinov, 1725 Ocean Front Walk 
219, Santa Monica CA 90401. This business is 
conducted by: co-partners. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 03/2023. Signed: Mehvish Shahzadi, 
general partner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/12/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023106235. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Comfort Zone LA, 2914 W 
75th Street, Los Angeles CA 90043. County: Los 
Angeles. 11503 S Saint Andrews Place, Los 
Angeles CA 90047. Doris Van Norton, 11503 S 
Saint Andrews Place, Los Angeles CA 90047. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Doris Van 
Norton, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/12/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023106979. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Cortes & Company, 11918 
Grapefruit Street 7, Whittier CA 90606. County: 
Los Angeles. Jorge Cortes, 11811 Gilbert St 6, 
Garden Grove CA 92841. Bridgette Ann Marie 
Joshua-Cortes, 11811 Gilbert St 6, Garden 
Grove CA 92841. This business is conducted by: 
a married couple. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 05/2023. 
Signed: Jorge Cortes, husband. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/15/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023107378. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: A World of Cultures, 1737 
N Orange Drive 19 Los Angeles CA 90029. 
County: Los Angeles. Yevette Renee Nelson, 
1737 N Orange Drive 19 Los Angeles CA 90029. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Yevette Renee 
Nelson, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/15/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023107677. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Hola Sunshine Speech and 
Language Services, 22022  Jodi Place, Saugus 
CA 91350. County: Los Angeles. Sonia Munoz-
Menjivar, 22022  Jodi Place, Saugus CA 91350. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 01/2022. Signed: Sonia Munoz-
Menjivar, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/16/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023107780. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Matrix Commodity; Matrix 
Rides (MAR), 5350 White Oak Ave Unit 203, 
Encino CA 91316. County: Los Angeles. Vahid 
Taghavi, 5350 White Oak Ave Unit 203, Encino 
CA 91316. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious business 

name or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Vahid Taghavi, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/16/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023107861. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Kodamas Studio, 426 Lyford 
Dr, La Verne CA 91750-4143. County: Los 
Angeles. 1701 East D Street Apt #1112, Ontario 
CA 91764. Juliana Garcia Man, 426 Lyford Dr, 
La Verne CA 91750-4143; Karen Garcia Man, 
1701 East D Street Apt #1112, Ontario CA 
91764. This business is conducted by: a general 
partnership. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Karen Garcia Man, general partner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/16/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023108691. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Golden Hammer Hosting, 
Golden Hammer Services 24355 Creekside 
Rd Unit 801565, Valencia CA 91355. County: 
Los Angeles. PO Box 801565, Santa Clarita 
CA 91380. Golden Hammer Ops LLC, 24355 
Creekside Rd Unit 801565, Valencia CA 91355. 
State of Organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 06/2020. Signed: Ryan 
Bonnell, manager. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/16/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023108777. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Ecocleanse, 6036 Golden 
West Ave, Temple City CA 91780. County: 
Los Angeles. Ecocleanse Corp, 6036 Golden 
West Ave, Temple City CA 91780. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Silverio J Salinas, 
Vice President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/16/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023108819. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: De Casas Real Estate, 
12812 Barranca Ln, Norwalk CA 90650. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON 5638674. De Casas Real 
Estate Corporation, 12812 Barranca Ln, Norwalk 
CA 90650. State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Jose A De 
Casas, President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/16/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023108832. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: LA Construction, 10710 
Firmona Ave, Inglewood CA 90304. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON 5619216. Lucas Alvarado 
Construction Inc, 10710 Firmona Ave, Inglewood 
CA 90304. State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Lucas 

Alvarado, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/16/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023108877. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Tiki Flame; Global PPC 
Team, 11750 Pala Mesa Dr, Porter Ranch CA 
91326. County: Los Angeles. A.K. Global, LLC, 
11750 Pala Mesa Dr, Porter Ranch CA 91326. 
State of Organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Kaitlyn 
Nesbitt Member. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/16/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023108887. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Cinar Tech, 23549 Victory 
Blvd #18, West Hills CA 91307. County: Los 
Angeles. Lauren Fredette, 23549 Victory Blvd 
#18, West Hills CA 91307. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2023. Signed: Lauren Fredette, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/16/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023108948. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: River Guide Labs, 1800 
Marine Ave, Manhattan Beach CA 90266. 
County: Los Angeles. Sanjeev Rao, 1800 Marine 
Ave, Manhattan Beach CA 90266. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2023. Signed: Sanjeev Rao, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/17/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023109575. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Keep America Clean 
Recycling, 21829 Chase St., Canoga Park 
CA 91304. County: Los Angeles. Mary Priest, 
21829 Chase St., Canoga Park CA 91304. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Mary Priest, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/17/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023109616. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Hierbas Latinas Naturales, 
1679 Indian Hill Blvd, Pomona CA 91767. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 5640164. Hierbas Latinas 
Naturales Corp, 1679 Indian Hill Blvd, Pomona 
CA 91767. State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Gustavo 
Fernandez, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/17/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 

filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023109768. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: StudleyDuds, 4848 Sancola 
Ave, North Hollywood CA 91601. County: Los 
Angeles. Dudley Beene, 4848 Sancola Ave, 
North Hollywood CA 91601. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2023. Signed: Dudley Beene, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/17/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023109833. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Wok N Tea, 14911 Pacific 
Ave, Unit 100, Baldwin Park CA 91706. County: 
Los Angeles. 825 E. Carroll Ave, Glendora CA 
91741. Hill Top Development Inc, 14911 Pacific 
Ave, Unit 100, Baldwin Park CA 91706. State 
of Incorporation: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2023. Signed: Esther Xing, Secretary. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/17/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023109841. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: H E Buena Vista 
Landscaping, 1643 W 64th St, Los Angeles CA 
90047. County: Los Angeles. H E Buena Vista 
Landscaping, 1643 W 64th St, Los Angeles CA 
90047. State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Homero Escalante 
Paz, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/17/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023110136. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Stratosphere Studios, 11271 
Ventura Blvd Apt 361, Studio City CA 91604. 
County: Los Angeles. BillWhite.com, LLC, 11271 
Ventura Blvd Apt 361, Studio City CA 91604. 
State of Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2023. Signed: William Whittle, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/18/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023110143. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Mavericks; Mavericks VNY, 
7900 Balboa Blvd Unit 116, Van Nuys CA 91406. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 202251013240. 
CONNECTIONVNY, LLC, 1900 Glades Road 
Suite 301, Boca Raton FL 33431. 
State of Organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Jordan Brown, 
managing member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/18/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 

B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023110191. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Dark Cloud, 1254 W. 91st 
St. Apt. C, Los Angeles CA 90044. County: Los 
Angeles. Steven Jason II, 1254 W. 91st St. Apt. 
C, Los Angeles CA 90044; Brandon Austin, 1501 
S Hoover St. #2, Los Angeles CA 90006. This 
business is conducted by: a general partnership. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Steven Jason II, general partner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/18/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023110270. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Charlie’s Tire Recycling, 
11833 Industrial Ave, South Gate CA 90280. 
County: Los Angeles. Carlos R Cisneros, 11833 
Industrial Ave, South Gate CA 90280. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 01/2010. Signed: Carlos R 
Cisneros, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/18/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023110648. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: My East Verdugo, 150 
S. Glenoaks Blvd 9113, Burbank CA 91502. 
County: Los Angeles. Tony Tatousian, 150 
S. Glenoaks Blvd 9113, Burbank CA 91502. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Tony 
Tatousian, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/18/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023110810. The following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Perez Valle Painting, 1936 Cypress 
Ave Apt 20, Los Angeles CA 90065. County: 
Los Angeles. Oscar Octavio Perez Valle, 1936 
Cypress Ave Apt 20, Los Angeles CA 90065. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 01/2019. Signed: Oscar Octavio 
Perez Valle, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/18/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023111277. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Senior Funding Reverse 
Mortgages, Senior Funding, 23801 Calabasas 
Rd. #2018, Calabasas CA 91302. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 2340414. Senior Funding 
Associates, 23801 Calabasas Rd. #2018, 
Calabasas CA 91302. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 04/2009. 
Signed: David D. Gomer, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/19/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023111429. The following person(s) is/are 
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doing business as: Barkers And Waggers, 12070 
Lakewood Blvd #1148, Downey CA 90242. 
County: Los Angeles. Hojeong Kim, 7332 Quill 
Dr Apt 123, Downey CA 90242. Eugene Lee, 
7332 Quill Dr Apt 123, Downey CA 90242. 
This business is conducted by: a married 
couple. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Hojeong Kim, wife. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/19/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023111588. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: ResourcesForYou, 8646 5th 
Street Apt B, Downey CA 90241. County: Los 
Angeles. PO Box 185, Downey CA 90241. Maria 
F Cota Rosales, 8646 5th Street Apt B, Downey 
CA 90241. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Maria F Cota Rosales, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/19/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023111810. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Baddie On The Block, 
707 Robinson Street, Los Angeles CA 90026. 
County: Los Angeles. Starrly Gladue, 707 
Robinson Street, Los Angeles CA 90026. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Starrly 
Gladue, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/19/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023111817. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Beauty By Starrly, 3120 
Sunset Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90025. County: 
Los Angeles. 707 Robinson Street, Los Angeles 
CA 90026. Starrly Gladue, 707 Robinson 
Street, Los Angeles CA 90026. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2023. Signed: Starrly Gladue, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/19/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023111940. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Safe Care Team-Health, 2986 
Webster Ave, Long Beach CA 90810. County: 
Los Angeles. Sharlaine Claire Torres Mamaradlo 
2986 Webster Ave, Long Beach CA 90810. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Starrly 
Gladue, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/19/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023112010. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Fit With Sonya, 150 
S. Glenoaks Blvd 9113, Burbank CA 91502. 
County: Los Angeles. Sonya Panoosian, 150 
S. Glenoaks Blvd 9113, Burbank CA 91502. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name or 

names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Sonya 
Panoosian, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/22/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023112073. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Sunday Softworks, 5632 Van 
Nuys Blvd #4022, Sherman Oaks CA 91401. 
County: Los Angeles. Kirby Walls, 5632 Van 
Nuys Blvd #4022, Sherman Oaks CA 91401. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Kirby Walls, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/22/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023112094. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Sarah’s Letter, 23807 
Haynes Street, West Hills CA 91307. County: 
Los Angeles. Carla Dillon, 23807 Haynes Street, 
West Hills CA 91307. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Carla Dillon, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/22/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023112414. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Exclusive Collections, 814 
Victor Ave 16, Inglewood CA 90302. County: 
Los Angeles. 814 Victor Ave 16, Inglewood 
CA 90302. Enetaro Nkwocha, 814 Victor Ave 
16, Inglewood CA 90302. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Enetaro Nkwocha, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/22/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023112824. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: STYLESBYSHAY, 8519 S 
Main St 4, Los Angeles CA 90003. County: Los 
Angeles. Chaquan Lavette Penn, 8519 S Main 
St 4, Los Angeles CA 90003. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 01/2016. Signed: Chaquan Lavette 
Penn, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/22/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023113066. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: CRE Advisory Service, 
18001 Belshire Ave., Artesia CA 90701. County: 
Los Angeles. Jesse Lee, 18001 Belshire Ave., 
Artesia CA 90701. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Jesse Lee, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/22/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 

in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023113129. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: MDMZ Inspectors; MDMZ 
Home Inspectors, MDMZ Company, 6542 
Ocean Crest Dr C108, Rancho Palos Verdes 
CA 90275. County: Los Angeles. MDMZ 
Construction, Inc., 6542 Ocean Crest Dr 
C108, Rancho Palos Verdes CA 90275. State 
of Incorporation: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Mohammad Maysam 
Razipour, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/23/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023113177. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Billy’s Kicks & Flicks, 
12611 Vanowen St. Apt 100, North Hollywood 
CA 91605. County: Los Angeles. Nabil 
Rashan Pierre, 12611 Vanowen St. Apt 100, 
North Hollywood CA 91605. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Nabil Rashan 
Pierre, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/23/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023113230. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Bob’s Wine Bar, 10421-
10423 Santa Monica Blvd, Los Angeles CA 
90025. County: Los Angeles. Bob B Golbahar, 
2020 Cotner Ave, Los Angeles CA 90025. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 01/2023. Signed: Bob B 
Golbahar, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/23/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023113340. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Main Title Music, 2115 
Benecia Ave, Los Angeles CA 90025. County: 
Los Angeles. David Reynolds, 2115 Benecia 
Ave, Los Angeles CA 90025. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2023. Signed: David Reynolds, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/23/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023113906. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Patricia Digital Services, 
Patricia Fashion Accessories, 6660 Klump Ave 
1, North Hollywood CA 91606. County: Los 
Angeles. Ana Patricia Alas, 6660 Klump Ave 1, 
North Hollywood CA 91606. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2015. Signed: Ana Patricia Alas, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/23/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023113914. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: GC Trucking, 13116 S Main 
St, Los Angeles CA 90061. County: Los Angeles. 
Gildardo Ceballos Arroyo, 13116 S Main St, Los 
Angeles CA 90061. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 04/2023. 
Signed: Gildardo Ceballos Arroyo, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/23/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114045. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: JKV Entertainment, 8522 
E Valley Blvd., #110, Rosemead CA 91770. 
County: Los Angeles. Gia Cht Trieu, 8522 E 
Valley Blvd., #110, Rosemead CA 91770. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Gia Cht 
Trieu, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/23/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114047. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: My Kitchen, 1155 S Diamond 
Bar Blvd #C, Diamond Bar CA 91765. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 3560394. MH Enterprise, 
Inc., 1155 S Diamond Bar Blvd #C, Diamond Bar 
CA 91765. State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Yongming 
Guo, President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/23/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114364. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Kiano’s Technical Solutions, 
5640 Santa Monica Blvd Apt 345, Los Angeles 
CA 90038. County: Los Angeles. Orien Demetre, 
5640 Santa Monica Blvd Apt 345, Los Angeles 
CA 90038. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 02/2023. 
Signed: Orien Demetre, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/24/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023 
and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114370. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Matrix Coffee Company, 
12142 Achilles St, Norwalk CA 90650. County: 
Los Angeles. Ruben Vergara Sifuentes, 
12142 Achilles St, Norwalk CA 90650. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Ruben Vergara 
Sifuentes, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/24/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114644. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Designs by Danzo, 158 
Gentry St Danzo Group, Pomona CA 91767. 
County: Los Angeles. Danzo Group, Inc., 158 
Gentry St Danzo Group, Pomona CA 91767. 
State of Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 

commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Chris Danielsen, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/24/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114700. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Millzbizz Care Services, 
1525 E Carson St Apt 4-224, Carson CA 90745. 
County: Los Angeles. Amelita Basadre, 1525 E 
Carson St Apt 4-224, Carson CA 90745. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 04/2022. Signed: Amelita 
Basadre, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/24/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114702. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Bright Day Home Care, 
1600 W Carson St Apt 206, Torrance CA 90501. 
County: Los Angeles. Estelita Dorion,1600 W 
Carson St Apt 206, Torrance CA 90501. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 04/2023. Signed: Estelita 
Dorion, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/24/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114704. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: RD Care Solutions, 3595 
Santa Fe Ave Sp 38, Long Beach CA 90810. 
County: Los Angeles. Rosella Dizon, 3595 Santa 
Fe Ave Sp 38, Long Beach CA 90810. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 04/2023. Signed: Rosella 
Dizon, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/24/2023. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114706. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: The Donut Odyssey, The 
Doughnut Odyssey, Donut Odyssey, Doughnut 
Odyssey, 12939 Haynes St., North Hollywood 
CA 91606. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
460773461. The Contingent Multinational, Inc. 
12939 Haynes St., North Hollywood CA 91606. 
State of Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Steven Urrutia, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/24/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023 and 06/17/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114712. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Brandon’s Pro Painting, 
18763 Runnymede St, Reseda CA 91335. 
County: Los Angeles. Brandon Grijalva, 18763 
Runnymede St, Reseda CA 91335. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 04/2023. Signed: Brandon 
Grijalva, owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 05/24/2023. NOTICE - 

This fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 05/27/2023, 06/03/2023.

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF: 
MARYANN JACOBI GRAY 

AKA MARYANN GRAY AKA 
MARYANN JACOBI 

CASE NO. 23STPB05095
To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interested 
in the WILL or estate, or both of 
MARYANN JACOBI GRAY AKA 
MARYANN GRAY AKA MARYANN 
JACOBI.
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has 
been filed by CHERYL J. CARTER 
in the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that CHERYL J. CARTER 
be appointed as personal 
representative to administer the 
estate of the decedent.
THE PETITION requests the 
decedent’s WILL and codicils, if 
any, be admitted to probate. The 
WILL and any codicils are available 
for examination in the file kept by 
the court.
THE PETITION requests authority 
to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without 
obtaining court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required to 
give notice to interested persons 
unless they have waived notice or 
consented to the proposed action.) 
The independent administration 
authority will be granted unless an 
interested person files an objection 
to the petition and shows good 
cause why the court should not 
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the petition will 
be held in this court as follows: 
07/18/23 at 8:30AM in Dept. 11 
located at 111 N. HILL ST., LOS 
ANGELES, CA 90012
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear 
at the hearing and state your 
objections or file written objections 
with the court before the hearing. 
Your appearance may be in person 
or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with 
the court and mail a copy to the 
personal representative appointed 
by the court within the later of 
either (1) four months from the 
date of first issuance of letters to 
a general personal representative, 
as defined in section 58(b) of the 
California Probate Code, or (2) 60 
days from the date of mailing or 
personal delivery to you of a notice 
under section 9052 of the California 
Probate Code.
Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as 
a creditor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file kept 
by the court. If you are a person 
interested in the estate, you may 
file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
MARCUS CHANG - SBN 268082
GUZMAN LAW GROUP, P.C.
1230 ROSECRANS AVENUE, 
SUITE 650
MANHATTAN BEACH CA 90266
6/3, 6/10, 6/17/23

CNS-3705980#

Order No.: 05947886 T.S. No.: 2023-
100597  Loan No.: 830 NOTICE OF 
TRUSTEE’S SALE  YOU ARE IN 
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DEFAULT UNDER A 
CONSTRUCTION DEED OF TRUST, 
ASSIGNMENT OF LEASES AND 
RENTS, SECURITY AGREEMENT 
AND FIXTURE FILING DATED 
9/28/2018.  UNLESS YOU TAKE 
ACTION TO PROTECT YOUR 
PROPERTY, IT MAY BE SOLD AT A 
PUBLIC SALE.  IF YOU NEED AN 
EXPLANATION OF THE NATURE 
OF THE PROCEEDING AGAINST 
YOU, YOU SHOULD CONTACT A 
LAWYER.  A public auction sale to 
the highest bidder for cash, cashier’s 
check drawn on a state or national 
bank, check drawn by a state or 
federal credit union, or a check drawn 
by a state or federal savings and loan 
association, or savings association, or 
savings bank specified in Section 5102 
of the Financial Code and authorized 
to do business in this state will be held 
by the duly appointed trustee as 
shown below, of all right, title, and 
interest conveyed to and now held by 
the trustee in the hereinafter 
described property under and 
pursuant to a Deed of Trust described 
below.  The sale will be made, but 
without covenant or warranty, 
expressed or implied, regarding title, 
possession, or encumbrances, to pay 
the remaining principal sum of the 
note(s) secured by the Deed of Trust, 
with interest and late charges thereon, 
as provided in the note(s), advances, 
under the terms of the Deed of Trust, 
interest thereon, fees, charges and 
expenses of the Trustee for the total 
amount (at the time of the initial 
publication of the Notice of Sale) 
reasonably estimated to be set forth 
below.  The amount may be greater 
on the day of sale.  Trustor: DP007 
16TH STREET, LLC, a California 
limited liability company  Duly 
Appointed Trustee: Beacon Default 
Management, Inc., a California 
corporation  Recorded 10/10/2018, 
as Instrument No. 20181028160, of 
Official Records in the office of the 
Recorder of Los Angeles County, 
California, under the power of sale 
therein contained, WILL SELL AT 
PUBLIC AUCTION TO THE 
HIGHEST BIDDER, for cash, or 
cashier’s check made payable to 
Beacon Default Management, Inc. 
(payable at the time of sale in lawful 
money of the United States) without 
warranty express or implied as to 
title, use, possession or encumbrances, 
all right, title and interest conveyed to 
and now held by it as such Trustee, in 
and to the following described 
property situated in the aforesaid 
County and State, to-wit:    Date of 
Sale: 6/27/2023 at 10:30 AM  Place of 
Sale:	 Behind the fountain 
located in Civic Center Plaza located 
at 400 Civic Center Plaza, Pomona, 
CA 91766  Said property is being sold 
for the purpose of paying the 
obligations secured by said Deed of 
Trust, including, without limitation, 
fees, and expenses of sale.  The total 
amount of the unpaid principal 
balance, together with reasonably 
estimated costs, charges, expenses, 
fees, and advances at the time of the 
initial publication of the Notice of 
Trustee’s Sale is: $5,185,982.38  Street 
Address or other common 
designation of real property: 817 16th 
Street Santa Monica, California 90403  
Legal Description: See Exhibit “A” 
attached hereto and made a part of.  
Trustee Sale file: 2023-100597  Exhibit 
“A”  All that certain real property 
situated in the County of Los Angeles, 
State of California, described as 
follows:  LOT “U” IN BLOCK 10, 
TOWN OF SANTA MONICA, IN 
THE CITY OF SANTA MONICA, 
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE 
OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAPS 
RECORDED IN BOOK 3, PAGES 80 
AND 81 AND IN BOOK 39, PAGES 
45 TO 51, INCLUSIVE OF 
MISCELLANEOUS RECORDS, IN 
THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY 
RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. The 
purported street address of said land 
as determined from the latest County 
Assessor’s Roll is: 817 16th Street, 
Santa Monica, California  The 
Assessor’s Parcel Number, as 
determined from the latest County 
Assessor’s Roll is: 4281-001-021   
Personal Property: See Exhibit “B” 

attached hereto and made a part of.  
Trustee Sale: 2023-100597 Exhibit “B” 
1. All machinery, motors, equipment, 
materials (including building 
materials), appliances, and fixtures 
now or hereafter installed or placed 
on or in said land (or any buildings or 
other improvements thereon) for the 
generation and distribution of air, 
water, heat, electricity, light, fuel or 
refrigeration or ventilating or air 
conditioning purposes or for sanitary 
or drainage purposes or for the 
exclusion of vermin or insects or for 
die removal of dust, refuse or 
garbage, and all elevators, escalators, 
tracks, ramps, loading platforms, 
fittings, doors, windows, signs, 
fronts, awnings, window shades, 
drapery rods and brackets, screens, 
floor coverings, incinerators, 
carpeting, all sprinklers and sprinkler 
equipment, trees, plants, shrubs and 
other landscaping, and all furniture, 
fixtures, sinks, stoves, ovens, 
refrigerators, cabinets, hot water 
heaters, hoods, vents ducts, flues, 
fans, ventilators, panels, and other 
property used in the operation or 
occupancy of said land or buildings 
and improvements, together with all 
additions to, substitutions for, 
changes in or replacements of the 
whole or any part of any part of any 
or all of said articles of property, and 
together with all property of the same 
character that Trustor may hereafter 
acquire at any time until the 
termination of this Deed of Trust and 
all proceeds received upon the sale, 
exchange, collection or other 
disposition of the foregoing. 2. All 
intangible property and rights 
relating to said land or the operation 
thereof, or used in connection 
therewith, including, but not limited 
to, all governmental permits relating 
to construction on said land, 
certificates of occupancy, trademarks, 
and name rights and goodwill 
relating to said land, buildings and 
improvements. 3.	 All reserves, 
deferred payments, deposits, refunds, 
cost savings and payments of any 
kind relating to the construction of 
any improvements on said land. 4. All 
water stock relating to said land. 5. All 
causes of action, claims, compensation 
and recoveries for any damage, 
condemnation or taking of said 
property, or for any conveyance in 
lieu thereof, whether direct or 
consequential, or for any damage or 
injury to said property, or for any loss 
or diminution in value of said 
property. 6. All plans and 
specifications prepared for 
construction of buildings and 
improvements on said land and all 
studies, data and drawings related 
thereto; and also all contracts and 
agreements of the Trustor relating to 
the aforesaid plans and specifications 
or to the aforesaid studies, data and 
drawings or to the construction of 
buildings and improvements on said 
land. 7.	 All monies on deposit for 
the payment of real estate taxes or 
special assessments against said 
property or said land or for the 
payment of premiums on policies of 
fire and other hazard insurance 
covering the property described 
herein or said land. 8. All proceeds 
from the sale, lease or transfer of all or 
any of the property described herein. 
The land referred to above is more 
particularly described on Exhibit A 
hereto and shall include all 
appurtenances and all buildings, 
structures, improvements and 
fixtures now or hereafter located on 
such land.    Tax Parcel Number: 4281-
001-021  The undersigned Trustee 
disclaims any liability for any 
incorrectness of the street address or 
other common designation, if any, 
shown above.  If no street address or 
other common designation is shown, 
directions to the location of the 
property may be obtained by sending 
a written request to the beneficiary 
within 10 days of the date of first 
publication of this Notice of Sale.  If 
the trustee is unable to convey title for 
any reason, the successful bidder’s 
sole and exclusive remedy shall be 
the return of monies paid to the 
Trustee, and the successful bidder 
shall have no further recourse. If the 

sale is set aside for any reason, the 
Purchaser at the sale shall be entitled 
only to a return of the deposit paid. 
The Purchaser shall have no further 
recourse against the Mortgagor, the 
Mortgagee, or the Mortgagee’s 
Attorney.   If you have previously 
been discharged through bankruptcy, 
you may have been released of 
personal liability for this loan in 
which case this letter is intended to 
exercise the note holder’s rights 
against the real property only.     THIS 
NOTICE IS SENT FOR THE 
PURPOSE OF COLLECTING A 
DEBT. THIS FIRM IS ATTEMPTING 
TO COLLECT A DEBT ON BEHALF 
OF THE HOLDER AND OWNER OF 
THE NOTE. ANY INFORMATION 
OBTAINED BY OR PROVIDED TO 
THIS FIRM OR THE CREDITOR 
WILL BE USED FOR THAT 
PURPOSE.   As required by law, you 
are hereby notified that a negative 
credit report reflecting on your credit 
record may be submitted to a credit 
report agency if you fail to fulfill the 
terms of your credit obligations.   The 
name, street address and telephone 
number of the Trustee is: Beacon 
Default Management, Inc. 30101 
Agoura Court, Suite 203 Agoura 
Hills, California 91301 Phone: (310) 
929-5457 Trustee’s Sale No. 2023-
100597  FOR TRUSTEE SALE 
INFORMATION PLEASE CALL: 
Stox Posting & Publishing, LLC Sale 
Line: (844) 477-7869 www.
stoxposting.com  NOTICE TO 
POTENTIAL BIDDERS: If you are 
considering bidding on this property 
lien, you should understand that 
there are risks involved in bidding at 
a trustee auction. You will be bidding 
on a lien, not on the property itself. 
Placing the highest bid at a trustee 
auction does not automatically entitle 
you to free and clear ownership of the 
property. You should also be aware 
that the lien being auctioned off may 
be a junior lien. If you are the highest 
bidder at the auction, you are or may 
be responsible for paying off all liens 
senior to the lien being auctioned off, 
before you can receive clear title to the 
property. You are encouraged to 
investigate the existence, priority, and 
size of outstanding liens that may 
exist on this property by contacting 
the county recorder’s office or a title 
insurance company, either of which 
may charge you a fee for this 
information. If you consult either of 
these resources, you should be aware 
that the same lender may hold more 
than one mortgage or deed of trust on 
the property.  NOTICE TO 
PROPERTY OWNER: The sale date 
shown on this notice of sale may be 
postponed one or more times by the 
mortgagee, beneficiary, trustee, or a 
court, pursuant to Section 2924g of 
the California Civil Code. The law 
requires that information about 
trustee sale postponements be made 
available to you and to the public, as a 
courtesy to those not present at the 
sale. If you wish to learn whether 
your sale date has been postponed, 
and, if applicable, the rescheduled 
time and date for the sale of this 
property, you may call (844) 477-7869 
or visit this Internet Web site www.
stoxposting.com, using the file 
number assigned to this case 2023-
100597. Information about 
postponements that are very short in 
duration or that occur close in time to 
the scheduled sale may not 
immediately be reflected in the 
telephone information or on the 
Internet Web site. The best way to 
verify postponement information is 
to attend the scheduled sale.  NOTICE 
TO TENANT: You may have a right 
to purchase this property after the 
trustee auction pursuant to Section 
2924m of the California Civil Code. If 
you are an “eligible tenant buyer,” 
you can purchase the property if you 
match the last and highest bid placed 
at the trustee auction. There are three 
steps to exercising this right of 
purchase. First, 48 hours after the date 
of the trustee sale, you may call (714) 
929-1034, or visit this internet website: 
www.stoxposting.com, using the file 
number assigned to this case 2023-
100597 to find the date on which the 
trustee’s sale was held, the amount of 

the last and highest bid, and the 
address of the trustee. Second, you 
must send a written notice of intent to 
place a bid, so that the trustee receives 
it no more than 15 days after the 
trustee’s sale. Third, you must submit 
a bid, by remitting the funds and 
affidavit described in Section 
2924m(c) of the Civil Code, so that the 
trustee receives it no more than 45 
days after the trustee’s sale. If you 
think you may qualify as an “eligible 
tenant buyer” or “eligible bidder,” 
you should consider contacting an 
attorney or appropriate real estate 
professional immediately for advice 
regarding this potential right to 
purchase.  Date: May 24, 2023 Beacon 
Default Management, Inc., a 
California corporation, as trustee   
Selina I. Parelskin, Authorized 
Signatory

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Yevgeniya Vladimirovna Lemberg, 

an adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 07/28/2023. Time: 8.30am Dept. 
K

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is 
over 18 years of age: Yevgeniya 

Vladimirovna Lemberg. And a petition 
for change of names having been 

duly filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Yevgeniya 

Vladimirovna Lemberg to Jane 
Yevgeniya Lemberg

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-entitled 
matter of change of names appear 
before the above-entitled court to show 
cause why the petition for change of 
name(s) should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for the 
objection at least two court days before 
the matter is scheduled to be heard and 
must appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not be 
granted. If no written objection is timely 
filed, the court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of general 
circulation for the County of Los Angeles, 
for four successive weeks prior to the 
date set for hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 26, 2023.
Hon. Lawrence Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
23SMCP00294
Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Ave
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition of Octavia 
Channel Jimenez, an adult over the 

age of 18 years, on behalf of 
Liam Ethan Baker, a minor under the 

age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following person(s) 
whose name is/are to be changed are 
under 18 years of age: Liam Ethan 
Baker. And a petition for change of 

names having been duly filed with the 
clerk of this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have the name changed from Liam 
Ethan Baker to Liam Ethan Jimenez 

Date: 07/21/2023. Time: 8.30am; Dept B

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-entitled 
matter of change of names appear 
before the above-entitled court to show 
cause why the petition for change of 
name(s) should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for the 
objection at least two court days before 
the matter is scheduled to be heard and 
must appear at the hearing to show 

cause why the petition should not be 
granted. If no written objection is timely 
filed, the court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of general 
circulation for the County of Los Angeles, 
for four successive weeks prior to the 
date set for hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 26, 2023
Gary Y Tanaka,
Judge of the Superior Court
23TRCP00220

Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd.
Norwalk CA 90650

In the Matter of the Petition of Lindsey 
Hoang-Vi Reyes, an adult over the age 

of 18 years.

​Date: 07/28/2023. Time: 9.30am Dept. 
C, Room 312

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 
18 years of age: Lindsey Hoang-Vi 
Reyes. And a petition for change of 

names having been duly filed with the 
clerk of this Court, and it appearing 

from said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed from 
Lindsey Hoang-Vi Reyes to Lindsey 

Hoang-Vi Reyes

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-entitled 
matter of change of names appear 
before the above-entitled court to show 
cause why the petition for change of 
name(s) should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for the 
objection at least two court days before 
the matter is scheduled to be heard and 
must appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not be 
granted. If no written objection is timely 
filed, the court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of general 
circulation for the County of Los Angeles, 
for four successive weeks prior to the 
date set for hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 23, 2023.
Olivia Rosales
Judge of the Superior Court
23NWCP00197
Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
111 N Hill St, Room 118
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of Morgan 
Elise Knowles, an adult over the age 

of 18 years.

​Date: 07/24/2023. Time: 9.30am Dept. 
26, Room 316

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is 

over 18 years of age: Morgan Elise 
Knowles. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed with 

the clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed from 

Morgan Elise Knowles to Morgan 
Knowles Sobotka

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-entitled 
matter of change of names appear 
before the above-entitled court to show 
cause why the petition for change of 
name(s) should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for the 
objection at least two court days before 
the matter is scheduled to be heard and 
must appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not be 
granted. If no written objection is timely 
filed, the court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 

British Weekly, a newspaper of general 
circulation for the County of Los Angeles, 
for four successive weeks prior to the 
date set for hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 25, 2023.
Elaine Lu
Judge of the Superior Court
23STCP01799
Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023094374. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Auto Body Service 
New Generation, 7247 ½ Eton Ave, Canoga 
Park CA 91303. County: Los Angeles. 
7241 Vassar Ave #106, Canoga Park CA 
91303. Jorge Luis Oxlaj Alvarez, 7247 ½ 
Eton Ave, Canoga Park CA 91303. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 05/2022. 
Signed: Jorge Luis Oxlaj Alvarez, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 04/28/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023096752. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Sky 1, 6724 
Jumilla Ave, Winnetka CA 91306. County: 
Los Angeles. Shlomi Benshoshan, 6724 
Jumilla Ave, Winnetka CA 91306. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Shlomi Benshoshan, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/02/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023097371. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: The Silky Way 
Extensions LLC, 6745 Farmdale Avenue 
Unit 3, North Hollywood CA 91606. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 202016710315. The 
Silky Way Extensions LLC, 6745 Farmdale 
Avenue Unit 3, North Hollywood CA 91606. 
State of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 04/2023. Signed: Jasmine Akmal, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/02/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023098699. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Brownstone 
Enterprises; Brownstone Solutions, 
Brownstone Incorporated, 2032 N Britton 
Dr, Long Beach CA 90815. County: Los 
Angeles. Gavin Brown, 2032 N Britton 
Dr, Long Beach CA 90815. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Gavin Brown, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/02/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023099050. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: My Favorite Kitchen, 
4812 Castle Road, La Canada CA 91011. 
County: Los Angeles. Aylin Soleymanian, 

Legal Notices
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It’s Time For Tea....
Traditional Afternoon Tea is now served
Wed-Sat. 11.30am-4pm in our tea room
(also available for baby showers, bridal 

showers and special occasions). 
King’s Head Pies now available in our bakery. 

Sausage rolls, pastries and 
delicious cakes, baked daily

Ye Olde King’s Head, 116 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401 • Tel: 310-451-1402

Meet Carl Hopgood, who 
moved to Los Angeles 
from London seven years 
ago to further his art 
career.

Was there a particular 
reason you chose LA?
After living in London 
for twenty years  it 
was time for a change! 
I had watched a 
documentary about 
David Hockney living 
in Los Angeles and 
the sense of freedom 
he felt had inspired 
me, too. The beautiful 
coastline reminded 
of my childhood 
growing up in Tenby, 
West Wales where the 
poet Dylan Thomas 
was born. It’s sunny 
atmosphere was such 
a stark contrast from 
the gloomy weather of 
the UK and the anxiety 
and depression that 
I experienced from 

that. I knew it would 
be good for both my 
mental health and my 
creativity. I had heard 
about the growing 
art scene and big 
collectors in California 
such as Chara 
Schreyer and Beth De 
Woody and museums 
including LACMA 
and The Broad.   I 
wanted to work in 
other mediums as 
well as the film video 
sculptures that I was 
known for and started 
working in Neon and 
have the freedom to 
explore this without 
the constraints that I 
felt London had.

What do you miss 
most from home?
I miss my family and 
friends the most and 
Sunday roasts! I try 
to go back and visit 
at least 3 times a year 

to see my nearest and 
dearest and also to visit 
new art exhibitions, 
curators and The 
Groucho Club! 
	 Saying goodbye 
to my parents at the 
airport was a tearful 
event… This was 
the first time I had 
ever travelled alone 
although my dog 
Pippa was traveling 
on a different flight so 
we would be reunited 
after ten hours!   My 
friend Nadine Coyle 
was living here at the 
time and she came 
to pick me up at the 
airport -we drove to 
Huntington Beach, 
where she and her 
family lived. Its 
long  beach  felt like 
home as it allowed 
dogs to run free on the 
sand.

What do you find is 
the biggest difference 
between living here 
and your hometown?
There are so many 
differences between 
living here and 
Cardiff, where I grew 
up. The city is so big, 
so many different 
places to explore and 
activities to enjoy, 
from surfing to hiking 
and watching movies 
in the open air! But 
you definitely need 
to drive. The food is 
also amazing, just so 
many options from 
street food to fine 
dining. The art scene 
is also exploding 
with many important 
galleries from Hauser 
and Wirth to Gagosian 
and Museums like 
The Broad and The 
Hammer. 

Do you have a hidden 
gem in LA that you 
want to share with us?
One of my favorite 
hidden gems is 

the Miracle Mile 
area where the 
LACMA  Museum 
and The Academy 
Museum are. The area 
used to be run down 
but it is now a hotbed 
for art and culture. 
I love Fanny’s, the 
restaurant and café 
which is part of the 
Academy Museum.

What would you 
suggest to others who 
are thinking about 
making the move 
here?
If you are considering 
moving here I would 
say it’s an expensive 
city and most people 
have to start from 

scratch no matter how 
well established they 
are in the UK.  So make 
sure you have other 
ways to earn money, 
especially if you are 
freelance. I also work 
as a set designer and 
prop stylist, which 
really helped in the 
early days.

Lastly, how can we 
find out more about 
you? Are you working 
on anything at the 
moment? 
I am currently 
being featured in a 
documentary about 
myself and my work, 
which shows my 
journey from the UK 

and documenting my 
flourishing art career. 
The director Kate 
Rees Davis (a fellow 
Brit) has set up a 
crowdfunding page to 
help finish the project 
so if you would like to 
help make this happen 
please take a look and 
donate at: https://
tinyurl.com/558a5e5t
 I am also in an 
exhibition that opens 
at The Bunker Art 
Space in West Palm 
Beach on December 
3rd and runs for 6 
months.

IG: @carlhopgood
Website: 

carlhopgood.com

Meet A Member: Carl Hopgood

Carl Hopgood: missing his family and Sunday roasts...but not much else
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Brits in LA

2995 Thousand Oaks Blvd., Thousand Oaks. (parking in rear)
Open: Mon-Sat. 10.30-5.30 • Sun: 10-6 • Tel: (805) 495-4042

Teas • Candy • Pastries • Bangers • 
Meat Pies • Heinz Beans • 

China Teapots • Tea Cozies • Gifts
Now featuring delicious, traditional handmade pies and 

pasties from Deli-SA. Chicken curry pasties, Cornish 
pasties, Steak & Kidney...and much more

Quality Imports from the British Isles...

Direct Contact: 
Annie 

(310) 710 8224

Stargazing 
with Annie Shaw

The Hare and Hounds

ARIES: You might be tempted to step out of line in an abrupt departure from 
the recent past. Just be sure you do not regret it. Next week will be a better time.
TAURUS: This is a time for you to sort out the mindspace you are currently 
stuck in. You may even resolve some unfinished business. Changes are around 
the corner.
GEMINI: You will likely be looking around you at stuff you could (or should) 
have completed of late. Now is the time to relax, not stress. Happy Birthday!
CANCER: You are probably feeling a little out of control, especially in your 
cash flow. It will soon be back on track due to Mars, currently in your money 
area. 
LEO: Don’t forget to breathe and relax, it’s the best way to get through these 
next few days. You are a leader so get your thoughts aligned and get ready to 
act. Your health and well-being is a priority currently.
VIRGO:  Your boss Mercury is heading in a backward direction next week. 
Relax as nothing much will be happening…enjoy the downtime.
LIBRA:  You likely have new situations arising. These will keep you busy for a 
while. Just enjoy this time as it will stop you thinking too far ahead.
SCORPIO: Your health and well-being is important now that Mars your boss 
has moved into powerful Leo.  Just make sure you stop worrying about things 
that likely will not happen.
SAGITTARIUS: There are some folks who do not understand why you are 
upbeat and in good spirits. This is your nature so be ready to just feel good no 
matter what. It’s time to take a few days away for fun.
CAPRICORN: Expect life to get easier for you now that Jupiter is in your area 
of finances, so make time to relax and count your blessings.  
AQUARIUS: You are usually busy at any given time. While you mostly 
enjoy helping others you are due for a  break. Even a few days away from the 
crowd would be good for you. 
PISCES:   Saturn is living with you for some time ahead. This means any 
situation not for your best and highest good should be up for review. Just 
remember, it’s always for the best.

Booze brands are lining 
up to sponsor Brits in LA 
Pub Quiz each Tuesday 
with tastings and prizes 
and on June 20 it will 
be the turn of Irish 
whiskey Clonakilty.
	 Adding to the fun 
of the trivia night at 
O’Briens on June 13 
was Guinness which 
used technology to put 
pictures of players’ faces 
in the foam of their pints.
	 Raising their glasses 
to victory in the quiz 
were My Goodness My 
Guinness, featuring 
Joanna Duff (right, while 
the singing contest and 
its chocolate cake prize 
was won by Lauren 
Samuels for her team, As 
Yet Untitled (top)
	 Join quizmaster 
Sandro Monetti for 
more tippling and trivia 
at O’Brien’s in Santa 
Monica next and every 
Tuesday.

A Drop 
of the 
Hard 

Stuff...



The british Weekly, Sat. June 17, 2023Page 12

4812 Castle Road, La Canada CA 91011; 
Anita Baratyan, 340 N Kenwood St 103, 
Glendale CA 91206. This business is 
conducted by: a general partnership. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Anita 
Baratyan, general partner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/04/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023101001. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Air Code Air Conditioning 
And Heating, 6724 Jumilla Ave, Winnetka 
CA 91306. County: Los Angeles. Shlomi 
Benshoshan, 6724 Jumilla Ave, Winnetka 
CA 91306. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Shlomi Benshoshan, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/08/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023105645. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: MindGames 
Behavioral Health; Modernized Behavioral 
Health, 2207 6th Street Unit 1, Santa 
Monica CA 90405. County: Los Angeles. 
Stephanie Lynn Juhos, 2207 6th Street 
Unit 1, Santa Monica CA 90405. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Stephanie Lynn Juhos, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/11/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023107499. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Nguyen Group; 
Nguyen Group Real Estate, Nguyen Group 
Finance, 6534 Petit Ave, Lake Balboa 
CA 91406. County: Los Angeles. Chuong 
Tran Nhat Nguyen, 6534 Petit Ave Los 
Angeles Lake Balboa CA 91406. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 03/2023. 
Signed: Chuong Tran Nhat Nguyen, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/15/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023107514. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: CNG Finance, 
See Lending, 6534 Petit Ave, Lake Balboa 
CA 91406. County: Los Angeles. Chuong 
Tran Nhat Nguyen, 6534 Petit Ave Los 
Angeles Lake Balboa CA 91406. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 03/2023. 
Signed: Chuong Tran Nhat Nguyen, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/15/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 

federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023107521. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: We Sold Realty; We 
Sold Houses, We Sold Houses Realty; We 
Sold Houses Guaranteed; We Sold Houses 
Guaranteed Realty, 6534 Petit Ave, Lake 
Balboa CA 91406. County: Los Angeles. 
Chuong Tran Nhat Nguyen, 6534 Petit Ave 
Los Angeles Lake Balboa CA 91406. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 03/2023. 
Signed: Chuong Tran Nhat Nguyen, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/15/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023107526. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Focal Assist; C. 
Nguyen Group, 6534 Petit Ave, Lake 
Balboa CA 91406. County: Los Angeles. 
Chuong Tran Nhat Nguyen, 6534 Petit Ave 
Los Angeles Lake Balboa CA 91406. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 01/2021. 
Signed: Chuong Tran Nhat Nguyen, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/15/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023108637. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Matamoros 
Recyling Services, 927 N Gage Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90063. County: Los Angeles. 
4003 E 6th St, Los Angeles CA 90023. 
Ubaldo Matamoros, 4003 E 6th St, Los 
Angeles CA 90023; Patricia Matamoros, 
4003 E 6th St, Los Angeles CA 90023. This 
business is conducted by: co-partners. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Ubaldo Matamoros, general partner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/15/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023110410. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Luv’n Crockett’s BBQ, 
3121 Viana Dr, Palmdale CA 93550. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 202357111400. Luv’n 
Crockett’s BBQ LLC, 3121 Viana Dr, 
Palmdale CA 93550. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Jamie 
Crockett, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/18/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023110816. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Icy Glow, 14655 
Titus St, Panorama City CA 91402. County: 
Los Angeles. Michelle Arango, 14655 
Titus St, Panorama City CA 91402. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 

Michelle Arango, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/18/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023113699. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Golden Sunshine 
Massage, 4933 Paramount Blvd, Lakewood 
CA 90712. County: Los Angeles. Golden 
Sunshine Massage Inc, 9050 Southview 
Rd, San Gabriel CA 91775. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Yanwei Zhang, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/23/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114014. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Harout’s Auto 
Parts, 12285 Branford St, Sun Valley CA 
91352. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
1873636. Broutian Enterprises, Inc, 
12285 Branford St, Sun Valley CA 91352. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2013. Signed: 
Harout Broutian, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/23/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114017. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: California Homes 
Realty Group; Isaac’s Realty Group, 
20130 Clark St, Woodland Hills CA 91367. 
County: Los Angeles. Marcello Isaac, 20130 
Clark St, Woodland Hills CA 91367. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2014. Signed: 
Marcello Isaac, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/23/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114268. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Occultus Obscura, 
7665 Hollywood Blvd Apt 15, Los Angeles 
CA 90046-2767. County: Los Angeles. 
Nathan O Sparks, 7665 Hollywood Blvd 
Apt 15, Los Angeles CA 90046-2767. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Nathan O Sparks, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/24/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114805. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Inglewood 
DMV Services, Blessings Freight And 

Trucking Services, K.D. Industries, 2926 
W Manchester Blvd. Inglewood CA 
90305. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
5706098. Purple Leaf Enterprises, 2926 
W Manchester Blvd. Inglewood CA 90305. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Felicia Jones, CFO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/24/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114892. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Bayside Export, 
741 W 24th Street #22, San Pedro CA 
90731. County: Los Angeles. 955 Deep 
Valley Drive #4123, Palos Verdes Peninsula 
CA 90274. Jonathan Lee, 741 W 24th 
Street #22, San Pedro CA 90731. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Jonathan Lee, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/24/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023115316. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: American Global Freight; 
AGF Nexus, 500 N Brand Blvd Suite 2049, 
Glendale CA 91203. County: Los Angeles. 
American Global Freights, 500 N Brand 
Blvd Suite 2049, Glendale CA 91203. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Armen Mardirousi, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/24/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023115326. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Wetzel’s Pretzels, 3250 
Big Dalton Ave., #803, Baldwin Park CA 
91706. County: Los Angeles. 100 N. Brand 
Blvd., Suite 402, Glendale CA 91203. Dalton 
Food Inc, 100 N. Brand Blvd., Suite 402, 
Glendale CA 91203. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2023. Signed: Saihum Hossain, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/24/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023115465. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Ritual Metta; Vibespa, 
Fitspa, 2037 20th St Apt C, Santa Monica 
CA 90404. County: Los Angeles. Joanna 
Tarnava, 2037 20th St Apt C, Santa Monica 
CA 90404. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
05/2023. Signed: Joanna Tarnava, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/24/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 

statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023115502. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Friendly Care, 
11144 Harris Ave, Lynwood CA 90262. 
County: Los Angeles. Teresa Gutierrez, 
11144 Harris Ave, Lynwood CA 90262. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Teresa Gutierrez, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/25/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023115564. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Crystal Clear Cleaning 
Services, 11357 Cometa Ave, Pacoima 
CA 91331. County: Los Angeles. Nuria 
Floridalma Olmedo De Guardado, 11357 
Cometa Ave, Pacoima CA 91331. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 05/2023. 
Signed: Nuria Floridalma Olmedo De 
Guardado, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/25/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023115608. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Freight Logistic, 
8311 Eastern Ave, Bell Gardens CA 90201. 
County: Los Angeles. 9620 Mallison Ave, 
South Gate CA 90280. AI#ON: 5691251. 
Freight Logistic, 8311 Eastern Ave, Bell 
Gardens CA 90201. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
05/2023. Signed: Bessy Romero Celedon, 
Secretary. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/25/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023116139. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Deal4Supply, 7457 
Lurline Ave, Winnetka CA 91306. County: 
Los Angeles. Bizcorp, 7457 Lurline Ave, 
Winnetka CA 91306. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 02/2023. Signed: Amir Madani, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/25/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023116151. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Modern Landscape 
Lighting, 7457 Lurline Ave, Winnetka CA 
91306. County: Los Angeles. Bizcorp, 
7457 Lurline Ave, Winnetka CA 91306. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Amir Madani, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 

and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/25/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023116800. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: LB Films International, 
4112 Effie Street, Los Angeles CA 90029. 
County: Los Angeles. Laura Becker, 4112 
Effie Street, Los Angeles CA 90029. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Laura Becker, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/26/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023117803. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Skin Haven, #114 
Via Colinas, Westlake Village CA 91362. 
County: Los Angeles. 145 Via Aldea, 
Newbury Park CA 91320. Lily Agulia, 145 
Via Aldea, Newbury Park CA 91320. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Lily Agulia, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/30/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023117959. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: S Clusive Salon Suites 
LLC, 11140 Jefferson Blvd Ste 1, Culver City 
CA 90230. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
202356911822. S Clusive Salon Suites 
LLC, 11140 Jefferson Blvd Ste 1, Culver 
City CA 90230. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: 
a limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Larita 
Richmond, CFO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/30/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023118457. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Dependable Diamond 
Transportation, 12440 Firestone Blvd Suite 
3025, Office J, Norwalk CA 90650. County: 
Los Angeles. Limitless Levels Corporation, 
5800 S. Eastern Ave Suite 500, Commerce 
CA 90040. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Wonder Brown, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/30/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023118460. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Socal Energy 
Savings, 12629 Riverside Drive 413, 
Valley Village CA 91607. County: Los 

News from Britain
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Angeles.  AI#ON: C4700465. Local Roofing 
Inc, 12629 Riverside Drive 413, Valley 
Village CA 91607. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2023. Signed: Or Sina, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/30/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023118673. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: JCM Administration 
Services, 3576 Norton Ave Apt B, Lynwood 
CA 90262. County: Los Angeles. Josefina 
Camacho Murillo, 3576 Norton Ave Apt 
B, Lynwood CA 90262. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 06/2017. 
Signed: Josefina Camacho Murillo, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/30/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 
06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023118836. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Dream Sequence, 
181 East Alegria Avenue Unit A, Sierra 
Madre CA 91024. County: Los Angeles. 
Serina Smith, 181 East Alegria Avenue 
Unit A, Sierra Madre CA 91024. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Serina Smith, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/30/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119142. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: WOODNBELL, 652 N 
Columbus Ave, Glendale CA 91203. County: 
Los Angeles. Scott Timothy Henson, 652 N 
Columbus Ave, Glendale CA 91203. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Scott Timothy Henson, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/30/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119144. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: California Trust Lending, 
11845 Olympic Blvd Ste 1100W, Los 
Angeles CA 90064. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 4595858. Sternberg Trading, 
Inc., 11845 Olympic Blvd Ste 1100W, Los 
Angeles CA 90064. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
04/2023. Signed: Joshua Louis Sternberg, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/30/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 

law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119207. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Breakthrough 
Genealogy, 1324 Sinaloa Drive, Glendale 
CA 91207. County: Los Angeles. P.O. 
Box 1569, Glendale CA 91209. The 
Grant Factory, LLC, 1324 Sinaloa Drive, 
Glendale CA 91207. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 09/2017. Signed: Franchesca 
Werden, Managing Member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/30/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119464. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Sigiled Flesh, 
461 Quail Dr., Los Angeles CA 90065. 
County: Los Angeles. Ryan Tarr, 461 
Quail Dr., Los Angeles CA 90065. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Ryan Tarr, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/31/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120063. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Alejandra’s Jewelry, 
690 E. Holt Ave, Pomona CA 91767. 
County: Los Angeles. 1255 N Cherry St 
303, Tulare CA 93274. Martha A. Martin, 
690 E. Holt Ave, Pomona CA 91767. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Martha A. Martin, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/31/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120520. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Connecting 
Communities, 10820 Beverly Boulevard 
Suite A5, PMB 1068, Whittier CA 90601. 
County: Los Angeles. Madeleine Prater, 
4316 Ogden Dr, Fremont CA 94538; Alec 
Burns, 34624 Yale Dr, Yucaipa CA 92399. 
This business is conducted by: a general 
partnership. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2022. Signed: Alec Burns, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/31/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/03/2023, 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023 and 06/24/2023

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF 

GRAFTON S. HARPER
Case No. 23STPB05730

	 To all heirs, beneficiaries, credi-
tors, contingent creditors, and per-
sons who may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate, or both, 
of GRAFTON S. HARPER
	 A PETITION FOR PROBATE 
has been filed by Spencer E. Harp-
er III in the Superior Court of Cali-

fornia, County of LOS ANGELES.
	 THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that Spencer E. Harper III 
be appointed as personal represen-
tative to administer the estate of the 
decedent.
	 THE PETITION requests author-
ity to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Before tak-
ing certain very important actions, 
however, the personal representa-
tive will be required to give notice 
to interested persons unless they 
have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the petition will 
be held on June 29, 2023 at 8:30 
AM in Dept. No. 5 located at 111 N. 
Hill St., Los Angeles, CA 90012.
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-
tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and le-
gal authority may affect your rights 
as a creditor. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney knowledgeable 
in California law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a per-
son interested in the estate, you 
may file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.

Attorney for petitioner:
STEPHANIE F BEZNER ESQ

SBN246414
DOAN-BEZNER

6411 SEABRYN DR
RANCHO PALOS VERDES CA 

90275-4755
CN997230 HARPER Jun 10,17,24, 

2023

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd
Norwalk CA 90650

In the Matter of the Petition of You 
Chan Jung, an adult over the age 

of 18 years.

​Date: 07/28/2023. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. C Room 312

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
You Chan Jung. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 

filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from You 

Chan Jung to Adam Jung

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-

entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 31, 2023.
Judge Olivia Rosales
Judge of the Superior Court
23NWCP00202

Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
600 E. Broadway Street

Glendale CA 91206

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Vanuhi Karamyan, an 

adult over the age of 18 years, on 
behalf of Areg Hakobyan, a minor 

under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person(s) whose name is/are 
to be changed is/are under 18 
years of age: Areg Hakobyan. 

And a petition for change of 
names having been duly filed 

with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have the name changed from 

Areg Hakobyan to Areg Sargis-
Sedikyan

Date: 08/09/2023. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept D

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 30, 2023
Robin Miller Sloan,
Judge of the Superior Court
23GDCP00100

Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

6230 Sylmar Avenue
Van Nuys CA 91401

In the Matter of the Petition of Blair 

Harlow Conrad, an adult over the 
age of 18 years.

​Date: 07/28/2023. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. A Room 570

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Blair Harlow Conrad. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have their name changed from 
Blair Harlow Conrad to Avaeo 
Hermes Aire Richie

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 6, 2023.
Virginia Keeny
Judge of the Superior Court
23VECP00320
Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

9425 Penfield Ave
Chatsworth CA 91311 

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Janet Ajung Kim, an adult over 

the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Janet Ajung Kim. And a petition 
for change of names having been 

duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 

petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Janet Ajung Kim to Hannah 

Ajung Kim

And in the Matter of the Petition 
of Janet Ajung Kim, an adult over 
the age of 18 years, on behalf of 
Maia Reine Kim Ortiz, a minor 
under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person(s) whose name is/are to 
be changed are under 18 years of 
age: Maia Reine Kim Ortiz. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have the name changed from 
Maia Reine Kim Ortiz to Deborah 
Joy Kim-Ortiz

Date: 08/04/2023. Time: 8.30am; 
Dept F51

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 2, 2023
David B Gelfound,
Judge of the Superior Court
23CHCP00233

Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
400 Civic Center Plaza

Pomona CA 91766

In the Matter of the Petition 
of JESSICA MARIE GARCIA, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 07/07/2023. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. L

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
JESSICA MARIE GARCIA. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from JESSICA MARIE GARCIA to 
Jessica Marie Garcia

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: May 2, 2023.
Peter A Hernandez
Judge of the Superior Court
23PSCP00203
Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

275 Magnolia Ave
Long Beach CA 90802

In the Matter of the Petition of Olya 
Janine Drewes, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 07/14/2023. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. 27

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
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changed is over 18 years of age: 
Olya Janine Drewes. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Olya Janine Drewes to Olie 
Janine Drewes

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 1, 2023.
Mark C Kim
Judge of the Superior Court
23SLBCP00213

Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023073079. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Visiting Angels 
Hospice, 539 N Glenoaks Blvd Ste 307, 
Burbank CA 91502. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: C3600729. Visiting Angels 
Hospice Inc, 539 N Glenoaks Blvd Ste 307, 
Burbank CA 91502. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 01/2018. Signed: Marta Makhshikyan, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
04/03/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023099228. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Fox Pro Insurance 
Services, 12440 Firestone Blvd Ste 311, 
Norwalk CA 90650. County: Los Angeles.  
AI#ON: 202251018048. Southwest Fox 
Insurance Solutions LLC, 12440 Firestone 
Blvd Ste 311, Norwalk CA 90650. State of 
Organization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Will Cabistan, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/04/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023109240. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Veterans Entitlement 
Home Loans; Fidelity Home Loans, 1334 
E Palmdale Blvd Suite C, Palmdale CA 
93550. County: Los Angeles. RMortgage 
LLC, 36777 Boxwood Ct, Palmdale CA 
93550. State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 

liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Ruben Torres, 
Managing Member. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/17/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023109439. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Puente Hills 
Nissan, 17320 Gale Ave, City of Industry 
CA 91748. County: Los Angeles. 1461 
Superior Ave., Newport Beach CA 92663. 
AI#ON: 5469544. GK Motors, Inc., 1461 
Superior Ave., Newport Beach CA 92663. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Issam Ghreiwati, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/17/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023110089. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Mancilla’s General 
Construction, Inc, 1826 N. Niagara St, 
Burbank CA 91505. County: Los Angeles. 
Mancilla’s General Construction, Inc, 
1826 N. Niagara St, Burbank CA 91505. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 05/2023. 
Signed: Raul Mancilla Sotelo, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/18/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023111071. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Smart And Loving 
Care Agent, 6032 Fairfield St East, Los 
Angeles CA 90022. County: Los Angeles. 
Rosemelita Cortez, 6032 Fairfield St East, 
Los Angeles CA 90022; Melver Cortez, 
6032 Fairfield St East, Los Angeles CA 
90022. This business is conducted by: 
a married couple. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Rosemelita 
Cortez, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/19/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023111273. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Unwind Catering, 
Divine Catering, 7311 Shoup Avenue, West 
Hills CA 91307. County: Los Angeles. Ellie 
Rouhparvar, 7311 Shoup Avenue, West 
Hills CA 91307. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Ellie Rouhparvar, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 

information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/19/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023112632. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Slowgenz T-Shirts & 
Apparel, 6030 South Arlington Avenue, Los 
Angeles CA 90043. County: Los Angeles. 
Danny Ted Thomas, 6030 South Arlington 
Avenue, Los Angeles CA 90043. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2018. Signed: 
Danny Ted Thomas, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/22/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023116257. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Wella Wellness Spa, 
1850 Whitley Ave Apt 419, Los Angeles 
CA 90028. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
202355413223. Richness LLC, 1850 
Whitley Ave Apt 419, Los Angeles CA 90028. 
State of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Onanong Promkittiyanont, 
member. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/22/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023116540. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Plant Lab, 1560 N Hobart 
Blvd Apt 2, Los Angeles CA 90027. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 202355015475. 
Plant Lab LLC, 1560 N Hobart Blvd Apt 2, 
Los Angeles CA 90027. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Dutsanee Deenor, Member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/17/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023116556. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Haji Sushi House, 
6357 Wilshire Blvd, Los Angeles CA 
90048. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
20235511455. Haji Sushi House LLC, 6357 
Wilshire Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90048. State 
of Organization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Kitawasut Nachiangmai, Member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/25/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 

be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023116598. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Cetina’s Trucking, 10625 
Roseton Ave, Santa Fe Springs CA 90670. 
County: Los Angeles. Cetina’s Trucking 
LLC, 10625 Roseton Ave, Santa Fe 
Springs CA 90670. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: 
a limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 02/2022. Signed: Conrad 
Cetina, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/25/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023117099. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: 9 Spice, 3648 Del Amo 
Blvd A, Torrance CA 90503. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON 202355315897. 9 Spice 
LLC, 3648 Del Amo Blvd A, Torrance CA 
90503. State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Krai 
Srivanitchayakun, member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/26/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023117167. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: IGGI, 1316 S Stanley 
Ave, Los Angeles CA 90019. County: 
Los Angeles. Ingela Oegaard, 1316 S 
Stanley Ave, Los Angeles CA 90019. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Ingela Oegaard, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/26/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023117437. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: SoCal ProTint, 
Glass Chip Pro, 16809 Bellflower Blvd 
#414, Bellflower CA 90706 County: Los 
Angeles. Greg Wible, 16809 Belflower 
Blvd. #414, Bellflower CA 90706. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 12/2006. Signed: 
Greg Wible, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/26/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 

2023117953. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Quanima 
Consulting, 243 S Kern Ave, East Los 
Angeles CA 90022. County: Los Angeles. 
Sterling Andre Quan Soon, 243 S Kern 
Ave, East Los Angeles CA 90022. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 04/2022. 
Signed: Sterling Andre Quan Soon, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/30/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023118633. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Brown Knows Cider, 
Brown’s Hard Cider, 24303 La Glorita 
Cir, Santa Clarita CA 91321. County: Los 
Angeles. Brown Partington, 24303 La 
Glorita Cir, Santa Clarita CA 91321. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 02/2016. Signed: 
Brown Partington, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/30/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119651. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Mr Seating, 14266 
Dalewood St Ste D, Baldwin Park CA 91706. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 5665987. 
Furnvision Corp, 14266 Dalewood St 
Ste D, Baldwin Park CA 91706. State of 
Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Aaron Perez Reyes, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/31/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119662. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Miho Sushi, 18373 
Ventura Blvd, Tarzana CA 91356. County: 
Los Angeles. 18373 Ventura Blvd. Tarzana 
CA 91356. AI#ON: 4147153. DFT Group, 
15701 Vincennes St., North Hills CA 91343. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Thapthep Kaewthongchuea, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/31/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119695. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Valley Cleaning 
Services, 18720 Oxnard St., #110, Tarzana 
CA 91356. County: Los Angeles. Marsha 
Cohen, 18720 Oxnard St., #110, Tarzana 
CA 91356. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 

to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Marsha Cohen, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/31/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119741. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: 15014 Alburtis, 
15014 Alburtis Ave, Norwalk CA 906590. 
County: Los Angeles. 16212 Flallon Ave, 
Norwalk CA 90650. AI#ON: 202356914250. 
15014 Alburtis LLC, 15014 Alburtis Ave, 
Norwalk CA 90650. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: 
a limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Juan C Chopin 
Moran, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/31/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119755. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Wedgibee Games; 
Sean Wejebe Games, 20113 LeMarsh 
Street, Chatsworth CA 91311. County: Los 
Angeles. Sean Michael Wejebe, 20113 
LeMarsh Street, Chatsworth CA 91311. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Sean Michael Wejebe, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/31/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119905. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: All Things Audio, 1511 
Heather Ridge Drive, Glendale CA 91207. 
County: Los Angeles. Daniel Alan Ribiat, 
1511 Heather Ridge Drive, Glendale CA 
91207. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
09/2017. Signed: Daniel Alan Ribiat, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/31/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120016. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: HelpingHandCare, 
3207 Magnolia Ave., Long Beach CA 
90806. County: Los Angeles. Liahl May 
Sison, 3207 Magnolia Ave., Long Beach CA 
90806. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
05/2023. Signed: Liahl May Sison, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/31/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
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on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120019. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: ICaregiver Pro, 3207 
Magnolia Ave., Long Beach CA 90806. 
County: Los Angeles. Jeric Steve Villodres 
Garcia, 3207 Magnolia Ave., Long Beach 
CA 90806. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
05/2023. Signed: Jeric Steve Villodres 
Garcia, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/31/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120294. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Too Nice, This Is 
Too Nice, 725 N Central Avenue Floor 2, 
Glendale CA 91203. County: Los Angeles. 
1164 N Commonwealth Avenue, Los 
Angeles CA 90029. Ian Quay, 1164 N 
Commonwealth Avenue, Los Angeles CA 
90029. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 10/2017. Signed: Ian Quay, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/31/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120348. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Lino’s Drywall & Stucco 
Patch and Repair, 20737 Arline Avenue, 
Lakewood CA 90715. County: Los Angeles. 
Lino Alberto Gonzalez Gaona, 20737 
Arline Avenue, Lakewood CA 90715. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Lino Alberto Gonzalez Gaona, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/31/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120563. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Yellow Monkey Homes, 
15219 Caravaca Road, La Mirada CA 
90638. County: Los Angeles. Jenny Paola 
Molina, 15219 Caravaca Road, La Mirada 
CA 90638. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 05/2023. Signed: Jenny Paola 
Molina, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/01/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 

law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120637. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: M1000, 7619 Jellico Ave, 
Northridge CA 91325. County: Los Angeles. 
Francis Lawlor, 7619 Jellico Ave, Northridge 
CA 91325. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Francis Lawlor, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/01/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120785. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: AC Laundry Repairs; 
Affordable Commercial Laundry Repairs, 
203 E Live Oak St Apt M, San Gabriel 
CA 91776. County: Los Angeles. Jesus 
J Hernandez Jimenez, 203 E Live Oak St 
Apt M, San Gabriel CA 91776; Geanella 
Sotomayor, 203 E Live Oak St Apt M, 
San Gabriel CA 91776. This business 
is conducted by: a married couple. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Geanella Sotomayor, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/01/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120873. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: ROBBIEMARSHALL, 
ROBBIE MARSHALL, 11664 National Blvd 
#415, Los Angeles CA 90064. County: 
Los Angeles. 8322 Regis Way, Los 
Angeles CA 90045. GoTo Solutions Inc, 
8322 Regis Way, Los Angeles CA 90045. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Jun Goto, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/01/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120894. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: NoHo Best 
Construction, 6614 Bellaire Ave, North 
Hollywood CA 91606. County: Los 
Angeles. Armen Javadyan, 6614 Bellaire 
Ave, North Hollywood CA 91606. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Armen Javadyan, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/01/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120919. The following person(s) is/

are doing business as: ConnectUNow, 
520 S. Grand Ave. #350, Los Angeles CA 
90071. County: Los Angeles. 7521 2nd 
Street, Downey CA 90241. Connect U 
Now LLC, 520 S. Grand Ave. #350, Los 
Angeles CA 90071. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2018. Signed: Sandra 
Ballar, Secretary. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/01/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023120937. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Sacred Sounds 
And Healing, 1031 Orange Ave Apt. C, 
Long Beach CA 90813. County: Los 
Angeles. Jenna M Scotto, 1031 Orange 
Ave Apt. C, Long Beach CA 90813. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Jenna M Scotto, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/01/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023121351. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Fishbowl Events, 
3923 Bledsoe Ave. Los Angeles CA 90066. 
County: Los Angeles. Charles Liu, 3923 
Bledsoe Ave. Los Angeles CA 90066. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 01/2022. Signed: 
Charles Liu, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/01/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023121476. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Omega Engineering 
Solution, 436 S Orange Ave., Apt C, 
Monterey Park CA 91755. County: Los 
Angeles. Win Han Tun, 436 S Orange 
Ave., Apt C, Monterey Park CA 91755. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Win Han Tun, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/01/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023121614. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Lake Massage, 
1357 Custoza Ave, Rowland Heights CA 
91748. County: Los Angeles. Wei Song, 
1357 Custoza Ave, Rowland Heights CA 
91748. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Wei Song, owner. Registrant(s) 

declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/01/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023122212. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Le Café De La Plage 
Santa Monica, 1301 Montana Avenue, 
Santa Monica CA 90403. County: Los 
Angeles. 303 North Palm Drive, Beverly 
Hills CA 90210. Le Café Montana LLC, 303 
North Palm Drive, Beverly Hills CA 90210. 
State of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2023. Signed: Bernard Benita, 
Managing Member. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/02/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023122707. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Smile 360; 360 
Smile, 210 S Garfield Ave, Monterey Park 
CA 91754. County: Los Angeles. Tim 
Wong DDS Dental Corporation, 210 S 
Garfield Ave, Monterey Park CA 91754. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Timothy Wong, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/05/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023122716. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: SoCal Digital 
Agency; SoCal Specialty Tools, Japan 
USA Precision Tools, 16809 Bellflower 
Blvd. #414, Bellflower CA 90706. County: 
Los Angeles. Gregory Alan Wible, 16809 
Bellflower Blvd. #414, Bellflower CA 90706. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2022. Signed: 
Gregory Alan Wible, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/05/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023122734. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Babes In Toyland; Babes 
By Design, 1040 San Rafael Avenue #207, 
Glendale CA 91202. County: Los Angeles. 
Stephanie Brown, 1040 San Rafael 
Avenue #207, Glendale CA 91202. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Stephanie Brown, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/05/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 

from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023123072. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Tea Shi, 421 N Rodeo Dr 
Suit 14, Beverly Hills CA 90210. County: Los 
Angeles. 4150 Arch Drive 215, Studio City 
CA 91604. Shila Beauty Center LLC, 421 N 
Rodeo Dr 14, Beverly Hills CA 90210. State 
of Organization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2023. Signed: 
Maksim Yeudakimenka, CFO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/05/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023123300. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Atlas Distribution 
Company, 21931 Burbank Blvd Unit 6, 
Woodland Hills CA 91367. County: Los 
Angeles. CinemaCloudworks Incorporated, 
21931 Burbank Blvd Unit 6, Woodland 
Hills CA 91367. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2023. Signed: Harmon Kaslow, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/05/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023123416. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: FM Consulting, 18375 
Ventura Blvd Ste 188, Tarzana CA 91356. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 5528661. 
Fortumia, Inc, 18375 Ventura Blvd Ste 188, 
Tarzana CA 91356. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Aleksey Sheychenko, Vice 
President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/05/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023123549. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: HM Transport, 
2040 Plaza Dr #4, West Covina CA 91790. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 4277296. 
Herencia Mexicana, 2040 Plaza Dr #4, West 
Covina CA 91790. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
06/2023. Signed: Donaji Zamora, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/05/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 

in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023123661. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Lida’s Cake & 
Pastry, 720 N. Lake Ave #3, Pasadena CA 
91104. County: Los Angeles. Lida’s Cake 
and Pastry, LLC, 720 N. Lake Ave #3, 
Pasadena CA 91104. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Albert Zadourian, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/05/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023123768. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Pacific Wellness 
Pod, 17503 Scudder Ct, Carson CA 
90746. County: Los Angeles. Anna Smith, 
17503 Scudder Ct, Carson CA 90746. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 03/2022. Signed: 
Anna Smith, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/05/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023123775. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Brief Athletics, 
20604 LeMay St, Winnetka CA 91306. 
County: Los Angeles. Karen Perez, 20604 
LeMay St, Winnetka CA 91306. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Karen Perez, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/05/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023124522. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Fossati Fashion, 11716 
Exposition Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90064. 
County: Los Angeles. Luisa Fossati, 11716 
Exposition Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90064. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2020. Signed: 
Luisa Fossati, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/06/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023124551. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Patio Cozy, 20025 
Wadley Ave, Carson CA 90746. County: 
Los Angeles. Melba L Neal, 20025 
Wadley Ave, Carson CA 90746. This 
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business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Melba L Neal, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/06/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023124736. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Spanish Certified 
Services, 5909 Shoshone Avenue, Encino 
CA 91316. County: Los Angeles. PO Box 
18551, Encino CA 91416. Glossa Inc, 
5909 Shoshone Avenue, Encino CA 91316. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Ana 
Isabel Garcia Munoz, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/06/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023125076. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Industry 
Connexion, 1724 N Highland Ave 504, 
Los Angeles CA 90028. County: Los 
Angeles. Roberto Barron, 1724 N Highland 
Ave 504, Los Angeles CA 90028. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Roberto Barron, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/07/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 06/10/2023, 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 07/01/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023125840. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: The Fungi Store, 
2108 N St N, Sacramento CA 95816. 
County: Sacramento. 321 N Pass Ave. Ste 
324, Burbank CA 91505. Shroo LLC, 2108 
N St N, Sacramento CA 95816. State of 
Organization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Veronika Issa Steinhoff, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/07/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/10/2023, 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023 and 
07/01/2023.

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF: 

BROOKE SMITH MAILE 
CASE NO. 23STPB06118

To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interested 
in the WILL or estate, or both of 
BROOKE SMITH MAILE.
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has 
been filed by STEPHEN AMOS 
SMITH in the Superior Court 
of California, County of LOS 

ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that STEPHEN AMOS 
SMITH be appointed as personal 
representative to administer the 
estate of the decedent.
THE PETITION requests the 
decedent’s WILL and codicils, if 
any, be admitted to probate. The 
WILL and any codicils are available 
for examination in the file kept by 
the court.
THE PETITION requests authority 
to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without 
obtaining court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required to 
give notice to interested persons 
unless they have waived notice or 
consented to the proposed action.) 
The independent administration 
authority will be granted unless an 
interested person files an objection 
to the petition and shows good 
cause why the court should not 
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the petition will 
be held in this court as follows: 
07/11/23 at 8:30AM in Dept. 2D 
located at 111 N. HILL ST., LOS 
ANGELES, CA 90012
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear 
at the hearing and state your 
objections or file written objections 
with the court before the hearing. 
Your appearance may be in person 
or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with 
the court and mail a copy to the 
personal representative appointed 
by the court within the later of 
either (1) four months from the 
date of first issuance of letters to 
a general personal representative, 
as defined in section 58(b) of the 
California Probate Code, or (2) 60 
days from the date of mailing or 
personal delivery to you of a notice 
under section 9052 of the California 
Probate Code.
Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as 
a creditor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file kept 
by the court. If you are a person 
interested in the estate, you may 
file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
NICOLE ANDERSON - SBN 
256212 AND ALEXANDRA 
MURPHY - SBN 286389
ANDERSON LAW GROUP, INC.
1000 N. COAST HIGHWAY,
STE 10
LAGUNA BEACH CA 92651
BSC 223500
6/17, 6/24, 7/1/23
CNS-3710121

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Craig Lawrence Silva, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 08/04/2023. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Craig Lawrence Silva. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have their name changed from 

Craig Lawrence Silva to Craig 
Frosty Silva

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 6, 2023.
Hon. Lawrence Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
23SMCP00310

Published: 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 and 
07/08/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
400 Civic Center Plaza

Pomona CA 91766

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Ceara Beltran and Henry 

Manuel III, adults over the age 
of 18 years, on behalf of Tristan 
Matthew Beltran, a minor under 

the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person(s) whose name is/are 
to be changed is/are under 18 
years of age: Tristan Matthew 
Beltran. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have the name changed from 
Tristan Matthew Beltran to Henry 
Matthew Manuel IV

Date: 08/08/2023. Time: 9.00am; 
Dept O, 5th floor

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the 
petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant 
the petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 8, 2023
Christian R Gullon,
Judge of the Superior Court
23PSCP00088

Published: 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 and 

07/08/2023.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

150 W Commonwealth Ave
Alhambra CA 91801

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Vivian Hoang-Vi Nguyen, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 08/23/2023. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. 3

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 
changed is over 18 years of age: 
Vivian Hoang-Vi Nguyen. And a 
petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Vivian Hoang-Vi Nguyen to 
Vivian Hoang-Vi Nguyen-Sharma

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-
entitled matter of change of 
names appear before the above-
entitled court to show cause why 
the petition for change of name(s) 
should not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for 
hearing of said petition. 

Dated: June 8, 2023
Robin Miller Sloan
Judge of the Superior Court
23AHCP00242

Published: 06/17/2023, 
06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 and 
07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023096914. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: La Calle Sucia, 
526 ½ N St Louis St, Los Angeles CA 
90033. County: Los Angeles. Danny 
Diaz, 526 ½ N St Louis St, Los Angeles 
CA 90033; George Michael Turcios, 526 
½ N St Louis St, Los Angeles CA 90033, 
Andrew Salcedo, 526 ½ N St Louis St, 
Los Angeles CA 90033. This business 
is conducted by: a general partnership. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Danny Diaz, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/02/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023097652. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Aundria Swan 
Sales, 1248 W. 51st Place, Los Angeles 
CA 90037-3423. County: Los Angeles. 
421 Gaviota Avenue, Long Beach CA 
90802. Aundria Swan, 421 Gaviota 
Avenue, Long Beach CA 90802. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 

business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Aundria Swan, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/03/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023099236. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Huge Value 
Store, 317 N. Morris Ave. West Covina 
CA 91790. County: Los Angeles. 964 
East Badillo St., #319, Covina CA 
91724. Doing Businesses, Inc., 317 N. 
Morris Ave. West Covina CA 91790. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Isidro H. Sanchez, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/04/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023100005. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: The SKN 
Club, 23300 Cinema Dr. Ste 250, 
Santa Clarita CA 91350. County: Los 
Angeles. SKN Firm LLC, 1401 21st 
Street Ste 5637, Sacramento CA 95811. 
State of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 04/2023. Signed: 
Karen R. Machado Martinez, Managing 
Member. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/05/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023100889. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Infinite 
Promotions; Psychic Tarot And Turkish 
Coffee Reader, 1128 South Rexford Dr 
Apt 2, Los Angeles CA 90035. County: 
Los Angeles. Edmond E Niknam 
Moghadam, 1128 South Rexford Dr Apt 
2, Los Angeles CA 90035. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 01/2020. 
Signed: Edmond E Niknam Moghadam, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/08/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 

Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023107558. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Boss Handy, 
1007 E Lomita Ave, Glendale CA 91205. 
County: Los Angeles. Siarhei Shauchuk, 
11809 W Magnolia Blvd. Valley Village 
CA 91607. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 01/2019. Signed: 
Siarhei Shauchuk, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/15/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023110862. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: KCOH Radio, 
19141 Golden Valley Rd Ste 1034, 
Santa Clarita CA 91387. County: Los 
Angeles. 8/11 LLC, 19141 Golden Valley 
Rd Ste 1034, Santa Clarita CA 91387. 
State of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2023. 
Signed: Damien Kirk, Managing 
Member. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/18/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023112874. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Scherzo Theatre 
Company, 918 Bethany Road, Burbank 
CA 91504. County: Los Angeles. Adam 
Dlugolecki, 918 Bethany Road, Burbank 
CA 91504. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Adam Dlugolecki, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/22/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023114947. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Jordan Gibbs 
Realty, 3500 W Manchester Blvd Unit 
267, Inglewood CA 90305. County: 
Los Angeles. Jordan Gibbs, 3500 W 
Manchester Blvd Unit 267, Inglewood 
CA 90305. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2006. Signed: 
Jordan Gibbs, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 05/24/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 

Neil Fletcher

Neil Fletcher
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expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023119401. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Thread 
Break, 19409 Wadley Ave, Carson CA 
90746. County: Los Angeles. Exxtralife 
Enterprises LLC, 19409 Wadley Ave, 
Carson CA 90746. State of organization: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 04/2023. 
Signed: Michael F Lutu, Managing 
Member. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/31/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023121927. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: A-Team CPA, 
453 Falcon Pl, Covina CA 91723-2024. 
County: Los Angeles. William Chen, 453 
Falcon Pl, Covina CA 91723-2024. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2023. Signed: William Chen, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/02/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023123768. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Pacific Wellness 
Pod, 17503 Scudder Ct, Carson CA 
90746. County: Los Angeles. Anna 
Smith, 17503 Scudder Ct, Carson CA 
90746. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 03/2022. Signed: Anna 
Smith, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/05/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023124062. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Vegan Glory, 8393 
Beverly Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90048. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 5496102. 
Vegan Glory Company, 8393 Beverly 
Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90048. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 

name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Chadawan Lamvatananont, 
Secretary. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/06/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023124267. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Exodo Travel 
& Tours Multiservices, 11208 Idalene 
St, Santa Fe Springs CA 90670. 
County: Los Angeles. Doris L Salas, 
11208 Idalene St, Santa Fe Springs 
CA 90670. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 01/2022. Signed: Doris L 
Salas, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/06/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023124952. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Racers Edge, 
4206 W Hood Ave, Burbank CA 91505. 
County: Los Angeles. James Krug, 4206 
W Hood Ave, Burbank CA 91505. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2012. Signed: James Krug, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/06/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023125070. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Ming RV Pros, 
795 Ironbark Lane, San Dimas CA 
91773. County: Los Angeles. XMING 
INC, 795 Ironbark Lane, San Dimas 
CA 91773. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2023. Signed: 
Xiaoming Cao, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/07/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023125240. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Complete 

Network Solutions, CNS, CNS4US.
COM, 7210 Jordan Ave., #A27, Canoga 
Park CA 91303. County: Los Angeles. 
Robert James Wagstaff, 7210 Jordan 
Ave., #A27, Canoga Park CA 91303. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Robert James Wagstaff, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/07/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023125242. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Suzijeffe Taxi 
Co, Blue Magic Limo Services, 7210 
Jordan Ave., #A27, Canoga Park CA 
91303. County: Los Angeles. Robert 
James Wagstaff, 7210 Jordan Ave., 
#A27, Canoga Park CA 91303. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Robert James Wagstaff, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/07/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023125244. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: THECOURIER, 
DUHCOURIER, 7210 Jordan Ave., 
#A27, Canoga Park CA 91303. County: 
Los Angeles. Robert James Wagstaff, 
7210 Jordan Ave., #A27, Canoga Park 
CA 91303. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Robert 
James Wagstaff, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/07/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023125246. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Cartridge 
Warehouse Center; CWC, 7210 Jordan 
Ave., #A27, Canoga Park CA 91303. 
County: Los Angeles. Dave Miller Ent., 
7210 Jordan Ave., #A27, Canoga 
Park CA 91303. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Brendan 
Charles Currey, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/07/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 

date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023125674. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Parts24.aero, 
17513 Margate St, Encino CA 91316. 
County: Los Angeles. M.S. International 
Eng&Sys Inc., 17513 Margate St, 
Encino CA 91316. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Mark Stuhl, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/07/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023125792. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Klear, 22120 
Clarendon St., #205, Woodland Hills 
CA 91367. County: Los Angeles. 
Edri Nomder Investments, 22120 
Clarendon St., #205, Woodland Hills 
CA 91367. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Lior Edri, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/07/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023126267. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: 8IGHT.INK, 1738 
W 153rd Street, Compton CA 90220. 
County: Los Angeles. Katrinca Moore, 
15574 Moonflower Avenue, Chino CA 
91708. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2023. Signed: 
Katrinca Moore, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/07/2023. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023126279. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Artists Collective 
Management, 2189 N Altadena Drive, 
Altadena CA 91001. County: Los 
Angeles. Stephanie N Smith, 2189 N 
Altadena Drive, Altadena CA 91001. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2023. Signed: Stephanie N Smith, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 

information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/08/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023126329. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: SpeakerAddict, 
Speaker Addict, 13065 Tom White Way 
Ste G, Norwalk CA 90650. County: 
Los Angeles. Cameron J Wink, 15025 
Rosalita Dr, La Mirada CA 90638. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 01/2015. Signed: Cameron J Wink, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/08/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023126545. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: CMA Properties, 
2201 E Willow St Suite D, Signal Hill CA 
90755. County: Los Angeles. Charles 
Moford Abrams, 2201 E Willow St Suite 
D, Signal Hill CA 90755. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Charles Moford Abrams, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/08/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023126709. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: OIC, Inc., 2711 
N Sepulveda Blvd #1083, Manhattan 
Beach CA 90266-2725. County: Los 
Angeles. Online Inspector Certifications, 
Inc., 2711 N Sepulveda Blvd #1083, 
Manhattan Beach CA 90266-2725. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 04/2022. Signed: Stacy T Maeda, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/08/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023126746. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Myla Design, 
400 W Wilson Ave Apt 2, Glendale CA 

91203. County: Los Angeles. Margarit 
Yeghshatyan, 400 W Wilson Ave Apt 
2, Glendale CA 91203. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
05/2018. Signed: Margarit Yeghshatyan, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/08/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023127176. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Minuteman 
Press, 5224 Laurel Canyon Blvd, Valley 
Village CA 91607. County: Los Angeles. 
IEDevelopment, Inc., 2721 Fairmount 
Avenue, La Crescenta CA 91214.  
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2023. Signed: Armen Bedrossian, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/08/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023127221. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Mixma 
Productions, 4910 Eldred St, Los 
Angeles CA 90042. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 3792550. Ryan Cross 
Presents, 4910 Eldred St, Los Angeles 
CA 90042. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2023. Signed: 
Martamaria Cross, Vice President.
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/08/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023127553. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: AMNY Services, 
22524 Margarita Dr, Woodland Hills 
CA 91364. County: Los Angeles. 
Alex Shidlovitsky, 22524 Margarita 
Dr, Woodland Hills CA 91364. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Alex Shidlovitsky, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/09/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
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name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023127765. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Bluewolf 
International Security, 2029 Allbrook St, 
Lomita CA 90717. County: Los Angeles. 
American Elite Guard Inc., 2029 
Allbrook St, Lomita CA 90717. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2023. Signed: Najeebullah Shinwari, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/09/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023128136. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Die Hard Stage 
Play, 9921 Robbins Drive Apt 5, Beverly 
Hills CA 90212. County: Los Angeles. 
Alessandro Monetti, 9921 Robbins Drive 
Apt 5, Beverly Hills CA 90212. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2023. Signed: Alessandro 
Monetti, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/09/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023128221. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Oh La La, 
921 E. Colorado Blvd, Pasadena CA 
91106. County: Los Angeles. 12035 
Wilshire Blvd # 702, Los Angeles CA 
90025. Cheval Bleu Inc, 12035 Wilshire 
Blvd # 702, Los Angeles CA 90025. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2023. Signed: Thomas Kocer, 
CFO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/09/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Statement of Abandonment of Use of 
Fictitious Business Name: 2023128267. 
Current file: 2023091428. The following 
person has abandoned the use of the 
fictitious business name: Vesper Villa, 
5646 Vesper Ave, Sherman Oaks CA 
91411. County: Los Angeles. Astghik 
Karapetyan, 5646 Vesper Ave, Sherman 
Oaks CA 91411. The fictitious business 
name referred to above was filed 
on: 04/25/2023, in the County of Los 
Angeles. This business is conducted 

by: an individual. Signed: Astghik 
Karapetyan, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 06/09/2023. 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023128316. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Pacific West 
Communications Of California, 431 
S Burnside Ave 5H, Los Angeles CA 
90036. County: Los Angeles. Craig A 
Bullard, 431 S Burnside Ave 5H, Los 
Angeles CA 90036. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2023. Signed: Craig A Bullard, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/09/2023. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of another 
under federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 
07/01/2023 and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023128481. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Kesh 
Marketing And Management, 
9936 Milburn Dr, Sun Valley CA 
91352. County: Los Angeles. Sean 
Keshishian, 9936 Milburn Dr, Sun 
Valley CA 91352. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Sean Keshishian, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/12/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023128594. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: P.A.C. 
Properties, 12716 Riverside Drive, 
Valley Village CA 91607. County: Los 
Angeles. Peter Coeler, 588 W Stafford 
Road, Westlake Village CA 91361. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 04/2002. Signed: Peter Coeler, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/12/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023129275. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: JAQ 
Entertainment Group, The Kitchen 
Table, At The Kitchen Table, 18034 
Ventura Blvd Suite 441, Encino 
CA 91316. County: Los Angeles. 
Jaqueline Fleming, 19225 Harliss St, 
Northridge CA 91324. This business 

is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
05/2018. Signed: Jaqueline Fleming, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/12/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023129441. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Gleeful 
Gear, 5100 Woodman Ave Apt 105, 
Sherman Oaks CA 91423. County: 
Los Angeles. Joshua Robbins, 5100 
Woodman Ave Apt 105, Sherman 
Oaks CA 91423. This business is 
conducted by:  an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2023. Signed: Joshua Robbins, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/12/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023129478. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Cars 
4 Cheap, 23819 Claymore Way, 
Valencia CA 91354. County: Los 
Angeles. Shakir Hanifa, 23819 
Claymore Way, Valencia CA 91354; 
Mufliha Shakir, 23819 Claymore Way, 
Valencia CA 91354. This business is 
conducted by: a general partnership. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2023. Signed: Shakir Hanifa, 
general partner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/12/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023129717. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: LA In 2026; 
L.A. Con V, 16835 Lahey St, Granada 
Hills CA 91344. County: Los Angeles. 
Southern California Institute For 
Fan Interests, Inc., 16835 Lahey St, 
Granada Hills CA 91344. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Elayne F. Pelz, Treasurer. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/12/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 

Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023129802. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Quantum 
Power Electric Company, 10514 
Sunland Blvd Apt 7, Sunland CA 
91040, County: Los Angeles. Artak 
Hakobyan, 10514 Sunland Blvd Apt 
7, Sunland CA 91040. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2023. Signed: Elayne F. Pelz, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/13/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023129823. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Purposeful 
Press, 821 North Parish Place, 
Burbank CA 91506. County: Los 
Angeles. Nicholas James Schenck, 
821 North Parish Place, Burbank CA 
91506. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Nicholas James Schenck, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/13/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023129835. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Fix All Home; 
Fix All Homes, 120 Glendora Ave, La 
Puente CA 91744. County: Los Angeles. 
Vincent Wen Ho, 120 Glendora Ave, 
La Puente CA 91744. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2023. Signed: Vincent Wen Ho, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/13/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023129901. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: GoodBadCat, 
511 S Rampart Blvd Apt 10, Los 
Angeles CA 90057. County: Los 

Angeles. Amayah Grace Kuehn, 
511 S Rampart Blvd Apt 10, Los 
Angeles CA 90057. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Amayah Grace Kuehn, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/13/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023129915. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Galactivators, 
182 ½ Covina Ave Upstairs, Long 
Beach CA 90803. County: Los Angeles. 
Christa Everest, 182 ½ Covina Ave 
Upstairs, Long Beach CA 90803; 
Joseph Katta, 182 ½ Covina Ave 
Upstairs, Long Beach CA 90803. This 
business is conducted by: co-partners. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 11/2018. Signed: Joseph Katta, 
general partner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/13/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
20231230115. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Buzzanco 
Computer Consulting Solutions DBA 
Datow Software, 4119 Charlemagne 
Avenue, Long Beach CA 90808. 
County: Los Angeles. Pamela 
Buzzanco, 4119 Charlemagne Avenue, 
Long Beach CA 90808. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
03/2003. Signed: Pamela Buzzanco, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/13/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
20231230121. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Diosas Y 
Divas, 600 S Broadway Unit A7 A9, 
Los Angeles CA 90014. County: Los 
Angeles. Brenda Rodriguez Miranda, 
430 E Ave 28, Los Angeles CA 
90031. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2023. 
Signed: Brenda Rodriguez Miranda, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/13/2023. NOTICE - This 

fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023130742. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Paradigm, 
12130 Millennium Drive Suite 300, 
Los Angeles CA 90094. County: Los 
Angeles. Millennium Drive Partners 
Inc., 12130 Millennium Drive Suite 
300, Los Angeles CA 90094. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2023. Signed: Khaled Yatim, 
Secretary. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/13/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023130763. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Top 
Renovation, 6350 Laurel Canyon 
Blvd. #310, North Hollywood CA 
91606. County: Los Angeles. Home 
Pro Remodeling & Construction Inc, 
6350 Laurel Canyon Blvd. #310, 
North Hollywood CA 91606. State of 
incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Yaakov Dayan, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/13/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2023131012. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Power Scale 
Media, 41 28th Avenue, #2, Los Angeles 
CA 90291. County: Los Angeles. Harry 
Garstka, 41 28th Avenue, #2, Los 
Angeles CA 90291. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Harry Garstka, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/14/2023. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
06/17/2023, 06/24/2023, 07/01/2023 
and 07/08/2023.
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Brits in LABW SPORT

Wolves have 
dismissed speculation 
surrounding Julen 
Lopetegui’s future and 
say he will remain as 
their head coach next 
season.
	 Lopetegui took over 
in November when 
Wolves were bottom 
of the Premier League 
table and guided them to 
safety.
	 However, the 
Spaniard’s future had 
been uncertain because 
of the club’s financial 
situation.
	 On Thursday sporting 
director Matt Hobbs 
said Lopetegui was 
“committed, he loves the 
area and the club”.
	 The former Spain and 
Real Madrid coach, 56, 
had previously said it 
would be “difficult to 
compete” in the top flight 
without investment 
and mentioned Wolves’ 
Financial Fair Play 

England midfielder 
Jude Bellingham said he 
had “goosebumps” and 
his “heart was close to 
stopping” when he was 
told Real Madrid wanted 
to sign him.
	 Bellingham, 19, has 
joined the Spanish club 
from Borussia Dortmund 
for an initial 103m euros 
(£88.5m).
The fee could reach 
133.9m euros (£115m) 
with add-ons.
	 “I’d always been 
aware of the interest 
from England so that 
was pretty normal,” 
said Bellingham at his 
presentation as a Real 
Madrid player.
	 “It was a bit of a surprise 
when my dad sat me 
down and said: ‘You’ve 
had a bit of interest from 
Real Madrid.’
	 “I think that was maybe 
about 12-15 months ago. 
When he said that I had 
goosebumps, my heart 
was close to stopping. 
It’s something you don’t 
expect growing up - 

being able to play for a 
team like this.”
	 Dortmund made 
Bellingham the most 
expensive 17-year-old in 
football when they signed 
him from Birmingham 
City for £25m in 2020 
and he enhanced his 
reputation with his 
performances for the 
German club.
	 He became Dortmund’s 
youngest captain at 19 
and was named the 
Bundesliga’s player of 
the season for the last 
campaign.
	 Bellingham had been 
linked with Liverpool, 
Manchester City and 
Manchester United 
before choosing to move 
to Real Madrid.
	 Tottenham  have 
submitted a joint £50m 
bid to  Leicester City  for 
England midfielder 
James Maddison, 26, 
and 25-year-old England 
forward Harvey Barnes, 
says the Daily Mail.
	 Meanwhile Manchester 
United,  Manchester 

City  and  Chelsea  could 
all enter the bidding 
war for  West Ham’s 
24-year-old England 
midfielder Declan Rice 
after  Arsenal’s initial 
£90m bid was turned 
down.
	 Arsenal  are continuing 
to prioritise a deal for Rice 
and have therefore pulled 
out of the race to sign 
21-year-old Brighton and 
Ecuador midfielder 
Moises Caicedo.
 Caicedo has decided to 
join  Chelsea, with the 
final negotiations now 
taking place.
 Chelsea  and Germany 
forward Kai Havertz, 
24, has agreed personal 
terms with Arsenal, who 
are yet to finalise a deal 
with the Blues.
 Chelsea face competition 
from  Manchester 
United  for the signing 
of Inter Milan’s Cameroon 
goalkeeper Andre Onana, 
27, although United have 
also shortlisted  Porto’s 
Portugal keeper Diogo 
Costa, 23.

“problems”.
	 However, Hobbs 
says he “never saw 
a situation” where 
Lopetegui, who won 
nine of his 23 league 
games after replacing 
Bruno Lage, was not in 
charge next season.
	 “There’s been a lot of 
chat about the club on 
the back of Julen’s press 
conferences before the 
season finished,” the 
sporting director said.

	 “What’s important is 
we’ve been in constant 
contact throughout. I 
was never in any doubt 
that he would remain at 
Wolves, but we have to 
acknowledge the project 
is different to what he 
thought it was.
	 “We had to allow him 
time to understand it 
and get his head around 
how to build a squad 
to be competitive in the 
Premier League.”

Our coach stays, insist Wolves

FUTURE UNCERTAIN: Julen Lopetegui

Bellingham: Real interest 
gave me ‘goosebumps’

of 36 in a Test. Their 
potential replacements, 
Marcus Harris and Matt 
Renshaw, who was born 
in Middlesbrough, both 
have Test averages under 
30.
	 And the Aussies have 
not clinched a first series 
win on English soil since 
2001, and the hosts’ 

Ashes:
cont. from back page

recent transformation 
under captain Ben Stokes, 
winning 11 of 13 Tests in 
the past 12 months, leaves 
them quietly confident.
	 Not only can they rely 
on the mighty hitting 
of Jonny Bairstow and 
Stokes, they still have 
the cagey and obdurate 
Joe Root in their ranks, 
plius old-timers James 
Anderson and Stuart 
Broad in attack. The latter 
two may be veterans but 
they are re-energised 

for what could be one 
last crack at the Aussies. 
And relative newcomers 
such as Ollie Pope and 
Ollie Robinson, whose 
first Ashes experience 18 
months ago ended in a 4-0 
steamrolling, have gained 
in stature and confidence 
in the intervening years, 
while debutants Ben 
Duckett and Harry Brook 
have been in fearsome 
Test form. 
	 All in all, it promises to 
be a fascinating summer.

Ederson  has revealed 
that Ruben Dias threw 
up in the handbag of Jack 
Grealish’s mum, Karen, 
during Manchester City’s 
Treble celebrations.
	 City’s players had 
four days to essentially 
run riot after winning 
the Champions League 
last Saturday, partying 
in Turkey and Ibiza 
before continuing the 
celebrations in England.
	 Several players didn’t 
shy away from drinking 
throughout the four 
days, with forward Jack 
Grealish the centre of 
attention after he arrived 
back in England having 
to be held up by  Kyle 
Walker.

It was booze galore for 
the City players, though, 
according to goalkeeper 
Ederson, some of the stars 
couldn’t hold their drink.
	 He told TNT Sports that 
several of his team-mates 
don’t usually drink, but 
put that to one side to 
toast their club’s Treble 
win.
	 But it was back to 
business quickly for 
City’s England stars, who 

joined up with Gareth 
Southgate’s squad ahead 
of Friday’s Euro 2024 
qualifier against Malta.
	 Grealish and Walker, 
plus Phil Foden, Kyle 
John Stones and Kalvin 
Phillips joined the 
squad on Tuesday and 
Southgate said all five 
are fit to play in Friday’s 
game but he is “yet to 
decide if that’s a good 
decision”.

JACK THE LAD: Grealish was at the center of Manchester City’s celebrations

CAN’T HOLD HIS DRINK: least that’s what 
Ederson says about teammate Ruben Dias...

EDERSON: 
Ruben Dias 
“threw up in  

Mrs.
Grealish’s 
handbag”
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RESTAURANT:
116 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 451-1402
Happy Hour Mon-Fri. 4-7

(food specials)
SHOPPE: 

132 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 394-8765
Open 10am-6pm 

Thurs/Fri/Sun: 10am-7pm 
Sat: 10am-8pm

COFFEE SHOPPE Open Daily 10am-4pm
Restaurant Open Mon-Thurs 10.30am • Fri-Sun at 10am (earlier for soccer games)

www.yeoldekingshead.com

6/16 Fri Euro 2024 Qualifying 
11.45am Malta vs England 
11.45am Greece vs Ireland 

 
6/17 Sat   

11.45am Portugal vs Bosnia & Herzegovina 
11.45am Faroe Islands vs Czech Republic 

 
MLS 

5.30pm Sporting KC vs LAFC
 

6/18 Sun Uefa Nations League Final 
1145am Croatia s Spain  

 
Concacaf Nations League  

3pm 3rd Place Playoff 
6pm Final 

6/19 Mon Euro 2024 Qualifying 
11.45am England vs North Macedonia 

11.45am Ireland vs Gibraltar 
11.45am Turkey vs Wales 

 
6/20 Tue Euro 2024 Qualifying 
11.45am Scotland vs Georgia 
11.45am Iceland vs Portugal 

(ask for more available games)
 

Concacaf Gold Cup Qualification 
1.30pm W1 vs W6 

4pm W2 vs W5 
6.20pm W3 vs  W4 

6/21 Wed. Major League Soccer 
7.30pm LA Galaxy vs Sporting KC 
7.30pm LAFC vs Seattle Sounders

FRIDAY at Edgbaston 
saw the latest chapter in 
sport’s greatest love story 
begin to unfold.
	 England host Australia 
in the First Test of the 
summer’s Ashes series, 
continuing a saga which 
began 140 years ago. 
And whether it is Ben 
Stokes or Pat Cummins 
getting their hands on the 
Ashes urn at The Oval at 
the end of July, they will 
be holding a (replica) 
romantic gift.
	 The concept of the 
Ashes was formed by 
a mock obituary in an 
English newspaper in 
the summer of 1882, but 
it was only the following 
winter in Australia that 
a real prize came into 
existence.
	 Australian Florence 
Morphy gave the small 
terracotta urn to England 
captain Ivo Bligh as a 
trophy and symbol of 
her love. The pair would 
eventually be married, 
while the two rival teams 
had something tangible to 

compete for.
	 Over the intervening 
140 years, England and 
Australia have become 
the best of enemies. 
Three Lions and Baggy 
Greens coming together 
at regular intervals to 
measure their cricketing 
excellence and celebrate 
everything we like and 
dislike about each other.
	 The visitors are 
favorites due both to 
their recent dominance 
in this contest, and their 
current form, which saw 
them dispatch India at 
the Oval at the weekend 
with a 209- run victory 
to clinch the World Test 
title for the first time. 
The Test Championship 
is contested over a two-
year cycle, during which 
Australia topped the 
league stage, before 
controlling this week’s 
final from the outset.
	 Australia captain 
Pat Cummins has told 
reporters winning the 
Ashes would be “legacy-
defining”.

	  “Whether we like it or 
not, Ashes tend to define 
eras and teams,” said 
Cummins, 30.
	 “We’ve played 
awesome cricket for the 
last two years and being 
there at the end holding 
the trophy feels really 
well deserved.
	 “That’s great for our 
team and Ashes are hard 
to win,
	 “It’s not going to be 
easy but if we were to win 
it, that is legacy-defining 
stuff.”
	 They possess the 
world’s number one 
Test batter in Marnus 
Labuschagne and, in 
Steve Smith, a player 
who could well end his 
career as the most prolific 
Ashes run-scorer since 
Don Bradman. But since 
the beginning of the last 
Ashes, teammate Usman 
Khawaja has averaged 
more than both of them.
	 But on the other side 
of the ledger, both big 
hitting David Warner and 
Khawaja have poor recent 

West Ham have rejected 
Arsenal’s first bid for 
England midfielder 
Declan Rice.
	 Gunners boss Mikel 
Arteta has made Rice 
one of his main transfer 
targets, with suggestions 
that a deal was close.
	 However, it is 
understood the initial 
offer for the 24-year-old 
has left the Hammers 
unimpressed as it contains 
a number of clauses.
	 Sources at West 
Ham do expect further 
communication from 
Arsenal, although they 
are also anticipating an 
offer from Manchester 
City.
	 City are refusing to 
comment on potential 
interest in Rice.
	 There is uncertainty 
over the futures of City 
captain Ilkay Gundogan 
and team-mate Bernardo 
Silva, which could force 

The Ashes start to glow once more
n England and Australia face off at Edgbaston; hosts hoping “Bazball” will regain the coveted urn 

records in the UK. In 2019, 
Warner averaged just 9.50 
as Stuart Broad put him in 
a hutch and kept him as a 

bunny. Khawaja averages 
less than 18 in the seven 
Tests he has played on 
English grass.

	 And not since 1926 
have Australia fielded 
two openers aged north 

Rice will cost more, Gunners told

KEY MAN: Declan Rice helped West Ham lift the 
Europa Conference trophy last week

the club’s manager, 
Pep Guardiola, into the 
transfer market.
	 West Ham chairman 
David Sullivan  has said 
he is “99%” sure  that 
Rice, who captained the 
Hammers to victory in 
the Europa Conference 
League earlier this month, 
will leave the club this 
summer.
	 Rice has played 245 
games and scored 15 
goals for West Ham, 
having made his debut 

in the 2016-17 season 
after coming through the 
academy.
	 He has been capped 
41 times by England, 
playing in all five of their 
matches at last winter’s 
World Cup.
	 Rice has one year left on 
his contract, although the 
Hammers have the option 
to extend that until the 
summer of 2025, leaving 
them in a strong position 
to negotiate a substantial 
transfer fee.

QUIETLY CONFIDENT? England skipper Ben Stokes

cont. on page 19, col. 1
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