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Sir Keir Starmer has unveiled La-
bour’s election manifesto, promising 
to “rebuild Britain” by boosting eco-
nomic growth.

 “Scotboberfest” hits Munich - page 10

“We promise to 
rebuild Britain”

Labour manifesto vows to “turn the page decisively”on 14 years of Tory government

	 The Labour leader said 
the document - titled 
Change - would “turn 
the page decisively” on 
14 years of Conservative 
government.
	 The running theme is 
a bid to boost wealth cre-
ation through streamlin-
ing planning rules and 
increasing business invest-
ment.
	 Thursday’s unveiling 
did not contain new poli-
cies beyond those already 
announced, and Sir Keir 
sought to make a virtue 
of the lack of policy fire-
works, saying he was run-
ning “to be prime minister, 
not a candidate to run the 
circus”.
	 The Labour leader used 
the launch event in Man-
chester to showcase al-

ready-announced policies 
he hopes will tempt voters 
to return his party to pow-
er.
	 These include setting 
up a new state-owned en-
ergy investment and gen-
eration company, hiring 
more police officers and 
renationalizing nearly all 
passenger rail.
	 Sir Keir sought to draw 
a contrast with Labour’s 
last election manifesto in 
2019, which contained 
policies such as giving 
workers a 10% stake in all 
large companies and free 
full-fibre broadband for 
all.
	 After his speech was 
briefly interrupted by 
heckling from a climate 
protester, he said: “We 
gave up on being a party 

of protest five years ago.
	 “The defining purpose 
of my Labour leadership 
has been to drag my party 
away from the dead end of 
gesture politics,” he add-
ed.
	 “We don’t have a mag-
ic wand. But what we do 
have, what this manifesto 
represents, is a credible 

long-term plan.”
	 Policies included in the 
manifesto include:
	 • introducing free 
breakfast clubs in all pri-
mary schools in England
	 •  £1.6bn to fund more 
appointments in NHS hos-
pitals, new CT scanners 
and extra dentist appoint-
ments

	 • recruiting 8,500 men-
tal health staff in England
	 Its proposed tax rises in-
clude introducing VAT on 
private school fees, a 1% 
stamp duty surcharge on 
foreigners buying prop-
erty, and hiking taxes on 
bonuses for managers at 
hedge funds and private 
equity firms.

	 It also says it would 
raise extra revenue by clos-
ing “loopholes” in the gov-
ernment’s existing plans to 
tax non-domiciled taxpay-
ers and oil and gas firms.
	 It says extra government 
borrowing would be limit-
ed to £3.5bn a year to fund 
its plan to invest in green 
energy projects.

Sir Keir Starmer: “running to be prime minister, not a candidate to run the circus”.
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News from Britain

cont. on page 3, col. 1

Nigel Farage has been 
offered bodyguards by 
the Home Office amid 
rising violence towards 
the Reform UK leader 
on the campaign trail.
	 Officials are under-
stood to be offering at-
risk candidates private 
security teams for cam-
paign events in the run-

A REFORM UK Party 
candidate has sparked 
fury with remarks that 
Britain would have 
been better off had it 
not fought Nazi Germa-
ny.
	 The comments by Ian 
Gribbin were made in 
2022 in which he said 
the UK would have 
been “far better” if we 
had taken up Hitler’s of-
fer of neutrality. He also 
described women as the 
“sponging gender” who 
should be “deprived of 
healthcare”.
	 Posted to the web-
site UnHerd, Mr Grib-
bin, who is standing 
in Bexhill and Battle in 
East Sussex, added that 
Winston Churchill was 
“abysmal” and praised 
Russia’s Vladimir Putin.
	 Tory veterans minister 
Johnny Mercer said the 
“shameful” comments 
showed “a shocking 
lack of judgment”. He 
added: “Misusing ap-
peasement to justify 
Nazi apologism is dis-
graceful. Comments like 
this are deeply troubling 
coming from a political 
party.”

‘out of context’
	 Mr Gribbin apologised 
“unreservedly” and said 
the quotes were taken 
out of context, adding he 
found it upsetting as his 
mother was the daughter 
of Russian Jews fleeing 
persecution.
	 The row derailed Ni-
gel Farage’s party’s tax 
plan, which pledged they 
would raise the income 
tax threshold to £20,000, 
taking millions out of 
paying tax altogether 
with savings of up to 
£1,500 per year.
In a complex explanation 
for how the party would 
afford the cut, chairman 
Richard Tice said it would 
be paid for by reorgan-
ising Bank of England 
quantitative easing debt 
into 75-year bonds.

Rishi Sunak has fired up 
the election by promis-
ing to slash legal migra-
tion in half with a Tory 
plan emerging to deport 
as many as 100,000 illegal 
immigrants.
	 Unveiling his mani-
festo, the Prime Minister 
shifted firmly on to the 
front foot by vowing de-
portation flights to Rwan-
da will take off within 
days if the Conservatives 
are returned to office.
	 Tory sources revealed 
the manifesto plans 
meant as many as 100,000 
illegal migrants could 
be sent to Rwanda and a 
series of other countries 
considered for deporta-
tions in “an uncapped 
scheme”. 
	 The PM  said the To-
ries would halve legal 
migration then cut num-
bers “every single year” 
– and he attacked Sir Keir 
Starmer’s Labour for not 
having a plan to thwart 
illegal migration.
	 With the Tories mak-
ing little or no headway 
against Labour’s huge 
lead in the opinion polls, 
many political observ-
ers saw the speech as a 
desperate gambit by the 
Prime Minister to regain 
the initiative.
	 But it showed little 
sign of making an im-
pact this week, with a 
new poll suggesting the 

Conservatives have now 
been overtaken by Nigel 
Farage’s reform party
	 A YouGov poll showed 
that support for Reform 
UK had jumped up to 
19%, up from 17% previ-
ously, and the Conserva-
tive Party unchanged on 
18%. Labour looks to be 
holding an unassailable 
lead with 37%.
	 More than 125,000 mi-
grants have arrived in 
Britain on small boats 
since 2018 and most are 
still in the country.
	 The Conservative party 
suggested up to 100,000 
people who have crossed 
the Channel illegally 
will be deported to oth-
er countries under their 
plans.
	 A spokesman said the 
deal with Rwanda is 
“uncapped” but some ar-
rivals will be returned to 
their own country.
	 Around 10,000 Alba-
nians have already been 
sent back under an agree-
ment struck with the Bal-
kan nation.
	 The Government has 
been in talks with other 
countries, such as Viet-
nam, to replicate the deal 
with Rwanda’s leader-
ship in Kigali.
	 A Tory spokesman 
said a pact with the East 
African nation is “an un-
capped scheme – this is 
the whole point”. 

	 Efforts to broker simi-
lar deals would continue 
under the Conservatives, 
he added.	
	 In an attempt to rev up 
his party’s election cam-
paign, Mr Sunak laid out 
his blueprint for the UK 
in a speech at Silverstone 
race track.
	 He announced £17bil-
lion of tax cuts to help 
workers, pensioners and 
parents over the next five 
years.
	 Promising to fight to 
the end for every vote, 
the PM claimed Labour 
planned to pick the pub-
lic’s pockets while failing 
to tackle migration.
	 Mr Sunak said: “Keir 
Starmer simply can’t tell 
you what he would do 
with people who come 
here illegally because 
he doesn’t believe it’s a 
problem. With Brexit we 
took control of our bor-

ders, but migration has 
been too high in recent 
years and we have a clear 
plan to reduce it. We an-
nounced changes which 
mean 300,000 people who 
were previously eligible 
to come here now can’t, 
and we will introduce a 
migration cap that means 
Parliament…will vote on 
how many people should 
be able to come here ev-

ery year.
	 “Our plan is this: we 
will halve migration as 
we have halved inflation, 
and then reduce it every 
single year.”
	 Net migration – the 
difference between the 
totals of people arriving 
and those leaving – hit a 
record high of 764,000 in 
2022, said the Office for 
National Statistics.

up to the General Elec-
tion.
	 This includes door staff 
and teams of up to four 
people for canvassing 
and public meetings.
	 Police chiefs fear the 
level of hatred directed 
towards politicians could 
lead to another attack.
	 The Home Office is un-
derstood to have contact-
ed Mr Farage about “ad-
ditional private security” 
after he was targeted at 
two campaign events 
within days of each other.
	 However, sources said 
there would not be “ded-
icated police support” for 
Mr Farage.
	 On Tuesday he was 
narrowly missed by ob-
jects thrown as he stood 
on the open top deck of 
his campaign bus at a 
rally in Barnsley, South 
Yorks. Yesterday Josh 
Greally, 28, was charged 
with using threatening, 
abusive, insulting words 
and behaviour with in-
tent to cause fear or pro-
voke unlawful violence.

	 It came after Victoria 
Thomas Bowen, 25, was 
charged with assault by 
beating and criminal 
damage when a milk-
shake was thrown over 
Mr Farage as he left 
the Moon and Starfish 
Wetherspoons pub in 
Clacton-on-Sea in Essex 
on Tuesday last week. 
She is due before Col-
chester magistrates next 
month.
	 Mr Farage warned that 
physical attacks are the 
next stage of a “cancel 
culture” intent on silenc-
ing him.
	 He told reporters he is 
having to “think twice 
about what I do” amid 
the rise in attacks.
	 However, he added de-
fiantly: “I’m not going to 
stop.”z
	 Conservative candi-
date Mark Jenkinson 
called the violence “an 
attack on democracy” 
and said he too has faced 
threats.
	 He said: “I’ve had 

I’ll kick 100,000 out, vows Rishi
n Trailing by double digits in the polls, PM promises radical new immigration policy

Reform 
candidate 
said ‘Hitler 
offer better 
than war’

Sunak: vowing to halve migration

Farage offered bodyguards amid rising 
violence towards Reform UK leader
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ONE OF the BBC’s most 
respected and influential 
presenters, Dr.  Michael 
Mosley, was found dead 
this week on the Greek 
island of Symi after go-
ing missing after tak-
ing a strenuous walk in 
scorching temperatures.
	  His body was found 
several days later near 
Agia Marina beach, just 
a few yards from a popu-
lar beachside bar. It is be-
lieved he died of natural 
causes.
	 Mosley, one of the best-
known presenters on 

British TV and radio, was 
a fixture on the airwaves 
for almost two decades, 
known for his engag-
ing and likeable style in 
shows that delved into 
diet, exercise and medi-
cine.
	 In 2019, the Telegraph 
described him as “argu-
ably the closest thing 
Britain has to a national 
treasure in the field of 
medical science”.
	 His series included 
Trust Me I’m a Doctor, 
The Truth about Exer-
cise and Lose a Stone in 

21 Days, and he became 
famous for testing out 
regimes and theories on 
himself – from inject-
ing snake venom into 
his own blood to eating 
tapeworms to see what 
impact they had on the 
body.
	 Millions more knew 
him for giving advice 
on BBC One’s The One 
Show and ITV’s This 
Morning.
	 The 67-year-old father-
of-four was reported 
missing after he set off for 
a walk from Agios Niko-

death threats, I’ve had 
acid attack threats, I’ve 
been accosted in my local 
shop while my wife and 
children were outside, 
and my activists have 
been threatened. You 
choose your representa-
tive, not activist groups 
too cowardly to stand for 
election.”
	 Brendan Clarke-Smith, 
who is also standing for 
the Conservatives, add-
ed: “Many of us have ex-
perienced similar. When 
people attack candidates 
– of any party – then it is 

laos beach - near where 
he was staying on the 
northeast side of the is-
land - at about 13:30 local 
time on Wednesday.

diet guru
	 His wife, Dr Clare Bai-
ley Mosley, raised the 
alarm when her husband 
did not return. Several 
days later TV crews re-
viewing helicopter foot-
age taken near the Agia 
Marina beach bar saw 
what looked like a body. 
CCTV footage from the 
area appeared to show 
Dr Mosley disappear 
from view as he slowly 
made his way down a 
hillside close to where 
his body was later found. 
He then collapses out of 
view behind a wall.
	 Dr Mosley was not a 
complete stranger to the 
island, having visited it 
eight years ago. The diet 
guru intended to hike 
under three miles back to 
the three-bedroom Mer-
chant House apartment 
in Symi Town, where 
they were staying – and 
in which, crucially, he 
had left his phone. Set-
ting off with a small bot-
tle of water and an um-
brella to shield himself 
from the sun, Dr Mosley 
negotiated a steep rocky 
track from the beach, ar-
riving back in the village 
of Pedi in just 20 minutes.
	 But there, he made 
a fatal error. Instead of 
turning left on the main 
road back to town, which 
would have brought him 
home in 30 minutes, he 
turned right and headed 
up a mountain track.
	 For the next hour and 
three-quarters he toiled 

TAKING COVER: Nigel Farage dodges a missile in Barnsley this week

an attack on all of us”.
	 Police sources admit 
it is “very difficult” to 
know whether bystand-
ers are planning to launch 
objects at politicians.
	 Officers rely on intel-
ligence to protect can-
didates, but “random” 
attacks pose the biggest 
problem to police as it is 
hard to know what the 
motivation is of those 
crowding around candi-
dates at public campaign 
events.
	 It is hoped a signifi-
cant police presence and 
swift arrests will deter 
attempted attacks on 
politicians.
Gavin Stephens, chair-

man of the National Po-
lice Chiefs Council, said 
it was crucial that the 
election campaign was 
“peaceful and well run”.
	 He told reporters at 
a briefing yesterday: 
“What I am clear on 
is policing has a very 
strong role to play in 
our primary mission 
of keeping the King’s 
peace.
	 “Throughout this 
campaign activity, it’s 
really important that it’s 
a peaceful and well-run 
campaign [so] democra-
cy can function well.
	 “We recognise that po-
licing has a strong role to 
play in that.”

Farage:
cont. from page 2

Much-loved BBC presenter 
perishes on Greek island

n Dr. Michael Mosley collapsed after a strenuous walk in searing heat

Dr. Mosley had a gift for making complex subjects accessible to his viewers

up steep rock-strewn 
paths, believing Symi 
Town was on the other 
side of the ridge in front 
of him. However, he 
was heading almost di-
rectly away from Symi, 
towards Agia Marina, 
which he reached after 
scrambling down a steep 
track.
	 As Dr Mosley reached 
a perimeter fence at the 
resort, the exhausting 
hike and blistering heat 
took their toll and he col-
lapsed.
	 Restaurant staff at Agia 
Marina said they failed 
to hear any cry for help 
or to spot Dr Mosley’s 
collapsed body.
	 He was found dead 
by a restaurant manager 
at the resort at around 
10.30am on Sunday.

easy life hacks
	 Dr Mosley was also 
famous for popularizing 
the 5:2 and the Fast 800 

diets, which advocate for 
intermittent fasting and 
low-carbohydrate meals.
	 Meanwhile, the sim-
ple, accessible health tips 
in his BBC Radio 4 series 
Just One Thing attract-
ed 25 million listeners 
around the world, with 
a TV version announced 
earlier this year.
	 Mosley launched Just 
One Thing in 2021, with 
each episode focusing on 
a single idea for listeners 
to improve their health 
and lifestyle.
	 He presented more 
than 100 episodes, ex-
ploring easy life hacks 
ranging from taking an 
early-morning walk and 
meditating to skipping 
and eating chocolate.
	 Mosley was born in 
India and brought up on 
the Philipppines before 
moving to the UK, where 
he studied PPE (philoso-
phy, politics and econom-
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Two 12-year-old boys 
have became the young-
est people to be convict-
ed of murder in Britain 
since the killing of James 
Bulger.
	 The pair, who cannot be 
named, were found guilty 
of murdering stranger 
Shawn Seesahai, 19, who 
was stabbed in the back 
through to his heart with 
a 16in machete blade.
	 At the time, last No-
vember, his killers were 
just months older than 
Robert Thompson and 
Jon Venables who were 
11 when they were found 
guilty of torturing and 
killing two-year-old 
James in 1993 on Mersey-
side.
	 Shawn’s devastated 
family cried and hugged 
in the gallery at Notting-
ham Crown Court after 
jurors on Monday found 
the knife-obsessed pair 
guilty.
	 His father Suresh and 
mother Manashwary said 
that they would never 

be able to get over their 
loss – and questioned 
how such young children 
could stalk the streets un-
checked with a deadly 
weapon.
	 Suresh said: “This 
world is a different world. 
Kids are dangerous now. 
If we don’t pay attention 
to them this will keep 
happening.”
	 Manashwary re-
marked: “Twelve-year-
old kids should be at 
home doing schoolwork 
and then going to bed.”

“I don’t care”
	 The couple, who also 
have a teenage daugh-
ter, told how Shawn’s 
friend called them to say 
that their son had been 
stabbed to death.
	 The court heard Shawn 
was initially shoul-
der-barged by the small-
er of the two boys who it 
was said “often” carried a 
machete.
	 He was then punched, 
kicked, stamped on and 

“chopped” at with the 
machete.
	 Shawn’s friend said 
that they both ran for 
their lives but Shawn 
then stumbled as he tried 
to sprint across Stowlawn 
playing fields within 
Wolverhampton’s East 
Park.
	 He was declared dead 
at the scene by emergency 
crews at 9.11pm. 
	 The boys, who were 
arrested a day later, had 
refused to answer police 
questions but both gave 
evidence to jurors, blam-
ing each other for inflict-
ing the fatal blow before 
leaving Shawn to die. The 
court was told the killers 
played video games after 
the November 13 attack 
with one cleaning the 
machete in bleach before 
stashing it under his bed.
	 Next day he bragged 
online “I don’t care” after 
being told that his victim 
Shawn had died.
	 Hours before the mur-
der, one boy wore a mask 

as he posed for a picture 
while brandishing the 
machete, which police 
believe had been bought 
online.
	 The trial was told that a 
teenage girl who had been 
with the 12-year-olds told 
police that both of them 
had been in possession of 
the machete, with one fre-
quently carrying it.
	 She described seeing 
one boy pick up the ma-
chete and hold it in the 
air before Shawn then 
collapsed and fell to the 
ground.

surgery
	 Shawn was from An-
guilla but was staying in 
Birmingham while recov-
ering from cataract sur-
gery that was not avail-
able on the Caribbean 
island. 
	 He had travelled to 
the UK with his friend 
Deron Harrigan and set-
tled in Handsworth.
	 Jurors heard the pair 
had gone to Wolver-

THE grieving moth-
er of Harry Dunn says 
she is “unspeakably 
hurt” that the US spy 
who killed her teenage 
motorcyclist son has 
refused to give live evi-
dence to his inquest.
	 Senior coroner Anne 
Pember issued a request 
to Anne Sacoolas last 
year, inviting her to at-
tend the hearing remote-
ly – but its first day was 
told this week that the 
offer “has not been taken 
up” by the American.
	 Harry’s heartbro-
ken mother Charlotte 
Charles labelled Sacoo-
las’s no-show decision 
as both “incomprehensi-
ble” and “disrespectful”.
	 Instead Sacoolas’s 
written evidence was 
read to the inquest 
in Sessions House, 

Northampton, in the 
form of a “significant 
statement”, alongside 
segments from her po-
lice interview and a wit-
ness statement written 
last December.
	 Sacoolas’s lawyer Ben 
Cooper KC said she had 
previously given a “full 
account” to police and 
taken “full responsibility 
for her actions”.

‘so stupid’
	 He said she had “pro-
vided everything she 
could to help this in-
quest” and offered to 
“answer any further 
questions”.
	 Sacoolas was driving 
a Volvo on the wrong 
side of the road outside 
US communications 
base RAF Croughton in 
Northamptonshire on 

August 27 2019 moments 
before she crashed into 
Harry, 19, causing him 
catastrophic injuries.
	 PC Al Knapper, who 
attended the scene, said 
Sacoolas was seen with 
her head in her hands 
and crying, after telling 
police: “I was so stupid.” 
Ms Charles told the hear-
ing yesterday: “I wanted 
to say that learning that 
Anne Sacoolas will not 
be attending Harry’s in-
quest this week was bit-
terly disappointing and, 
as a mother, is utterly 
incomprehensible to me.

‘disrespectful’
	 “She could have cho-
sen to give me and our 
family this opportunity 
to finally understand 
what led to Harry’s 
death that night. But no.

hampton that November 
evening with a third man 
Jamal Clarke, because Mr 
Clarke wanted to visit his 
girlfriend in the city.
	 Suresh told Sky News 
that the teenager “was 
always with me, from 
the time he was born and 
growing up.
	 “When he’d have been 
around 16 he started to 
work with me.
	 “Whatsoever he knew 
that I’d need help with 

he’d always be there.”
	 Manashwary added: 
“He’s always there for us 
– a very protective child.
	 “He helped his father 
[at work] with all the 
tools, he helped me[at] 
home with the chores, he 
loved to do that.”
	 Judge Mrs Justice Tip-
ples called it a “tragic 
and distressing case” 
and said she will pass 
sentence on the boys next 
month.

	 “I am unspeakably 
hurt that she has cho-
sen to hide instead and 
it cannot help but feel 
disrespectful to Harry, 
the life he had and the 
future he lost.”
	 Briony Ballard, the 
counsel to the inquest, 
remarked that the coro-
ner could not “force or 
compel an individual to 

attend”.
	 After the crash the US 
State Department assert-
ed diplomatic immunity 
on behalf of intelligence 
agency employee Sacoo-
las, 46, and she left the 
UK 19 days later.
	 But following a pro-
tracted campaign in 
both Britain and the 
US by Harry’s family 

she faced a High Court 
judge at the Old Bailey 
via video-link in Decem-
ber 2022.
	 She had pleaded guilty 
to causing death by care-
less driving and Mrs 
Justice Cheema-Grubb 
handed Sacoolas an 
eight-month prison sen-
tence, suspended for 12 
months.

Britain sees youngest boys convicted 
of murder since the killing of James Bulger
n Machete-wielding pair killed Anguillan teen in Wolverhampton Park

Shawn Seesahai died in an unprovoked attack

Harry Dunn mum “unspeakably hurt” as 
son’s killer stays away from inquest

Anne Sacoolas (left) drove into Harry’s Dunn’s motorcycle in August 2019
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PAEDOPHILE pop 
star Gary Glitter has 
been ordered to pay 
a woman he abused 
when she was 12 more 
than £500,000in dam-
ages.
	 Glitter, 80, whose 
real name is Paul 
Gadd, was hit with the 
compensation order 
on Wednesday after 
his victim sued him in 
London’s High Court.
	 It could now spark 
fresh claims from oth-
er victims of the glam 
rock star.
	 Glitter was jailed for 
16 years in 2015 for 
abusing the girl and 
two other children be-
tween 1975 and 1980.
	 The singer still 
boasts a £6million for-
tune from hits includ-
ing I’m The Leader Of 
The Gang – and has 
nearly 700,000 month-
ly listeners on Spotify.

champagne
	 Glitter was 33 when 
he met the 12-year-old 
at a concert in Birming-
ham in 1977, his 2015 
trial heard.
He invited her and her 
mother to his hotel the 
following night, where 
he plied them with 
champagne before rap-
ing the schoolgirl.
	 The trial heard she 
was invited back to 

Glitter’s London home 
where she was again 
raped and sexual as-
saulted.
	 The High Court hear-
ing was told the victim 
had been “humiliated 
and coercively con-
trolled” by Glitter.
	 Mrs Justice Tipples 
said the £508,800 dam-
ages included £381,000 
in lost earnings and 
£7,800 for future thera-
py and treatment, plus 
£84,000 interest.
	 She added: “The 
claimant did not tell 
anyone in her family 
what happened to her 
as she was worried 
that she would bring 
shame on them all and 
she thought her family 
would not love her any 
more if they knew.”

child abuse
	 The woman’s barris-
ter, Jonathan Metzer, 

said Glitter’s abuse 
had a “dramatic and 
terrible impact” on his 
victim.
	 Glitter was freed au-
tomatically from The 
Verne prison in Dorset 
last year after serving 
half of his 2015 fixed-
term determinate sen-
tence.
	 But he was back be-

hind bars under six 
weeks later for breach-
ing licence conditions 
by trying to access the 
dark web and view im-
ages of children.
	 After losing a parole 
hearing last month, he 
was said to have told 
fellow inmates he be-
lieves he will die before 
his release date of 2031.

	 In 1999, Glitter was 
jailed for possessing 
thousands of child 
abuse images.
	 He was expelled 
from Cambodia in 2002 
amid sex crime allega-
tions and later spent 
two-and-a-half years in 
jail for sexually abus-
ing two girls aged 10 
and 11 in Vietnam.

ics) at Oxford University, 
He briefly worked as 
an investment banker, 
but became bored with 
finance after two years 
in the job. He retrained 
as a doctor at the Royal 
Free Hospital in London, 
aiming to become a psy-
chiatrist. But rather than 
using his skills in a medi-
cal capacity, he joined the 
BBC as an assistant pro-
ducer in 1985.
	 He worked his way 
through the ranks, be-
coming producer of sci-
ence shows like Tomor-
row’s World, QED and 
Horizon.
	 Other behind-the-
scenes credits include 
The Human Face, which 
was presented by John 
Cleese and featured 
Elizabeth Hurley, Pierce 
Brosnan and Sir Da-
vid Attenborough, and 
was recognised with an 
Emmy nomination in 
2002.
	 Mosley received Bafta 
nominations for his work 
as executive producer on 
Leonardo, which starred 
Sir Mark Rylance as the 
painter, and Pompeii - 
The Last Day, both in 
2003.
	 Greek police spokes-
woman Konstantia Di-
moglidou said the initial 
examination confirmed 
there were no injuries on 
his body.
	 She said the position 
of his body indicated he 
died of natural causes.

Mosley:
cont. from page 3

Gary Glitter ordered to pay half a million in damages
n Disgraced former pop star victimized 12 year old fan and others over five year period

Glitter (real name Paul Gadd), does not expect to live to see his expected release in 2031
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ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd
Norwalk CA 90650

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Danyelle Renay Clark-Guti-

errez, an adult over the age of 18 
years.

​Date: 07/22/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. C Room 312

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Danyelle Renay Clark-Gutierrez. 
And a petition for change of names 

having been duly filed with the 
clerk of this Court, and it appearing 

from said petition that said peti-
tioner(s) desire to have their name 

changed from Danyelle Renay 
Clark-Gutierrez to Danyelle 

Renay Gutierrez

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 21, 2024.
Olivia Rosales
Judge of the Superior Court
24NWCP00203
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Ave
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition of Cara 
Nicole Craig, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 06/28/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. P 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Cara 
Nicole Craig. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Cara Nicole Craig to Kara Nicole 
Soligray

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 

be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 13, 2024
David K. Reinert
Judge of the Superior Court
24TRCP00193
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Ave
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Samuel Vernon Weiss, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 06/28/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. P 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Samuel 
Vernon Weiss. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Samuel Vernon Weiss to Samuel 
Vernon Weisse

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 13, 2024
David K. Reinert
Judge of the Superior Court
24TRCP00194
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024078884. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
MARAF, 10032 Commerce Ave. Unit 
#2, Tujunga CA 91042. County: Los 
Angeles. Maria Khublaryan, 10032 
Commerce Ave. Unit #2, Tujunga CA 
91042. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Maria Khublaryan, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
04/11/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 

of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024092747. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Prime Selection Management, 453 S 
Spring St Ste 400, Los Angeles CA 
90013. County: Los Angeles. Aliyah 
Oyemade, 453 S Spring St Ste 400, 
Los Angeles CA 90013. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Aliyah Oyemade, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 04/30/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024093888. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Unity Visitation Services, 4821 Lank-
ershim Blvd Ste F, North Hollywood 
CA 91601. County: Los Angeles. Jo-
anna Marcos Mariano, 4821 Lanker-
shim Blvd Ste F, North Hollywood CA 
91601. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 01/2024. 
Signed: Joanna Marcos Mariano, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 05/01/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024093924. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Crave Cafe-West Hills, 22950 
Vanowen St, West Hills CA 91307. 
County: Los Angeles. Crafe Cafe Inc, 
22950 Vanowen St, West Hills CA 
91307. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 02/2019. 
Signed: Samer Akel, CFO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/01/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 

06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024095263. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Northern Cafe, 9305 Reseda Blvd, 
Northridge CA 91324. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: C4565311. NNC 
Corp, 9305 Reseda Blvd, Northridge 
CA 91324. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conduct-
ed by: a corporation. The Regis-
trant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Binan Jiang, President. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/02/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024096214. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Martinez I.T. Telecom, 6629 San Luis 
St, Paramount CA 90723. County: 
Los Angeles. Anthony Martinez, 
6629 San Luis St, Paramount CA 
90723. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Anthony Martinez, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/03/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024098210. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Sandy Sails, 42230 Brittle Bush Dr, 
Quartz Hill CA 93536. County: Los 
Angeles. Urban Baby Club LLC, 
42230 Brittle Bush Dr, Quartz Hill CA 
93536. State of Organization: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 04/2024. Signed: Sandy Poole, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 05/07/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024100988. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 

Boutique De Fleurs, 5511 S Vermont 
Ave, Los Angeles CA 90037. County: 
Los Angeles. Wenceslao Omar Orte-
ga Amaya, 5511 S Vermont Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90037. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2024. Signed: Wenceslao 
Omar Ortega Amaya, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/09/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024101617. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
OC Comprehensive & Glorify Med 
Spa Mobile Service, 261 W Howard 
Street, Pasadena CA 91103. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Lani Dela Noche, 
261 W Howard Street, Pasadena CA 
91103. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Lani Dela Noche, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/10/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024102952. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
A&H Novelties, 7739 Bradwell Ave 
Apt 38, Whittier CA 90606. County: 
Los Angeles. Ahsan Hassan, 7739 
Bradwell Ave Apt 38, Whittier CA 
90606. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024 
Signed: Ahsan Hassan, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/13/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024103518. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Brew Coffee, 15116 Kadota Street, 
Sylmar CA 91342. County: Los An-
geles. Judith Herrera, 15116 Kadota 
Street, Sylmar CA 91342; Donny 
Urrutia, 15116 Kadota Street, Sylmar 
CA 91342. This business is conduct-
ed by: a married couple. The Reg-

istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 11/2023. Signed: Judith Herrera, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 05/14/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024103913. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Herb By Sheila, 3101 Ocean Park 
Blvd. Ste #100 PMB#479, Santa 
Monica CA 90405. County: Los An-
geles. Shelia Shammond Hinton, 
3101 Ocean Park Blvd. Ste #100 
PMB#479, Santa Monica CA 90405. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Shelia Shammond Hinton, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/14/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024103936. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Schoolvantage Consulting, 1883 W. 
Royal Hunte Dr. Ste. 200A, Cedar 
City UT 84720. County: Los Ange-
les. Vertex PV Group, LLC, 1883 
W. Royal Hunte Dr. Ste. 200A, Ce-
dar City UT 84720. State of Orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Frank 
Navarro, managing member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/14/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024104671. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Left Coast Pets. 2531 W 237th 
Street Ste 101, Torrance CA 90505. 
County: Los Angeles. Jennifer 
Trudell, 2531 W 237th Street Ste 
101, Torrance CA 90505. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a limited li-
ability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
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under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Jennifer Trudell, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/15/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024104713. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Stewards of the Earth; Stewards, 
453 W Spring Street Ste 400, Los 
Angeles CA 90013. County: Los An-
geles. Circularity Loop LLC, 453 W 
Spring Street Ste 400, Los Angeles 
CA 90013. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conduct-
ed by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: David Durey, 
managing member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/15/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024105840. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: Hoar 
Haus Records, 915 W Foothill Blvd 
Suite C-130, Claremont CA 91711. 
County: Los Angeles. John Patrick 
Hoar, 915 W Foothill Blvd Suite 
C-130, Claremont CA 91711. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 01/2022. Signed: John 
Patrick Hoar, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/15/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024105849. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Law Office of Aryeh Kaufman, 
5482 Wilshire Blvd., PMB 1907, 
Los Angeles CA 9036. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 4666460. Aryeh L. 
Kaufman, Esq. APC, 5482 Wilshire 
Blvd., PMB 1907, Los Angeles CA 
9036. State of Incorporation: Cali-
fornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2020. 

Signed: Aryeh Kaufman, CEO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/15/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024105864. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Mena’s Pest Solutions, 1527 Larch-
wood Ave, Hacienda Heights CA 
91745. County: Los Angeles. Jon-
athan Mena, 1527 Larchwood Ave, 
Hacienda Heights CA 91745. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 04/2024. Signed: Jon-
athan Mena, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024105890. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Otterly Amazing Bakery, 3816 
Beethoven 205, Los Angeles CA 
90066. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
202462118065. Mar Vista Foods 
LLC, 3816 Beethoven 205, Los An-
geles CA 90066. State of Organiza-
tion: California. This business is con-
ducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 05/2024. Signed: Schuyler 
Ream, managing member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024105941. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Aya Designed, 6649 McLennan 
Ave, Van Nuys CA 91406. County: 
Los Angeles. Aya Stone, 6649 Mc-
Lennan Ave, Van Nuys CA 91406. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Aya Stone, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 

05/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024106269. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: Twin 
Bridges, 4605 Lankershim Blvd, 
#700, North Hollywood CA 91602. 
County: Los Angeles. Joe Bratcher, 
4605 Lankershim Blvd, #700, North 
Hollywood CA 91602. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2024. Signed: Joe Bratcher, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 05/16/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024106340. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Bless Up Care, 20540 Hawatha 
St., Chatsworth CA 91311. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Nadine Balansag, 
20540 Hawatha St., Chatsworth CA 
91311. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Nadine Balansag, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024106362. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: USTAAD, 
5593 Palm Dr Unit 107, Hawthorne 
CA 90250. County: Los Angeles. 
Funatx LLC, 5593 Palm Dr Unit 107, 
Hawthorne CA 90250. State of Orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Pooja 
Gunjikar, managing member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 

itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024106379. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: LA’s 
Best Care Products, 11011 Venice 
Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90034. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Ahed Farajallah, 
11011 Venice Blvd, Los Angeles CA 
90034. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Ahed Farajallah, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024106615. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Stanley 
Tucci The Dog, 2042 S Shenando-
ah St Apt 5, Los Angeles CA 90034. 
County: Los Angeles. Katherine Bo-
naccorso, 2042 S Shenandoah St 
Apt 5, Los Angeles CA 90034. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Katherine 
Bonaccorso, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024106618. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Goldstein Wellness, 2028 Via 
Visalia, Palos Verdes Estates, CA 
90274. County: Los Angeles. BGPR 
Corporation of Delaware, 2028 Via 
Visalia, Palos Verdes Estates, CA 
90274. State of Incorporation: Del-
aware. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Peter Ryang, CFO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 

06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024106722. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Hope Of The Valley Rescue Mission, 
16641 Roscoe Place, North Hills 
CA 91343. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 3266653. Hope The Mission, 
16641 Roscoe Place, North Hills CA 
91343. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 12/2009. 
Signed: Rowan Alexander Vansleve, 
President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/16/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024106831. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
VAS PNL Academy, 11539 Ruffner 
Ave, Granada Hills CA 91344. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Varduhi Sargsyan, 
11539 Ruffner Ave, Granada Hills CA 
91344. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Varduhi Sargsyan, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/17/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024107076. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Strokes, 5208 Lennox Ave, Sherman 
Oaks CA 91401. County: Los An-
geles. Tomer Peretz, 5208 Lennox 
Ave, Sherman Oaks CA 91401. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2024. Signed: 
Tomer Peretz, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/17/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024107123. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 

Nancy Nazari Retreats, 5719 Hes-
peria Avenue, Encino CA 91316. 
County: Los Angeles. Nancy Nazari, 
5719 Hesperia Avenue, Encino CA 
91316. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Nancy Nazari, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/17/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024107125. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Travel Care 
Mexico, 4956 Hood Drive, Woodland 
Hills CA 91364. County: Los Ange-
les. AI#ON: 202460513495. Mexus 
International, LLC, 4956 Hood Dr., 
Woodland Hills CA 91364. State 
of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
David Eisenstadt, manager. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/17/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024107128. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
USA Armenian Grill, 13927 Valerio 
St., Van Nuys CA 91405. County: 
Los Angeles. Liana Shkhyan, 13927 
Valerio St., Van Nuys CA 91405. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Liana Shkhyan, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/17/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024108202. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ozone Full 
Health, Ozone Holistic Manufactur-
ing, Triple A Investments, 1606 N. 
Willow Ave, Compton CA 90221. 
County: Los Angeles. Ozone FSO 
LLC, 1606 N. Willow Ave, Compton 
CA 90221. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conduct-
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ed by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 05/2024. Signed: Axel Daniel 
Oliva, managing member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/20/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024108265. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
LA Film Junkies; Haitian Bricolage 
Gallery, African Diaspora Distribu-
tion Company, Constant Produc-
tion, Constant University, Haiti Film 
Studio, 10706 West Octave Lane, 
North Hollywood CA 91601. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Jack Alvin Jeffrey 
Constant, 10706 West Octave Lane, 
North Hollywood CA 91601. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 03/2006. Signed: Jack 
Alvin Jeffrey Constant, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/20/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024109051. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Carnaval, 342 S Thomas Street, 
Pomona CA 91766. County: Los 
Angeles. S & J Pomona, LLC, 342 S 
Thomas Street, Pomona CA 91766. 
State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Regis-
trant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2010. Signed: Steven Melnick, 
managing member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/20/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024109054. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: Tao 
Productions, 659 S. Orange Dr., Los 
Angeles CA 90036. County: Los An-
geles. Andrew George Taylor, 659 S. 
Orange Dr., Los Angeles CA 90036; 
Michelle Owen, 659 S. Orange Dr., 
Los Angeles CA 90036. This busi-

ness is conducted by: co-partners. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Andrew George 
Taylor, general partner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/20/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024109056. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
US Donuts & Yogurt, 11719 Whittier 
Blvd, Whittier CA 90601. County: Los 
Angeles. New US Donuts & Yogurt 
Inc, 11719 Whittier Blvd, Whittier CA 
90601. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Tony Weng, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/20/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024109106. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Parada Productions, 44646 Shad-
owcrest Drive, Lancaster CA 93536. 
County: Los Angeles. Nicklaus 
Parada, 44646 Shadowcrest Drive, 
Lancaster CA 93536. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 06/2019. Signed: Nick-
laus Parada, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/21/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024109193. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
The Strategic Leader, 11150 West 
Olympic Blvd Suite 1050, Los Ange-
les CA 90064. County: Los Angeles. 
Raymond Beatty, 11150 West Olym-
pic Blvd Suite 1050, Los Angeles CA 
90064. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Raymond Beatty, owner. 

Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/21/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024109359. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Epic Raven Media, 1883 W. Royal 
Hunte Dr. Ste. 200A, Cedar City UT 
84720. County: Los Angeles. Ver-
tex PV Group, LLC, 1883 W. Royal 
Hunte Dr. Ste. 200A, Cedar City UT 
84720. State of Organization: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Frank Navarro, 
managing member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/21/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024109610. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Dún Dealgan Media, 8608 Hollo-
way Drive #103, West Hollywood 
CA 90069. County: Los Angeles. 
Timothy Joseph Shiner, 8608 Hol-
loway Drive, West Hollywood CA 
90069. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Timothy Joseph Shiner, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 05/21/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024109737. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Joe’s Coin Laundry El Monte; Joe’s 
Coin Laundry Covina, 17026 E. Cy-
press St Suite A and C, Covina CA 
91722. County: Los Angeles. JCL 
Services LLC, 1436 Paloma St., 
Pasadena CA 91104. State of Orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 02/2014. Signed: Cather-
ine Lopez, managing member. Reg-

istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/21/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024109958. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: SoFresh And SoClean, 12707 
Mitchell Ave 201, Los Angeles CA 
90066. County: Los Angeles. Roost-
er Panda, LLC, 12707 Mitchell Ave 
201, Los Angeles CA 90066. State 
of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Jeniffer Gayosso, manager. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/21/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024110226. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Calvary Fellowship Christian Acad-
emy, 4016 Grand Avenue, Ste. A 
#1027, Chino CA 91710. County: 
Los Angeles. Calvary Chapel Fellow-
ship Church, 4016 Grand Avenue, 
Ste. A #1027, Chino CA 91710. State 
of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 05/2024. Signed: Gary S. 
Yamamoto, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/22/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024110229. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Injury Papi, 617 South Olive Street 
422, Los Angeles CA 90014. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 20201926001. 
Perez Casillas APC, 617 South Olive 
Street 422, Los Angeles CA 90014; 
Law Offices of Ruben Guerra, PC, 
617 South Olive Street 422, Los 
Angeles CA 90014. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liabili-
ty partnership. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2019. 
Signed: Tizoc Perez-Casillas, gen-

eral partner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/22/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024110651. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Coldwell Banker Express, 713 W 
Duarte Rd. #236, Arcadia CA 91007. 
County: Los Angeles. Agent Collec-
tive, 777 S Figueroa St. Suite 4600, 
Los Angeles CA 90017. State of 
Incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Erwin Pineda, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 05/22/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024 
and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024111052. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Green Electronic Recycling, 
1429 W El Segundo Blvd, Gardena 
CA 90249. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 5041587. Cazh, Inc., 1429 
W El Segundo Blvd, Gardena CA 
90249. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Aztul Cabeza, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/22/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF 
PAMELA L. GASKEY aka 

PAMELA PHILLIPS GASKEY, 
PAMELA GASKEY, PAMELA 

LEE GASKEY
Case No. 24STPB05361

	 To all heirs, beneficiaries, credi-
tors, contingent creditors, and per-
sons who may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate, or both, 
of PAMELA L. GASKEY aka PAME-
LA PHILLIPS GASKEY, PAMELA 
GASKEY, PAMELA LEE GASKEY
	 A PETITION FOR PROBATE 
has been filed by William Joseph 
Gaskey in the Superior Court of 

California, County of LOS ANGE-
LES.
	 THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that William Joseph Gas-
key be appointed as personal rep-
resentative to administer the estate 
of the decedent.
	 THE PETITION requests the 
decedent’s will and codicils, if any, 
be admitted to probate. The will and 
any codicils are available for exam-
ination in the file kept by the court.
	 THE PETITION requests author-
ity to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Before tak-
ing certain very important actions, 
however, the personal representa-
tive will be required to give notice 
to interested persons unless they 
have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the petition will 
be held on June 21, 2024 at 8:30 
AM in Dept. No. 5 located at 111 N. 
Hill St., Los Angeles, CA 90012.
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-
tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and le-
gal authority may affect your rights 
as a creditor. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney knowledgeable 
in California law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a per-
son interested in the estate, you 
may file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.

Attorney for petitioner:
PAUL HORN ESQ

SBN 243227
PAUL HORN LAW GROUP PC

11404 SOUTH STREET
CERRITOS CA 90703

CN107208 GASKEY Jun 1,8,15, 
2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

150 West Commonwealth Avenue
Alhambra CA 91801

In the Matter of the Petition of Gas-
sia Georges Ilanejian AKA Gas-
sia George Ilanejian AKA Gassia 
George Ilanjian, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 07/10/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. 3

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Gassia Georges Ilanejian AKA 
Gassia George Ilanejian. And 

a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 
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said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 

from Gassia Georges Ilanejian 
AKA Gassia George Ilanejian to 

Gassia George Ilanejian

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 21, 2024.
Robin Miller Sloan
Judge of the Superior Court
24NNCP00222
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

18336 Sylvan Street
Tarzana CA 91335

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Henrietta Letailleur-Hamm, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 07/08/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. A Room 510

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Henrietta 
Letailleur-Hamm. And a petition 
for change of names having been 
duly filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Henriet-
ta Letailleur-Hamm to Hendricks 
Letailleur-Hamm

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 24, 2024.
Virginia Keeny
Judge of the Superior Court
24VECP00218
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California

County of Los Angeles
6230 Sylmar Avenue
Van Nuys CA 91401

In the Matter of the Petition of Irina 
Zharov, an adult over the age of 

18 years.

​Date: 07/08/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. W Room 610

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Irina 
Zharov. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Irina 
Zharov to Irina Zharovskaya

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 23, 2024.
Virginia Keeny
Judge of the Superior Court
24VECP00216
Published: 05/25/2024, 06/01/2024, 
06/08/2024 and 06/15/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024083084. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: CPT Greens, 15134 Indiana 
Ave. Apt 11, Paramount CA 90723. 
County: Los Angeles. Theodore 
Beauford, 15134 Indiana Ave. Apt 
11, Paramount CA 90723. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Theo-
dore Beauford, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
04/17/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024098124. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Newmarket Homes LA, 9454 
Wilshire Blvd. #100, Beverly Hills 
CA 92012. County: Los Angeles. 
Emily Rose, 9454 Wilshire Blvd. 
#100, Beverly Hills CA 92012. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 04/2024. 
Signed: Emily Rose, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 

in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/07/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024100975. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Chess Moves Creative Media, 
4138 Palo Verde Avenue, Lake-
wood CA 90713. County: Los An-
geles. Cedric Lonell Haynes, 4138 
Palo Verde Avenue, Lakewood CA 
90713. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Cedric Lonell Haynes, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/09/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024102054. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: AIRSOFTGI.COM, AIRSOFT 
GI INC, 21077 Commerce Point 
Dr, Walnut CA 91789. County: Los 
Angeles. 88 Trading Inc., 21077 
Commerce Point Dr, Walnut CA 
91789. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2011. 
Signed: Lily Chun Ling Wang, 
CFO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/10/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024103358. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
P & S Realty, Best Coast Mortgage, 
Best Coast Escrow, 946 Verdugo 
Circle Dr., Glendale CA 91206. 
County: Los Angeles. P. & S. Hol-
lywood Development Corporation, 
946 Verdugo Circle Dr., Glendale CA 
91206. State of Incorporation: Cali-
fornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/1979. 
Signed: Dikran Shirinyan, Presi-
dent. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 

true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/14/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024106437. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
CLIQONU, 19761 Inspiration Trail, 
Topanga CA 90290. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 202359814038. 
Echo My Muse LLC, 19761 Inspira-
tion Trail, Topanga CA 90290. State 
of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Jennifer Bari Humphrey, 
Vice President. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024107171. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Next Level Auto Center, 3431 
Cherry Ave, Long Beach CA 90807. 
County: Los Angeles. Vinh Automo-
bile Service, Inc., 3431 Cherry Ave, 
Long Beach CA 90807. State of 
Incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 07/2020. Signed: 
Vinh Hoang, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/17/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024107303. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Soluciones Rental Car, 518 
Evergreen St Apt 1, Inglewood 
CA 90302. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 6156514. A-Axion Corp, 
518 Evergreen St Apt 1, Inglewood 
CA 90302. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Sandra Viviana 
Jimenez Moriones, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-

rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/17/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024107728. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: SJ Services, 518 Evergreen St 
Apt 1, Inglewood CA 90302. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 6156514. 
A-Axion Corp, 518 Evergreen St 
Apt 1, Inglewood CA 90302. State 
of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a cor-
poration. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Sandra Viviana Jimenez Moriones, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/17/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024107743. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Diaz 503 Trucking, 7111 Perry Rd, 
Bell Gardens CA 90201. County: 
Los Angeles.  AI#ON: 6185790. 
Diaz 503 Trucking Corp, 7111 Per-
ry Rd, Bell Gardens CA 90201. 
State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Jaime Ardiles Orellana Diaz, Pres-
ident. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/17/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024107863. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Dream Printing LA, 5625 Pacific 
Blvd, Huntington Park CA 90255. 
County: Los Angeles. Dream 
Printing LA Inc, 5625 Pacific Blvd, 
Huntington Park CA 90255. State 
of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a cor-
poration. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Cuauhtemoc Sanchez Rodriguez, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 

filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/17/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024107974. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Maia; Your Doula Maia, 5934 
Shoshone Ave, Encino CA 91316. 
County: Los Angeles. Maia Spak, 
5934 Shoshone Ave, Encino CA 
91316. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Maia Spak, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/20/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024108689. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Seven Day Liquor Mart, 6100 Bell-
flower Blvd, Lakewood CA 90713. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
6098061. M7D Liquor Inc, 6100 
Bellflower Blvd, Lakewood CA 
90713. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Bashir Hadib, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/20/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024108774. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Vegan House Thai Bistro, 
1435 N Highland Ave, Los Angeles 
CA 90028. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 202355015475. Plant Lab 
LLC, 1435 N Highland Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90028. State of Orga-
nization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Dutsanee Deenor, Member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/20/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 

Legal Notices
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Need a little reset?

Join us in our cozy Join us in our cozy 
Tea Room for After-Tea Room for After-
noon Tea  noon Tea  
Wed-Sat 11.30-4pmWed-Sat 11.30-4pm

Enjoy a selection of sandwiches, pastries, 
sausage rolls and a glass of 

bubbly! Private parties available.
Ye Olde Kings Head • 116 Santa Monica Blvd.

Santa Monica • 310.451.1402

BIRTH 
ANNOUCEMENT

Proud parents Andres 
Jesus Escobedo and 
Lydia Ann Caro are 

happy to announce the 
birth of their daughter 
Nia Love Escobedo. 

Date of birth: 
May 14th 2024 

Time: 14.13  
Gender: F 

Weight: 7lbs 10oz 
Length: 20 in 

Born at Kaiser in 
Baldwin Park

Coverage for cleanings, 
fi llings, crowns — even 
dentures! Get dental 
insurance from 
Physicians Mutual 
Insurance Company. 

It’s easy! Call today

1-855-537-2305
Dental50Plus.com/British

Get your FREE Information Kit

DENTAL
Insurance
Great coverage for retirees.

Product/features not available in all states. Contact us for complete details about this insurance solicitation. To fi nd a network provider, go to 
physiciansmutual.com/fi nd-dentist. This specifi c offer not available in CO, NV, NY, VA – call 1-800-969-4781 or respond for a similar offer in your 
state. Certifi cate C254/B465, C250A/B438 (ID: C254ID; PA: C254PA); Insurance Policy P154/B469, P150/B439 (GA: P154GA; OK: P154OK; TN: P154TN).
6347

SCOTLAND fans cel-
ebrated their team’s 
participation in their 
first major tournament 
since 1998 in fine style 
this week, descending 
on the German city of 
Munich in such huge 
numbers that beerhall 
owners began describ-
ing their visit as ‘Scoto-

berfest’.
	 Even before the bulk 
of an estimated 100,000 
fans descended on the 
Bavarian capital, the ad-
vance party had already 
made their mark, with a 
piper filmed falling off 
a table in a bar, to the 
amusement of its Ger-
man staff.

	 Arriving by plane, 
train, campervan, 
bike and even on foot, 
kilt-clad  Scotland 
fans dressed in blue and 
white and carrying plen-
ty of bagpipes arrived in 
Munich’s main square 
Thursday as they geared 
up for the nation’s big-
gest party in 26 years.

	 Scotland took on hosts 
and four-time World 
Cup winners Germany 
in the opening game 
of  Euro 2024  on Friday 
after the BW went to 
press, and no matter 
the result of the open-
ing game, the fans were 
in the mood to party, 
quickly laying siege to 
Munich’s famed beerh-
alls.
	 As the first renditions 
of Flower of Scotland, 
Yes Sir I Can Boogie, and 
No Scotland, No Party 
were blasted out by pip-
ers, other chose to bring 
a taste of home as they 
glugged down bottles 

of Buckfast, the caffein-
ated tonic wine made by 
monks but largely  con-
sumed on Scottish street 
corners.
	 Some had arrived from 
as far afield as Australia 
while others had taken for 

flights across Europe on 
their journey or travelled 
by caravan.
	 But by far the biggest 
entrance was Craig Fergu-
son, 20, who walked 500 
miles, and 500 more, after 
setting off from Hampden 

Munich hails ‘Scotoberfest’ as 
100,000-strong Tartan Army hit the 

beerhalls for a Euro 2024 party
n Back home, there’s a shortage of tartan as fans snap up 

‘drinking kilts’ for the opening clash with Germany

Getting intae the spirit: Scottish fans in Munich
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2995 Thousand Oaks Blvd., Thousand Oaks. (parking in rear)
Open: Mon-Sat. 10.30-5.30 • Sun: 10-6 • Tel: (805) 495-4042

Teas • Candy • Pastries • Bangers • 
Meat Pies • Heinz Beans • 

China Teapots • Tea Cozies • Gifts
Now featuring delicious, traditional handmade pies and 

pasties from Deli-SA. Chicken curry pasties, Cornish 
pasties, Steak & Kidney...and much more

Quality Imports from the British Isles...

Direct Contact: 
Annie 

(310) 710 8224

The Hare 
and Hounds

ARIES: You might be  tempted to step out of your comfort zone. This is an 
abrupt departure from the recent past, so just be sure you do not regret it. Next 
week is a better time.
TAURUS: Now should be the time for you to sort out the mind space you 
are currently in. You may even resolve some unfinished business. Changes are 
around the corner.
GEMINI: You will likely be looking around you at stuff you could or should 
have completed of late. Now is the time to relax, not stress. Happy Birthday!
CANCER: You are probably feeling a little out of control, especially in your 
cash flow. It will soon be back on track due to Mars currently in your money 
area. 
LEO: Don’t forget to breathe and relax this coming week, it’s the best way to 
get through a challenging time. Your health should be getting back on track, 
but do not over do anything.
VIRGO: Now your opposite sign Pisces is relaxing under the watchful eye of 
Saturn you may want to do the same this week ahead. Nothing much should 
rock your world. 
LIBRA: You will likely have to face at least one new situation this coming week 
- probably more than one. These will keep you on your toes for a while, so en-
joy the challenge as it will stop you thinking too far ahead.
SCORPIO: Your emotional well-being is important now that Mars your boss 
has moved into your opposite sign of Taurus. Just make sure you stop worry-
ing about things that likely will not happen.
SAGITTARIUS: There are some folks who do not understand why you are 
upbeat and in good spirits. This is your nature so be ready to just feel good no 
matter what. It’s time to take a few days away to relax.
CAPRICORN: Life will soon be easier for you now that Jupiter is in your area 
of finances, so make time to relax. Be aware of your patterns from past relation-
ships and do not repeat them.
AQUARIUS: You are usually busy at any given time. While you mostly enjoy 
helping others you are due for a break. Even a few days away from the crowd 
will be good for you. 
PISCES: Saturn is living with you for some time ahead. This means any situa-
tion not for your best and highest good should be up for review. Just remember 
it’s always for the best!

Local News

Stargazing with 
Annie Shaw

Park in Glasgow on foot 
41 days ago.
	 On arrival he was 
showered with cham-
pagne and handed bottles 
of Buckfast as the Scot-
land party entered full 
swing.
	 Mr Ferguson joked that 
he had “brought the Scot-
tish weather with me,” as 
he arrived in the Munich 
sunshine.
	 “It was incredible, this 
is officially my 15 min-
utes of fame,” he said as 
the bottle of Buckfast he 
had been given fell and 
smashed on the ground.
	 “I’m a bit tired but I 
could have kept going. 
It was taken out of my 
control what I’d be doing 
when I got here. I came 
in and I was having bev-
vies before I crossed the 
finish line. Us Scotland 
fans now just have to let 
our hair down and enjoy 
it because we don’t get to 
enjoy it very often.”
	 Mr Ferguson, who 
raised £50,000 for charity, 
initially did not have a 
ticket to the game but has 
now been given one by a 
supporter.
	 “I think it makes the 
walk and all those miles a 
little bit less crazy the fact 
that I will now actually 
be going to the game,” he 
said.
	 “I started this journey 
with just me, my bag, no 
ticket, no nothing, Just 
a stupid idea and well, 
fast-forward, you know, 
41 days, here I am.”

	 The bars are not the 
only thing drying up. 
Scotland’s kiltmakers are 
bemoaning a lack of tar-
tan as thousands snap up 
“drinking kilts” for the 
tournament.
	 Some outfitters have 
“completely run out” of 
stock as canny fans opt for 
ex-hire kilts, a cheaper al-
ternative to the traditional 
dress.

	 David Hughes, 62, 
owner of Bowdens, in 
Leith, Edinburgh, said he 
has been forced to turn ea-
ger buyers away after he 
ran out of stock last week.
	 He said: “We have 
completely run out. I’m 
turning guys away, two 
or three a day, asking for 
an ex-hire kilt. It’s brilliant 
for business, I just wish I 
had more.”

WORTH THE WAIT? Scotland face hosts Germany in the opening match

QUIZ PRO QUO

One of the best nights out in Los Angeles, Brits 
in LA Pub Quiz continues to pull in the crowds 
each Tuesday at O’Briens in Santa Monica.
	 The reigning champs are Biden His Time Until 
Sentencing but everyone’s a winner at quizmaster 
Sandro Monetti’s fun trivia game.



  The british Weekly, Sat. June 15, 2024Page 12

years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024109059. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Hollywords; Hollyword, 7058 Bianca 
Ave. Lake Balboa CA 91406. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Richard W. Kroon, 
7058 Bianca Ave. Lake Balboa CA 
91406. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Richard W. Kroon, own-
er. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/20/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024110396. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Noisiboi, 2506 Arthur St, Los Ange-
les CA 90065. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 3460678. Studio Graenitz 
Inc., 2506 Arthur St, Los Angeles CA 
90065. State of Incorporation: Cali-
fornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Maximilian Graenitz, Pres-
ident. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/22/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024110482. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Core  Services, 200 S. Barrington 
Avenue #49750, Los Angeles CA 
90049. County: Los Angeles. Pros-
perity Ventures NO 01, LLC, 200 
S. Barrington Avenue #49750, Los 
Angeles CA 90049. State of Orga-
nization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Alex Soofer, Manager. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/22/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 

must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024110578. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: XENOFLUFF, 21694 Can-
yon Heights Cir, Santa Clarita 
CA 91390. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 202462210365. Xenofluff 
Art, Tech, And Design LLC, 24307 
Magic Mountain Pkwy #1006, Va-
lencia CA 91355. State of Orga-
nization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2022. 
Signed: Alexander Rafalovich, 
member. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/22/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024110752. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Not Your Everyday Holiday, 7717 
Teesdale Ave, North Hollywood CA 
91605. County: Los Angeles. Chris-
tine Judy Starnino, 7717 Teesdale 
Ave, North Hollywood CA 91605. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Christine Judy Starnino, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/22/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024111481. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Pupuseria La Placita Portena, 
22807 Figueroa St, Carson CA 
90745. County: Los Angeles. Sig-
fredo Nerio, 22807 Figueroa St, 
Carson CA 90745. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Sigfredo Ne-
rio, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/23/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 

of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024112371. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Kazarian Measures Ruskin, KMR 
Talent, KMR, 8200 Lankershim Bl. 
#820, North Hollywood CA 91601. 
County: Los Angeles. Kazarian/
Measures/Ruskin & Associates, 
Inc., 8200 Lankershim Bl. #820, 
North Hollywood CA 91601. State 
of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a cor-
poration. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 02/2019. 
Signed: Mark David Measures, 
President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/23/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024112374. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Primo Driving Schools, 10909 
Kinross Avenue, Los Angeles CA 
90024. County: Los Angeles. Primo 
Driving School, LLC, 5652 Glenford 
Street, Los Angeles CA 90008. State 
of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2012. 
Signed: Mark Alan Primack, manag-
ing member. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/23/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024112377. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Gama Transportation, 365 Burchett 
Street Apt 207, Glendale CA 91203. 
County: Los Angeles. Ali Hasani 
Nasab, 365 Burchett Street Apt 207, 
Glendale CA 91203. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Ali Hasani 
Nasab, owner. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/23/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 

filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024112908. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Transformational Goddess Re-
treats, 628 24th Pl, Hermosa Beach 
CA 90254. County: Los Angeles. 
Helen Hodgson, 628 24th Pl, Her-
mosa Beach CA 90254. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Hel-
en Hodgson, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/24/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024112398. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: EZ Drain & Plumbing Services; 
EZ Drain & Plumbing, Drain And 
Plumbing Services; EZ Drain And 
Plumbing, 9527 Slauson Ave., 
Pico Rivera CA 90660. County: 
Los Angeles. Joshua Fluhrer, 6709 
Washington Ave. #944, Whittier 
CA 90608. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Joshua Fluhrer, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/23/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024113351. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Wetzel’s Pretzels, 26471 Carl 
Boyer Dr., Santa Clarita CA 91350. 
County: Los Angeles. Snack Source 
Inc., 26471 Carl Boyer Dr., Santa 
Clarita CA 91350. State of Incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Rafiq 
Alam, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/24/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 

fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024113388. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Gold Coast Dental, 901 W. Whittier 
Blvd, La Habra CA 90631. County: 
Los Angeles. Diane Boval DDS A 
Professional Dental Corporation, 
901 W. Whittier Blvd, La Habra CA 
90631. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Bruno Boval, Treasurer. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 05/28/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024113608. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: SAMRI, 1700 Broadview Drive, 
Glendale CA 91208. County: Los 
Angeles. Jared Noh, 1700 Broad-
view Drive, Glendale CA 91208. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Jared Noh, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/28/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024113863. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
California Huaren Headlines, 411 E. 
Huntington Drive, #107-520, Arca-
dia CA 91006. County: Los Angeles. 
L & D Int’l Media Group, 411 E. Hun-
tington Drive, #107-520, Arcadia CA 
91006. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Tiny Yao, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/28/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 

Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024114401. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Think First Publishing, 11119 
Ringwood Ave, Santa Fe Springs 
CA 90670. County: Los Angeles. 
William C Raff, 11119 Ringwood 
Ave, Santa Fe Springs CA 90670. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
William C Raff, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/28/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024114457. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Vanguard Services; Vanguard Opti-
cal, 26811 Brookhollow Dr Valencia 
CA 91355. County: Los Angeles. 
Vanguard Trading Services LLC, 
26811 Brookhollow Dr Valencia CA 
91355. State of Organization: Cali-
fornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Lawrence 
Choi, Managing Member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 05/28/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024114488. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Phoenix Tutoring And Educa-
tional Consulting Services, 12755 
Kittridge St, North Hollywood CA 
91606. County: Los Angeles. 
Armine Javadyan, 12755 Kittridge 
St, North Hollywood CA 91606. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Armine Javadyan, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 05/28/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024
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Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024115283. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Fresh Bites; Mazz Mezz, 105 N Hill 
Ave #103, Pasadena CA 91106. 
County: Los Angeles. Medcatering 
Inc, 105 N Hill Ave #103, Pasade-
na CA 91106. State of Incorpora-
tion: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 05/2024. Signed: Missak 
Janjanian, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 05/29/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/01/2024, 06/08/2024, 
06/15/2024 and 06/22/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N. Hill Street Room 102
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Yolanda Soto-Mayor, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 08/16/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Yolanda 
Soto-Mayor. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 
Yolanda Soto-Mayor to Chloe 

Mayor

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 22, 2024.
Curtis A. Kin, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP01648
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

9425 Penfield Ave
Chatsworth CA 91311 

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Gabrielle Elise Dunn El, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 07/11/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. F51

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Gabrielle 
Elise Dunn El. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Gabrielle Elise Dunn El to Gabri-
elle-Elise El Family of Dunn

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 9, 2024.
David B. Gelfound
Judge of the Superior Court
24CHCP00176
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

9425 Penfield Ave
Chatsworth CA 91311 

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Prince Mikhail Dawid Johnson 

El, an adult over the age of 18 
years.

​Date: 07/11/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. F47

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Prince 
Mikhail Dawid Johnson El. And 

a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Prince Mikhail Dawid John-
son El to Prince Mikhail-Dawid El 

Family of Johnson

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 

the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 9, 2024.
David B. Gelfound
Judge of the Superior Court
24CHCP00175
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

Alhambra Courthouse
150 West Commonwealth Avenue

Alhambra CA 91801

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Juan Jesus Gonzalez, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 08/02/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. X

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Juan 
Jesus Gonzalez. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 

filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Juan Jesus Gonzalez to Raider 
JJ Gonzalez

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: June 5, 2024
Robin Miller Sloane, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24NNCP00267
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024086012. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Baie Beauty Bar; Lotus 3 Pub-
lishing Company, 5850 W 3rd 
Street Suite E1165, Los Angeles 
CA 90036. County: Los Angeles. 
Lotus 3, LLC, 5850 W 3rd Street, 
Los Angeles CA 90036. State of 
Organization: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a limited li-
ability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Kamala Ayers, Manager. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 04/22/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a ficti-

tious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024086731. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Cali Express Notary; 360 Degree 
Inspections, 5850 W 3rd Street 
Suite E1165, Los Angeles CA 
90036. County: Los Angeles. JMC 
Realty Group, LLC, 5850 W 3rd 
Street, Suite E1165, Los Angeles 
CA 90036. State of Organization: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a limited liability compa-
ny. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Ka-
mala Joselyn Ayers, Manager. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 04/22/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024090020. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Herman Architects, 1725 Gardena 
Ave Second Floor, Glendale CA 
91204. County: Los Angeles. R.S. 
Herman, Architects, Inc., 1725 Gar-
dena Ave Second Floor, Glendale 
CA 91204. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed here-
in on: 04/2024. Signed: Richard 
Herman, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
04/25/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024091937. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Fast Friends Clothing, 7018 Free-
sia Ct Rigged For Dirt, Eastvale CA 
92880-8920. County: Los Angeles. 
Fast Friends Clothing LLC, 7018 
Freesia Ct, Eastvale CA 92880-
8920. State of Organization: Cali-
fornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 04/2022. Signed: Ali Sed-
aghat, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 04/29/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the of-
fice of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement 

must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024100946. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Aquatic Arts, 3734 W Century 
Blvd suite 4, Inglewood CA 90303. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
3985174. Kaier Inc, 3734 W Cen-
tury Blvd suite 4, Inglewood CA 
90303. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Adepegba Rogers, CFO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/09/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024102834. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Mini White, 1622 Cactus Drive, Lan-
caster CA 93535. County: Los An-
geles. Kieron Cheuk-Chi Lo, 1022 
S. 5th Street, Alhambra CA 91801; 
Anita Shun Chong Chow, 1022 S. 
5th Street, Alhambra CA 91801. 
This business is conducted by: a 
married couple. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Kieron Cheuk-Chi Lo, hus-
band. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 05/13/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fic-
titious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024102921. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Shop The Collab Uptown, 
6737 Greenleaf Ave, Whittier CA 
90601. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 6215175. Shops By The 
Collab Collective Inc, 800 S Beach 
Blvd Suite E, La Habra CA 90631. 
State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Rosemarie Drieslein, Pres-
ident. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 05/13/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 

Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fic-
titious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024103717. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Hydrox Design, 11938 Fairford 
Ave, Norwalk CA 90650. County: 
Los Angeles. Omar Gustavo Ma-
ranon Romero, 11938 Fairford Ave, 
Norwalk CA 90650. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Omar 
Gustavo Maranon Romero, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/13/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024104383. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: The Vandalist, 6754 Greenleaf 
Ave., Whittier CA 90601. County: 
Los Angeles. Peter Obregon, 6754 
Greenleaf Ave., Whittier CA 90601; 
Steven Obregon, 6754 Green-
leaf Ave., Whittier CA 90601. This 
business is conducted by: a gen-
eral partnership. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Steven Obregon, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/14/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the of-
fice of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024104863. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Parents Thrive, 394 S Los Robles 
Ave Unit 1, Pasadena CA 91101. 
County: Los Angeles. Jordan Co-
hen, 394 S Los Robles Ave Unit 1, 
Pasadena CA 91101. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 01/2023. Signed: Jor-
dan Cohen, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/15/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
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ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024108330. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Therapy With Grace, 1010 North 
Central Ave Ste 303, Glendale 
CA 91202. County: Los Angeles. 
Altagracia Akopyan, 1010 North 
Central Ave Ste 303, Glendale CA 
91202. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Altagracia Akopyan, own-
er. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 05/20/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024111026. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Brandon Christy Productions, 
14007 Peach Grove St, Sherman 
Oaks CA 91423. County: Los Ange-
les. Brandon Alfred Fownes, 14007 
Peach Grove St, Sherman Oaks CA 
91423. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Brandon Alfred Fownes, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/22/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024111712. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Homage Vintage, 5126 1/2 Riverton 
Ave, North Hollywood CA 91601. 
County: Los Angeles. Kevin Bebak, 
5126 1/2 Riverton Ave, North Hol-
lywood CA 91601. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Kevin Be-
bak, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/23/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 

federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024112396. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Enchanted Whimsyland, 2100 
Redondo Beach Blvd Suite C, Unit 
#426, Torrance CA 90504. County: 
Los Angeles. Lisa Poo, 2100 Re-
dondo Beach Blvd Suite C, Unit 
#426, Torrance CA 90504. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Lisa 
Poo, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/23/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024113292. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Mega Event Decor, 7139 Ha-
zeltine Ave 218, Van Nuys CA 
91405. County: Los Angeles.Juan 
Menchaca  Saldivar, 7139 Hazel-
tine Ave 218, Van Nuys CA 91405. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 04/2024. 
Signed: Juan Menchaca Saldivar, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/24/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024113684. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
J.T. Atlantic Brakes Auto Part Sales, 
12903 S Atlantic Ave, Compton 
CA 90221. County: Los Angeles. 
Juan Torres, 12903 S Atlantic Ave, 
Compton CA 90221. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Juan Torres, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/28/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024114211. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: YCS Consultants; YCS-Consul-
tants, 1745 Grand Ave. Long Beach 
CA 90804. County: Los Angeles. 
YCS-Consultants LLC, 1745 Grand 
Ave. Long Beach CA 90804. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Christopher Griener, man-
aging member. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/28/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024114368. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Khate & Roe; OfOneBrand, 
Mulholland Drop, One Plus Me, 
Vanilla N Cream, More Of That, 
1213 E 14th Street, Los Angeles 
CA 90021. County: Los Angeles. 
Love The Earth Corp., 1213 E 14th 
Street, Los Angeles CA 90021.  
State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Sindy Messing, Secretary. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 05/28/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024114435. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Kolibri Audit; Kolibri Compa-
ny, 1056 E Walnut Ave, Glendora 
CA 91741. County: Los Angeles. 
Kimberly Michele Jordison, 1056 
E Walnut Ave, Glendora CA 91741. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 10/2017. 
Signed: Kimberly Michele Jordison, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/28/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 

06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024114718. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Rivers Cleaners, 10231 Old 
River School Road, Downey CA 
90241. County: Los Angeles. Jorge 
Luis Vicente, 2116 E Stockwell St, 
Compton CA 90222. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 09/2019. Signed: Jorge 
Luis Vicente, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/28/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024115664. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Talkspot, 17721 Burbank Blvd, 
Encino CA 91316. County: Los 
Angeles. Mojtaba Hajebi, 17721 
Burbank Blvd, Encino CA 91316; 
Parisa Tahaniankakhki, 17721 
Burbank Blvd, Encino CA 91316. 
This business is conducted by: a 
married couple. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Parisa Tahaniankakhki, 
wife. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/29/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024116114. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
OUTCOMESAI, 201 Anderson St, 
Manhattan Beach CA 90266. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Cloud Raiders Inc, 
201 Anderson St, Manhattan Beach 
CA 90266. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2024. Signed: Laure Linn, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/30/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024116554. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Kairos Property Management, 9011 
David Ave, Los Angeles CA 90034. 
County: Los Angeles. Stanley Yung, 
9011 David Ave, Los Angeles CA 
90034. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2010. 
Signed: Stanley Yung, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/30/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024116937. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Garcia Air Systems, 1034 W Ave 
H6, Lancaster CA 93534. County: 
Los Angeles. Garcia Air Systems 
LLC, 629 E 80th St, Los Angeles 
CA 90001. State of Organization: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a limited liability compa-
ny. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Jose 
A Garcia, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/30/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024117087. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Uncommon Thread, 8463-4, 
Melrose Place, Los Angeles CA 
90069. County: Los Angeles. Un-
common Thread LLC, 601 S. Rim-
pau Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90005. 
State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Sarah Aaronson, 
President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/30/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024117181. The following 

person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Axon Astrology, 6716 Hillpark Drive 
Apt 208, Los Angeles CA 90068. 
County: Los Angeles. David Carl-
son, 6716 Hillpark Drive Apt 208, 
Los Angeles CA 90068.  This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2024. Signed: 
David Carlson, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/31/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024117210. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Conley Mental Health, 390 Haus-
er Blvd. Apt 5F, Los Angeles CA 
90036. County: Los Angeles. Chris-
topher Michael Conley, 390 Haus-
er Blvd. Apt 5F, Los Angeles CA 
90036. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Christopher Michael Con-
ley, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/31/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024117279. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
First Friends Church; Whittier First 
Friends Church, 13205 Philadel-
phia St, Whittier CA 90601. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 2151898. 
Whittier Monthly Meeting Of The 
Society Of Friends, 13205 Phil-
adelphia St, Whittier CA 90601. 
State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 12/1999. 
Signed: Brendon Woirhaye, CFO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 05/31/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024117409. The following 
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person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Ary Construction, 22543 Ventura 
Blvd., Suite 228, Woodland Hills 
CA 91364. County: Los Angeles. 
Avraham Ardeny, 22543 Ventura 
Blvd., Suite 228, Woodland Hills 
CA 91364. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Avraham Ardeny, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/31/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024117411. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Ruffero, 18341 Sherman Way Suite 
209B, Reseda CA 91335. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 4251430. 
Zulay Construction & Design, Inc, 
18341 Sherman Way Suite 209B, 
Reseda CA 91335. State of Incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: My-
nor Hernandez, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/31/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024117429. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
CR Controls LLC, 382 N Lemon 
Ave #251, Walnut CA 91789. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. CR Controls LLC, 
382 N Lemon Ave #251, Walnut CA 
91789. State of Organization: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 05/2024. Signed: Chel-
sea Rivera, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/31/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024117456. The following 

person(s) is/are doing business 
as: SBG SoCal, 5104 Meridian 
St, Los Angeles CA 90042. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles.  Speakeasy Jiu 
Jitsu LLC, 5104 Meridian St, Los 
Angeles CA 90042. State of Orga-
nization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Marco Antonio Sanchez II, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/31/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024117795. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Almndtree Digital, 10613 Wood-
stead Ave., Whittier CA 90603. 
County: Los Angeles.  Almndtree 
LLC, 10613 Woodstead Ave., 
Whittier CA 90603. State of Orga-
nization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Jeremiah Choi, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
05/31/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024118026. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Joe’s Coin Laundry El Monte; 
Joe’s Coin Laundry Covina, Joe’s 
Coin Laundry, 17026 E. Cypress St 
Suites A and C, Covina CA 91722. 
County: Los Angeles. JCL Services, 
LLC, 1436 Paloma St., Pasadena 
CA 91104. State of Organization: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a limited liability compa-
ny. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 02/2014. Signed: 
Catherine Lopez, managing mem-
ber. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/31/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024118130. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Simpletrust Solutions LLC, 
Venerari Studios LLC, 1166 1/2 
N Sierra Bonita Ave, Pasadena 
CA 91104. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 202460618163. Venerari 
Industries LLC, 1166 1/2 N Sierra 
Bonita Ave, Pasadena CA 91104. 
State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 01/2024. Signed: Mickey Wong, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/31/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024119051. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Noho Arena, 3800 Barham Blvd 
Ste 309, Los Angeles CA 90068. 
County: Los Angeles. Rashad Ali-
yev, 3800 Barham Blvd Ste 309, 
Los Angeles CA 90068; Sarvat 
Maharramli, 3800 Barham Blvd Ste 
309, Los Angeles CA 90068. Rusan 
Gasimov, 3800 Barham Blvd Ste 
309, Los Angeles CA 90068; Zaur 
Ismayilov, 3800 Barham Blvd Ste 
309, Los Angeles CA 90068. This 
business is conducted by: a gen-
eral partnership. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Rashad Aliyev, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/03/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024119292. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Stoopid T-Shirt, Stoopid Tees, 7237 
Corbin Ave, Winnetka CA 91306. 
County: Los Angeles. Jorge Beni-
tez, 19918 Hatton St, Winnetka CA 
91306. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Jorge Benitez, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/03/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 

state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024119355. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: ÆON, TWO IS PRIME, 12439 
Magnolia Blvd Suite 100, Valley 
Village CA 91607-2450. County: Los 
Angeles. Magnafilm, Inc., 12439 
Magnolia Blvd Suite 100, Valley 
Village CA 91607-2450. State of 
Incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Meir 
Sharony, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/03/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024119617. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: PANWHOLESALES, 14548 
Nordhoff St Unit 311, Panorama St 
Unit 311, Panorama City CA 91402. 
County: Los Angeles. Daniel Thanh 
Huynh, 14548 Nordhoff St Unit 311, 
Panorama St Unit 311, Panora-
ma City CA 91402. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Daniel 
Thanh Huynh , owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/04/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024119854. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Pickle N Tequila, 12217 Texas Ave 
Apt 302, Los Angeles CA 90025. 
County: Los Angeles. Camille Me-
jia, 12217 Texas Ave Apt 302, Los 
Angeles CA 90025. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 04/2024. Signed: Camille 
Mejia, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/04/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 

federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024120797. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Mommy’s Domestic Agency, 23708 
Kittridge St., West Hills CA 91307. 
County: Los Angeles. Andrea Pe-
pay, 23708 Kittridge St., West Hills 
CA 91307. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2024. Signed: Andrea Pe-
pay, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024120851. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Celebrate & Cheer, Celebrate & 
Cheer Party Decor & More, 16415 
Colima Rd, Hacienda Heights CA 
91745. County: Los Angeles. Ma-
ria Del Carmen Ramirez, 435 La 
Seda Rd, La Puente CA 91744. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Maria Del Carmen Ramirez, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/05/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/08/2024, 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024 and 06/29/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 North Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Alexia Marie Canales, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 08/30/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86, Room 836

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Alexia 
Marie Canales. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Alexia Marie Canales to Alexia 
Marie Van Ryn

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 

granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: June 6, 2024
Curtis A Kin
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP00
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 North Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of Hec-
tor Orlando Melendes Jr., an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 07/19/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86, Room 836

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Hector 
Orlando Melendes Jr.. And a pe-
tition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of 

this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Hector Orlando Melendes 
Jr. to Hector Orlando Esparza

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 6, 2024
Curtis A Kin, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP01446
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Michael Ware Winblood, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 08/02/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following per-

Neil Fletcher
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son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Michael 

Ware Winblood. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 

filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from Mi-
chael Ware Winblood to Michael 

Ware Hollingsworth

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: June 7, 2024
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SMCP00293
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition of Yun 
Ji Kim, an adult over the age of 

18 years.

​Date: 08/16/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Yun Ji 
Kim. And a petition for change of 
names having been duly filed with 
the clerk of this Court, and it ap-

pearing from said petition that said 
petitioner(s) desire to have their 

name changed from Yun Ji Kim to 
Yun Ji Bertken

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 29, 2024
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SMCP00268
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

425 Penfield Ave.
Chatsworth CA 91311

In the Matter of the Petition of Sar-
ah Megan Vogt, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 07/26/2024. Time: 08.30am 
Dept. F51

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Sarah Megan Vogt. And a petition 
for change of names having been 

duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 

petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Sarah Megan Vogt to Ocean 

Nayeh

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: May 24, 2024
Andrew E Cooper, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24CHCP00198
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024093717. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Keene Studio, 4930 Balboa Blvd 
#260633, Encino CA 91426. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Tobias Keene, 
4930 Balboa Blvd #260633, Encino 
CA 91426. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Tobias Keene, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/01/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 202407784. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Petros Express, 10332 Florali-
ta Ave, Sunland CA 91040. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Artin Petrosian, 
10332 Floralita Ave, Sunland CA 
91040. This business is conducted 

by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Artin Petrosian, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 05/06/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024099893. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Renovaid, 22843 Ventura Blvd, 
Woodland Hills CA 91364. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Toraj Ighani, 99 
Reading St, Fillmore CA 93015. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Toraj Ighani, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 05/08/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024111227. Current file: 
2021023025. The following person 
has abandoned the use of the fic-
titious business name: Stunt Play-
ers Directory, 11306 Moorpark St., 
#4, North Hollywood CA 91602. 
County: Los Angeles. Hunter 
Crowder, 11306 Moorpark St., #4, 
North Hollywood CA 91602. The 
fictitious business name referred 
to above was filed on: 01/28/2021, 
in the County of Los Angeles. This 
business is conducted by: an indi-
vidual. Signed: Hunter Crowder, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/22/2024. 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024111228. Current file: 
2020184771. The following person 
has abandoned the use of the fic-
titious business name: Stunt Play-
ers Directory, 11306 Moorpark St., 
#4, North Hollywood CA 91602. 
County: Los Angeles. Hunter 
Crowder, 11306 Moorpark St., #4, 
North Hollywood CA 91602. The 
fictitious business name referred 
to above was filed on: 11/10/2020, 
in the County of Los Angeles. This 
business is conducted by: an indi-
vidual. Signed: Hunter Crowder, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/22/2024. 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024113290. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Training With Mili, 1135 Lundy Dr, 
Simi Valley CA 93065. County: Los 
Angeles. Milagros Mercedes Ro-
jas, 1135 Lundy Dr, Simi Valley CA 
93065. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Milagros Mercedes Rojas, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/24/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024115721. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
V.Y. Settings, 608 S Hill St Suite 
601, Los Angeles CA 90014. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Vartan Yessayan, 
608 S Hill St Suite 601, Los Ange-
les CA 90014. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Vartan Yessayan, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 05/29/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024120955. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Kamran Men, 5033 Llano Dr., 
Woodland Hills CA 91364. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Elaheh Sabeti, 
5033 Llano Dr., Woodland Hills 
CA 91364. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Elaheh Sabeti, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024120997. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Dan Finishing Painting And Car-
pentry, 6918 Jumilla Ave, Winnetka 

CA 91306. County: Los Angeles. 
Danesh Jazbani, 6918 Jumilla Ave, 
Winnetka CA 91306. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 05/2024 Signed: Danesh 
Jazbani, owner. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/05/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024121068. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Tachavirat Real Estate, 15823 
Dodrill Dr, Hacienda Heights CA 
91745. County: Los Angeles. 
Shaw Tachavirat, 15823 Dodrill 
Dr, Hacienda Heights CA 91745. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 02/2024 
Signed: Shaw Tachavirat, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 06/05/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024121080. Current file: 
2022009450. The following person 
has abandoned the use of the fic-
titious business name: Enchanted 
Synergy, 2601 E Victoria St 283, 
Rancho Dominguez. Georgina 
Spencer, 2601 E Victoria St 283, 
Rancho Dominguez, CA 90220. 
Rochelle Kidd, 10821 S St Andrews 
Pl, Los Angeles CA 900047. The 
fictitious business name referred 
to above was filed on: 01/13/2022, 
in the County of Los Angeles. 
This business is conducted by: 
a general partnership. Signed: 
Georgina Spencer, general part-
ner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/05/2024. 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024121125. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Enchanted Synergy, 2601 E Victo-
ria St #283, Compton CA 90220. 
County: Los Angeles. Georgina 
Spencer, 2601 E Victoria St #283, 
Compton, CA 90220 This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 06/2024. Signed: Geor-
gina Spencer, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 

statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/05/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024121461. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Sisi Business Solutions, 3820 
Valley Blvd #A, Walnut CA 91789. 
County: Los Angeles. HIS Builders, 
Inc., 20306 Elkwood Road, Walnut 
CA 91789. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2024. Signed: Jong Soo 
Jung, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024121641. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Amara Asian Mart; Amara Myanmar 
Mart, 662 Fairview Ave, Arcadia 
CA 91007. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 202461510212. Amara 
Myanmar LLC, 662 Fairview Ave, 
Arcadia CA 91007. State of orga-
nization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Kyaw Soe Min, Member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 06/06/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024121662. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Mostra International, 535 S Curson 
Avenue 6L, Los Angeles CA 90036. 
County: Los Angeles. Lauren Lyn-
ley, 535 S Curson Avenue 6L, Los 
Angeles CA 90036. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 05/2024. Signed: Lau-
ren Lynley, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 

Neil Fletcher
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Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/06/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024121688. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Redondo Beach Movers Com-
pany, 811 N Catalina Ave Suite 
2018B, Redondo Beach CA 90277. 
County: Los Angeles. Adolat Fay-
zullaeva, 811 N Catalina Ave Suite 
2018B, Redondo Beach CA 90277. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Adolat Fayzullaeva, own-
er. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 06/06/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024121762. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: New Steel, 1535 Potrero Ave, 
South El Monte CA 91733. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: C3841954. LA 
Steel Fabricators Inc. 1535 Potre-
ro Ave, South El Monte CA 91733. 
State of incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Victor Hsieh, Secretary. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 06/06/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024121797. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Spence Collective, 6304 W 78th 
Street, Los Angeles CA 90045. 
County: Los Angeles. Decadent 
World Inc., 6304 W 78th Street, Los 
Angeles CA 90045. State of incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2024. Signed: 
Emily Spence, CFO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 

Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/06/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024122094. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Modern Potters, 1308 E. Colorado 
Blvd. #3270, Pasadena CA 91106. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
202462216204. AM Ecom LLC, 355 
S Madison Ave #216, Pasadena CA 
91101.  State of organization: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conduct-
ed by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Alisha 
Bordsen, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/06/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024122110. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
AV Towing And Transport, 6740 En-
sign Ave AV Towing and Transport, 
North Hollywood CA 91606. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 6254959. 
AV Towing and Transport, 6740 
Ensign Ave, North Hollywood CA 
91606. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Armen Simonyan, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 06/06/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024122179. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
LA Cantina Bonita, 6123 W Avenue 
K-2, Lancaster CA 93536. County: 
Los Angeles. Sofia Wong, 6123 W 
Avenue K-2, Lancaster CA 93536. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Sofia Wong, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 

the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/06/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024122202. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Vita Skin, 9955 Tecum Rd Unit 
9955, Downey CA 90240. County: 
Los Angeles. Jessica Marquez, 
9955 Tecum Rd Unit 9955, Downey 
CA 90240. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Jessica Marquez, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/06/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024122215. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Oasis Nursing Services, 16444 
Paramount Blvd 300, Paramount 
CA 90723. County: Los Angeles. 
Chukwuemeka Ofoha, 16444 Par-
amount Blvd 300, Paramount CA 
90723; Chinoso Alinnor, 16444 
Paramount Blvd 300, Paramount 
CA 90723. This business is con-
ducted by: a general partnership. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2004. Signed: 
Chukwuemeka Ofoha, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/06/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024122371. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Institute For Integrative Heal-
ology, 3101 Ocean Park Blvd Ste 
100 #488, Santa Monica CA 90405. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
6252725. Justin Laube MD & Thais 
Salles Araujo MD, PC, 3101 Ocean 
Park Blvd Ste 100 #488, Santa 
Monica CA 90405. State of incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 06/2004. Signed: Thais 
Salles Araujo, CEO. Registrant(s) 

declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/06/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024122441. Current file: 
2022170901. The following per-
son has abandoned the use of the 
fictitious business name: Laundry 
Lavanderia, 133 S Mednik Ave, 
Los Angeles CA 90022. Silly Pants 
Laundry, Inc., 4216 Chase Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90066. County: Los An-
geles. The fictitious business name 
referred to above was filed on: 
08/01/2022, in the County of Los 
Angeles. This business is conduct-
ed by: a corporation. Signed: Brent 
O. Russell, Secretary. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/06/2024. Published: 06/15/2024, 
06/22/2024, 06/29/2024 and 
07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024122535. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Brug’s; Brug’s Car Care, 23540 
Balmoral Ln, West Hills CA 91307. 
County: Los Angeles. VDB Con-
glomerate LLC, 23540 Balmoral 
Ln, West Hills CA 91307. State of 
organization: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a limited li-
ability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 03/2024. 
Signed: Jack Van Dere Brug, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/07/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024122657. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Limitless Innovative, 12629 Riv-
erside Dr Apt. 435, Valley Village 
CA 91607. County: Los Angeles. 
United Digital Media Solutions Inc., 
12629 Riverside Dr Apt. 435, Valley 
Village CA 91607. State of incorpo-
ration: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Amirhossein 
Farrohi, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/07/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 

that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024122893. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Round The Clock Care, 1132 16th 
St Unit 4, Santa Monica CA 90403. 
County: Los Angeles. Alces LLC, 
1132 16th St Unit 4, Santa Monica 
CA 90403. State of organization: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a limited liability compa-
ny. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names list-
ed herein on: 05/2024. Signed: Cesi 
Wee, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/07/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024123034. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Simply Unique Goods, 440 N Bar-
ranca Ave #1043, Covina CA 91723. 
County: Los Angeles. Scrubjay 
Ventures LLC, 440 N Barranca Ave 
#1043, Covina CA 91723. State of 
organization: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a limited li-
ability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Roxanne Swasey, manag-
ing member. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/07/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024123187. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Galdamez Contracting, 6424 
Dempsey Ave, Van Nuys CA 91406. 
County: Los Angeles. Jose Galda-
mez, 6424 Dempsey Ave, Van Nuys 
CA 91406. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2024. Signed: Jose Galda-
mez, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/07/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 

fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024123193. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Cellini, 606 S Hill St Ste 1204, Los 
Angeles CA 90004. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 6155071. Cellini 
International Corp, 606 S Hill St, 
Los Angeles CA 90004. State of 
incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Ron-
ny Alejandro Munoz Hernandez, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/07/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024123790. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Deb And Suzy Do Pilates, 22025 
Ventura Blvd., Suite 101, Woodland 
Hills CA 91364. County: Los Ange-
les. AI#ON: 202360018402. AB And 
Flow Pilates LLC, 22025 Ventura 
Blvd., Suite 101, Woodland Hills CA 
91364. State of organization: Cali-
fornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Deborah 
Schector, manager. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/10/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024124538. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Wandercorp Travel, 4745 Sawtelle 
Blvd, Culver City CA 90230. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Daria Semiakina, 
4745 Sawtelle Blvd, Culver City CA 
90230. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Daria Semiakina, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 06/10/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
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fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024124684. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Cell Rejuvenation Center of 
Los Angeles; Four Trees Resto-
ration Therapy, 2975 Wilshire Blvd. 
Suite 241, Los Angeles CA 90010. 
County: Los Angeles. Four Trees 
Restoration Therapy, 2975 Wilshire 
Blvd. Suite 241, Los Angeles CA 
90010. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 04/2023. 
Signed: Hanna Ae Sook Cho, Sec-
retary. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/10/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024124692. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Forget Me Not Scrunchies, 755 N 
Sweetzer Ave Apt 105, Los Ange-
les CA 90069. County: Los Ange-
les. Splodeo Rodeo LLC, 755 N 
Sweetzer Ave Apt 105, Los Angeles 
CA 90069. State of organization: 

California. This business is con-
ducted by: a limited liability compa-
ny. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names list-
ed herein on: n/a. Signed: Michael 
Nicholas, Member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/11/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024124752. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Bixby Endodontics; Bixby Endo, 
612 E. Carson St, Long Beach 
CA 90807. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 5610723. Nedjat-Haiem 
Dental Corporation, 200 North 
Swall Dr #504, Beverly Hills CA 
90211. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Michael Nedjat-Haiem, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/11/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 

of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024124813. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Pele, Pele Studio, 1951 Selby 
Ave Unit 4, Los Angeles CA 90025. 
County: Los Angeles. Hiroyuki Ono, 
1951 Selby Ave Unit 4, Los Angeles 
CA 90025. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 05/2024. Signed: Hiroyuki Ono, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/11/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024124836. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: New Advantage Consulting, 
2704 W Carson Street, Torrance 
CA 90503. County: Los Angeles. 
Anwer A. Merchant, 2704 W Car-
son Street, Torrance CA 90503. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 

under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Anwer A. Merchant, own-
er. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 06/11/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024125031. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Zap That Tatt, 27420 Tourney 
Rd Ste 150, Valencia CA 91355. 
County: Los Angeles. Discovery 
Skinworks Inc, 27420 Tourney Rd 
Ste 150, Valencia CA 91355. State 
of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a cor-
poration. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Paul Horowitz, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/11/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 

Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024125648. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
JRL Realty, 1110 N. Virgil Ave. PMB 
90281, Los Angeles CA 90029. 
County: Los Angeles. Alba Luna, 
1110 N. Virgil Ave. PMB 90281, Los 
Angeles CA 90029. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Alba Luna, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/11/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024125977. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Jacqueline Knemeyer Art, 8726 
S. Sepulveda Blvd Suite D2331, 
Los Angeles CA 90045. County: 
Los Angeles. Jacqueline Knemey-
er, 8726 S. Sepulveda Blvd Suite 
D2331, Los Angeles CA 90045. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Jacqueline Knemeyer, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 

all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/12/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024126229. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Àrmonia IFS and EMDR Therapy, 
3031 N San Fernando Blvd Suite 
100, Burbank CA 91504. County: 
Los Angeles. Jennifer Leon Salinas, 
1816 W 42nd St, Los Angeles CA 
90062. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Jennifer Leon Salinas, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/12/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 06/15/2024, 06/22/2024, 
06/29/2024 and 07/06/2024

Aging in Place?
Consider an AmeriGlide stair lift 
to keep you safe on your stairs.

Benefits of an AmeriGlide stair lift:

Eliminate the risk of falls. 

Enjoy a comfortable ride up  
and down all of your home.

Enjoy comfortable, safe  
and easy access to all of 
your home.

More affordable than 
options such as moving.

Custom fit to 
your staircase

Indoor and  
Outdoor options

Fast delivery 
and installation

SAVE $200

1-844-638-6682

CALL NOW TO Call today to get your FREE, 
no obligation quote  
in minutes!ON ANY STAIR LIFT!

Why you need dental insurance in retirement.

Medicare doesn’t pay for dental care.1

As good as Medicare is, it was never meant to cover 
everything. If you want protection, you need to purchase 
individual insurance.

Early detection can prevent small 
problems from becoming expensive ones.
The best way to avoid large dental bills is preventive 
care. Experts recommend checkups twice a year. 

Previous dental work can wear out.
Your odds of having a dental problem only go up as you age.2

Treatment is expensive — especially the 
services people over 50 often need.
Unexpected bills, like $190 for a filling, or $1,213 for a crown3

can be a real burden, especially if you’re on a fixed income.

Call for a FREE Information Kit!

1-855-537-2305
Dental50Plus.health/british

Product/features not available in all states. Contact us for complete details about this insurance solicitation. To fi nd a network provider, 
go to physiciansmutual.com/fi nd-dentist. This specifi c offer not available in CO, LA, NV, NY – call 1-800-969-4781 or respond for a similar 
offer in your state. Certifi cate C254/B465, C250A/B438 (ID: C254ID; PA: C254PA); Insurance Policy P154/B469, P150/B439 (GA: P154GA; NY: 
P154NY; OK: P154OK; TN: P154TN).
6247-0324

DENTAL Insurance
from Physicians Mutual Insurance Company

1 “Medicare & You,” Centers for Medicare & Medicaid Services, 2024. 2 “Aging changes in teeth and gums”, medlineplus.gov, 4/17/2022. 3 American 
Dental Association, Health Policy Institute, 2020 Survey of Dental Fees, Copyright 2020, American Dental Association.

When you’re 
comparing plans ...

 Look for coverage that 
helps pay for major services. 

 Look for coverage 
with no deductibles.  

 Shop for coverage 
with no annual maximum 
on cash benefits. 

Simply put — without 
dental insurance, there 
may be an important 
gap in your healthcare 
coverage.
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KANE:
cont. from back page

TO THE SURPRISE of 
many outsiders, Man-
chester United have de-
cided to retain the ser-
vices of Erik ten Hag for 
the forthcoming season.
	 But the Dutchman’s 
role at the club will be 
tweaked, as he moves  to 
the position of the club’s 
head coach rather than 
manager, while his influ-
ence in terms of player 
recruitment will be di-
luted.
	 But ultimately, the 
Dutchman is still in 
charge of United. He 
has got what he wanted 
– even if his players are 
shocked by the club’s 
decision to keep him.
	 How he did it appears 
to be one of his greatest 
achievements since he 

arrived at Old Trafford 
in 2022.
	 United finished eighth 
in the Premier League, 
with a negative goal 
difference, and crashed 
out of the Champions 
League in the group 
stages.
	 But it appears Ten Hag 
struck gold when he got 
his hands on some sil-
verware in United’s final 
game of an otherwise 
difficult season, beating 
arch rivals Manchester 
City in the FA Cup final.
	 Co-owner Sir Jim Rat-
cliffe, who now runs all 
football operations at 
United, looked on im-
pressed as Ten Hag out-
thought Pep Guardiola 
to guide his team to vic-
tory at Wembley.

	 Ratcliffe also regard-
ed United’s thrilling 
victory against Jurgen 
Klopp’s Liverpool in the 
quarter-finals as proof 
that Ten Hag is capable 
of matching or bettering 
the best.
	 Now the challenge 
is to do this on a more 
consistent basis – and he 
will have to do so with 
some signings that he 
will not have chosen.
	 Ten Hag has now 
won two trophies in his 
first two seasons at Old 
Trafford. Ratcliffe made 
it clear when he spoke 
to the media in London 
earlier this year that 
United will continue to 
be judged on silverware.
	 Crippling injuries and 
off-field issues weak-

that in the weeks to 
come.”
	 That is at the heart of 
the issue. England have 
a younger squad with 
fewer caps and less 
tournament know-how. 
When you ditch players 
such as Maguire and 
Grealish it puts more 
focus on Marc Guehi, 
Phil Foden, Gordon, 
Palmer and others to 
step up. But Kane add-
ed: “I think we have 
more than enough ex-
perience, especially a 
lot of players who have 
played in two or three 
tournaments now.
	 “There are always 
going to be new play-
ers who are in their first 
tournament. 
	 “It is about making 
sure they feel comfort-
able and they feel at ease 
when they are training, 
or on the pitch, just to 
be themselves. We have 
more than enough. 
	 “The lads who have 
played in a lot of tour-
naments have to step 

ened Ten Hag’s hand 
last season but there is 
no escaping the fact that 
he has survived because 
certain others could not 
be persuaded to replace 
him.
	 Gareth Southgate 
remains Ratcliffe’s ul-
timate choice, but the 
England manager is 
masterminding the 
Three Lions’ assault on 

Euro 2024 and will wait 
until the end of the sum-
mer before deciding his 
next move.
	 Ratcliffe also spoke 
to Thomas Tuchel but 
the German told him he 
was not interested, while 
Mauricio Pochettino dis-
tanced himself from the 
job.
	 So after two weeks of 
talks with right-hand 

man Sir Dave Brailsford, 
technical director Jason 
Wilcox and incoming 
CEO Omar Berrada, Rat-
cliffe chose to stick in-
stead of twist.
	 The 54-year-old 
Dutchman will have to 
rebuild his trust in his 
superiors, knowing a 
poor start to next season 
will leave him battling to 
save his job again.

used by 30 top Euro-
pean clubs and takes 
performance, age and 
contract length into ac-
count. More than 240,000 
players in more than 250 
leagues have been val-
ued.
	 Although Kylian 
Mbappe is the world’s 
most valuable player at 
£130m after completing 
his move to Real Madrid, 
France’s squad value, of 
£900m, is well behind 
England. There are three 
other stars figuring at the 
Euros in the world’s top 
10 most valuable play-
ers – Germany pair Ja-
mal Musiala (£99m) and 
Kai Havertz (£77m) and 
France’s Eduardo Cama-
vinga (£82m).
	 Paul Macdonald, 
co-founder of Football-
Transfers, who played a 
key role in developing 
the ETV algorithm, said: 
“With UEFA and respec-
tive leagues clamping 
down on overspending, 
we are witnessing a mar-
ket where teams will be 

up and be there for the 
ones who need a bit of 
help.”
	 Kane started England’s 
defeat by Iceland, missed 
a sitter and was substi-
tuted. The former Totten-
ham star only featured 
for half an hour in the 
other warm-up friendly 
with Bosnia and Herze-
govina.
	 He missed the end of 
the season with Bayern 
because of a back inju-
ry but he now feels fit, 
sharp and ready to go.
	 Kane said: “I am all 
good. The plan was for 
me to play 60 minutes.
	 “It has been a real-
ly good camp for me 
in that sense. Getting a 
good week of training, 
30 minutes, a few more 
days of training and then 
60 minutes. I feel really 
prepared and in a good 
place. 
	 “It would have been 
nice if I had scored with 
that finish against Ice-
land but that is the way 
it goes. Overall it has 
been a good camp for my 
fitness – we have a nice 
build-up now into the 
business end.”

Squad:
cont. from back page

more careful with their 
budgets. 
	 “What a selling team 
values a player at varies 
wildly from what their 
actual market value – 
based on the parameters 
set within our algorithm 
– concludes that they are 
worth. Their ETV is rela-
tive to the ability, poten-
tial and achievements of 
other players in the algo-
rithm, and in this case, 
with the likes of Mbappe 
and Bellingham leading 
the way, the best will al-
ways rise to the top.”
	 Arsenal’s Declan Rice 
– signed from West Ham 
for £105m last summer 
– was valued at £68.9m, 
which is certain to create 
debate among Gunners 
fans, who created chants 
last season about how 
they got a bargain.
	 Kobbie Mainoo’s value 
is certain to rocket from 
£19.7m after his break-
through season at Man-
chester United. 
	 The figures show En-
gland’s future is bright. 
But now Southgate must 
get the best out of his 
squad and deliver Euros 
success.

Ten Hag keeps his job...
but gets a demotion

n In wake of FA Cup victory, Dutchman’s new title will be 
head coach with less input into player recruitment

AHEAD OF Friday’s 
opening Euro 2024 match 
Scotland boss Steve 
Clarke was urging his 
players not to get dis-
tracted by the “enormi-
ty” of the game at Alli-
anz Arena in Munich.
	 The match took place 
after the BW went to 
press.
	 “It’s the opening game 
of a four-team section, 
three matches, we know 
what we have to do to 
qualify and that’s all we 
focus on,” the head coach 
said this week.
	 “Everyone is fully fit, 
flying, desperate to be se-
lected and ready to go.
	 “The enormity of the 
opener is a bit of a side-
show and hopefully we 
don’t get too caught up in 
that.
	 “It’s a difficult game. 
One of the mantras I’ve 
had is respect everyone 
and fear no one.
	 “We know they’re a 
good team but hopefully 
we can show everyone 
we’re a good team as 
well.”

	 “We don’t want any re-
grets,” said captain Andy 
Robertson with a stern 
look on his face. “We’re 
ready, excited, all eyes 
are on us and it’s time to 
show what we can do.”
	 “We believe we can do 
it.”	
	 Robertson has good 
memories of this stadi-
um and a moral to draw 
on, if he so desires. In 
the spring of 2019 his 
club drew 0-0 at home 
to Bayern Munich in the 
knockouts of the Cham-
pions League. Not a lot 
of people gave Liverpool 
a chance of winning the 
return leg then, just as 
virtually nobody gives 
Scotland a chance of win-
ning here now, but they 
did; they won 3-1.
	 He smiled at the mem-
ory of it. Jurgen Klopp, 
he said, would be at the 
game on Friday. He told 
Robertson in an exchange 
of texts a week ago.
	 “Hopefully he’ll enjoy 
his night, but not that 
much,” Robertson said of 
his old manager.

Scotland ‘fully fit and 
flying..and ready to go”

The Cup that cheers: Erik Ten Hag with his job-saving trophy last month
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COFFEE SHOPPE Open Daily 10am-4pm
Restaurant Open Mon-Thurs 10.30am • Fri-Sun at 10am (earlier for soccer games)

www.yeoldekingshead.com

Sat. 6/15
9am Spain vs Croatia
Noon: Italy vs Albania
Sun. 6/16
9am Slovenia vs Denmark
Noon: Serbia vs England
Mon. 6/17
9am: Belgium vs Slovakia
Noon Austria vs France
Tues. 6/18
9am: Turkey vs Georgia
Noon: Portugal vs Czech Rep

Wed. 6/19
9am Germany vs Hungary
noon Scotland vs Switzerland
Thurs 6/20
9am: Denmark vs England
Noon Spain vs Italy
Fri 6/21
9am: Poland vs Austria
Noon: Netherlands vs France
Sat. 6/22
9am Turkey v Portugal
Noon Belgium vs Romania

PUB & RESTAURANT:
116 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 451-1402
Happy Hour Mon-Fri. 4-7

(food specials)
SHOPPE:

132 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 394-8765
Open 10am-6pm

Thurs/Fri/Sun: 10am-7pm
Sat: 10am-8pm

cont. on page 19, col 3

Join us for the Euro 2024 Finals!  
June 14 - July 14

SKIPPER Harry Kane 
has promised that En-
gland will be ready for 
the Euros.
	 Kane insisted no one 
should be writing off 
their chances, because 
they have enough “fan-
tastic” players to light up 
the tournament.
	 England are one of the 
favourites, along with 
France, Germany and 
Portugal, but Gareth 
Southgate’s men were 
given a brutal reality 
check by Iceland on Fri-
day night.
	 The final warm-up 
friendly at Wembley was 
supposed to be a mo-
rale-boosting send-off.
	 However, it turned 
into a nightmare with the 
1-0 defeat raising doubts 
about England’s defend-
ing and whether South-
gate can find the right 
balance in midfield.

	 The Three Lions have 
less than a week to pre-
pare for the Group C 
opener with Serbia on 
Sunday and alarm bells 
have started to ring. 
	 Luke Shaw has just re-
turned to training while 
Jude Bellingham report-
ed this weekend after his 
Champions League hero-
ics.
	 Southgate took a big 
decision by axing Jack 
Grealish and Harry Ma-
guire from his squad to 
give a new generation 
their chance, and it raises 
questions over whether 
they have enough experi-
ence.
	 But Kane believes 
they still have enough 
strength in depth, espe-
cially with youngsters 
such as Cole Palmer, be-
low, and Anthony Gor-
don having earned their 
places.

	 The Bayern Munich 
striker said: “Everyone 
has proven they deserve 
to be here. We go away 
and everyone should be 
proud they are represent-
ing England at a major 
tournament.
	 “Everyone brings 
something different to 
the team and we are go-
ing to need all 26 players 
if we are going to be suc-
cessful. That is the mes-
sage – that we are togeth-
er.
	 “There are a lot of fan-
tastic players. Players 
who have had really, re-
ally good seasons. 
	 “You can’t ignore that. 
Players at the top of their 
game, on high form, de-
serve to be playing for 
their country. 
	 “Being England man-
ager is not easy – you 
have a lot of tough deci-
sions, a lot of players to 

EURO 2024 opens this 
weekend and as usual 
the British press have 
worked themselves 
into a lather hyping up 
the chances of Gareth 
Southgate’s England 
team.
	 Seemingly every as-
pect of the team’s prepa-
ration for the tournament 
has been covered in mi-
croscopic detail, from 
their luxury base in the 
German countryside, to 
their individually cus-
tomized diet, right down 
to the music each player 
listens to in his down-
time.
	 But of course England 
are not the only repre-
sentatives of the home 
nation in attendance - 
Steve Clarke’s Scotland 
are also hoping to make a 
good fist of their first ap-
pearance in a major tour-
nament in more years 
than most Scots care to 
remember.

pick from. You can only 
choose 26. 
“We have done that and I 
think we have a fantastic 

squad. 
	 “But, as always, it is 
about how you handle 
the games and the tour-

nament, how you handle 
the pressure. We are go-
ing to have to deal with 

	 But whether they come 
home in glory, ignominy, 
or something in between, 
at least England lead 
their rivals in one depart-
ment - the value of their 
squad. The 26-man party 
are worth a staggering 
£1.06billion, with four 
players valued at more 
than €100million (£84m).
	 Real Madrid’s Jude 
Bellingham is the most 
expensive at nearly 
£120m while Phil Foden, 
Harry Kane and Bukayo 
Saka also all feature in 
the global top 10.
	 It shows why South-
gate is under pressure to 
deliver with his star-stud-
ded Three Lions. The 
figures are provided by 
ETV (Estimated Transfer 
Value), a market-lead-
ing transfer valuation 
algorithm developed by 
Dutch data company 
SciSports.
	 The system is already 

KANE: we’re ready to make history
n England skipper issues rallying cry 

as Euro 2024 kicks off in Germany

England have ‘a lot of fantastic players’ said Harry Kane on Thursday

England’s billion dollar squad

cont. on page 19, col 1


