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UPBEAT MESSAGE: Sir Keir and Lady Victoria Starmer in Liverpool this week

Britain can become a country of pride, wealth and stability 
if the public accepts a series of difficult “trade-offs”, rejects 
nimbyism and sees through the Conservatives’ populist 
“lies”, Keir Starmer has said.
	 In his first Labour con-
ference  speech as prime 
minister, he urged the 
public to keep faith amid 
tough and sometimes 
unpopular choices made 
by the government, tell-
ing them he understood 
their impatience for real 
change.
	 Those difficult deci-
sions include building 
new prisons so that justice 
could be served, over-
ground pylons to provide 
cheaper electricity, and 
accepting that a serious 
system to tackle irregular 
migration would also in-
clude accepting some asy-
lum seekers.
	 Starmer attempted to 
draw a line under a week 
of bruising rows over do-
nations, telling delegates 
he would not be distract-
ed by noisy criticism of his 
government which he re-
garded as “mere glitter on 
a shirt cuff”, a reference 
to a protest during last 
year’s speech.
	 The prime minister left 
the gathering in Liverpool 
early to travel to New 
York on Tuesday for the 
UN general assembly, 

with senior aides pressing 
for meetings with the US 
presidential candidates 
Kamala Harris and Don-
ald Trump.
	 But aides said that he 
had now started to ad-
dress concerns, some of 
them internal, that he had 
been too gloomy since 
taking office while trying 
to “level with” the public 
about the economic in-
heritance. They believe 
that he is now begin-
ning to explain why the 
tough choices in front of 
him – including tax ris-
es and public spending 
cuts, which are expected 
in next month’s budget – 
will be worth it.
	 “People ask us now, as 
we seek patience in pur-
suit of national renewal: 
‘What will we get to show 
for it?’ I understand that. 
After all, what they are 
used to is a lie. An act, a 
charade, a performance,” 
he told party delegates.
	 “You can call it popu-
lism – many people do. 
But I prefer to call it the 
politics of easy answers. 
Because at its core that’s 
what it is. A deliberate 

refusal to countenance 
tough decisions because 
the political pain is just 
too much to bear.”
	 “The time is long over-
due for politicians to level 
with you about the trade-
offs this country faces. Be-
cause if the last few years 
have shown us anything, 
it’s that if you bury your 
head because things are 
difficult, your country 
goes backwards.”

‘stronger than bricks’
	 In a speech that used the 
word “Britain” 21 times, 
Starmer condemned the 
summer’s rioting, draw-
ing loud applause when 
he said the UK unequiv-
ocally rejected those in-
volved in violent thug-
gery and “vile” racism.
	 “To those who say the 
only way to love your 
country is to hate your 
neighbour, because they 
look different, I say not 
only do we reject you, we 
know that you will never 
win,” he said.
	 “Because the British val-
ues we stand for, not just 
the rule of law, but a love 
for this country and our 

neighbours, the respect 
for difference under the 
same flag, that is stronger 
than bricks and you know 
that.”
	 In a policy-light speech, 
Starmer announced that 
veterans, young care leav-
ers and victims of domes-
tic abuse would be given 
a “guaranteed roof over 
their head”.	
All three groups will be 
exempt from local resi-
dency tests, which most 
councils currently have 
in place to determine 
who can qualify for social 
housing.
	 In a message particular-
ly significant in Liverpool, 
he confirmed that the 
government would bring 

forward a Hillsborough 
law by the time of the next 
anniversary of the 1989 
football stadium disaster 
in April.
	 And he confirmed that 
GB Energy, the new pub-
licly owned energy com-
pany, would be based 
in Aberdeen, drawing 
months of speculation to 
an end.
	 Starmer’s 54-minute ad-
dress was interrupted by 
a Gaza protester.
	 The prime minister an-
gered some on the left 
of his party when he re-
sponded with a prepared 
line: “This guy has ob-
viously got a pass from 
the 2019 conference,” a 
reference to Labour’s cat-

astrophic election defeat 
under Jeremy Corbyn.
	 However, he also made 
an unfortunate slip-up, 
calling for the return of 
“sausages” from Gaza, 
rather than the Israeli 
hostages taken during 
Hamas’s attack on 7 Oc-
tober last year. He quickly 
corrected his mistake.
	 Starmer said that he 
understood public cyni-
cism in politics and that 
he knew how hard it was 
for the public to hear pol-
iticians asking for more. 
“But deep down, I think 
you also know that our 
county does need a long-
term plan and that we 
can’t turn it back,” he add-
ed.

KEEP THE FAITH!
n Starmer urges unity as he vows to build ‘a new Britain’

n  PM tells Labour ‘he will not con people with false hope’
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News from Britain

Former government 
minister Michael Gove  
(above) is to be the new 
editor of The Specta-
tor, after the magazine 
was bought by hedge 
fund tycoon and GB 
News-backer Sir Paul 
Marshall.
	 He will take on the role 
at the start of October, 
according to Freddie Say-
ers, the magazine’s pub-
lisher.
	 In a post on X, formerly 
Twitter, Mr Sayers, who 
is also the chief executive 
of new owner OQS, add-
ed Mr Gove was “perfect-
ly suited to the role”.
	 Mr Gove, who stepped 
down from Parliament at 
the general election, was 
a journalist before he be-
came a Conservative MP.
	 He will start the job 
after final approval from 

Acoba, the advisory com-
mittee on business ap-
pointments which advis-
es former ministers when 
they take jobs after leav-
ing the government.
	 Mr Gove replaces 
Fraser Nelson, who is 
stepping down “after 
15 incredibly successful 
years”, Mr Sayers said.
	 Mr Nelson will contin-
ue to write for The Spec-
tator and will become as-
sociate editor.
	 In an article published 
on Wednesday, Mr Nel-
son called Mr Gove “the 
clear successor” to re-
place him.
	 “He’s a first-class jour-
nalist who took a detour 
into politics and not (as 
so often happens) the 
other way around,” he 
wrote.
	 “There’s never a good 

time to leave a job like 
mine but, after 15 years 
and a new owner with 
big ambitions, there is an 
obvious time.”
	 Mr Nelson has over-
seen a highly successful 
period for the magazine, 
including the growth of 
its digital product.
	 His decision to step 
down follows Andrew 
Neil’s exit as the maga-
zine’s chairman earlier 
this month.
	 Mr Gove, first elected 
MP for Surrey Heath in 
2005, served in the gov-
ernments of David Cam-
eron, Theresa May, Boris 
Johnson and Rishi Sunak.
	 He takes on his new 
role as editor of the 
right-leaning magazine 
as the Conservative party 
prepares to elect its next 
leader.	

Rachel Reeves has 
promised Britain’s “best 
days lie ahead” as she 
sought to strike a more 
optimistic tone in her 
first speech to the La-
bour Party conference as 
chancellor.
	 Reeves has been ac-
cused of talking the econ-
omy down by warning of 
“tough choices” to deal 
with what she says is a 
worse-than-expected in-
heritance from the Con-
servatives.
	 In her speech, she 
said: “My ambition for 
Britain knows no lim-
its because I can see the 
prize on offer if we make 
the right choices now.”
	 But she faces a back-
lash from the trade 
unions and many La-
bour members over her 
decision to strip winter 
fuel payments from 10 
million pensioners, with 
a conference debate ex-
pected later this week.
	 As Reeves stood up 
to deliver her 25 min-
ute speech, news broke 
that nurses in England 
have  said the govern-
ment’s award of a 5.5% 
pay rise is not enough, in 
an online poll.
	 Then, a few minutes 
into the speech, the chan-
cellor was interrupted 
by a heckler protesting 

about continued arms 
sales to Israel while the 
war with Hamas in Gaza 
continues.
	 A campaign group 
called The Climate Re-
sistance has claimed re-
sponsibility for the pro-
test.
	 As the protester was 
dragged out of the hall, 
the chancellor won a 
standing ovation for say-
ing that “this is a changed 
Labour Party and not a 
party of protest”.
	 She also received 
a rapturous response 
when she promised a 
“war on Tory waste”, 
with the appointment of 
a Covid corruption com-
missioner to help recoup 
£674m of disputed con-
tracts the Conservatives 
had agreed to waive.
	 To loud applause, 
she said: “That money 
belongs in our police, it 
belongs in our health ser-
vice and belongs in our 
schools. Conference, we 
want that money back.”
	 She announced that 
Labour’s promise to set 
up free breakfast clubs 
would be piloted in 750 
primary schools in En-
gland from April, at a 
cost of £7m.
	 This will be followed 
by a national rollout, 
she told the conference, 

describing it as “an in-
vestment in our young 
people, an investment in 
reducing child poverty 
and investment in our 
economy”.
	 Defending her deci-
sion to cut winter fuel 
payments for many 
pensioners, she said: “It 
was made clear to me 
that failure to act swift-
ly could undermine the 
UK’s fiscal position with 
implications for public 
debt, mortgages and pric-
es.
	 “And so, I took action 
to make the in-year sav-
ings necessary.”
	 Looking ahead to her 
first Budget on 30 Oc-
tober, Reeves said there 
would be no increases in 
income tax, national in-
surance or VAT - and “no 
return to austerity”.
	 She said it would be 
a Budget for economic 
growth and investment - 
but gave few clues about 
tax and spending deci-
sion it might contain.
Instead, she spoke of the 
“prize” on offer from 
economic stability and a 
new industrial strategy 
to spread wealth across 
Britain.
	 “Yes, we must deal 
with the Tory legacy and 
that means tough deci-
sions, but I won’t let that 

Chancellor strikes optimistic tone to party faithful
PARTY CONFERENCE: Reeves promises a Budget for growth 

and investment and vows to plug ‘Tory black hole’

RACHEL REEVES: “My ambition for Britain knows no limits”

dim our ambition for Brit-
ain,” she told delegates.
	 “So, it will be a bud-

get with real ambition, a 
budget to fix the founda-
tions, a budget to deliver 

the change that we prom-
ised, a Budget to rebuild 
Britain.”	

Gove named new editor of Spectator
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cont. on page 4, col. 1

British police called on 
Thursday for anyone 
with allegations against 
former Harrods owner 
Mohamed Al Fayed to 
come forward and said 
it would look to prose-
cute others after multi-
ple women accused the 
late billionaire of sexual 
abuse and rape.
	 A BBC documenta-
ry aired last week said 
Al Fayed had  sexually 
abused  female staff at 
his London department 
store Harrods and had 
threatened them if they 
tried to complain. It said 
the company had failed 
to intervene and helped 
to cover up abuse allega-
tions during his owner-
ship from 1985 to 2010.
	 Although Al Fayed 
himself died last year, 
aged 94, London’s Met-
ropolitan Police said it 
would explore whether 
any other individuals 
could be pursued for 
criminal offences.
	 “It is vital that any vic-
tims have a voice and 
are able to report any 
allegations if they have 
not done so before, and 

know that they will be 
taken seriously,” said 
Stephen Clayman, head 
of specialist crime at the 
Metropolitan Police.
	 “We have specialist 
teams to ensure all those 
victims who make con-
tact with us are support-
ed in the best way possi-
ble.”
	 One woman, known 
only as ‘Kate’, told the 
BBC that she was 16 
when she was raped by 
Mohamed Al Fayed said 
the assault “changed the 
course of my life and ca-
reer entirely”.
	 Kate was working at 
Harrods - her first job 
- and she was also sub-
jected to inappropriate 
and “humiliating” ques-
tioning by the billionaire 
and an intrusive medical 
check.
	 “I want people to ful-
ly understand just how 
much of a monster he 
truly was,” Kate said, 
adding that she wanted 
to speak out after seeing 
other women come for-
ward.
	 “It has affected so 
many areas of my life, 

but having to live with 
the deep shame of what 
happened to me so 
young, being paranoid 
at night walking by my-
self, not trusting men in 
any form of even slightly 
vulnerable situation, are 
to name but a few,” she 
said.
	 Kate said “inappro-
priate questions” start-
ed soon after she began 
working for Al Fayed.
	 “He asked me if I had 
a boyfriend and if I had 
been sexually active,” 
she said.
	 “I was 16-years-old 
and a virgin, which he 
discovered.”
	 She said Al Fayed then 
asked to see her and be-
gan discussing the inti-
mate details of her med-
ical and “questioned my 
purity”.
	 She found the conver-
sation “confusing, intru-
sive and humiliating”, 
she said.
	 Al Fayed knew that 
she had a long distance 
to travel to work and of-
fered that she could stay 
at his Park Lane apart-
ment, which she said 

Mohamed Al Fayed died last year at the age of 94

Al Fayed: a scandal deepens, Met 
urges victims to come forward

was sold as another staff 
perk.
	 She said she was 
“scared” but “knew I 
had no option to say no” 
when she was “sum-
moned” to his apart-
ment one night.

	 “He tried to pressure 
me in to having sex with 
him,” she said.
	 “He tried to be charm-
ing and keep things light 
and jokey, but I kept 
saying no and then his 
mood changed and the 

threats started - he was 
angry.
	 “The doors were 
locked and I couldn’t get 
out. He raped me.”
	 Other women have 
come forward to say 

ALL IS FORGIVEN: Mr. Cherry is recuperating in hospital after the attack

A holiday of a lifetime 
in Zambia almost ended 
in tragedy when a hippo 
hit a couple’s canoe and 
flipped them into the 
water, dragging 63-year-
old Roland Cherry into 
the depths before tossing 
him into the air, causing 

major injury.
	 Mr Cherry and wife 
Shirley, from Warwick-
shire, were in the third 
week of their dream trip 
when disaster struck on 
the Kafue River and he 
ended up wedged in the 
animal’s jaws.

	 Quick-thinking by a lo-
cal hospital saved his life, 
said Mr Cherry, who suf-
fered serious leg, abdom-
inal and shoulder injuries.
	 He said he did not hate 
hippos since he was “con-
scious we were in their 

I don’t hate hippos - despite one attacking me

cont. on page 5, col. 1
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A former police officer 
who funded his lavish 
lifestyle by duping thou-
sands of people involved 
with a horse racing bet-
ting syndicate has been 
jailed.
	 Michael Stanley admit-
ted misusing money from 
members of the Layezy 
Racing Syndicate for sev-
eral years before his arrest 
in 2019.
	 Terry Wildey, a retired 
hairdresser from Kent, 
said he and his family 
had put £200,000 into the 
scheme after he encour-
aged his own relatives to 
invest.
	 “He’s a rat isn’t he,” he 
told reporters, after Stan-
ley was sentenced to six 
years’ imprisonment at 
Maidstone Crown Court.
	 “He consciously set 
that up with the sole in-
tention of taking people’s 
money.”

	 About £44m was paid 
into the scheme and an 
estimated £34m was 
withdrawn by members, 
leaving a £10m shortfall 
which remains unac-
counted for.
	 One victim lost nearly 
£500,000, the court heard.
	 The former Kent Po-
lice sergeant, 68,  plead-
ed guilty to running 
the “Ponzi scheme”  in 
March.
	 The court was told the 
syndicate started out with 
family and friends and 
grew to more than 6,000 
members, and had a wait-
ing list of 3,000 people at 
the time it collapsed.
	 It also heard that Stan-
ley, from Walderslade, 
used £4m on personal 
spending, including to 
buy himself a £400,000 
property in Spain, Land 
Rover vehicles amount-
ing to more than £600,000 

Ministry of Defence offi-
cials concluded private-
ly in a 2019 letter that 
allegations to be aired 
in a BBC Panorama on 
alleged SAS war crimes 
were “broadly accurate”.
	 Despite the internal 
warning, the MoD’s re-
sponse sought to deny 
the claims, pointing out 
that Royal Military Po-
lice investigations into 
the alleged war crimes 
had resulted in no pros-
ecutions.
	 The letter, from a se-
nior MoD official to 
then-defence secretary 
Sir Ben Wallace, was one 
of several internal docu-
ments cited on Monday 
at an Independent Inqui-
ry relating to Afghani-
stan.
	 The inquiry is examin-
ing whether there is cred-
ible evidence that the 
SAS unlawfully killed 
people on night raids.
	 The letter informed 
Sir Ben that “the level of 
detail” in Panorama’s re-

quest for comment “sug-
gests they have spoken to 
well-placed sources”.
	 It went on to warn that 
there was “a risk that 
these sources will have 
provided Panorama with 
documents that will en-
able them to substantiate 
these allegations”.
	 The BBC reported on 
‘credible’ allegations that 
the SAS had repeatedly 
killed unarmed detain-
ees and civilians on night 
raids in Afghanistan, and 
that RMP investigations 
into the alleged killings 
had been improperly 
closed down.
	 The BBC subsequently 
reported in 2022 that one 
SAS unit had unlawfully 
killed 54 people in one 
six-month tour.
	 Sir Ben told the inquiry 
on Monday that he had 
always wanted to get to 
the bottom of the alle-
gations against the SAS, 
and that when made 
aware of concerns about 
special forces operations 

in Afghanistan he had 
repeatedly sought more 
information about those 
concerns.
	 The internal MoD doc-
uments disclosed in court 
showed that, despite the 
department’s conclusion 
that there were “broadly 
accurate” allegations in 
the letter from the BBC, 
officials “should contin-
ue to resist allegations 
of widespread systemic 
abuse and criminal be-
haviour” and “should 
rebut Panorama’s alle-
gations about investiga-
tions and decisions being 
improperly influenced”.
	 Another document re-
vealed that before sign-
ing off the reply to the 
BBC’s request for com-
ment, Sir Ben had sought 
out and read a classified 
memo written by a very 
senior member of UK 
Special Forces that out-
lined serious concerns 
over alleged SAS mur-
ders in Afghanistan.
	 The memo, written to 

the head of Special Forc-
es in April 2011, said that 
there appeared to be “an 
unofficial policy” among 
SAS squadrons to kill 
any fighting-age Afghan 
male during a raid “re-
gardless of the immedi-
ate threat they pose to 
our troops”.
	 It added: “In some in-
stances this has involved 
the deliberate killing of 
individuals after they 
have been restrained by 
[the SAS] and the subse-
quent fabrication of evi-
dence to suggest a lawful 
killing in self defence.”
	 It emerged last year 
that the memo was 
locked away in a safe, 
despite a law which re-
quires every command-
ing officer in the armed 
forces to report any ev-
idence of war crimes to 
the Royal Military Police.
	 Asked about the memo 
in court on Monday, Sir 
Ben said the memo was 
a “very important docu-
ment and the allegations 

that followed from it 
were very important”.
	 He added that he was 
“concerned” about the 
contents of the memo, 
“but I also refer you to 
the date – it was a decade 
before my time”.
	 Sir Ben said he would 
have expected the com-
manding officer of the 
special forces unit re-
sponsible, and the 
then-Director Special 
Forces, General Jonathan 
Page, to refer the allega-
tions to the RMP.
	 “There was no excuse 
for the commanding of-
ficer or the Director Spe-
cial Forces not to have re-
ferred that to police,” he 
said. “It is inexcusable.”
	 Pressed by the inqui-
ry team about whether 
he had sought out the 
source of the allegations 
in the memo – a whis-
tleblower from within 
special forces – Sir Ben 
acknowledged that he 
had not.
	 The inquiry continues.

and 23 race horses.
	 He also bought £1.6m 
in cryptocurrency and 
£622,000 worth of silver 
bullion.
	 The judge told Stanley: 
“Your conduct was not 
reckless, but deliberate, 
sustained and repeat-

ed. When people gam-
bled with you, they did 
not know the true odds. 
They were told lies.”
	 Stanley, who gained 
the trust of members 
thanks to his back-
ground as a police of-
ficer, was also banned 

from being a director of 
a company for 15 years.
	 He will serve half of 
his sentence in custody, 
and the rest on licence, 
while a five-year Serious 
Crime Prevention Order 
will start on the day he is 
released from prison.

they too were subject 
to “intrusive” medical 
tests, including sexual 
health tests, while work-
ing at Harrods, conduct-
ed by  Dr Jo Coxon. 
	 The Justice For Har-
rods survivors group 
has filed a complaint 
to the General Medical 
Council about her con-
duct.
	 She was one of two 
doctors repeatedly 
named by women for 
carrying out intru-
sive medical examina-
tions and sexual health 
screening while they 
were working at Har-
rods.
	 Another doctor also 
reported to have carried 
out the medical tests - 
Wendy Snell - has since 
died.
The group has confirmed 
to the BBC that a com-
plaint has been put in 
to the medical regulator 
about Dr Coxon, but the 
details of the complaint 
have not been shared.
	 Lawyers represent-
ing women alleging 
rape and sexual assault 
against Al Fayed said 
they had received more 
than 150 new enquiries 
from women.
	 Harrods, which was 
sold by Al Fayed to the 
investment vehicle of 
the Qatar royal family 
in 2010, has said in re-
sponse to the allegations 
that it was “utterly ap-
palled”.
	 Several media organi-
sations had exposed al-
legations of sexual abuse 
against Al Fayed in the 
past, including Vanity 
Fair in 1995, Britain’s 
ITV in 1997 and Channel 
4 in 2017. Many of the 
women only felt able to 
speak publicly after his 
death.
	 In 2009, prosecutors 
decided not to charge Al 
Fayed over a claim that 
he had sexually assault-
ed a 15-year-old girl in 
his store, saying there 
was no realistic prospect 
of conviction.
	 He always denied the 
accusations.

Al Fayed:
cont. from page 3

Ex-sergeant jailed over horse racing betting fraud
n Trusted cop bilked £44m out of investors in elaborate Ponzi scheme

Michael Stanley used the money to fund a lavish lifestyle

SAS war crimes claims ‘broadly accurate’
n Elite unit targeted fighting age males in Afghanistan, inquiry hears
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A British man known 
as ‘Old Dry Keith’ who 
went viral for making 
‘white people’s food’ 
has died after being di-
agnosed with bone can-
cer.
	 Keith Brown, (pic-
tured, right) who was a 
citizen of New Zealand, 
attracted millions of 
viewers on the Chinese 
social media platform 
Douyin each day as he 
made lunches, including 
ham sandwiches and 
eggs on toast.
	 His account, which 
was run by his wife ‘Jane’ 
Zhang Jian, reached over 
one million followers 
with a trend even being 
sparked in China of peo-
ple trying to create their 
own ‘dry lunch’.
	 Some Chinese super-

markets also created a 
‘dry shopping area’ with 
ingredients Keith reg-
ularly used, including 
bread.
	 Keith and Jane met in 
Malaysia in 2007 before 
she began posting videos 
of him as she adapted to 
life in the UK.
	 They quickly went vi-
ral in China, with one 
clip showing Keith un-
able to find an avocado 
to go with his smoked 
salmon.
	 Jane told the BBC: ‘I 
was quite surprised by 
how popular Keith be-
came in China.
	 ‘It’s not that I didn’t ex-
pect people to like him, 
but I wasn’t prepared for 
how it would turn out.’
	 Zhou Zhiruo, a writer 
from China, said: ‘We 

watch him struggling 
to saw apart two slices 
of dry bread, as hard as 
weapons-grade steel, 
slicing off a few thin 
streaks of yellow from a 
block of hardened but-
ter that has not yet com-
pletely thawed, and then 
placing two slices of pre-
smoked salmon on top.
	 ‘This vision is enough 
to make ordinary peo-
ple think of the lunch 
they just hurriedly swal-
lowed, and feel empathy 
and sadness. 
	 ‘He is just like all those 
of us who have to pay 
our credit card bill but 
our salary hasn’t arrived, 
or have to go to a meet-
ing but find that their 
mobile phone battery is 
at 10 per cent. He bravely 
faces all of life’s blows.’

territory” while in the wa-
ter, but he was “not very 
fond of what [one] did to 
me”.
	 The attack by the sub-
merged animal happened 
near the Cherries’ camp 
during a leg of the trip 
that was an organized ca-
noe safari.
	 “When the hippo first 
hit the canoe, there was a 
massive crash, much like 

a car crash really,” said 
Mr Cherry, an experi-
enced canoeist.
	 The craft “reared up in 
the air”, tossing the pair 
into the water.
	 “I remember surfacing, 
realizing my shoulder 
was quite badly injured 
and I realiszed I’d dislo-
cated it from the outset 
and the consequences 
were that I couldn’t actu-
ally swim.
	 	 He was then 
dragged to the bottom of 
the river.
	 Mr Cherry explained: 

“I do remember think-
ing ‘oh no, what a way to 
go... I’m not ready to die’ 
and I thought this was it, 
because nobody survives 
hippo attacks.”
	 He said he then remem-
bered being sat in shallow 
water on the bank, but 
was grabbed again.
	 “We know subsequent-
ly from fellow travellers 
I was grabbed again and 
thrown through the air 
like a rag doll but towards 
the bank which was the 
godsend,” Mr Cherry told 
reporters.

China mourns “Old Dry Ken”
n Keith Brown’s boring sandwiches went viral on social media

Hippo:
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Legal Notices

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Ave
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Kathryn Ann Stratford, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/18/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. P Room 440

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: 
Kathryn Ann Stratford. And 

a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 

from Kathryn Ann Stratford to 
Kathryn Stratford McCarthy

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 29, 2024.
Judge David K. Reinert
Judge of the Superior Court
24TRP00342
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
300 East Walnut Street
Pasadena CA 91101

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Nicholas Matthew Mlachnik, 
an adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 11/08/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. P

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: 
Nicholas Matthew Mlachnik. And 

a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Nicholas Matthew Mlachnik 

to NiKlaus Matthew Green

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 30, 2024
Robin Miller Sloan, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24NNCP00511
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024174196. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Agency At 
Your Service, Sev Travel And Tours, 
Turkish Travel And Tours, 3901 W 
4th Street 2, Los Angeles CA 90020. 
County: Los Angeles. Sevim Acun 
Cameron, 3901 W 4th Street 2, Los 
Angeles CA 90020. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Sevim Acun Cameron, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024175687. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Auto Part 
Recycler, 7711 S Alameda St, Los 
Angeles CA 90001. County: Los An-
geles. Mr. Ford Auto Dismantling Inc., 
7711 S Alameda St, Los Angeles CA 
90001. State of incorporation: Califor-
nia. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: 

Jesus Cadena, President. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/21/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024177603. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Raw Power 
Electric, 5908 Lorelei Ave, Lakewood 
CA 90712. County: Los Angeles. 
Dennis D Wilson, 5908 Lorelei Ave, 
Lakewood CA 90712. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Dennis D Wilson, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/22/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178351. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: RI Supercar, 
2121 Rosecrans Ave Ste 2310, El 
Segundo CA 90245. County: Los An-
geles. Russel Islam, 2121 Rosecrans 
Ave Ste 2310, El Segundo CA 90245. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Russel 
Islam, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/23/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178393. The following person(s) 

is/are doing business as: JC Advising 
Services, 1131 1/2 W 85th St, Los 
Angeles CA 90044. County: Los An-
geles. Jose C Villafranco, 1131 1/2 W 
85th St, Los Angeles CA 90044. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 10/2019. Signed: Jose C Villa-
franco, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/23/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178998. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Mental 
Health Forward, 3633 E. Broadway, 
Long Beach CA 90803. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 0509985. Mental 
Health America of Los Angeles, 3633 
E. Broadway, Long Beach CA 90803. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 08/2024. Signed: Shu-Yung 
Kung, CFO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/26/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179283. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ricky’s PR 
Auto Body Shop, 2411 Sichel St Unit 
B, Los Angeles CA 90031. County: 
Los Angeles. Ricardo Silva, 2411 
Sichel St Unit B, Los Angeles CA 
90031. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2023. 
Signed: Ricardo Silva, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/26/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 

name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179675. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: What A 
Sweet Art, Gift Wana, 2108 N Gle-
noaks Blvd., Burbank CA 91504. 
County: Los Angeles. Pina Group 
Inc., 2108 N Glenoaks Blvd., Burbank 
CA 91504. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Ivette Mesrobi, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/27/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179731. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Hogan 
Events, Yard Cards By Star Party, 
Event Suite, 1590 Rosecrans Ave 
D166, Manhattan Beach CA 90266. 
County: Los Angeles. Hogan Events 
Group LLC, 1590 Rosecrans Ave 
D166, Manhattan Beach CA 90266. 
State of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Monique Hogan, Member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/27/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 

09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024181687. Current file: 
2024002717. The following person 
has abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious business name: The World of 
Bakery And Restaurant; The World 
of Bakery, 6001 Hooper Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90001. The World of 
Bakery And Restaurant Corp, 6001 
Hooper Ave, Los Angeles CA 90001. 
The fictitious business name referred 
to above was filed on: 01/04/2024, in 
the County of Los Angeles. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
Signed: Delfino Martinez Gutierrez, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/28/2024.  Published: 
09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024 
and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024181834. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: HAL, 1300 
S Broadway Unit G, Glendale CA 
91205. County: Los Angeles. Hayk 
Kirakosyan, 1300 S Broadway Unit 
G, Glendale CA 91205. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 08/2024. Signed: Hayk Kirako-
syan, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/29/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024181894. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Crumbl-Hastings Ranch, 3827 E 
Foothill Blvd, Pasadena CA 91107. 
County: Los Angeles. Ellevee LLC, 
7111 Santa Monica Blvd B411, West 
Hollywood CA 90046. State of orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Daniel 
Vine, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/29/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 

County of Los Angeles 
Department of the Treasurer 

and Tax Collector

Notice of Divided Publication

Pursuant to Revenue and Taxation Code 
(R&TC) Sections 3702, 3381, and 3382, 
the Los Angeles County Treasurer and Tax 
Collector is publishing in divided distribution, 
the Notice of Online Public Auction of Tax-
Defaulted Property Subject to the Tax 
Collector’s Power to Sell in and for the 
County of Los Angeles, State of California, 
to various newspapers of general circulation 
published in the County. A portion of the list 
appears in each of such newspapers. 

Notice of Online Public Auction of 
Tax-Defaulted Property Subject to the 
Tax Collector’s Power to Sell (Sale No. 

2024B)

Whereas, on Tuesday, July 9, 2024, the 
Board of Supervisors of the County of Los 
Angeles, State of California, directed the 

County of Los Angeles Treasurer and Tax 
Collector (TTC), to sell certain tax-defaulted 
properties at the online public auction.  

The TTC does hereby give public notice, 
that unless said properties are redeemed, 
prior to the close of business on Friday, 
October 18, 2024, at 5:00 p.m. Pacific Time, 
the last business day prior to the first day 
of the online public auction, the TTC will 
offer for sale and sell said properties on 
Saturday, October 19, 2024, beginning at 
3:00 p.m. Pacific Time, through Tuesday, 
October 22, 2024, at 12:00 p.m. Pacific 
Time, to the highest bidder, for not less than 
the minimum bid, at online public auction at 
https://www.govease.com/los-angeles.

The minimum bid for each parcel is the total 
amount necessary to redeem, plus costs, as 
required by R&TC Section 3698.5.

If a property does not sell during the online 
public auction, the right of redemption will 
revive and remain until Friday, December 6, 
2024, at 5:00 p.m. Pacific Time.  

The TTC will re-offer any properties that 
did not sell or were not redeemed prior to 
Friday, December 6, 2024, at 5:00 p.m. 
Pacific Time, for sale at online public auction 
at https://www.govease.com/los-angeles 
beginning Saturday, December 7, 2024, at 
3:00 p.m. Pacific Time, through Tuesday, 
December 10, 2024, at 12:00 p.m. Pacific 
Time.

Prospective bidders should obtain detailed 
information of this sale from the County of 
Los Angeles Treasurer and Tax Collector 
at ttc.lacounty.gov. Bidders are required 
to pre-register at https://www.govease.
com/los-angeles and submit a refundable 
$5,000 deposit in the form of wire transfer, 
electronic check, cashier’s check or 
bank-issued money order at the time of 
registration. Registration will begin on 
Friday, September 20, 2024, at 8:00 a.m. 
Pacific Time and end on Tuesday, October 
15, 2024, at 5:00 p.m. Pacific Time.  

Pursuant to R&TC Section 3692.3, the TTC 

sells all property ̀ `as is`` and the County and 
its employees are not liable for any known 
or unknown conditions of the properties, 
including, but not limited to, errors in the 
records of the Office of the Assessor 
(Assessor) pertaining to improvement of the 
property.

If the TTC sells a property, parties of 
interest, as defined by R&TC Section 4675, 
have a right to file a claim with the County 
for any proceeds from the sale, which are 
in excess of the liens and costs required to 
be paid from the proceeds. If there are any 
excess proceeds after the application of the 
minimum bid, the TTC will send notice to all 
parties of interest, pursuant to State law.

Please direct requests for information 
concerning redemption of tax-defaulted 
property to the Treasurer and Tax Collector, 
at 225 North Hill Street, Room 130, Los 
Angeles, California 90012. You may also 
call (213) 974-2045, Monday through 
Friday, 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. Pacific Time, 
visit our website at ttc.lacounty.gov or email 

us at auction@ttc.lacounty.gov.

The Assessor’s Identification Number (AIN) 
in this publication refers to the Assessor’s 
Map Book, the Map Page, and the individual 
Parcel Number on the Map Page. If a 
change in the AIN occurred, the publication 
will show both prior and current AINs. An 
explanation of the parcel numbering system 
and the referenced maps are available 
at the Office of the Assessor located at 
500 West Temple Street, Room 225, Los 
Angeles, California 90012, or at assessor.
lacounty.gov. 

I certify under penalty of perjury that the 
foregoing is true and correct. Executed 
at Los Angeles, California, on August 26, 
2024.

_________________________________
ELIZABETH BUENROSTRO GINSBERG

Treasurer and Tax Collector

County of Los Angeles
State of California

The real property that is subject to this notice 
is situated in the County of Los Angeles, 
State of California, and is described as 
follows:

PUBLIC AUCTION NOTICE OF SALE  OF 
TAX-DEFAULTED PROPERTY SUBJECT 
TO THE POWER OF SALE(SALE NO. 
2024B)
  3571 AIN 4434-031-001 NJJR LTD 
LOCATION COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES 
$4,044.00
  3572 AIN 4434-031-002 NJJR LTD 
LOCATION COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES 
$4,419.00
 3573 AIN 4434-034-022 
TENNESEN,BRADLEY LOCATION 
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES $6,708.00

CN110420 547 Sep 21,28, Oct 5, 2024
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Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182178. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Front Door 
Escrow, A Non-Independent Broker 
Escrow, 2121 Rosecrans Ave Ste 
2310, El Segundo CA 90245. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Front Door Ltd, 
2121 Rosecrans Ave Ste 2310, El 
Segundo CA 90245. State of incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Russel Islam, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/29/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182197. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Diagnostic 
Radiology Specialists, 1201 S Hope 
Street Apt 3420, Los Angeles CA 
90015. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
6223856. Diagnostic Radiology Spe-
cialists, A Professional Medical Cor-
poration, 1201 S Hope Street Apt 
3420, Los Angeles CA 90015. State 
of incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Arpan Jitendra 
Desai, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/29/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182218. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Kahn’s 
Bazaar, 5112 Sepulveda Blvd 201, 
Sherman Oaks CA 91403. County: 
Los Angeles. Ashkhan Aref, 5112 
Sepulveda Blvd 201, Sherman Oaks 
CA 91403. This business is conduct-
ed by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Ashkhan Aref, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182234. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: QT Real 
Estate Photography, 795 Gaviota 
Avenue, Long Beach CA 90813. 
County: Los Angeles. Quiet Thunder 
Media LLC, 795 Gaviota Avenue, 
Long Beach CA 90813. State of orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 06/2017. Signed: Angela 
Ann Valley, managing member. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 

This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182815. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ava’s 
Apothecary, 1730 Camino Palme-
ro Street Apt 106, Los Angeles CA 
90046. County: Los Angeles. True 
Apothecary, 1730 Camino Palme-
ro Street Apt 106, Los Angeles CA 
90046. State of incorporation: Califor-
nia. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: 
Tonya Lariviere, President. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182851. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: JC Auto 
Sales, 2817 Everest Way 535, Pine 
Mountain Club, CA 93222. County: 
Kern. Jose Francisco Cambronero, 
18375 Ventura Blvd 535, Tarzana CA 
91356. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Jose Francisco Cambronero, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/30/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182866. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Gluten Free Meister; glutenfreenoo-
dle.com, 8104 Maxine St, Pico Rive-
ra CA 90660. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 3694313. Kobayashi Noodle 
International, Inc., 8104 Maxine St, 
Pico Rivera CA 90660. State of in-
corporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2014. Signed: Aya Y Sugiura, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/30/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182955. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Truvella 
Cosmetics; Truvella Beauty, 6300 
Variel Ave., Ste 102, Woodland Hills 
CA 91367. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 4794550. More Water Inc., 
6300 Variel Ave., Ste 102, Wood-
land Hills CA 91367. State of incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Joseph Caputo, CEO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182958. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: B&B Mobile 
Notary, 23261 Erwin St. Woodland 
Hills CA 91367. County: Los Angeles. 
Joanne Lynn Bowland, 23261 Erwin 
St. Woodland Hills CA 91367. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Joanne Lynn Bow-
land, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/30/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182960. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Heart2Serve, 21221 Oxnard Street 
Apt. 628, Woodland Hills CA 91367. 
County: Los Angeles. Linda Kay 
Larson, 21221 Oxnard Street Apt. 
628, Woodland Hills CA 91367. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Linda Kay Larson, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/30/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182962. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Angels 
Van, 7403 Jason Ave, West Hills CA 
91307. County: Los Angeles. Angels 
Group of Companies LLC, 7403 
Jason Ave, West Hills CA 91307. 

State of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Joji M. Jacob, manager. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024183119. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Apex Balco-
ny Inspection, 4645 Van Nuys Blvd. 
#201, Sherman Oaks CA 91403. 
County: Los Angeles. Apex Adu 
Builders, 4645 Van Nuys Blvd. #201, 
Sherman Oaks CA 91403. State of in-
corporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Oren Diamant, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024183272. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: From A 
Prince, 15590 Marie Place, Westmin-
ster CA 92683. County: Los Angeles. 
Deandre Kerell Adkins, 15590 Marie 
Place, Westminster CA 92683. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Deandre Kerell 
Adkins, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/30/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024183511. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lucky-
Charm, 611 Wilshire Blvd Suite 900 
PMB #538, Los Angeles CA 90017. 
County: Los Angeles. Yoori Kim, 611 
Wilshire Blvd Suite 900 PMB #538, 
Los Angeles CA 90017. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 08/2024. Signed: Yoori Kim, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 

and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/03/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024183588. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Mandy Nail 
Studio, 887 N Lake Ave Ste 101, 
Pasadena CA 91104. County: Los 
Angeles. Xuemei Cao, 887 N Lake 
Ave Ste 101, Pasadena CA 91104. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Xuemei 
Cao, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/03/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024183942. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Hayley’s 
House, 865 Via de la Paz Unit #69, 
Pacific Palisades CA 90272. County: 
Los Angeles. Sober Is Sexy, LLC, 865 
Via de la Paz Unit #69, Pacific Pali-
sades CA 90272. State of organiza-
tion: California. This business is con-
ducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 01/2023. Signed: Hayley Mor-
tison, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/03/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024184558. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Eckeard’s 
Mobile Service, 2020 Nichols Street, 
Pomona CA 91768. County: Los 
Angeles. Chris Eckeard, 2020 Nich-
ols Street, Pomona CA 91768. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Chris Eckeard, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/03/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 

state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024184653. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ely Realty, 
4413 Coldwater Canyon Ave, Studio 
City CA 91604. County: Los Angeles. 
LMW Construction Inc, 4413 Cold-
water Canyon Ave, Studio City CA 
91604.  State of incorporation: Cali-
fornia. This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: 
Lee Meydan Weinstein, CEO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/03/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024184656. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: AEVA; Aki-
va Films, Kivy Media, 12439 Magno-
lia Blvd., Suite 100, Valley Village CA 
91607. County: Los Angeles. Mag-
nafilm, Inc., 12439 Magnolia Blvd., 
Suite 100, Valley Village CA 91607. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Meir Sharony, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/03/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024185207. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Comme 
Des Garfield; Reelboy, 1611 Glen-
don Avenue Apt 2, Los Angeles CA 
90024. County: Los Angeles. Deme-
trios Tzamaras, 1611 Glendon Ave-
nue Apt 2, Los Angeles CA 90024. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: 
Demetrios Tzamaras, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/04/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.
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Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024185215. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
34 North Collectibles, 21301 Erwin 
Street Unit 522, Woodland Hills CA 
91367. County: Los Angeles. Chris 
Duhancioglu, 21301 Erwin Street Unit 
522, Woodland Hills CA 91367. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 09/2024. Signed: Chris Duhancio-
glu, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/04/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024185674. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lawrence 
Mobile Detail, 6215 Overhill Dr Suite 
C, Los Angeles CA 90043. County: 
Los Angeles. Lawrence Deshuan 
Daniels Jr., 6215 Overhill Dr Suite 
C, Los Angeles CA 90043. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 08/2024. Signed: Lawrence 
Deshuan Daniels Jr., owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/04/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024185745. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
JP Builds, 19442 Baelen Street, 
Rowland Heights CA 91748. County: 
Los Angeles. Joshua Park, 19442 
Baelen Street, Rowland Heights CA 
91748. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Joshua Park, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/04/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024. 

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 North Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Hannah Christine Park, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 11/18/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. 9 Room 9

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 

18 years of age: 
Hannah Christine Park. And a 

petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 

petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have their name changed from 

Hannah Christine Park to Christine 
Qess

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: September 10, 2024
Elaine Lu
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02912
Published: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Ave
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition of Kath-
ryn Ann Stratford, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/18/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. P Room 440

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 

18 years of age: 
Kathryn Ann Stratford. And a 

petition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 

petition that said petitioner(s) desire 
to have their name changed from 

Kathryn Ann Stratford to Kathryn 
Stratford McCarthy

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 29, 2024.
Judge David K. Reinert
Judge of the Superior Court
24TRP00342
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 North Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of Ayser 
Selin Bozkaya, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 12/06/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is 

over 18 years of age: Ayser Selin 
Bozkaya. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed with 
the clerk of this Court, and it appear-
ing from said petition that said peti-
tioner(s) desire to have their name 

changed from Ayser Selin Bozkaya 
to Selin Bozkaya Ketchum

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: September 06, 2024
Curtis A. Kin, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02871
Published: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024159404. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Route Transmis-
sion & Auto Service, 14524 Keswick St C, 
Van Nuys CA 91405. County: Los Ange-
les. Remberto Velasquez, 14524 Keswick 
St C, Van Nuys CA 91405; Irma Velas-
quez, 14524 Keswick St C, Van Nuys 
CA 91405. This business is conducted 
by: a married couple. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Irma Vel-
asquez, wife. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 07/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024166590. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Speedy Home 
Refi, 47 Westminster Ave, Venice CA 
90291. County: Los Angeles. Cam Ts-
aowimonsiri, 47 Westminster Ave, Venice 
CA 90291. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 10/2021. Signed: Cam Tsaow-
imonsiri, owner. Registrant(s) declared 

that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/08/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024167755. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as:  Panda Chinese, 
24484 Marzal St., Valencia CA 91354. 
County: Los Angeles. Jing Ma, 24484 
Marzal St., Valencia CA 91354. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 08/2014. 
Signed: Jing Ma, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 08/09/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 
10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024169761. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Kaiju Kingdom 
Collectibles, 5029 Scott St, Torrance CA 
90503. County: Los Angeles. Justin Mar, 
5029 Scott St, Torrance CA 90503. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Justin Mar, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 08/13/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 
10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024173545. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: G F Construction, 
9831 Brockway St, El Monte CA 91733. 
County: Los Angeles. G F Fire Protec-
tion Inc, 9831 Brockway St, El Monte 
CA 91733. This business is conduct-
ed by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Weijia 
Huang, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024177828. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Kumi Colors, 
22019 Lostine Ave, Carson CA 90745. 
County: Los Angeles. Trischa Lao Te-
odoro, 22019 Lostine Ave, Carson CA 
90745. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Trischa Lao Teodoro, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/23/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 

on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024177856. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Clean Truck 
Check Pro, 1305 Dover Hill Rd, Santa 
Barbara CA 93103. County: Santa Bar-
bara. Taylor Dye, 1305 Dover Hill Rd, 
Santa Barbara CA 93103. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The Regis-
trant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: 
Taylor Dye, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/23/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178600. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Garbo Graphics, 
5949 W 77th Place, Los Angeles CA 
90045. County: Los Angeles. Alex Gar-
banati, 5949 W 77th Place, Los Angeles 
CA 90045. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Alex Gar-
banati, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/26/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178718. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: The Nook LA, 928 
25th Street, Santa Monica CA 90403. 
County: Los Angeles. Cosima Elwes, 928 
25th Street, Santa Monica CA 90403. 
This business is conducted by: an indi-
vidual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Cosima Elwes, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/26/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179580. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Sips ‘N Swag, 
3536 W 59th Pl, Los Angeles CA 90043. 
County: Los Angeles. Raschelle McGraw, 
3536 W 59th Pl, Los Angeles CA 90043; 
Gail Herring, 3536 W 59th Pl, Los Angeles 
CA 90043. This business is conducted by: 
a general partnership. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Gail Herring, 
general partner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/26/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 

of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024180304. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Nare Vard, 250 
S. San Fernando Apt 222, Burbank CA 
91502. County: Los Angeles. Nare Var-
danyan, 250 S. San Fernando Apt 222, 
Burbank CA 91502. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Nare 
Vardanyan, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/27/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Statement of Abandonment of Use of 
Fictitious Business Name: 2024180987. 
Current file: 2020054871. The following 
person has abandoned the use of the 
fictitious business name: RD Gibbs And 
Company, 3523 Ocean View Blvd, Glen-
dale CA 91208. LGR & R Inc, 3523 Ocean 
View Blvd, Glendale CA 91208. The fic-
titious business name referred to above 
was filed on: 03/05/2020, in the County 
of Los Angeles. This business is conduct-
ed by: a corporation. Signed: Timothy D 
Gibbs, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/28/2024. Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024181189. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Artística Enter-
tainment Pictures, 1015 S Woods Ave, 
East Los Angeles CA 90022. County: Los 
Angeles. Luis Rafael Jimenez Mendez, 
1015 S Woods Ave, East Los Angeles CA 
90022. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Luis Rafael Jimenez 
Mendez, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/28/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024181263. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Quan Ngon Nha 
Trang, 311 E Valley Blvd San Gabriel 
CA 91776. County: Los Angeles. East-
ern Light Inc, 932 Momax St, Azusa CA 
91702. State of incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a corpo-
ration. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
08/2024. Signed: Frances Lo, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/28/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under federal, state or common law 
(see Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024181816. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Sequestered Film, 
3727 W. Magnolia Blvd #421, Burbank 
CA 91505. County: Los Angeles. Brian 
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Joseph Cavanaugh, 3727 W. Magnolia 
Blvd #421, Burbank CA 91505. George 
Marshall Hilliard, 3727 W. Magnolia Blvd 
#421, Burbank CA 91505. This business 
is conducted by: an unincorporated as-
sociation other than a partnership. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Brian Joseph Cavanaugh, gen-
eral partner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, et 
seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182448. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Jobless Technology, 688 N Rims-
dale Ave Apt 120, Covina CA 91722. 
County: Los Angeles. Jie Zou, 688 
N Rimsdale Ave Apt 120, Covina CA 
91722; Mu Jia, 688 N Rimsdale Ave 
Apt 120, Covina CA 91722. 
This business is conducted by: a 
married couple. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Jie Zou, wife. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/29/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-
ment must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of an-
other under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 
10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182751. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Rhino Masonry, 1526 Allgeyer Ave, 
South El Monte CA 91733. County: 
Los Angeles. Jesus Javier Casta-
neda, 1526 Allgeyer Ave, South El 
Monte CA 91733. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Jesus Javier Casta-
neda, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/30/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024183706. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
J&J General Services, 40040 Blue-
bird Ln, Palmdale CA 93551. County: 
Los Angeles. Jeanae Ficklin, 40040 
Bluebird Ln, Palmdale CA 93551. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: 
Jeanae Ficklin, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/03/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-

ment must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of an-
other under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 
10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024184716. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: GA2 
Development, 802 S Ditman Ave, 
Los Angeles CA 90023. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 6336559. GA2 De-
velopment Corp, 802 S Ditman Ave, 
Los Angeles CA 90023. State of 
incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Jose Carlos 
Uribe Solorzano, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/03/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-
ment must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of an-
other under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 
10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024184798. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Disco Kitty Pet Care, 7939 Reseda 
Blvd Apt 205, Reseda CA 91335. 
County: Los Angeles. Khristy Sian, 
7939 Reseda Blvd Apt 205, Rese-
da CA 91335. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Khristy Sian, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/04/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024184900. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: Pro 
Neo Frequency, 11464 Oxnard St 2, 
North Hollywood CA 91606. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Meruyert Zhaxy-
lykova, 11464 Oxnard St 2, North 
Hollywood CA 91606. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 08/2024. Signed: Meruyert 
Zhaxylykova, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/04/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-
ment must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of an-
other under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 
10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024184930. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Atelier Facial Contouring, 18321 

Ventura Blvd Suite 680, Tarzana 
CA 91356. County: Los Angeles. 
Jowita Mitchell, 5400 Lindley Ave 
110, Encino CA 91316. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 09/2024. Signed: Jowita Mitch-
ell, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/04/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024184981. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
JHDJ Landscaping Services, 5009 
S Slauson Ave Apt 3, Culver City CA 
90230. County: Los Angeles. Jose 
Damian Juarez Martinez, 5009 S 
Slauson Ave Apt 3, Culver City CA 
90230. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Jose Damian Juarez Marti-
nez, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/04/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024185745. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
JP Builds, 19442 Baelen Street, 
Rowland Heights CA 91748. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Joshua Park, 19442 
Baelen Street, Rowland Heights 
CA 91748. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 09/2024. Signed: Joshua Park, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/04/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024185945. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: Zip-
py Company, 12019 Pierce St, Sylmar 
CA 91342. County: Los Angeles. Elma 
Ordono Ruden, 12019 Pierce St, Syl-
mar CA 91342. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein on: 
08/2024. Signed: Elma Ordono Rud-
en, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 

Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024185948. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Prestige Care Plus, 18137 Topham 
St, Tarzana CA 91335. County: Los 
Angeles. Jayson Victor S. Mala-
sig, 18137 Topham St, Tarzana CA 
91335. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Jayson Victor S. Malasig, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024186072. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Eben-Ezer Restaurant, 8672 Lindley 
Ave., Northridge CA 91325. County: 
Los Angeles. Ebenezer Restauran-
te Salvadoreno, Inc., 8672 Lindley 
Ave., Northridge CA 91325. State of 
incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 01/2023. Signed: Brenda 
M Linares, secretary. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/05/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-
ment must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights of an-
other under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 
10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024186099. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Queen Bee Mobile Notary & Apos-
tille; Queen Bee Mobile Notary, 
333 Washington Blvd #469, Mari-
na del Rey CA 90292. County: Los 
Angeles. Jennifer Jaye Fraser, 333 
Washington Blvd #469, Marina del 
Rey CA 90292. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein on: 
01/2007. Signed: Jennifer Jaye Fra-
ser, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024186128. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 

New Millennium Enterprise, 18660 
Brymer Street, Porter Ranch CA 
91326. County: Los Angeles. Mar-
garita Gatus, 18660 Brymer Street, 
Porter Ranch CA 91326; Brian Ga-
tus, 18660 Brymer Street, Porter 
Ranch CA 91326. This business is 
conducted by: a married couple. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Margarita Gatus, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024186276. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: Lu-
nalista; Luna Lista, 28031 Ridgebluff 
Ct, Rancho Palos Verdes CA 90275. 
County: Los Angeles. Jens Welling, 
28031 Ridgebluff Ct, Rancho Palos 
Verdes CA 90275. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 01/2024. Signed: Jens Welling, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024186338. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Poncho’s Tlayudas, 5854 Denver 
Avenue, Los Angeles CA 90044. 
County: Los Angeles. Poncho’s 
Tlayudas, LLC, 5854 Denver Ave-
nue, Los Angeles CA 90044. State 
of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 01/2022. 
Signed: Odilia Romero, member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 09/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024186561. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: El-
larm, 108 W Maple St Unit 5, Glendale 
CA 91204. County: Los Angeles. Va-
heh Ghazarian, 108 W Maple St Unit 
5, Glendale CA 91204. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Vaheh Ghaz-
arian, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/05/2024. 

NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024186653. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Capital Alchemy, Digital Assets Al-
chemy, 2003 Morgan Ln, Redondo 
Beach CA 90278. County: Los An-
geles. Robert Enriquez, 2003 Mor-
gan Ln, Redondo Beach CA 90278. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Robert Enriquez, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 09/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024186655. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Now And Vend, 2003 Morgan Ln, 
Redondo Beach CA 90278. County: 
Los Angeles. Robert Enriquez, 2003 
Morgan Ln, Redondo Beach CA 
90278. Alexis Mia Enriquez, 2003 
Morgan Ln, Redondo Beach CA 
90278. This business is conducted 
by: a general partnership. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Robert Enriquez, gen-
eral partner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024187039. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Madu Concepts, 3780 Kilroy Air-
port Way, Suite 200, Long Beach 
CA 90806. County: Los Angeles. 
Meas Development, Inc., 3780 Kilroy 
Airport Way, Suite 200, 3780 Kilroy 
Airport Way, Suite 200, Long Beach 
CA 90806. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Desmonde Veas, Vice 
President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/06/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
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Travel

The Camino de San-
tiago is having a mo-
ment.
	 The ancient pilgrim-
age across Northern 
Spain to the cathe-
dral city of Santiago 
de Compostela near 
the Galician coast 
dates back more than 
a thousand years, to 
those uncertain days 
when anxious believ-
ers braved bad weath-
er, bandits and wolves 
to show their devo-
tion to St James the 
Apostle, whose bones 
are reputedly buried 
there. These days the 
worst that is likely to 
befall what the Span-
ish call ‘peregrinos’ 
are sore feet, a bad in-
ternet connection and 
running of out of hot 
water at the commu-
nal hostels – or alber-
gues – that are all part 
of the modern day pil-
grim experience.
	 But let’s back up a 
little. The route from 
the south west tip of 
France to the end of 
the known world – 
Finisterre – had been 
known from Roman 
and pagan times. It’s 
position directly un-
der the Milky Way 
prompted early star-
gazers to believe the 
route – or The Way, as 
Camino most directly 
translates to English 
– had special pow-
ers and was a meet-
ing point of ancient 
‘ley lines’ connecting 
cosmic energy fields. 
The Romans built a 
road along what is 
now the Camino, but 
with the fall of empire 
the place became lit-
tle more than a back-
water until the ninth 
century, when a hum-
ble farmer allegedly 
found some bones in 

a field directly under 
a gathering of stars. A 
local cleric ‘identified’ 
the bones as belong-
ing to St James, the 
famous fisher-of-men 
apostle, and the place 
was named ‘Cam-
pos-Stella’ (field of 
stars). Pilgrims soon 
started to arrive. And 
they’ve been coming 
ever since.
	 By medieval times 

the Camino was con-
sidered one of Chris-
tendom’s Big Three 
pilgrimages, along 
with Jerusalem and 
Rome. Hostels, alber-
gues and other refug-
es sprang up to house 
and feed them over-
night. Local churches 
welcomed them, too. 
And less savory types 
sought to prey on 
them, prompting the 

Knights Templar, no 
less, to build a string 
of hilltop safehouses 
along the route to pro-
vide safe haven.

rebirth
	 But in later centuries 
the importance of the 
Church began to ebb, 
and by renaissance 
times the Camino had 
largely fallen into into 
disuse, becoming lit-
tle traveled outside of 
orthodox Catholic cir-
cles right up into the 
1970s. 
	 But by the turn of 
this century, things 
had started to change. 

Well-known authors 
including Paulo Coel-
ho and Shirley Mc-
Laine wrote best-sell-
ers about the Camino. 
Ageing Westerners – 
often those approach-
ing retirement age and 
looking for meaning 
in their lives began to 
discover the camino. 
Guide books started 
to appear. Tour com-
panies started to offer 
guided trips, long and 

short, for various stag-
es of the Camino. And 
then, in 2014 came the 
release of the mov-
ie The Way, in which 
Martin Sheen stars as 
a Californian dentist 
who embarks on the 
Camino as a tribute to 
his deceased son. Sud-
denly everyone was 
interested in taking 
that hike.
	 My interest in The 

Ten weeks on the Camino
The famed 500-mile walk through Northern Spain is all the rage right now. 

Nick Stark puts on his hiking boots and and joins in the....fun 

JUST THE ESSENTIALS: a backpack and poles

THE START OF SOMETHING BIG: a signpost leaving St Jean Pied de Port

LONG WALK AHEAD: the Camino’s first day takes you over the Pyrenees

CONT:/
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2995 Thousand Oaks Blvd., Thousand Oaks. (parking in rear)
Open: Mon-Sat. 10.30-5.30 • Sun: 10-6 • Tel: (805) 495-4042

Teas • Candy • Pastries • Bangers • 
Meat Pies • Heinz Beans • 

China Teapots • Tea Cozies • Gifts
Now featuring delicious, traditional handmade pies and 

pasties from Deli-SA. Chicken curry pasties, Cornish 
pasties, Steak & Kidney...and much more

Quality Imports from the British Isles...

Direct Contact: 
Annie 

(310) 710 8224

The Hare 
and Hounds

ARIES: Time to make decisions now that Mars is in your area of overall life chang-
es. The Sun in your opposite sign Libra is assisting you, so listen to your intuition as 
to what should be your direction now.
TAURUS: You have a lot going for you, however patience is required. Any situa-
tion can change soon and your boss planet Venus in your opposite sign Scorpio will 
make sure it’s good for you.
GEMINI: Lately you are able to move forward in  your life and do stuff at will. 
Mercury your boss is going forward now  so be prepared for an even faster pace.
CANCER: The arrival recently of Mars   in your general life will likely bring up 
anything on hold for some time. Just do not panic as it’s going to move faster than 
you expect..
LEO:  You are raking over the coals of past situations and some of it is unfinished 
business as far as you are concerned. Be prepared because the other side or person 
will not be in agreement. It will be best overall to let it go for good. 
VIRGO: It’s best to not worry about what you have no control over. There are 
things you have wanted to do so do try to catch up and Mercury your boss in a 
better mood now will assist you in your efforts.
LIBRA: Now that the Sun is shining on you, life is picking up at a better pace than 
for some time. Career moves for the consideration are on the  way to you and along 
with this you can expect to see some plans come to fruition. Happy Birthday!
SCORPIO: Better days are on the way overall and for some of you already starting. 
Your boss Mars in sensitive Cancer will help you to be more aware of what you 
really want and need in your life generally.
SAGITTARIUS: Make the most of the change of direction in life now. It’s good to 
get rid of stuff mentally or physically for better days ahead. Your boss Jupiter in 
your opposite sign Gemini is assisting you to make the right choices.
CAPRICORN: Lots of changes are happening in and around your life current-
ly, this is due to mighty Pluto moving out of your life after many years.  Possible 
moves of all kinds are in store and you could make decisions for the long term now 
quite quickly.
AQUARIUS: You should be enjoying some down time. Your boss Uranus is on the 
move soon and can bring lots of new opportunities to your life. Possibly a good job 
offer can pop up - do not hesitate to consider it.
PISCES: Saturn is digging deep into your life and will likely bring up some unfin-
ished emotional situation which is  best to deal with promptly.You’re getting ready 
to move forward in life in a more mellow way.

Stargazing with 
Annie Shaw

Local News

Return of the Sausages 
were the winning team 
at the latest Brits in LA 
Pub Quiz with a banger 
of a performance.
	 It was a wurst case 
scenario for their rivals 
as the sausages rolled 
to victory at O’Briens in 
Santa Monica.
	 Join your fellow Brits 
there next Tuesday at 8 
as quizmaster Sandro 
Monetti hosts more triv-
ia fun.

Way started after see-
ing that movie. My 
interest was piqued, 
but no sufficiently 
to commit. Research 
revealed that there 
are actually multiple 
caminos, starting in 
Portugal, France, It-
aly and elsewhere in 
Spain, for example. 
There is even a Cami-
no Ingles, starting in 
England. But the ‘clas-
sic Camino’ starts on 
the French side of the 
Pyrenees and contin-
ues for about 500 miles 
to the city of Santiago. 
And for the really de-

voted, there’s another 
few days journey all 
the way to the Atlan-
tic coast at Finisterre. 

Calling to me
	 Upon delving a lit-
tle deeper into the 
subject, I found that 
people I knew socially 
had done the Camino. 
Or family members 
of friends. One ac-
quaintance of mine, I 
discovered, had actu-
ally written an e-book 
about it. I am one of 
the least religious peo-
ple you will ever meet, 
but after these repeat-
ed signs of a connec-
tion to the Camino, 
I began to feel it was 
calling to me. And 

that feeling, I later 
learned, is very com-
mon among Camino 
first-timers. So I read 
some books, listened 
to some podcasts, 
joined some internet 
forums, until myself 
and my partner were 
ready to commit. We 
joined the Camino on 
September 15th and 
started walking. And 
we’re still going. A 
little footsore it’s true, 
but dutifully clocking 
12-18 miles each day, 
hoping to reach San-
tiago towards the end 
of October. 
	 Hopefully this will 
pique your interest, 
too, so come along for 
the ride.

Sizzling Sausages!

CAMINO:
cont. from page ten
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lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024187107. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Sonshine Photos, 5028 2nd 
Avenue, Los Angeles CA 90043. 
County: Los Angeles. Theophilus 
Bostick, PO Box 5151, Gardena CA 
90249. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Theophilus Bostick, own-
er. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/06/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024187365. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Axium, 14106 Pontlavoy Ave, Santa 
Fe Springs, CA 90670. County: Los 
Angeles. AA International Ventures 
LLC, 14106 Pontlavoy Ave, Santa 
Fe Springs, CA 90670. State of or-
ganization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 09/2024. Signed: 
Aryan Manish Khemani, managing 
member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/06/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024187369. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
MGAL Creative, 14028 Tahiti Way 
410, Marina del Rey CA 90292. 
County: Los Angeles. Meg Galas-
so, 14028 Tahiti Way 410, Marina 
del Rey CA 90292. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Meg Galasso, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/06/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024187649. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Satellite TV Services, 16304 Van 
Ness Ave, Torrance CA 90504. 
County: Los Angeles. Softech Ebiz 
Solutions LLC, 16304 Van Ness Ave, 
Torrance CA 90504. State of or-
ganization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names list-

ed herein on: n/a. Signed: Shakil Rai, 
President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/09/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024187703. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Rocket Maids Referral Agency, 
4255 San Rafael Ave, Los Angeles 
CA 90042. County: Los Angeles. 
Rocket Maids LLC, 4255 San Ra-
fael Ave, Los Angeles CA 90042. 
State of organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a lim-
ited liability company. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Irina Nikiforova, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 09/09/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024187727. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Playa Vista Mobile Notary, 333 
Washington Blvd. #469, Marina del 
Rey CA 90292. County: Los Ange-
les. Jennifer J Fraser, 333 Washing-
ton Blvd. #469, Marina del Rey CA 
90292. This business is conduct-
ed by: an individual. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 01/2008. 
Signed: Jennifer J Fraser, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 09/09/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024187992. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Diamond Drop Pool Service, 26067 
Viento Ct, Valencia CA 91355. 
County: Los Angeles. Armond An-
driasian, 26067 Viento Ct, Valencia 
CA 91355. This business is conduct-
ed by: an individual. Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Armond Andriasian, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 09/09/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 

of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024188262. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Lugyá’h, 4301 W. Jefferson Blvd., 
Los Angeles CA 90016. County: Los 
Angeles. Poncho’s Tlayudas, LLC, 
5854 Denver Ave, Los Angeles CA 
90044. State of organization: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Odilia Romero, 
member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/09/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024189412. Current file: 
2023060356. The following per-
son has abandoned the use of the 
fictitious business name: Born Cold 
Apparel, 440 N Barranca Avenue 
#6004, Covina CA 91723. Born 
Cold LLC, 2041 San Anseline  Ave-
nue 6, Long Beach CA 90815. The 
fictitious business name referred 
to above was filed on: 03/20/2023, 
in the County of Los Angeles. 
This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. Signed: 
Samuel Seth Pedro Marin, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 09/10/2024. Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024189425. Current file: 
2023064296. The following per-
son has abandoned the use of the 
fictitious business name: Born Cold 
Apparel, 440 N Barranca Avenue 
#6004, Covina CA 91723. Born 
Cold LLC, 440 N Barranca Avenue 
#6004, Covina CA 91723. The fic-
titious business name referred to 
above was filed on: 03/23/2023, 
in the County of Los Angeles. 
This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. Signed: 
Samuel Seth Pedro Marin, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 09/10/2024. Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024189920. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: Dow 
Villa Publishing, 8149 Santa Monica 
Blvd #370, Los Angeles CA 90046. 
County: Los Angeles. Dawson’s 
Peak Action Factory LLC, 8149 San-
ta Monica Blvd #370, Los Angeles 
CA 90046. State of organization: 
California. This business is conduct-
ed by: a limited liability company. 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 09/2024. Signed: Matt Dawson, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/10/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 

of the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024190151. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
DP Trading, 22704 Ventura Blvd 
Unit 344, Woodland Hills CA 91364. 
County: Los Angeles. Peggy Pegah 
Shadkamian, 22704 Ventura Blvd 
Unit 344, Woodland Hills CA 91364. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Peggy Pegah 
Shadkamian, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/11/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 and 
10/05/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024190290. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Lobster-Guys Long Beach, 141 E 
Willow St Unit Q, Long Beach CA 
90806. County: Los Angeles. JCM 
136 LLC, 141 E Willow St Unit Q, Long 
Beach CA 90806. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Weisi 
Cai, manager. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/11/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fic-
titious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024 
and 10/05/2024.

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF: 
CAROL B. SHERMAN AKA 
CAROL BETH SHERMAN 

AKA CAROL B. NASS 
CASE NO. 24STPB10367

To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interested 
in the WILL or estate, or both of 
CAROL B. SHERMAN AKA CAR-
OL BETH SHERMAN AKA CAROL 
B. NASS.
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has 
been filed by RACHEL V. NASS 
in the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that RACHEL V. NASS be 
appointed as personal representa-
tive to administer the estate of the 
decedent.
THE PETITION requests the dece-
dent’s WILL and codicils, if any, be 
admitted to probate. The WILL and 
any codicils are available for exam-
ination in the file kept by the court.
THE PETITION requests author-
ity to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Before tak-
ing certain very important actions, 
however, the personal representa-
tive will be required to give notice 
to interested persons unless they 

have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
A HEARING on the petition will 
be held in this court as follows: 
10/22/24 at 8:30AM in Dept. 11 lo-
cated at 111 N. HILL ST., LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90012
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting of 
the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-
tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as 
a creditor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file kept 
by the court. If you are a person in-
terested in the estate, you may file 
with the court a Request for Special 
Notice (form DE-154) of the filing of 
an inventory and appraisal of estate 
assets or of any petition or account 
as provided in Probate Code sec-
tion 1250. A Request for Special 
Notice form is available from the 
court clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
BURTON A. MITCHELL - SBN 
79317
ANDREW K. STEENBOCK - SBN 
271904
JEFFER MANGELS BUTLER 
MITCHELL LLP
1900 AVENUE OF THE STARS 
7TH FLR
LOS ANGELES CA 90067
Telephone (310) 203-8080
9/21, 9/28, 10/5/24

CNS-3853173#

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF: 
PHILLIP GALLIGAN LOD-

WICK AKA PHILLIP LODWICK 
AKA PHILL LODWICK 

CASE NO. 24STPB06669
To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interested in 
the WILL or estate, or both of PHILLIP 
GALLIGAN LODWICK AKA PHILLIP 
LODWICK AKA PHILL LODWICK.
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has 
been filed by MALCOLM K. LOD-
WICK in the Superior Court of Califor-
nia, County of LOS ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR PROBATE re-
quests that MALCOLM K. LODWICK 
be appointed as personal represen-
tative to administer the estate of the 
decedent.
THE PETITION requests authority to 
administer the estate under the In-
dependent Administration of Estates 
Act. (This authority will allow the per-
sonal representative to take many ac-
tions without obtaining court approval. 
Before taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal rep-
resentative will be required to give 
notice to interested persons unless 
they have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The indepen-
dent administration authority will be 
granted unless an interested person 
files an objection to the petition and 
shows good cause why the court 
should not grant the authority.
A HEARING on the petition will be 

held in this court as follows: 11/14/24 
at 8:30AM in Dept. 99 located at 111 
N. HILL ST., LOS ANGELES, CA 
90012
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting of 
the petition, you should appear at the 
hearing and state your objections or 
file written objections with the court 
before the hearing. Your appearance 
may be in person or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a con-
tingent creditor of the decedent, you 
must file your claim with the court and 
mail a copy to the personal represen-
tative appointed by the court within 
the later of either (1) four months from 
the date of first issuance of letters to 
a general personal representative, as 
defined in section 58(b) of the Califor-
nia Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal deliv-
ery to you of a notice under section 
9052 of the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as a 
creditor. You may want to consult with 
an attorney knowledgeable in Califor-
nia law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file kept 
by the court. If you are a person in-
terested in the estate, you may file 
with the court a Request for Special 
Notice (form DE-154) of the filing of 
an inventory and appraisal of estate 
assets or of any petition or account 
as provided in Probate Code section 
1250. A Request for Special Notice 
form is available from the court clerk.
In Pro Per Petitioner
MALCOLM K. LODWICK
2201 HARPER ST #B-5
LAWRENCE KS 66046
9/21, 9/28, 10/5/24

CNS-3853571#

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF: 
MENASCHE M. NASS AKA 

MENASCHE NASS AKA ME-
NASHE NASS 

CASE NO. 24STPB10378
To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interested in 
the WILL or estate, or both of MENA-
SCHE M. NASS AKA MENASCHE 
NASS AKA MENASHE NASS.
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has 
been filed by RACHEL V. NASS 
in the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR PROBATE re-
quests that RACHEL V. NASS be ap-
pointed as personal representative to 
administer the estate of the decedent.
THE PETITION requests the dece-
dent’s WILL and codicils, if any, be 
admitted to probate. The WILL and 
any codicils are available for exam-
ination in the file kept by the court.
THE PETITION requests authority to 
administer the estate under the In-
dependent Administration of Estates 
Act. (This authority will allow the per-
sonal representative to take many ac-
tions without obtaining court approval. 
Before taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal rep-
resentative will be required to give 
notice to interested persons unless 
they have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The indepen-
dent administration authority will be 
granted unless an interested person 
files an objection to the petition and 
shows good cause why the court 
should not grant the authority.
A HEARING on the petition will be 
held in this court as follows: 10/17/24 
at 8:30AM in Dept. 5 located at 111 N. 
HILL ST., LOS ANGELES, CA 90012
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting of 
the petition, you should appear at the 
hearing and state your objections or 
file written objections with the court 
before the hearing. Your appearance 
may be in person or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a con-
tingent creditor of the decedent, you 
must file your claim with the court and 
mail a copy to the personal represen-
tative appointed by the court within 
the later of either (1) four months from 
the date of first issuance of letters to 
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a general personal representative, as 
defined in section 58(b) of the Califor-
nia Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal deliv-
ery to you of a notice under section 
9052 of the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as a 
creditor. You may want to consult with 
an attorney knowledgeable in Califor-
nia law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file kept 
by the court. If you are a person in-
terested in the estate, you may file 
with the court a Request for Special 
Notice (form DE-154) of the filing of 
an inventory and appraisal of estate 
assets or of any petition or account 
as provided in Probate Code section 
1250. A Request for Special Notice 
form is available from the court clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
BURTON A. MITCHELL - SBN 79317
ANDREW STEENBOCK - SBN 
271904
JEFFER MANGELS BUTLER 
MITCHELL LLP
1900 AVENUE OF THE STARS 7TH 
FLR
LOS ANGELES CA 90067
Telephone (310) 203-8080
9/21, 9/28, 10/5/24

CNS-3853883#

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

200 W Compton Blvd
Compton CA 90221

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Ricardo Sedano Briseno Jr, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 11/14/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. E Room 1004

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: 
Ricardo Sedano Briseno Jr. And 
a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 

from Ricardo Sedano Briseno 
Jr to

 Wolfgang Pierre d’Hàtrou Dena

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 4, 2024
Wendy L Wilcox
Judge of the Superior Court
24CMCP00128
Published: 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024 and 10/05/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N. Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the matter of In the Matter of the 

Petition of Brittany Kendziora, 
an adult over the age of 18 years, 
on behalf of Aiden Christopher 
Coury, a minor under the age of 

18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is under 18 years of age: 
Aiden Christopher Coury. And 

a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have the name changed 
from Aiden Christopher Coury to 

Aiden Christopher Kendziora

​Date: 10/18/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 1, 2024.
Hon Curtis A. Kin
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02420
Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd
Norwalk CA 90650

In the Matter of the Petition of Amy 
Marie Letwin, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 11/15/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. C Room 312

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Amy 
Marie Letwin. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Amy Marie Letwin to Amy Marie 
Letwin Burns

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 

general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 13, 2024
Judge Olivia Morales
Judge of the Superior Court
24NWCP00367
Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N. Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the matter of In the Matter of 
the Petition of Brenda Celene 

Arriaga, an adult over the age of 
18 years, on behalf of Kiara Rose 
Arriaga Mendoza, a minor under 

the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is under 18 years of age: 
Kiara Rose Arriaga Mendoza. 

And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the 

clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said peti-

tioner(s) desire to have the name 
changed from Kiara Rose Arriaga 
Mendoza to Kiara Rose Alvarado 

Arriaga

​Date: 11/04/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. 9 Room 9

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 30, 2024.
Elaine Lu
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02805
Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Mahlet Solomon Belay, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/25/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Mahlet 
Solomon Belay. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 

filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Mahlet Solomon Belay to Mahlu 
Adele Belay

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-

titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 13, 2024
Lawrence H Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SMCP00482
Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N. Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the matter of In the Matter of the 
Petition of Katherin L. Rodriguez, 
an adult over the age of 18 years, 
on behalf of Sasha Yarenith Ro-
driguez Gonzalez, a minor under 

the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is under 18 years of age: Sasha 
Yarenith Rodriguez Gonzalez. 

And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the 

clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said peti-

tioner(s) desire to have the name 
changed from Sasha Yarenith 
Rodriguez Gonzalez to Sasha 
Mariana Palacios Rodriguez

​Date: 12/20/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 12, 2024.
Curtis A. Kin
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02940
Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024167664. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Dog ZZZ’s, 498 E 
Morningside Street, Long Beach CA 90805. 
County: Los Angeles. Linda Snyder, 498 E 
Morningside Street, Long Beach CA 90805. 
This business is conducted by: an individu-
al. The Registrant(s) commenced to trans-

act business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Linda Snyder, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/09/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024169929. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: JC Chicken, 1815 
Hawthorne Blvd 320, Redondo Beach CA 
90278. County: Los Angeles. Julian Oroz-
co Hidalgo, 1929 W 147th St, Gardena CA 
90249. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
01/2024. Signed: Julian Orozco Hidalgo, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/13/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024180701. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Inhype Sanctuary, 110 
E. Wilson Ave., Glendale CA 91206. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Kevin Do, 110 E. Wilson 
Ave., Glendale CA 91206. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The Regis-
trant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Kevin Do, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/27/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024181734. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Psychoenalysis Center, 
Psy-E Center, 1123 Wilshire Blvd #173, 
Santa Monica CA 90403. County: Los An-
geles. Slobodan Nesovic, 1123 Wilshire 
Blvd #173, Santa Monica CA 90403. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 10/2020. Signed: 
Slobodan Nesovic, owner. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/28/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182237. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Strong Magnolia 
Beauty & Barber Studio, 2610 Magnolia 
Ave, Long Beach CA 90806. County: Los 
Angeles. Ana Maria Echeverria, 2170 Mag-
nolia Ave, Long Beach CA 90806. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Ana 
Maria Echeverria, owner. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 

business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024182325. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Haramara Wellness 
Retreats, 11418 Segrell Way, Culver City 
CA 90230. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
202461816602. Innovative Mind Digital 
Group LLC, 11418 Segrell Way, Culver City 
CA 90230. State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Dmitry Olev, Presi-
dent. Registrant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 08/29/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024187004. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Arroyo Car Wash, 8734 
Cedros Ave 5, Panorama City CA 91402. 
County: Los Angeles. Javier Arroyo De Je-
sus, 8734 Cedros Ave 5, Panorama City CA 
91402. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
08/2024. Signed: Javier Arroyo De Jesus, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 09/06/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024187418. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Loving Hearts 
Transportation, 1858 W. 144th St, Gardena 
CA 90249. County: Los Angeles. Loving 
Hearts Private Care Inc., 1858 W. 144th St, 
Gardena CA 90249. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Annetta Sparks, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/06/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed pri-
or to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024187512. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: FlowWithJasmine, 
24016 Via Vizcaya, Valencia CA 91354. 
County: Los Angeles. Jasmine Di Bella, 
24016 Via Vizcaya, Valencia CA 91354. 
This business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 01/2023. 
Signed: Jasmine Di Bella, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/06/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed pri-
or to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024187532. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Loving Hearts Private 
Care & Health Care Staffing Service, 1858 
W. 144th St, Gardena CA 90249. County: 
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Los Angeles. Loving Hearts Private Care 
Inc., 1858 W. 144th St, Gardena CA 90249. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: An-
netta Sparks, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/06/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024187710. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: EMBM Manage-
ment, 14119 W Monroe Place, Van Nuys 
CA 91405. County: Los Angeles. Ryan Mc-
Daniel, 14119 W Monroe Place, Van Nuys 
CA 91405; Krystina McDaniel, 14119 W 
Monroe Place, Van Nuys CA 91405. This 
business is conducted by: a married couple. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Ryan 
McDaniel, husband. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/09/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024189110. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Grover’s Handyman 
Services, 10242 Halawa Dr, Huntington 
Beach CA 92646. County: Orange. Grover 
Fye, 10242 Halawa Dr, Huntington Beach 
CA 92646. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Grover Fye, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/10/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024189926. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Skies Above Pro-
ductions, 625 Fair Oaks Avenue Suite 374, 
South Pasadena CA 91030. County: Los 
Angeles. Skies Above Media Inc., 625 Fair 
Oaks Avenue Suite 374, South Pasadena 
CA 91030. State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Glynnon Williams, President. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/11/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024190384. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: BRAIDBYK, 455 S 
Lake Ave Suite 103 Suite 21, Pasadena 
CA 91101. County: Los Angeles. Suzan 
Karlane Kwidja Njila,  455 S Lake Ave Suite 
103 Suite 21, Pasadena CA 91101. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2023. Signed: 
Suzan Karlane Kwidja Njila, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in the 

statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/11/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024190567. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Baja Fresh Solutions, 
1350 E San Bernadino Rd Apt 171, West 
Covina CA 91791. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 6350450. Baja Fresh Solutions 
Corp, 1350 E San Bernadino Rd Apt 171, 
West Covina CA 91791.  Suzan Karlane 
Kwidja Njila,  455 S Lake Ave Suite 103 
Suite 21, Pasadena CA 91101. State of In-
corporation: California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names list-
ed herein on: n/a. Signed: Araceli Morales 
Calderon, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/11/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024191406. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Sana Sana, 5234 Sale 
Ave, Woodland Hills CA 91364. County: 
Los Angeles. Karen Firestone, 5234 Sale 
Ave, Woodland Hills CA 91364.. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Karen 
Firestone, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/12/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024191430. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Bee Spa, 3974 Atlantic 
Ave, Long Beach CA 90807. County: Los 
Angeles. Bee Huang, 3974 Atlantic Ave, 
Long Beach CA 90807. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The Regis-
trant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Bee Huang, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 09/12/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024191437. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Calming Minds, 
11856 Balboa Blvd., #296, Granada Hills 
CA 91344. County: Los Angeles. Calming 
Minds Marriage & Family Therapy, Inc, 
11856 Balboa Blvd., #296, Granada Hills 
CA 91344. State of Incorporation: Califor-
nia. This business is conducted by: a cor-
poration. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Isabel Barin, President. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/12/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this statement 

does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024191539. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: GSL Auto Group, 7602 
N Claybeck Ave, Burbank CA 91505. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Krystyna Gasparian, 7602 
N Claybeck Ave, Burbank CA 91505. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 09/2024. Signed: 
Krystyna Gasparian, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/12/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024192836. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Moo Moo Matcha, 
18756 Vintage St, Northridge CA 91324. 
County: Los Angeles. Vanessa Suarez, 
18756 Vintage St, Northridge CA 91324. 
This business is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Vanessa Suarez, owner. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/13/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024193694. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Yeya’s Tacos, 2557 
Lincoln Blvd, Venice CA 90291. County: 
Los Angeles. Adan Hernandez, 2557 Lin-
coln Blvd, Venice CA 90291. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The Regis-
trant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: Adan 
Hernandez, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024193702. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Coastline Express 
Car Wash, 3525 E Anaheim St, Long Beach 
CA 90804. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
201804410421. Coastline Car Wash LLC, 
3525 E Anaheim St, Long Beach CA 90804. 
State of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
02/2022. Signed: Zain Ramjan, member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/16/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024193794. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Savor Soup Compa-

ny, 30902 Clubhouse Dr. Unit 1D, Laguna 
Niguel CA 92677. County: Orange. Court-
ney Gibbs,  30902 Clubhouse Dr. Unit 1D, 
Laguna Niguel CA 92677. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The Regis-
trant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2024. Signed: Court-
ney Gibbs, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024193862. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Ultraclean Supply, 
11138 E Del Amo Blvd. #204, Lakewood 
CA 90715. County: LA County. Ramjan 
Brothers Enterprises Inc, 4021, East Ana-
heim Street, Long Beach CA 90804. State 
of Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2014. Signed: Abdul 
Ramjan, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024193881. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Loving Hearts Thrive, 
1858 W. 144th St, Gardena CA 90249. 
County: Los Angeles. Loving Hearts Moth-
er’s And Daughters In Unity, 1858 W. 144th 
St, Gardena CA 90249. State of Incorpora-
tion: California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Annetta Sparks, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/16/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.ari

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024193886. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Sani-Tec USA, 
4021, East Anaheim Street, Long Beach 
CA 90804. County: LA County. Ramjan 
Brothers Enterprises Inc, 4021, East Ana-
heim Street, Long Beach CA 90804. State 
of Incorporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2001. Signed: Abdul L. 
Ramjan, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024194438. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Scheer Health Systems 
Consulting, 4828 Aqueduct Ave, Encino CA 
91436. County: LA County. Arnold Joseph 
Scheer, 4828 Aqueduct Ave, Encino CA 
91436. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
06/2018. Signed: Arnold Joseph Scheer, 

owner. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 09/17/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024194785. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: JC Sound Healing, 1901 
Arenas Dr, Pomona CA 9166. County: LA 
County. Qin Cao, 1901 Arenas Dr, Pomona 
CA 9166. County: LA County. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The Regis-
trant(s) commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 09/2024. Signed: Qin Cao, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 09/17/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 09/21/2024, 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024 and 10/12/202

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

312 N Spring Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Eddie Romero Guerrero, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 11/04/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. 9 Room 9

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Eddie Romero Guerrero. And a 
petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Eddie Romero Guerrero to 

Eddie Romero

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 28, 2024.
Elaine Lu
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02756
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

6230 Sylmar Avenue
Van  Nuys CA 91401

In the Matter of the Petition of 

Edina Wurtz, an adult over the age 
of 18 years.

​Date: 11/08/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. A Room 510

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: 
Edina Wurtz. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Edina Wurtz to Elisa Zoey Mbulo

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 20, 2024.
Virginia Keeny
Judge of the Superior Court
24VECP00447
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720  Norwalk Blvd
Norwalk CA 90650

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Hyun Joon Kim, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 11/04/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. C Room 312

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Hyun Joon Kim. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 

filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Hyun Joon Kim to 
Harrison Just Kim

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 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Dated: September 19, 2024.
Judge Olivia Rosales
Judge of the Superior Court
24NWCP00375
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

6230 Sylmar Avenue
Van Nuys CA 91401

In the matter of In the Matter of the 
Petition of 

Kristina Elizabeth Marie Anderson 
and Jeffrey Shaun Polanco, 

adults over the age of 18 years, on 
behalf of Kassia, Clover Anderson, 
Polanco, a minor under the age of 

18 years.

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is 

under 18 years of age: 
Kassia, Clover Anderson, Polanco. 
And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) de-
sire to have the name changed from 
Kassia, Clover Anderson, Polanco 

to 
Kassia, Clover, Anderson Polanco

​Date: 11/04/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. O Room 511

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 19, 2024
Virginia Keeny
Judge of the Superior Court
24VECP00443
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N. Hill Street Room 102
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Kathryn Helen Winchester, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 01/10/2025. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: 
Kathryn Helen Winchester. And a 
petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Kathryn Helen Winchester 

to Kathryn Joyce Acquarelli

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 

to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 24, 2024.
Curtis A. Kin, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP03058
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

9425 Penfield Avenue Room 1200
Chatsworth CA 91311

In the matter of In the Matter of 
the Petition of Querra Jones, an 
adult over the age of 18 years, on 

behalf of 
Khloe Monroe Jones-Warren, a 
minor under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is under 18 years of age: 
Khloe Monroe Jones-Warren. 

And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the 

clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said peti-

tioner(s) desire to have the name 
changed from 

Khloe Monroe Jones-Warren to 
Khloe Monroe Warren

​
Date: 11/20/2024. Time: 8.30am 

Dept. F43

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 20, 2024
David B. Gelfound
Judge of the Superior Court
24CHCP00373
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N. Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Runyu Shi, an adult over the age 

of 18 years.

​Date: 12/20/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Runyu 
Shi. And a petition for change of 

names having been duly filed with 
the clerk of this Court, and it ap-

pearing from said petition that said 
petitioner(s) desire to have their 

name changed from Runyu Shi to 
Mingrui Shi

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 13, 2024.
Hon. Curtis A. Kin, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02963
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Avenue
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Zuhri Amira Leslie-Tate, an 
adult over the age of 18 years

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Zuhri Amira Leslie-Tate. And a 

petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Zuhri Amira Leslie-Tate to 

Indigo Ngame

And in the matter of the Petition 
of Zuhri Amira Leslie-Tate, an 
adult over the age of 18 year, on 
behalf of Xiomara Jade Orozco 
and Nara Lilette Orozco, minors 

under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person(s) whose name is to be 

changed is/are under 18 years of 
age: Xiomara Jade Orozco and 
Nara Lilette Orozco. And a peti-
tion for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of 

this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have the name changed 

from Xiomara Jade Orozco to 
Jade Ngame and from 
Nara Lilette Orozco to 

Nara Ngame 

Date: 11/01/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. M Room 350

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 

granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 12, 2024
Gary Tanaka
Judge of the Superior Court
24TRCP00353
Published: 09/28/2024, 
10/05/2024, 10/12/2024 and 
10/19/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Ipek Eren, an adult over the age of 

18 years.

​Date: 11/01/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Ipek Eren. 
And a petition for change of names 

having been duly filed with the 
clerk of this Court, and it appearing 

from said petition that said peti-
tioner(s) desire to have their name 
changed from Ipek Eren to Talia 

Ipek Eren

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: September 19, 2024.
Lawence H. Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SMCP00489
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182970. Current file: 
2022269006. The following person 
has abandoned the use of the fic-
titious business name: Autotrade, 
15001 Vanowen Street, Apt 3, Van 
Nuys CA 91405. Suharfil, Inc, 15001 
Vanowen Street, Apt 3, Van Nuys 
CA 91405.  The fictitious business 
name referred to above was filed on: 
12/13/20022, in the County of Los An-
geles. This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. Signed: Ksenia Para-
filova, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 

that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/30/2024. 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024183250. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Activate 
Meaning, 7740 Painter Ave, Ste 105, 
Whittier CA 90602. County: Los An-
geles. Emmanuel Arath Reyna, 7740 
Painter Ave, Ste 105, Whittier CA 
90602. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Emmanuel Arath Reyna, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 10/12/2024 
and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024183759. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lionheart 
Creative Agency, 10745 La Grange 
Ave, Los Angeles CA 90025. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Lumina Enterprises 
LLC, 10745 La Grange Ave, Los An-
geles CA 90025. State of Organiza-
tion: California. This business is con-
ducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Joshua Candau, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/03/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024184859. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Y & Y Re-
covery, 7731 Aldea Ave, Van Nuys 
CA 91406. County: Los Angeles. Di-
ana Makhtesytan, 7731 Aldea Ave, 
Van Nuys CA 91406. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
08/2024. Signed: Diana Makhtesytan, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/04/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024189074. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Julia J. Photo, 11239 Ventura Blvd 
Ste 103, #215, Studio City CA 91604. 
County: Los Angeles. Julia Johnson, 

11239 Ventura Blvd Ste 103, #215, 
Studio City CA 91604. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Julia Johnson, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/10/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 10/12/2024 
and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024189892. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Pearl and 
Joy Catering, 9545 Reseda Blvd Ste 
20, Northridge CA 91324. County: 
Los Angeles. Kickin Kitchen LLC, 
9545 Reseda Blvd Ste 20, Northridge 
CA 91324. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conduct-
ed by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 09/2024. Signed: Tina Tsai, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/10/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024190414. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Neo Mov-
ers, 2450 Colorado Ave 209, Santa 
Monica CA 90404. County: Los An-
geles. Sadokat Dusbekova, 2450 
Colorado Ave 209, Santa Monica CA 
90404. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Sadokat Dusbekova, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/11/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024191521. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Apolonia, 
1516 W 1st St Apt 104, San Pedro 
CA 90732. County: Los Angeles. 
Paola Alferez, 1516 W 1st St Apt 104, 
San Pedro CA 90732. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 09/2024. Signed: Paola Alferez, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/12/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
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five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024192179. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Hilma Pho-
tography, 1018 E. Garfield Ave. #A, 
Glendale CA 91205. County: Los 
Angeles. Hilma Shahinian, 1018 
E. Garfield Ave. #A, Glendale CA 
91205. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Hilma Shahinian, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/13/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024192455. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Chili Tango 
Thai Cuisine, 474 E San Bernadino 
Rd, Covina CA 91723. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 6330463. Yadama-
da Corporation, 474 E San Bernadino 
Rd, Covina CA 91723. State of Incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Siriyada Vanakul, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/13/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024193269. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ecloectic 
Studio, Neurotic Tendencies, 1770 
El Cerrito Pl #201, Los Angeles CA 
90028. County: Los Angeles. Kristen 
Suszek, 1770 El Cerrito Pl #201, Los 
Angeles CA 90028. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Kristen Suszek, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 10/12/2024 
and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024193396. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Pighead 
Skincare, 4552 Murietta Ave, Sher-
man Oaks CA 91423. County: Los An-
geles. Zachary Foster, 4552 Murietta 
Ave, Sherman Oaks CA 91423. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 09/2024. Signed: Zachary Fos-
ter, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/16/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024193748. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Esteban 
Liquor, 3109 Century Blvd, South 
Gate CA 90280. County: Los Ange-
les. AI#ON: 6035418.  Corner Stop 
Liquor Mart Inc, 3109 Century Blvd, 
South Gate CA 90280. State of In-
corporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 04/2024. Signed: Mario Kassis, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/16/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024193794. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Savor Soup 
Company, 30902 Clubhouse Dr. 
Unit 1D, Laguna Niguel, CA 92677. 
County: Orange. Courtney Gibbs,  
30902 Clubhouse Dr. Unit 1D, Lagu-
na Niguel, CA 92677. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
05/2024. Signed: Courtney Gibbs, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/16/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024193806. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Asfour Trading, 150 W Foothill Blvd 
Apt 22D, Pomona CA 91767. County: 
Los Angeles. Basel Haddad, 150 W 
Foothill Blvd Apt 22D, Pomona CA 
91767. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 

Signed: Basel Haddad, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 10/12/2024 
and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024194025. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Pro Key Entertainment, 3852 Vinton 
Ave Apartment 408, Culver City CA 
90232-3373. County: Los Angeles. 
Don’t Tell Larry LLC, 3852 Vinton 
Ave Apartment 408, Culver City CA 
90232. State of Organization: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Gregory Porper, managing 
member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/16/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024194201. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: A&A Jewels, 
432 Harvard Blvd 102, Los Angeles 
CA 90020. County: Los Angeles. MD 
Faruque Ahmed, 432 Harvard Blvd 
102, Los Angeles CA 90020. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: MD Faruque Ahmed, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/167/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024194756. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: One Cup, 
9111 Youngdale St, San Gabriel CA 
91775. County: Los Angeles. One 
Cup, 9111 Youngdale St, San Gabri-
el CA 91775. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
01/2018. Signed: Yau Chung Tong, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/17/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 

not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024194919. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ecolectic 
Studio; D’Unno, 1770 El Cerrito Pl 
#201, Los Angeles CA 90028. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Kristen L Suszek, 
1770 El Cerrito Pl #201, Los Angeles 
CA 90028. This business is conduct-
ed by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Kristen L Suszek, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/17/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 10/12/2024 
and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024195003. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Satellite-TV 
Service, HD-TV Services, 16304 
Van Ness Ave, Torrance CA 90504. 
County: Los Angeles. Softech EBiz 
Solutions LLC, 16304 Van Ness Ave, 
Torrance CA 90504. State of Orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Shakil A Rai, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/17/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024195012. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Farias Land-
scape & Design, 9032 Rivera Rd, 
Pico Rivera CA 90660. County: Los 
Angeles. Farias Landscape & Design 
LLC, 9032 Rivera Rd, Pico Rivera CA 
90660. State of Organization: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Gonzalo Farias Chavez, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/17/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024195140. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lily Well-

ness Global, 1938 Olympus Ave, 
Hacienda Heights CA 91745. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Lizhen Zhang, 1938 
Olympus Ave, Hacienda Heights CA 
91745. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Lizhen Zhang, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/18/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 10/12/2024 
and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024195210. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Bright Side 
Learning Solutions, 453 S Spring 
St Ste 400 #817, Los Angeles CA 
90013. County: Los Angeles. Melis-
sa Ashton, 453 S Spring St Ste 400 
#817, Los Angeles CA 90013. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Melissa Ashton, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/18/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024195311. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Happy Days 
Care Home, 140 W 220th, Carson CA 
90745. County: Los Angeles. Eloisa 
Delantar, 140 W 220th St, Carson CA 
90745. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Eloisa Delantar, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/18/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 10/12/2024 
and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024195597. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Anza Insurance Center, 17480 Coli-
ma Road #228, Rowland Heights CA 
91748. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
6303849. Anza Insurance Service, 
Inc, 17480 Colima Road #228, Row-
land Heights CA 91748. State of In-
corporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Alice Mei Chun Liu, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 

and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/18/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024196018. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ocean Park 
Press, 4605 Lankershim Blvd Ste 
700, North Hollywood CA 91602. 
County: Los Angeles. Foxtail20, Inc, 
4605 Lankershim Blvd Ste 700, North 
Hollywood CA 91602. State of Incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Clay Savage, Pres-
ident. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/18/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024196262. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Gigastorm 
IT Services, 18143  Sundowner Way 
953, Canyon Country CA 91387. 
County: Los Angeles. Salvador Ti-
najero, 18143  Sundowner Way 953, 
Canyon Country CA 91387; April E. 
Tinajero, 18143  Sundowner Way 
953, Canyon Country CA 91387. 
This business is conducted by: a 
married couple. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Salvador Tinajero, husband. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/19/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024196364. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: The Pedi-
atric Specialist Institute, The Rehab 
Specialist Institute, 13607 Ranchill 
Dr, Cerritos CA 90703.  County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON:C4104863. Hope 
And Dreams Inc, 13607 Ranchill Dr, 
Cerritos CA 90703. State of Incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 04/2022. Signed: Michael Ang, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/19/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
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on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024196367. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: International 
Association of Neurology; World Fed-
eration Of Neuroscience, 13607 Ran-
chill Dr, Cerritos CA 90703.  County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON:C4104863. 
Hope And Dreams Inc, 13607 Ran-
chill Dr, Cerritos CA 90703. State of 
Incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 02/2018. Signed: Michael Ang, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/19/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024197107. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Credo-CA, 
7818 Clearfield Ave, Panorama City 
CA 91402. County: Los Angeles. Ara 
Kurazyan, 12626 Burbank Blvd Apt 
#206, Valley Village CA 91607. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 03/2016. Signed: Ara Kura-
zyan, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/20/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024197130. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: Mr. 
Electric Of Woodland Hills, 23283 
Ventura Blvd, Woodland Hills, CA 
91364. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
3824300. Fire Net, 23283 Ventura 
Blvd, Woodland Hills, CA 91364. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 12/2023. Signed: Ehsan Amiri, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/20/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 

Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024197199. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Papa Life 
Science LLC, 1445 W Anaheim 
Street, Long Beach CA 90813. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. LB Anaheim Street 
LLC, 1445 W Anaheim Street, Long 
Beach CA 90813. State of Organi-
zation: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 09/2024. Signed: Kenneth 
Corben, managing member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/20/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024197274. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: RNR Tax 
Services, 12521 Correnti St,  Paco-
ima CA 91331. County: Los Angeles. 
Twelve Five Solutions, Inc., 12521 
Correnti St,  Pacoima CA 91331. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Reina Reyes, 
Secretary. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/20/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024197488. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Edifice 
Suites, 201 Santa Monica Blvd. Suite 
300, Santa Monica CA 90401. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Gorman & Miller, A 
Law Corporation, 201 Santa Monica 
Blvd. Suite 300, Santa Monica CA 
90401. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Ken Miller, President. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/20/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024197756. The following person(s) 

is/are doing business as: Lacon V, 
16835 Lahey St, Granada Hills CA 
91344. County: Los Angeles. South-
ern California Institute For Special-
ized Literature, Inc., 16835 Lahey St, 
Granada Hills CA 91344. State of In-
corporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2023. Signed: Elayne F. Pelz, 
Treasurer. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/20/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024197904. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Polk-A-Dot, 
1334 E Colorado Blvd, Pasadena CA 
91106. County: Los Angeles. Happy 
California Trading LLC, 1334 E Col-
orado Blvd, Pasadena CA 91106. 
State of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Nicole Young, managing 
member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/20/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024197945. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: NA Repair 
Services, 5707 Riverton Ave, North 
Hollywood CA 91601. County: Los 
Angeles. Aleksei Volodkin, 5707 
Riverton Ave, North Hollywood CA 
91601. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Aleksei Volodkin, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/23/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024198018. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Car King, 
10914 Garvey Ave, El Monte CA 
91733. County: Los Angeles. Car 
King Auto Group, 10914 Garvey Ave, 
El Monte CA 91733. State of Incor-
poration: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation.
 The Registrant(s) commenced to 

transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Yongjie Liu, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/23/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024198287. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
RLA Transportation; RLA Limousine, 
RLATR.com, RLALIMO.com, RLA-
TRANSPORTATION.COM, RLA 
Transport, RLATRANSPORT.COM, 
RLATR, 14900 Magnolia Boulevard 
#56885, Sherman Oaks CA 91413. 
County: Los Angeles. Montem, LLC, 
14900 Magnolia Boulevard #56885, 
Sherman Oaks CA 91413. State of 
Organization: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a limited li-
ability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 10/2019. 
Signed: Paul Jackson, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/23/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024198624. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Bloom Art-
ists Agency, 312 N. Kenwood St. 
Apt. A, Burbank CA 91505. County: 
Los Angeles. Diane Pardoe, 312 N. 
Kenwood St. Apt. A, Burbank CA 
91505. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Diane Pardoe, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/23/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024198844. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Margarian 
Consulting, 1048 Rosedale Avenue 
3, Glendale CA 91201. County: Los 
Angeles. Margarian Consulting LLC, 
1048 Rosedale Avenue 3, Glendale 
CA 91201. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conduct-
ed by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Piruza Margarian, 

CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/23/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024199148. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Tattooarte, 
4433 S Alameda St Spc A-11B, Los 
Angeles CA 90058. County: Los 
Angeles. Victor Manuel Lopez De 
Los Santos, 4433 S Alameda St Spc 
A-11B, Los Angeles CA 90058. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 09/2024. Signed: Victor Manuel 
Lopez De Los Santos, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/23/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024199267. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: West Hon-
est International, Inc., 275 Paseo Te-
soro, Walnut CA 91789. County: Los 
Angeles. Natureen International, Inc., 
275 Paseo Tesoro, Walnut CA 91789. 
State of Incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 09/2024. Signed: Zheng Mei 
Liu, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/24/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024199305. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: AI IP, 9100 
Wilshire Blvd Ste 333 #22, Beverly 
Hills CA 90212. County: Los Angeles. 
Ellen Weiler Stiefler, 9100 Wilshire 
Blvd Ste 333 #22, Beverly Hills CA 
90212. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Ellen Weiler Stiefler, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/24/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 

Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024199798. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: SIJIL, SIJIL 
Studio, 5525 Media Dr #5, Los Ange-
les CA 90042. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 202460417727. Hidden Sigil 
LLC, 5525 Media Dr #5, Los Ange-
les CA 90042. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conduct-
ed by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
09/2024. Signed: Benjamin Juster, 
manager. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/24/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024199940. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: KREM, 177 
Merrill Ave, Sierra Madre CA 91024. 
County: Los Angeles. Shroo LLC, 177 
Merrill Ave, Sierra Madre CA 91024. 
State of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2024. 
Signed: Veronika Issa Steinhoff, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/24/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024199697. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Empty Exhibit, 1124 E Pacific Coast 
Hwy #A223, Long Beach CA 90806. 
County: Los Angeles. Nico DeLucia, 
1124 E Pacific Coast Hwy #A223, 
Long Beach CA 90806. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 09/2024. Signed: Nico DeLucia, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/24/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/28/2024, 10/05/2024, 
10/12/2024 and 10/19/2024
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WE CANCEL TIMESHARES
Many people believe their timeshares cannot be cancelled, but they
often can be. Our founder and CEO, Chuck McDowell, has successfully
helped over 30,000 families get rid of their timeshare and he can
likely help you too. If you were misled, lied to, or pressured, you
may have an easy exit with a 100% money back guarantee.

•  Start with a FREE consultation to tell your story.

•  If we see that the circumstances of your situation qualify
   you to exit the timeshare, you’ll be assigned a specialist to walk
   you through the process. Don’t think for another minute that you

are stuck with this. What we do is help
you cancel your timeshare along with all
of the debt and fees associated with it.
Guaranteed.

“Wesley Financial was awesome 
to work with. They were pro-
fessional and very understanding
of the situation we were in.
Thank you all so much. This has
been a huge burden and you 
all helped relieve that burden.
Thank you.”

- Kyle S
Wesley Financial Group, LLC client

Chuck McDowell, Founder & CEO

•  Our Resolution Department works quickly to have your
  timeshare and all related fees permanently terminated.   

We’ve been able to help many timeshare owners that 
contact us. You could be one phone call away from complete
peace of mind.

We have a dedicated team waiting for your call.

How Does the Cancellation Process Work?  

Call 1.877.854.0943

4.7 based on 1,103 reviews 4.9 based on 463 reviews 4.7 based on 833 reviews

Get your free information kit and see if you qualify:

*This is an Advertisement. Wesley Financial Group, LLC (“WFG”) and/or its a liates, successors, or assigns are
not lawyers and/or a law firm and does not engage inthe practice of law or provide legal advice or legal

representation. Actual results depend on each client’s distinct case and no specific outcome is guaranteed. 

Aging in Place?
Consider an AmeriGlide stair lift 
to keep you safe on your stairs.

Benefits of an AmeriGlide stair lift:

Eliminate the risk of falls. 

Enjoy a comfortable ride up  
and down all of your home.

Enjoy comfortable, safe  
and easy access to all of 
your home.

More affordable than 
options such as moving.

Custom fit to 
your staircase

Indoor and  
Outdoor options

Fast delivery 
and installation

SAVE $200

1-866-654-6288

CALL NOW TO Call today to get your FREE, 
no obligation quote  
in minutes!ON ANY STAIR LIFT!

Teenager Ethan Nwaneri 
scored his first Arsenal 
goals as they cruised to 
victory over League One 
Bolton on Wednesday to 
reach the Carabao Cup 
fourth round.
	 The 17-year-old, mak-
ing his first senior start 
for the club, slotted into 
an empty net from Ra-
heem Sterling’s cross, be-
fore taking advantage of 
some sloppy Bolton play 
to pick up the ball from 
Declan Rice and roll un-
der visiting goalkeeper 
Luke Southwood.
	 Nwaneri’s two goals 
came after he had already 
played a part in Arsenal’s 
16th-minute opener with 
a fizzed cross which Scott 
Arfield failed to clear and 
Rice dispatched a calm 
finish into the bottom cor-
ner.
	 “You can tell he is play-
ing with a confidence and 
belief and an understand-
ing of what he needs to 
do on the pitch,” said 

Arsenal boss Mikel Ar-
teta, whose side will face 
Championship Preston at 
Deepdale in the next 
round.
	 “In his journey with 
the first team he is always 
ahead of what everybody 
expected and I expected 
too. He deserves that and 
he is part of us so he will 
have the minutes.”
	 Sterling tapped home 
the fourth from a cou-
ple of yards in the 64th 
minute after Southwood 
spilled Bukayo Saka’s ef-
fort. It was the forward’s 
first goal in Arsenal co-
lours, on his first start, 
since joining from Lon-
don rivals Chelsea on 
transfer deadline day.
	 Kai Havertz wrapped 
up a convincing win at 
Emirates Stadium after 
guiding home a rebound 
when Sterling’s shot was 
saved.
	 Aaron Collins had 
pulled one back for Bolton 
in the 53rd minute after a 

brilliant counter-attack. It 
was ultimately a consola-
tion, but one that denied 
teenage Arsenal goal-
keeper Jack Porter a clean 
sheet on his record-set-
ting senior debut.
	 At 16 years and 72 
days old, he became the 
youngest player to start 
a first-team game for 
the Gunners, breaking 
a mark set by Cesc Fab-
regas in October 2003 in 
the League Cup against 
Rotherham.
	 Porter is the club’s 
fourth choice, but got 
the call after number one 
stopper David Raya was 
ruled out with a thigh 
injury, summer signing 
Neto was cup-tied, hav-
ing already featured in 
the competition for par-
ent club Bournemouth, 
and Tommy Setford was 
also out injured.
	 “We told him yester-
day and he was over the 
moon,” added Arteta on 
Porter.

	 “It is a big step, a big 
occasion, but he reacted 
really well. He was really 
composed in training and 
his team-mates helped 
him too. What an experi-
ence and what a way to 
break a record.”
	 The Carabao Cup has 
long been seen as an 
opportunity to bleed in 
youngsters with Fabregas 
and Jack Wilshere among 
those to begin their Arse-

nal careers in the compe-
tition.
	 After a gruelling Pre-
mier League game 
against Manchester City 
on Sunday, boss Arte-
ta opted to rest several 
first-team starters and 
chose a youthful line-up 
with Porter, full-back 
Josh Nichols, 18, Myl-
es Lewis-Skelly, 18, and 
Nwaneri making their 
full senior debuts. Two 

other teenagers Maldini 
Kacurri and Ismeal Kabia 
also made their first foray 
into first-team football off 
the bench.
	 But bolstered by the 
experience of Rice and 
Jorginho in midfield and 
the quality of Saka and 
Sterling on the wings, 
Arsenal’s youngsters had 
the freedom to showcase 
their talent in this com-
fortable victory.

Dream start for Arsenal teen

“He is always ahead of what everybody expected,” said Arsenal manager 
Mikel Arteta of 17 year old Ethan Nwaneri
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Weekend Football Results

Monday’s Results

Wednesday’s Results

United:
cont. from back page

Manchester City have 
confirmed Spain mid-
fielder Rodri suffered 
a knee ligament inju-
ry  against Arsenal  on 
Sunday.
	 Rodri was substituted 
in the 21st minute after he 
twisted the joint in a colli-
sion with Arsenal’s Thom-
as Partey at a corner.
	 No timescale has yet 
been put on the player’s 
recovery, but speaking 
after Tuesday’s  Carabao 
Cup win over Watford, 
Pep Guardiola said he is 
set for a lengthy spell on 
the sidelines.
	 “Still we don’t have the 
definitive [diagnosis] but 
he will be out for a long 
time - a while,” said the 
City boss. “But there are 

some opinions that maybe 
it will be less than we ex-
pected.
	 “We are waiting for the 
last phone calls from him 
and the doctors for what 
definitely he has and the 
type of surgery he has to 
get.”
	 Rodri has travelled to 
Spain to see a specialist 
following initial tests in 
Manchester.
Guardiola has described 
the 28-year-old as “irre-
placeable” - City have not 
lost in the last 48 Premier 
League matches in which 
he has started - but the 
manager says he will find 
a solution in his absence.
	 City were beaten in four 
out of the five games Ro-
dri missed last season, 

Ligament damage spells long layoff for Rodri

while he has lost just once 
in 50 appearances all com-
petitions.
	 He was also named 
player of the tournament 
as Spain won Euro 2024 
in July and is one of the fa-

vourites to win the Ballon 
d’Or next month - given to 
the world’s best player.
	 A week ago the former 
Atletico Madrid player, 
who played 63 times for 
City and Spain last sea-

son, claimed players  are 
“close to” striking  over 
an increase in the number 
of games in the calendar, 
including an expanded 
Champions League and 
Club World Cup.

	 Unnerstall had ear-
lier produced a mag-
nificent reaction save to 
prevent Mees Hilgers 
turning the ball into his 
own goal.
	 Home skipper Bru-
no Fernandes also went 
close before substitute 
Kobbie Mainoo had a 
penalty appeal turned 
down.
	 After finishing bot-

tom of their Champions 
League group with only 
one win last season, this 
was not the ideal way 
for United to open their 
latest European cam-
paign ahead of a tricky 
looking trip to Porto on 
3 October.
	 With the new for-
mat, there is plenty of 
time for United to make 
amends at least. On the 
plus side, they are now 
unbeaten in four games, 
even if the last two have 
been draws.

the bench as his oppor-
tunity to show Poste-
coglou why he should 
get more starts was cut 
short.
	 There were plenty 
of positives to take for 
Postecoglou, though.
	 Valuable minutes 
for his young players, 
a clean sheet despite 
being down to 10 men 
and confidence-boost-
ing goals for summer 
signing Solanke as 
well as Johnson, who 
reportedly deactivated 
his Instagram account 
because of criticism re-
ceived in the wake of 
his club’s derby defeat 
to Arsenal earlier this 

month.
But Spurs’ all-out at-
tacking style often 
leaves them vulnerable 
to the counter-attack.
	 Qarabag must have 
wondered what else 
they needed to do 
to find the net as the 
wasteful Juninho had 
a goal ruled out for off-
side, Bayramov went 
close several times and 
Vicario produced a 
brilliant save to deny 
Cafarquliyev’s long-
range strike.
	 The sight of Son hob-
bling off in the second 
half could also be a 
concern as Spurs face 
Manchester United in 
the Premier League on 
Sunday, before a trip 
to Hungary to face Fer-
encvaros next week.

SPURS:
cont. from back page

Rodri leaves the field against Arsenal on Sunday
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S PUB & RESTAURANT:

116 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 451-1402
Happy Hour Mon-Fri. 4-7

(food specials)
SHOPPE:

132 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 394-8765
Open 10am-6pm

Thurs/Fri/Sun: 10am-7pm
Sat: 10am-8pm

cont. on page 19, col. 5

SAT 9/28 EPL 
9.30AM WOLVES V LIVERPOOL 

MLS 
4.30PM CINCINNATI  V LAFC 

4.30PM INTER MIAMI V CHARLOTTE 
SUN 9/29 EPL 

830AM MAN UTD V TOTTENHAM 
 

NFL -ASK FOR AVAIL GAMES 
 

MON 9/30 EPL 
NOON BOURNEMOUTH V SOUTHAMPTON 

NFL MNF 
4.30PM TITANS V DOLPHINS 
5.15PM SEAHAWKS V LIONS 

 
TUE 10/1 CHAMPIONS LEAGUE 

NOON ARSENAL V PSG 
NOON SL. BRATISLAVA V MAN CITY 

NOON DORTMUND V CELTIC 
NOON LEVERKUSEN V MILAN 

 
WED 10/2 CHAMPIONS LEAGUE 
NOON LIVERPOOL V BOLOGNA 
NOON ASTON VILLA V BAYERN 

NOON LILLE V REAL MADRID 
 

MLS 
4.45PM COLUMBUS V INTER MIAMI 
6.30PM COLORADO V LA GALAXY 

7.30PM LAFC V ST. LOUIS 
 

THURS 10/3 EUROPA LEAGUE 
NOON FC PORTO V MAN UTD 

NOON RANGERS V LYON 
 

CONFERENCE LEAGUE  
NOON CHELSEA V GENT 

 
NFL TNF 

5.15PM BUCCANEERS V FALCONS

BW SPORT/Football

Darts League Is Back! Tues @7.30pm
Free Round Of Beers For All Players - Win Or Lose

Complimentary Appetizers

Christian Eriksen was 
hero and villain for 
Manchester United as 
Erik ten Hag’s men 
stumbled at the start 
of their Europa League 
campaign, being held to 
a draw by their Dutch 
manager’s boyhood 
club Twente.
	 Eriksen gave United 
a first-half lead with a 

superb strike from in-
side the penalty area.
	 However, against a 
dogged Twente outfit, 
Eriksen was punished 
when he allowed him-
self to be caught in pos-
session by Sam Lammers 
just outside the United 
box.
	 The former Rangers 
player took maximum 

advantage as he drove a 
blistering effort past An-
dre Onana.
	 Ten Hag’s side had 
opportunities to snatch 
victory in the final stages 
and Twente goalkeeper 
Lars Unnerstall denied 
Joshua Zirkzee, whose 
left-footed effort was 
heading into the net.

Another bad night for Ten Hag

The pressure’s on 
for Erik ten Hag

Tottenham began their 
Europa League cam-
paign with an impres-
sive 3-0 victory over 
Qarabag despite going 
down to 10 men from 
the seventh minute.
	 After a 35-minute 
delay to kick-off at 
Tottenham Hotspur 
Stadium on Thursday 
night because of travel 
disruptions, the home 
side were dealt an ear-
ly blow when defend-
er Radu Dragusin was 
shown a straight red 
card for bringing down 
Juninho in a one-on-
one as the Brazilian 
raced through on goal.
	 Despite that, Brennan 
Johnson had the ball in 
the back of the net five 
minutes later when 
Qarabag were caught 
playing out from the 
back and Dominic So-
lanke placed it into the 

path of the 23-year-old 
to slot into the bottom 
corner.
	 It was Johnson’s third 
goal in as many games.
	 Pape Sarr doubled 
Spurs’ lead in the 52nd 
minute, controlling a 
loose ball at the far post 
before smashing home.
	 Qarabag were 
awarded a penalty 
three minutes later 
when Yves Bissou-
ma brought Elvin Ca-
farquliyev down, but 
Toral Bayramov’s 
spot-kick was poor and 
pinged off the crossbar.
	 The Azerbaijan Pre-
mier League champi-
ons created an abun-
dance of chances, with 
Guglielmo Vicario 
making some fine 
saves, but ultimately 
Qarabag lacked the 
cutting edge that Ange 
Postecoglou’s side 

showed at the other 
end.
	 Solanke wrapped 
up victory in the 68th 
minute after goalkeep-
er Mateusz Kochals-
ki pushed Son Heu-
ng-min’s strike from 
distance into the strik-
er’s path and he pro-
duced a confident fin-
ish.
	 Postecoglou said 
before the match the 
expanding football 
schedule is reaching a 
“dangerous level” and 
therefore used it as an 
opportunity to shuffle 
his pack, making six 
changes from the side 
that beat Brentford in 
the Premier League on 
Saturday.
	 He handed 18-year-
olds Lucas Bergvall 
and Archie Gray their 
second Spurs starts but, 
following Dragusin’s 

dismissal, midfielder 
Bergvall was sacrificed 
as defender Destiny 

Udogie came on.
Swede Bergvall, who 
snubbed Barcelona to 

join Spurs in the sum-
mer, looked forlorn on 

IN THE GROOVE: Brennan Johnson has scored in his last three Spurs games

TEN MEN GOOD FOR SPURS

cont. on page 19, col. 5


